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The Diocese of Brisbane 

The Diocese of Brisbane is coterminous with Southern Queensland. Its area is 542,000
sq.km, and its population is about half of the entire population of the State which is
estimated at four million. The members of the Anglican Church of Australia form about
25% of this number. There are 517 clergy and 303 churches.

On 14 June, 1859, Dr Edward Wyndham Tufnell was consecrated first Bishop of
Brisbane, and arrived here in September 1860, to exercise Episcopal control in the newly
formed Colony of Queensland. The Bishop arrived to find the work in the Diocese
maintained by the utterly inadequate staff of three clergy. To these must be added the six
clergy the Bishop brought with him. When, after fourteen years’ strenuous pioneer work,
the Bishop resigned, he left a staff of 26 clergy and a Diocese equipped and furnished
with all the needful machinery for Diocesan administration.

In 1874, when Bishop Tufnell resigned, the Synod of the Diocese failing to elect a
successor or to delegate the power of appointment to the Church at home, the
appointment of his successor lapsed to the Bishops of Australia and Tasmania, by whom
the Right Reverend Mathew Blagden Hale, Bishop of Perth, was nominated. Bishop Hale
was translated to Brisbane in 1876. During the episcopate of Bishop Hale, which lasted
eight years, the Diocese of North Queensland was formed. In the year 1878 the Rev’d 
George Henry Stanton, then Vicar of St Giles in the Fields, was consecrated Bishop of
the new Diocese, and arrived in Queensland in 1879.

In 1884, when Synod was called upon to elect a successor as bishop in succession to
Bishop Hale, the choice was delegated to the Archbishop of Canterbury, which resulted
in the consecration of the Rev’d William Thomas Thornhill Webber, on St Barnabas’ Day, 
1885. The Bishop was enthroned by the Primate in St John’s Pro-Cathedral on 17
November 1885. When the Bishop arrived he found 33 clergy working in the Diocese; on
his death, in the year 1903, the number had risen to 57. The episcopate of Bishop Webber
is well remembered for two great outward achievements – the creation of the Diocese of
Rockhampton and the successful launching of the Cathedral project. On SS Philip and
James’ Day 1889, the Venerable Nathaniel Dawes, Archdeacon of Brisbane, was
consecrated Coadjutor-Bishop of the Diocese, with special oversight over the Northern
portion, and when four years later the See of Rockhampton was formed, Dr Dawes was
elected its first Bishop.

When, in 1903, the choice of Bishop was delegated to the Archbishop of Canterbury, the
Rev’d St Clair George Alfred Donaldson was nominated to the vacant See.

Archbishop Donaldson resigned from 15 November 1921. The Right Rev’d Gerald Sharp
was elected to fill the vacancy by the Archbishop Election Committee, and was enthroned
in St John’s Cathedral on 16 November 1921. He remained in charge of the Diocese as
Archbishop until the day of his death, 30 August 1933.
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In November 1933, the Archbishop Election Committee met in Brisbane and elected the
Rev’d John William Charles Wand, Dean of Oriel College, Oxford. Archbishop Wand was 
consecrated in St Paul’s Cathedral, London, on Tuesday, 1 May 1934, and on
Wednesday, 5 September, was enthroned in St John’s Cathedral, Brisbane. He resigned
on 31 July 1943, on his appointment as Bishop of Bath and Wells.

On 3 November 1943, having been elected by the Archbishop Election Committee, the
Right Rev’d Reginald Charles Halse, Bishop of Riverina, was enthroned in St John’s 
Cathedral, Brisbane. He remained in charge of the Diocese as Archbishop until the day
of his death, 9 August 1962.

On 28 March 1963, having been elected by the Archbishop Election Committee, the Right
Rev’d Philip Nigel Warrington Strong, Bishop of New Guinea, was enthroned in St John’s 
Cathedral, Brisbane. He resigned on 30 June 1970.

On 10 July 1970, the Rev’d Canon Frank William Coaldrake, Chairman of the Australian
Board of Missions, was elected to be the Archbishop of Brisbane. Unfortunately, he died
suddenly on 22 July 1970 before he could be consecrated or enthroned.

On 17 October 1970, having been elected by the Archbishop Election Committee, the
Right Rev’d Dr Felix Raymond Arnott, Bishop Coadjutor of Melbourne, was enthroned in 
St John’s Cathedral, Brisbane. He resigned on 31 July 1980.

On 15th November 1980, having been elected by the Archbishop Election Committee,
the Right Rev’d John Basil Rowland Grindrod, Bishop of Rockhampton, was enthroned 
in St John’s Cathedral, Brisbane.

His resignation took effect from  4 December 1989.

On 22 March 1990, having been elected by the Archbishop Election Committee, the Right
Reverend Peter John Hollingworth, Bishop of the Inner City of Melbourne, was enthroned
in St John’s Cathedral, Brisbane. His resignation became effective from 25 June 2001.

On 2 February 2002, having been elected by the Archbishop Election Committee, the
Right Rev’d Dr Phillip John Aspinall, Assistant Bishop of Adelaide, was installed in St 
John’s Cathedral, Brisbane.
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St John’s Cathedral, Brisbane 

The Cathedral Church of St John the Evangelist is one of the great works of architecture 
stemming from the Victorian neo-gothic revival of the 19th Century.  

The design, by eminent English architect John Loughborough Pearson, is a mixture of 
French and Early English neo-Gothic style, with many features reminiscent of Norman 
cathedrals in Caen and Coutances. Pearson had already designed a new cathedral for 
Truro in Cornwall, where he concentrated principally on English Gothic style, but for this 
building he planned a polygonal apse at the east end, and a double-aisled nave, providing 
a processional ambulatory around the central worship space. 

The sexpartite ribs of the vault, rising from the major and minor piers of the nave and 
chancel give a unified sense of space and grace, with elegance of form and proportion. 
It is understood that this is the most extensive stone vault in the southern hemisphere. 

The pillars which form such a notable feature of the cathedral are marvellously varied in 
form and scale – from the solid Romanesque piers of the southern chapels and the 
graceful columns of the nave and chancel, to the massive piers of the crossing, and the 
elegant columns in the Lady Chapel. 

The outer walls of the cathedral are of pink porphyry from the O’Connell Town quarry in 
Windsor, four kilometres from Brisbane. The interior stone in varying shades of creamy 
brown is sandstone from Helidon, near Toowoomba. The external window dressings of 
the first stage were of stone from the Pyrmont quarries in Sydney, New South Wales, 
while those of the later stages are also from the Helidon quarries in Queensland. 

The Lady Chapel and the Southern Chapels form delightful intimate spaces for smaller 
services and private prayer, and their different character is emphasised by the differing 
treatments – the Lady Chapel (originally intended as a Children’s Chapel) is designed
with a calculated lightness and grace which makes it at once a place to which children 
can relate without being over-awed. The children of the Diocese contributed towards the 
cost of this chapel, placing in the offertory at the Consecration Ceremony, gifts in 
specially-made silken purses. The Southern Chapels, with the solid Romanesque piers 
remind one of many a parish church with a side aisle (indeed the reference to the previous 
St John’s in George Street, may be deliberate).

The High Altar is somewhat Byzantine in style with contrasting coloured marbles, and 
inlaid glass mosaics. The central panel of the front is made of quartz and agate. The 
rounded pillars are green Cornish marble, and the Altar is inlaid with alabaster, and green 
quartz in the side panels. The mensa (table top) is made of three slabs of grey-green 
marble from Iona (the traditional birthplace of British Christianity). The Altar is a memorial 
to Bishop Webber, whose inspiration led to the building of the cathedral. His body rests 
beneath the Altar, having been translated from the Toowong cemetery in 1910. 
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Pearson’s original design included an impressive baldachino (canopy) supported by four 
columns above the High Altar (similar to that he had designed for Peterborough 
Cathedral). The floor has been specially strengthened to carry the additional weight. 

The Pulpit, carved from Cornish soapstone, was imported from England and features a 
carved panel depicting Christ teaching the people. 

The Font, of grey black marble, rests on columns of Frosterley marble in which can be 
seen interesting fossils. 

The carved Choir Stalls in the chancel were designed by Frank Pearson (John Pearson’s 
son), and the initial sections were carved in Burmese teak, by Luscombes of Exeter. The 
carving of the remainder of the stalls was continued by Colin Blumson, one of Australia’s
first Churchill fellows, and completed in 1992. 

The canopies on the north side of the choir contain representations of British saints, 
Alban, Patrick, Ninian and David, together with patron saints associated with diocesan 
schools. On the south side, are represented King George V and Queen Mary, together 
with founding Bishops of Australia and the province of Queensland. 

The pipe organ, built by Messrs Norman and Beard in 1910, was rebuilt and enlarged in 
1969-72 by Messrs Hill, Norman and Beard. The carved organ case of the north transept, 
designed by Frank Pearson, was donated by Herbert Jones in commemoration of the 
centenary of the City of Brisbane 1824-1924. At the time of the rebuild in 1972, carved 
wooden screens were provided for the Swell organ facing into the Chancel — these latter 
being designed by Arnold Conrad and executed by Colin Blumson, featuring a pair of 
ringtail possums in the middle of the screen. 

The stained glass ranges from imported English glass of the early 20th Century (such as 
the great Wheel Window of the north transept, designed by Frank Pearson and executed 
by Burlisson and Grylls), through Australian designs by William Bustard to the more 
recent modern glass of the clerestory and nave by David Saunders and Glenn Mack, 
stained glass artists with a deep sense of spiritual vocation. 

The completed cathedral is 79.2m long. The width of the nave is 10.6m, the outer aisles 
9.6m, and the transepts 8m. The height of the ceiling vault is 18.2m. 

Construction History 

The first Church of St John 1843-1854 stood on the corner of what is now Queen Street 
and North Quay. St John’s church was then moved to a new site between William, George
and Elizabeth Streets and the old building was used for a while as a school and also as 
the Brisbane Volunteer Fire Station. This Church was built in 1850-54 to a design by E.T. 
Blacket.  

There were three stages to the building of the second St John, the first beginning with the 
laying of the foundation stone when a portion of the William Street nave was built; the 
second, when this was extended by the length of two bays, and the third when a duplicate 
nave with chancel were added. The Church was dedicated to St John the Evangelist by 
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Bishop Tyrrell on 29 October 1854. St John’s remained the parish church of Brisbane 
until it became the pro-cathedral of the Diocese of Brisbane. The enthronement of Bishop 
Tufnell on 4 September 1860 gave a new status to the little St John’s Church as pro-
cathedral for the Diocese of Brisbane.  
 
In 1876, a peal of eight bells was installed in a wooden tower at the original site of St 
John’s Church in William Street. However they were housed in a timber belfry which only 
allowed them to be chimed not rung. This remained the case when the bells were 
transferred to the present cathedral site in 1906 and housed in a temporary timber bell 
tower. 
 
In 1879-1880 the school was built. The last service in the second St John’s was held on 
7 August 1904. In that same year St Luke’s Church in Charlotte Street was opened and 
dedicated to serve as the pro-cathedral until the new Cathedral was built.  
 
The new cathedral was designed John Loughborough Pearson for his friend William 
Webber who had been appointed third Bishop of Brisbane in 1885. Bishop Webber 
promoted the idea of replacing the old church with a cathedral and he and John Pearson 
discussed plans for the cathedral in 1886. In September of that year, at his inaugural 
address to the Diocese, the Bishop reported that the Diocesan Council had agreed to 
invite Pearson to prepare the design. He commented: “Thus our citizens will see that we 
aim at giving to Brisbane nothing less than the best which highest modern art can 
produce.” 
 
Pearson’s plans were approved in April 1889, although there were no resources in hand 
to attempt the commencement of such a grand project in the fledgling colony. The pro-
cathedral site in William Street was clearly inadequate, and in 1899 an alternative site 
between Adelaide and Ann Streets at the northern entrance to the city was purchased, 
and a site plan was produced in 1900. 
  
Construction work on St John's Cathedral commenced with the laying of the Foundation 
Stone on 22 May 1901 by the Duke of Cornwall and York (later King George V), on his 
way home from the opening of the first Federal Australian Parliament in Melbourne. It is 
located on the north side of the sanctuary, beside the altar rail, and can be seen from the 
ambulatory. 
 
In 1904, the old St John’s in Queen’s Park was demolished and much of the material was 
used in the construction of the St John’s Day School (now known as Webber House).  
 
The building of the Cathedral commenced on 22 April 1906. The first stage of the 
cathedral was built between 1906 and 1910 and consecrated on the Feasts of Saints 
Simon and Jude (28 October) 1910; it comprised the polygonal end (the east end), 
sanctuary and chancel, the side chapels, transepts and first bay of the nave. The organ, 
the pulpit and the rose window were in position in time for the Consecration of the 
Cathedral.  
 
By the time the building commenced in 1906, both the architect John Pearson and the 
motivating Bishop Webber had died and the design development had passed to 
Pearson’s architect son Frank Loughborough Pearson. He was never able to visit the 
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site. The contractor for the first stage of building was Peter Rodger of Ballarat, Victoria. 
Care has been taken to remain faithful to Pearson’s concept and designs. The original 
plan envisaged a cathedral which would cost some £100,000 (and at that time the colony 
numbered some 100,000 inhabitants). It was a very grandiose scheme for its time. The 
first stage of the building (about one-third of its bulk) was commenced in 1906 and 
completed in 1910, at a cost of some £37,000. 
 
The clergy stalls were installed in June 1913. The sounding board over the pulpit was not 
installed until September 1916.  
 
In 1944, it was resolved to make the completion of St John's Cathedral the Diocesan War 
Memorial. On 24 October 1946 an appeal was launched. On 15 July 1947 Field Marshall 
Viscount Montgomery of Alamein laid the corner stone (known as the Stone of 
Remembrance) of the extensions.  
  
On Sunday 21 August 1955, the first sod was turned by His Excellency the Governor-
General of Australia (Sir William Slim).  
 
A Start of Building Service was celebrated on 21 November 1965 and work resumed. On 
27 May 1968 HRH Prince Philip unveiled a stone in the new portion commemorating the 
completion of the masonry. The two bay extensions (1964-68) were completed and 
consecrated on Friday 22 November 1968. On the advice of structural engineers, added 
strength was given to the structure by incorporating within the piers a core of steel. 
 
In 1988, two bells were added to the peal as a Bicentennial gift from the Friends of the 
Cathedral and the Cathedral Gift Shop, and the 10 bells were transferred to a steel frame 
intended to be the skeleton of the north west tower. Here they could be rung full circle, 
but only with a fair degree of difficulty because of excessive movement in the tower. In 
2004 they were rehung in their final resting place above the nave crossing as Pearson 
intended, where they can be rung in full circle without compromise.  
 
The final stage of construction to complete the cathedral commenced in 1989. Peter Dare 
of Exeter was appointed the master mason in the same year. After a time he also took 
over the role of construction manager, and has overseen the completion of the nave and 
the west end of the Cathedral.  
 
Work took place on the south-west porch between June 1989 and 1990, and continued 
with construction of the fourth bay of the nave and the western front. The western front 
was opened in December 2006. Work then commenced on the construction of the 
western towers.  
 
In 2000 the first stained glass window was installed in the West end; this commemorated 
Australian-United States of America comradeship during World War II; it was executed 
by Glenn Mack of Victoria. 
  
In early 2000 a public competition was held for the design of the major window in the west 
front, known as the Millennium window. The design submitted by Scott Maxwell on the 
theme of “creation” was accepted by the Cathedral Chapter and executed by Warwick 
Blair of Brisbane.  
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In mid 2000 work on the Cathedral, which had been previously supervised by Conrad & 
Gargett Pty Ltd, was transferred to architect Michael Kennedy because of his expertise 
in conservation architecture. The Cathedral Chapter at the same time established its own 
CAD drawing office and appointed an architectural draftsman to facilitate issues of 
drawing and cutting profiles for the computed directed wire saw used to produce stone 
for the building. John Phillips R.I.B.A. of London acted as a consultant architect to the 
project until his death in 2006. 

In late 2006, Peter Dare returned to England. He remained a consultant to the project, 
but the role of construction manager has passed to Terry McCallum. Cliff Lawrence was 
the foreman mason in charge of stone work. 

The western spires were raised on the 1 March 2008 and the central spire on the 11 
November 2008, complete with the installation of the last two bells. Both days received 
wide, national media coverage and were an historic achievement. This marked the end 
of the construction of the cathedral. The cost of the final stage of cathedral construction 
was $39.2m.  

The West Windows were installed in March 2009 (a public competition for the design was 
held and was won by Mr Glenn Mack). The exciting design centers on the theme of the ‘I
am’ saying from St John’s gospel, and includes symbolism which captures the desire to 
enter into dialogue with other faiths and the world of science. The Catholic Archdiocese 
(who celebrated 150 years of the Catholic Archdiocese in Brisbane in 2009) donated a 
pair of windows as their gift to us on the sesquicentenary of the Anglican Diocese of 
Brisbane. We also have a window commemorating the 150th anniversary of the Anglican 
Diocese of Brisbane as well as the State of Queensland.  

The Cathedral was consecrated by the Most Reverend Dr Phillip Aspinall on 29 October 
2009, in an extremely moving and powerful liturgy. Music was provided by the cathedral 
Choir, the Camerata of St John’s and the Brisbane Chamber Choir. The service was 
attended by over 50 bishops, former Archbishops, Deans of the Cathedral, ecumenical 
friends and political figures. The preacher was the Very Rev’d David Richardson
(Archbishop of Canterbury’s Representative to the Holy See and Director of the Anglican 
Centre in Rome). The Service incorporated a welcome by the traditional owners, a 
didgeridoo player and dancing the Gospel by representatives of the Torres Strait Islander 
group. A DVD of the Service was made and distributed at the end of the year.  

It was fitting that we were able to consecrate the cathedral in the sesquicentenary year 
of both the State of Queensland and the Anglican Diocese of Brisbane. 

The consecration dinner took place the following evening 30 October and was another 
successful event with a wonderful musical content. 

Plans to develop the northern precinct in sympathy with Pearson’s vision continued during 
2009. Permission was sought from the Brisbane City Council to amend our successful 
development application to allow for staging the project, i.e. stage one is to refurbish St 
Martin’s, Webber and Church Houses for office accommodation and build the three-story 
annexe behind Webber House and stage two is constructing the car park. We await the 
outcome of discussions. 
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Cathedral Coin Collection 

In 2010, a donor, who wishes to remain anonymous, donated an extensive collection of 
ancient coins to St John’s Cathedral. Some coins in the collection date back to the time 
of Christ. Jack Barnes made a secure showcase for the coins that are on public display 
near the southern chapels. The core collection is supplemented by the temporary addition 
of coins and other items of interest that refer to a specific event.  

Northern Precinct Development 

Plans for the construction of an extension to Webber House firmed as 2011 progressed. 
Groundbreaking ceremonies were conducted by the Dean for the cathedral 
congregations on 24 July, and by the Archbishop for staff on 7 September. Hutchinson’s
Builders commenced work on Monday 28 November. Work was completed in 2012, 
allowing for many of the diocesan services to be co-located in the Cathedral grounds and 
allowing for the centralizing of functions for the diocese and the cathedral.  

After consideration, chapter named the site St John’s Cathedral Precinct. Chapter wished 
to create a welcoming environment not only for staff, but also for all visitors to the 
cathedral and precinct. Both Webber House and the annexe are known as Webber 
House. 

A blessing of Webber House and the commissioning of the people of St John’s Cathedral
Precinct was conducted by the Archbishop on 4 October 2012. 

Refurbishment of St Martin’s House commenced in early November 2012, and was 
completed during 2013 by Hutchinson’s Builders. During the work extensive termite 
damage was identified and treated. There will be ongoing work in order to avoid future 
infestations. The public toilet block was also refurbished. 

Stage two, the development of the cloisters and the construction of a car park remains 
on the table and will only proceed at a time when sufficient funds are available. Parking 
on site is increasingly problematic and visitors are encouraged to take public transport. 

CCTV 

Before the G20 was held in November 2014, the cathedral team carried out a security 
audit of the cathedral and precinct. This led to the upgrading of our security cameras. 
These are also used liturgically.  

As a result of the upgrade we now have the capacity to live-stream liturgies and other 
cathedral events. The bells and bell ringers can also now be observed from screens 
placed in the nave. 
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BHP Billiton Building,  

380 Queen St – Grocon Constructions 

Grocon, the builders, and Nexus, the owners, opened this building mid-2015. Aspects of 
the building are in sympathy with the cathedral such as the building being designed to 
reflect the porphyry and sandstone of the cathedral.  
 
Hobbs Park is located in the building and was named by the Right Honourable Graham 
Quirk, Lord Mayor of Brisbane on 12 March 2015. There are plans to construct a 
pedestrian bridge connecting Hobbs Park to the east end of the cathedral, thus 
establishing a connection between the Brisbane River and historic Adelaide House (The 
Deanery). A pedestrian bridge will be a great benefit attracting people to St John’s 
Precinct. The cathedral and 380 Queen Street management have a very good ongoing 
working relationship. 

Storm 27 November 2014 – Precinct Damage 

On 27 November 2014, a ferocious storm cell hit Brisbane causing extensive damage to 
St John’s Precinct. 
 
All buildings on the site sustained substantial damage to roofs and windows. The 
cathedral suffered large amounts of water ingress which affected the organ and other 
areas. Fortunately the damage was covered by insurance. The repair works cost a total 
of $6m and continue into 2018. Work undertaken included: replacement of roof tiles on 
the cathedral, St Martin’s House, Webber House and Church House, replacement of the 
copper sheeting on the western towers and the central tower, replacement of the 
cathedral lighting control system and external lighting. Replacement of roofing on the 
Deanery and Webber House annexe, installation of new stainless steel box guttering and 
13 new dormer vents around the ambulatory roof of the cathedral. The chapels sustained 
water damage during the storm. As a result the chapels floor underwent restoration work 
in 2015 and 2016, the carpets were removed and the floors polished. This work 
dramatically improved the acoustics in these chapels. Extensive repair work was carried 
out on the organ and was completed in 2018.  
  
The Lady Chapel and southern chapels also sustained water damage following the storm 
on 27 November 2014. As a result the chapels underwent floor restoration work in 2015 
and 2016, the carpets were removed and the floors polished. This work dramatically 
improved the acoustics in these chapels.  

Cathedral Stained Glass Windows 

Post-storm, the upper ambulatory windows on the east end of the cathedral have been 
repaired and cleaned, protective glass was installed to prevent future damage. The 
protective glass was not covered by storm damage insurance.  
 
The seven lower ambulatory windows (Bustard Windows) were taken out, restored and 
replaced. Again, protective glass was installed. This work was not covered by storm 
damage insurance but was undertaken to utilise the scaffolding that was erected for storm 
damage repair work.  
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The repair work on the remainder of the stained glass window on the eastern side of the 
cathedral was completed in 2017. 

Church House Refurbishment 

In August 2016, refurbishment work on Church House commenced and was completed 
in December 2016. NPS Commercial was the contractor. Church House is now back to 
its original state. The building has been totally rewired, painted, recarpeted, reglazed and 
new air conditioning installed. The main entrance is now at the southern face of the 
building and allows for disabled access. 

During 2017, the diocesan archives moved into the ground floor of Church House and the 
Anglican Schools Office moved into the upper floor. 

Tapestry Cushions from the Lady Chapel 

The collection of 400 cushions was cleaned and restored in 2015, and catalogued in 
2016. The cushions are currently being displayed in the glass cabinet in the northern 
transept. A new lighting system was installed in the display cabinet to highlight the 
cushions. The display changes monthly. 

Refurbishment of Blessed Sacrament Chapel 

In 2015, Jack Barnes was commissioned to craft a new tabernacle for the Blessed 
Sacrament Chapel and to restore the altar. The tabernacle is now in place and enhances 
this space. In 2017, Jack Barnes developed a proposal to further enhance the altar. A 
faculty for the work has been granted and Jack Barnes commenced work in 2018. The 
altar piece is due for completion by Christmas 2018.  

West End Statues 

The first three statues were installed in their niches on the west end of the cathedral on 
28 January 2015. The Christ: Holy Wisdom; John the Baptiser; and Mary Magdalene were 
the first of the series of 13 statues to be lifted into place. Statues in the west end are part 
of Pearson’s plan for the cathedral. The statues are being carved by Dr Rhyl Hinwood 
AM, as funds are available and will be lifted in sets of three. Funds to complete all the 
statues were received in 2018.  

Mary, Mother of Jesus and Joseph of Nazareth; Lazarus of Bethany, Mary of Bethany 
and Martha of Bethany; and James and John the Evangelist were dedicated on 6 May 
2016. 

On 29 November 2017, Matthias & Judas Iscariot; Peter & Paul; Luke & Matthew and
Thomas & Mark were blessed by the Archbishop. The lifting of the statues into their niches 
was delayed until 15 December due to wet weather. 
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James the Just & Bartholomew and Jude & Simon have been carved and in late 2018, 
Dr Rhyl Hinwood AM was carving the last statue, Phillip & Andrew. These will be raised 
into place in early 2019. This will complete the project. 

Oratory Floor 

The designs for the oratory (the space left vacant when the font was moved to the west 
end) floor and for the associated furniture have now been finalised. The project will be 
funded through a bequest from Dianna and Elizabeth Luker. Jack Barnes was 
commissioned to construct the mosaic floor in 2018, which he will commence when the 
Blessed Sacrament Chapel work is finished. This project is due for completion in 
readiness for the 10th anniversary of the consecration of the cathedral in October 2019.  

Cathedral Sound System 

As reported in previous years, the cathedral’s 10 year old sound system was problematic 
and in need of a complete overhaul. After much consideration Chapter commissioned 
Brisbane Sound to install a Dante mixing console and processor, 38 speaker system that 
is zoned so that sound can be in the whole cathedral or directed to particular areas thus 
giving flexibility for different worship, liturgies, groups and concerts.  

The project was challenging as St John’s Cathedral had a sound delay of six seconds, 
the usual sound delay is 1-1.5 seconds. Another challenge was to install aesthetically 
pleasing speakers and cabling and this was achieved.  

The first large service when the sound system was used was the Ordination of Priests 
and Deacons on 2 December 2017, with approximately 1,150 people in attendance. The 
sound was excellent.  

Queens & Regimental Colours & Guidons Display Project 

Discussions were initiated last 2016 with Steve Taubert, author of Preserving our Proud 
Heritage, to preserve and display the damaged guidons and regimental colours which at 
present are stored in St Martin’s House. Steve has offered to be the champion for the 
project and will coordinate grant applications etc. This project is ongoing. 

Brisbane City Council’s City Centre Neighbourhood Plan 

The Brisbane City Council revised City Centre Neighbourhood Plan outcomes were good 
for St John’s Cathedral as the Brisbane City Council was sympathetic to maintaining the 
sightlines to the cathedral including views from Cathedral Square. Chapter was pleased 
with this outcome.  

HRH The Duke of York, KG – Visit to the Cathedral 2017 

On 24 September 2017, HRH, The Duke of York, KG (Prince Andrew) and the Governor 
of Queensland, His Excellency the Hon Paul de Jersey AC attended the 9.30am Service 
and each did a reading.  
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New Vestments 

Chapter purchased new blue vestments which were used during Advent 2017, and were 
well received. New white vestments were also ordered. The Dorcus Guild will work on 
embroidering designs on the vestments.  

The Ministry of Laying on of Hands 

with Prayer & Anointing 

Conversations were held with the cathedral community and this ministry was offered on 
the first Sunday of each month after the 9.30am Service from 4 February 2018.  

Supplicants were invited to move to the Lady Chapel after receiving communion. There 
was significant demand for the ministry. The feedback has been very positive. The use 
of the High Altar for the 9.30am Service was reintroduced, also for the first Sunday of 
each month.  

St John's Cathedral Girls’ Choir 

The Girls’ Choir was introduced mid-2018 and is going very well. 

Cathedral Doors 

The north west and north east doors of the cathedral were cleaned and restored in 2018. 
The hinges and steel work has been cleaned, recoated and realigned.  

Death of Mr Ken Addison 

Chapter marked with sadness the death of Mr Ken Addison who was very active in the 
diocese over many years. Ken also had a real love of the cathedral and a wealth of 
knowledge, as demonstrated in his publication “Historical and Archives Notes” on the
cathedral which has been a much needed and often referred to resource at the cathedral 
ever since.  

Ken carefully managed the diocesan finances as treasurer and the cathedral finances as 
a member of the building sub-committee of chapter which was set up to oversee the final 
stages of construction of the cathedral, his knowledge and expertise were put to good 
use in this role. Ken’s son, Bruce, was a chorister at the cathedral.  

Ken was awarded an OAM in the Queen’s Birthday Honours 2018, just before his death. 
Ken was a good and faithful servant, a quiet achiever. 

Mr Michael Dodson 

In late 2017, Michael retired from the cathedral after 42 years as Verger/Groundsman. In 
late 2018, Michael was diagnosed with oesophagus cancer which spread to other organs. 
His prognosis is not good and he is expected to live until the end of the year.  

19



Queensland Government Anzac Centenary Grant 

During 2018, Chapter successfully applied for a Queensland Government Anzac 
Centenary Grant our application has been successful. Chapter published a booklet, St
John's Cathedral and the Anzac Legend” which was launched on 19 December 2018. 
The booklet is on the military of memorabilia in the Cathedral including the ANZAC flag 
which hangs in the Southern Chapels. It has been established that the flag in our 
possession was the last flag Allied to fly at ANZAC Cove. 

Choir Reunion 

This was a well-attended event with former choristers gathering together to rehearse 
before dinner, then Evensong followed by a party. One man was a chorister in 1949.  

Adelaide House (The Deanery) Balcony 

In 2018, Chapter was successful in obtaining a grant of $50,000 from the Community 
Sustainability Action Grants, Heritage Conservation to restore the balcony of the Deanery 
to its original state. The total cost of the work is $110,000 and further application has been 
made to the National Trust for an appeal to fund the shortfall. The initial work is on hold 
until we receive the funding shortfall. Jack Barnes is undertaking the work and Ivan 
McDonald is the Heritage Architect overseeing the project. Adelaide House is a significant 
building in the history of Queensland as the balcony was where the declaration of 
Queensland as a separate State from New South Wales was declared in December 1859. 

National Trust Appeal – Adelaide House 

In November 2018, Chapter submitted a National Trust Heritage Appeal Application for 
restoration work to Adelaide House. It is hoped that Chapter will be successful in obtaining 
funding to refurbish the entire Deanery. 

National Trust Appeal – Cathedral Completion Program 

and Cathedral Restoration & Repair 

In November 2018, Chapter submitted a National Trust Heritage Appeal Application to 
combine completion and maintenance of the cathedral. Chapter hopes this Application is 
successful and the Appeal will be called, Cathedral Completion Program and Cathedral
Restoration & Repair.
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Diocese of Brisbane 2018 

St Martin’s House, 373 Ann Street, Brisbane, 4000
GPO Box 421, Brisbane, 4001  Tel 3835 2222 Fax 3831 1170

Web www.anglicanchurchsq.org.au  Email gmoffice@anglicanchurchsq.org.au

Archbishop 
The Most Reverend Dr PJ Aspinall

B.Sc, Grad.Dip.R.E, B.D.(Hons), PhD, M.BA

Assistant Bishops
The Right Reverend JD Greaves, KSJ, BTh (Northern Region)

The Right Reverend CD Venables, BA (Hons), BTh (Western Region)
The Right Reverend AJ Roundhill, MA (Hons), BTh (Hons) (Southern Region)

Dean 
The Very Rev’d Dr PC Catt, B.Sc, B.D, PhD

Archdeacons 

Brisbane The Venerable OE Anderson
BA (Hons), Grad.Dip.Counselling

Burnett The Venerable KM Dean-Jones
OGS, BA Dip.Ed., ThL.(Hons)

Sunshine Coast The Venerable JC Worrall
BTh, Grad Dip Min, M.Min

Lilley The Venerable CD Johnson (Resigned Feb 2019)
BTh, M.Min

Moreton The Venerable DR Ferguson
BTh. MMin.

Oxley The Venerable MAJ Faragher
BMus (Hons), MMus, MEd, FTCL, GradDipTheol, ipAngOrd.

Gold Coast The Venerable VA Hoare
MTh. BA., Grad.Dip. Sp.Ed., Grad DipTh., Cert.Tchg

The West Vacant

The Downs The Venerable MD Carlyon
B.Bus, BA

Cunningham Vacant

Archbishop’s special licence for hearing  
confessions concerning child sexual abuse
The Venerable OE Anderson
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Archbishop’s Chaplains (Examining) 

B.Th.
M.Ed., B.Th., Dip.Lit.Stud., MAICD

B.Th, Grad.Dip.Arts (R.Ed),
MR.Ed.tssf
BA, GradDipEd(Sec), MTh,
MEdLeadership
BA(Hons), M.Ed.
BA, Grad.Dip.Psych., Grad.Dip.Min.,
MAPS
M.Ed.St., B.Ed., Dip.Th.
BA (Hons), B.Th., M.A.P.S., DHSc

BE, PhD
BA(Nat.Sc.Camb), Ph.D. (Agr.) 
(UWI), M.Pub.Ad. (UQ)
DipHlthSci (Couns), GradCert GT 
(Gestalt Therapy) 
B.Th.
B.Th., Grad.Dip.Min.
Th.L.
B.Ed., B.Th., Grad.Dip.Comp.Ed.,
Cert.Tchg.
M.Ec., B.Fin.Admin., B.Th., Dip.Min.
B.Th.

The Rev’d F Andrews
The Rev’d DG Campbell (Bro Donald, SSF) 
Mrs D Coffey
The Rev’d R Clifton

The Rev’d Canon N Colledge 

Mrs J Dyke
The Rev’d Canon M Florence

Mr D Green
The Rev’d Canon Dr MA Harvey
(Resigned 2018) 
The Rev’d KL Lewis
Dr R Manfield
Dr R McFadyen

Ms J Mychajlyk

The Rev’d LA Raymond 
The Rev’d G Shaw 
The Rev’d AG Shephard
The Rev’d K Spreadborough

The Rev’d M Uptin 
The Rev’d NK Whereat 
Mrs H Walker
The Rev’d Dr G Warren MB, BS, FRANZCR, M.MED Sc. 

BTh.

Chancellor 
The Hon Justice DA Mullins
B Com, LLB (Hons), LLM (Adv)

Deputy Chancellor 
The Hon Justice D Thomas
B.Com, LLB (Hons)

Archivist 
Mr M Rogers

Chairman of Committees
The Rev’d Canon GF Harch

Director of Professional 
Standards 
Mr G Milles BA, BLLB

General Manager, 
Diocesan Registrar and 
Secretary 
Mr TC Reid
B.Com., LL.B. Grad Cert
Mgt

Auditors 
Ernst & Young
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The Cathedral Church of St John
The Evangelist, Brisbane 

Cathedral Office: St Martin’s House, 373 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000 
GPO Box 421, Brisbane 4001 Tel 3835 2231 Fax 3832 3173

B.Sc, Grad.Dip.RE, BD(Hons), PhD, MBA

B.Sc, BD, Ph.D

BA, Dip.Ed, PhD
BA (Hons), BTh. MAPS, DHSc
B.Surv, BA
B App Sc, Grad Dip Ed, Grad Dip Th
B.Th; Grad Cert Mental Health; M.Ed
Grad.Dip. Ex.Children; Grad.Dip Sp. Ed; Dip.
Sec. Teaching
M. Prof.Comm, BD

BTh
BA (Hons), ThL (Hons.), BD (Hons.), D Min
B.Th., Grad. Dip. Pastoral Counselling, Cert.
Min.
C.St.B., BA,Th.Dip
BTh, Cert Ed Min, EHCC, CPE, M.Couns

B Com, LLB (Hons), LLM (Adv) (Chancellor)

Dip.Tchg. BA (Hist.), Grad.Cert. Ed., BTh

BE (Hons), MEngSc, GCertM, MSc, BTh

Archbishop 
The Most Reverend Dr PJ Aspinall

Dean 
The Very Reverend Dr PC Catt

Residentiary Canons
The Rev’d Canon Dr MJ Free
The Rev’d Canon Dr MA Harvey 
The Rev’d Canon GF Harch
The Rev’d Canon SP Leisemann 
The Rev’d Canon CA Selvage

The Rev’d Canon R Tutin

Honorary Canons
The Rev’d Canon B W Boase
The Rev’d Canon Dr RG Bowles 
The Rev’d Canon EF Crossman

The Rev’d Canon RG Martin
The Rev’d LM McWilliam

Lay Members of Chapter 
The Honourable Justice DA Mullins 
Lay Canon S Bain
Lay Canon Dr C Gourlay
Lay Canon R King
Lay Canon Dr H Lancaster
Lay Canon Dr R Manfield
Lay Canon J Postle
Lay Canon T Weder
Lay Canon H Wootton 

Assistant Priest
The Rev’d SL Wilton 

Assistant Curate 
The Rev’d BF Pagram 

Honorary Deacon 
The Rev’d Dr A Solari Grad Dip Th, MB ChB (Bristol), Dip. GP 

(Monash) 
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Chapter Clerk 
Mr TC Reid   B B.Com. LL.B. Grad Cert Mgt 

 
Director of Music  
Mr G Morton  
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Mr A Kouznetsov 
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Officers of the Synod 

President 
The Most Rev’d Dr Phillip 
Aspinall, Archbishop of Brisbane 

Chancellor 
The Hon Justice DA 
Mullins 

Deputy Chancellor 
The Hon Justice D 
Thomas 

Secretaries  
The Rev’d Canon S Leisemann Mr A Thomson 

Chair of Committees 
Mrs K Lauchland 
General Manager & 
Diocesan Registrar 
Secretary of  
Diocesan Council 
Mr T C Reid 

Diocesan Council 

The Most Reverend the 
Archbishop of Brisbane (Chair) 

Ex-officio members 
The Assistant Bishops: 
The Rt Rev’d JD Greaves KSJ 
The Rt Rev’d AJ Roundhill 
The Rt Rev’d CD Venables 

Ex-officio members 
The Hon Justice DA 
Mullins (Chancellor)  

Elected members  
The Rev’d Canon GF Harch 
The Rev’d G Hoyte 
The Rev’d A Lowe  
The Rev’d G Moses 
The Ven JC Worrall 

Elected members 
Dr G Dashwood  
Mrs J Dyke 
Dr RS Kerr OAM 
Mr D O’Connor 
Mr D Sneesby  

Diocesan Leadership Team 

The Most Rev’d Dr PJ Aspinall 
Archbishop of Brisbane 
The Rt Rev’d JD Greaves  
The Rt Rev’d AJ Roundhill 
The Rt Rev’d CD Venables
The Rt Rev'd Dr JC Holland

Ms K Crouch 
Dr S Harrison 
Ms S Long 
Ms S Molloy 
Mr TC Reid 
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Legal Committee 

Mr R Dennings 
Ms M Fraser  
Prof R Mortensen 
The Hon Justice D A 
Mullins  
Mr D O’Connor (Chair) 
Ms A Rae 
Ms V Rajanayagam 
The Hon Justice D 
Thomas 

Diocesan Audit & Risk Committee 

The Rev’d Canon GF Harch 
(Resigned 2018) 
The Rev’d G Moses 

Mr G Brady 
Mr A Dann  
(Resigned 2018) 
Mr C Hutley 
Dr R Kerr 
Dr J Smeed 
Mr D Sneesby (Chair) 

Professional Standards Board 

The Rev’d N Canon Colledge 
The Rev’d Canon Dr M Free 
The Rev’d G March
The Rev’d P Mitchell

Mr P Dunning QC  
(Deputy President) 
Mr J Fradgley 
Ms A Jones  
Dr S Lee 
Mr D Murphy QC 
Dr A Quayle 
The Hon Justice D 
Thomas (President) 

Professional Standards Committee 

The Rev’d DM Murphy 
The Rev’d K Pitman 

Professor R Bland 
(Convenor)  
Dr Y Darlington 
Ms K Volk 
Ms E Wilson, QC 

29



Cathedral Chapter 

The Most Rev’d Dr PJ 
Aspinall, Archbishop of 
Brisbane 
The Very Rev’d Dr PC Catt 
(Chair) 
The Rev’d Canon Dr MJ Free 
The Rev’d Canon GF Harch 
The Rev’d Canon Dr MA 
Harvey (Resigned 2018) 
The Rev’d Canon S 
Leisemann 
The Rev’d Canon C Selvage 
The Rev’d Canon R Tutin 

Canon S Bain  
Canon C Gourlay  
Canon R King 
Canon H Lancaster  
Canon R Manfield  
The Hon Justice DA 
Mullins (Chancellor) 
Canon J Postle  
Mr TC Reid  
(Chapter Clerk) 
Canon T Weder 
Canon H Wootton 

Committee of Elections & Qualifications 

The Hon Justice DA Mullins 
(Chancellor) 

Archbishop Election Committee 

The Rt Rev’d JD Greaves 
The Rt Rev’d CD Venables 
The Rev’d Canon BW Boase  
The Very Rev’d Dr PC Catt 
The Rev’d Canon Dr MJ Free 
The Rev’d Canon GF Harch 
The Rev’d GM Hoyte 
The Rt Rev’d JC Holland 
The Rev’d AM Lowe 
The Rev’d G Moses 
The Rev’d Dr C Wynne 

Diocesan Nominators 

The Rev’d M Calder 
The Very Rev’d Dr PC 
Catt 

Reserve Nominators 
The Rev’d Dr J Inkpin 
The Rev’d L Johnson 
The Rev’d T Sparks 
The Rev’d M C Uptin 
The Rev’d J Worrall 

Mrs G Frankcom 
Mr A Gallimore 
Mr C Gehrmann 
Mrs J Haywood 
Ms B Holland-Leam 
Dr R Manfield 
The Hon Justice D Mullins 
The Hon Justice D Thomas 
Mr A Thomson 

Archbishop’s Appointment 
Ms R Elu 
Mr J Eustace 

Mr AJ Gallimore 

Reserve Nominators 
Mr C Gehrmann 
Mr G Sparks 
Mr A Thomson  
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Board of Enquiry under the Tribunal Canon 

The Rt Rev’d Dr J Holland 
The Rev’d GM Hoyte 

Archbishop’s Appointments 
Mr JI Fradgley (Chairman) 
Mr R Mason 
Mr F Perrin 
Mr G Windsor 

Panel of Triers under the Tribunal Canon 

(Chair vacant) 
The Rev’d G Moses 
The Rev’d Canon R Tutin 
The Rev’d J Van Den Bos 
The Rev’d Dr C Wynne 

Mrs B Briggs 
Mr A J Gallimore 
Ms B Holland-Leam 
Mr G Sparks 

Commissioners under the Benefices Avoidance Canon 

The Ven O Anderson 
The Rev’d S Crothers-
Robertson 
The Rev’d Canon R Tutin 

Mr C Gourlay 

Archbishop’s Appointment 
The Hon Justice D Thomas 

Provincial Council 

Provincial Council of the Province shall consist of its Metropolitan, its 
Registrar, its Chancellor and from each of its Dioceses, the Diocesan 
and one half of the number of clerical and lay people that it is entitled to 
have as members of Provincial Synod.  
The following are ex-officio members. The Most Reverend The 
Archbishop of Brisbane, Vacant (Provincial Chancellor), Mr TC Reid 
(Provincial Registrar).  
The Diocese of Brisbane is entitled to four clerical and four lay people as 
members of Provincial Council.  

The Rev’d Canon Dr M Free Mr A J Gallimore 
Dr R Kerr 
Dr R McFadyen 
Mr A Sauer 

Provincial Synod Representatives 

The Rev’d Canon B Boase  
The Rev’d Canon E Crossman 
The Rev’d Canon Dr M Free  
The Rev’d D Talbot  

Dr A Dashwood  
Mr A Gallimore  
Mr I Hamilton  
Dr R Kerr, OAM  
The Hon Justice D Mullins 
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General Synod 

The Rt Rev’d CD Venables 
The Rev’d MN Calder
The Very Rev’d Dr PC Catt 
The Rev’d Canon GF Harch 
The Rt Rev’d Dr JC Holland 
The Rev’d GM Hoyte 
The Rev’d AM Lowe 
The Rev’d GF Moses 
The Rev’d MC Uptin 
The Rev’d JC Woolner 

Mr D Aspinall 
Mr M Calder 
Mr A J Gallimore  
Mr CM Gourlay 
Mrs JA Haywood 
Dr S Kerr  
The Hon Justice DA Mullins 
Dr TM Nicholson 
Mr TC Reid  
Mr AAL Thomson 
Mr TA Van Den Bos 

Finance & Diocesan Services Commission (FDSC) 

The Most Rev’d Dr PJ Aspinall 
Archbishop of Brisbane 
The Rev’d S Perry 
The Rev’d P Shayler-Webb 
The Rev’d Canon GLD Smith 
The Rev’d D Talbot

Mr J Davies 
Ms D Houston-Jones 
Dr R Kerr OAM 
Ms S Long (ED FDSC) 
Mr D Porter (Chair) 
Mr F Prostamo 
(Resigned 2018) 
Emer Prof C Ryan 
Mr A Weder 
Mr G Windsor 
Mr B Wilson 

Diocesan Insurance Fund Board of Management (DIFBOM) 

Ministry Education Commission 

The Most Rev’d Dr PJ Aspinall 
Archbishop of Brisbane (Chair) 
The Rt Rev’d Dr JC Holland 
(Executive Director) 
The Rev’d Canon S Leisemann 

Dr A Dashwood 
Mr S Goakes 
Mr R Grimshaw 
Prof G Kearney 
Prof R Wolff 

The Rev’d K Bourke
The Rev’d SE Kjellgren 
The Rev’d MC Uptin 

Ms K Crouch  
Mr A Levick 
Ms S Long (Exec Dir FDSC) 
Mr C Ryan (FDSC) 
Mr A J Sauer OAM (Chair) 
(Resigned 2018)
Ms E Stannard 
Mr L Stephens 
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The Brookfield Advisory Group 

The Rt Rev’d Dr J Holland (Chair)
The Rt Rev’d RW Nolan 

Mrs V Binns (Secretary) 
Mrs J Brown 
Mrs N Dennington 
Ms H Eckersley 
Ms V Hasker 
Ms S Robertson 
Mr I Ross 
Mrs A Wilson (Caretaker/Admin) 

St John’s College Council 

The Most Rev’d Dr PJ Aspinall 
Archbishop of Brisbane 
The Rev’d Prof RC Wolff  

Mr JG Allpass 
Mr H Bonifant 
Dr A Campbell 
Ms K Charters 
Ms K Dixon 
Mr R Dunning AC 
Dr G Nimmo  
Mr J Peden QC (Chair) 
Mr S Roberts 
Dr J Williamson  
Prof S Derrington  

Anglican Schools Commission 

The Most Rev’d Dr PJ Aspinall,  
Archbishop of Brisbane 
The Rt Rev’d J Greaves (Chair) 

Ms S Bain 
Mrs S Larsen 
Dr R Law 
Ms S Molloy (ED) 
Mr T Reid (GM) 
Dr M Sly  
Dr J Smeed 

Anglican Church Grammar School Council 

The Rev’d Dr C Wynne** Dr A Campbell (Headmaster) 
Professor A Carroll 
Mr C Castrisos 
Mr B Downes  
Dr T Ford  
Mr D Gow  
Mr D O’Connor (Chair)* 
Mr M Williams 
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Cannon Hill Anglican College Council 

The Rev’d G March** 
The Rev’d D Petersen 

Ms T Adams  
Dr R Baird 
Mrs R Bell (Principal) 
Mr A Duvenage  
Mr P Gardiner  
Ms D Lang 
Mr A McCullough (Bursar 
& Company Secretary) 
Mr B Moy* 
Dr G Nicholson (Chair)  

Coomera Anglican College Council 

The Rev’d Canon G Smith Ms J Bartlett 
Mr A Gilbert 
The Hon M Keech 
Mr S Knott (Chair) 
Professor D Pendergast 
Mr G Powell* 
Ms P Roberts 
Dr M Sly (Principal) 
Mr M Temperton 

Forest Lake & Springfield Anglican Colleges Ltd (FSAC Ltd) 

Ms J Crombie 
Mr B Kelly (Resigned 2018) 
Ms S Molloy 
Mr T Reid (Chair) 
Mr S Scott 
Mr I Turner (Resigned 2018) 

Fraser Coast Anglican College Council 

Vacant** 
The Rev’d S Wilson 

Mr B Eaton (Chair) 
Ms K Kee 
Ms S Shaw 
Mrs L Sutton 
Mr J Wright (Principal) 

St Andrew’s Anglican College Council 

The Rev’d M Calder  
The Rev’d C Ivey (Principal) 

Ms R Cheales (Chair) 
Ms R Craven  
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Mr S Gamble  
Mr C Nancarrow 
Mr S Robson 
Mr D Ryan 
Dr S Simon 
Ms L Woodward** 

St Hilda’s School Council 

The Rev’d D Talbot** Mr M Beddoes 
Prof Mrs S Brandis 
(Chair & ASC Appointee)* 
Ms M Peterson (nee Dick) 
Mrs S Schleimer 
Mrs J Wilson-Reynolds 
(Head of School) 

St Luke’s Anglican School Council 

The Ven K Dean-Jones Mrs H Conradie (Chair) 
Ms T Dwyer 
Mr D Hart 
Mr C Merritt (Head) 
Mr D Newby 
Ms A Pafumi* 
Mr R Pozzan 
Mr D Reed (Business 
Manager) 
Mr M Story  
Mr T Wilkinson 

St Paul’s School Council 

The Rev’d Canon R Bowles 
The Rev’d L Johnson 

Mr D Barlow 
Mr D Brosnan 
Dr P Browning (Headmaster) 
Mr R Law (Chair)** 
Mr G O’Hara 
Mr M Sing 
Mrs C Sweeney  
(Finance Manager) 
Mr A van Zyl 
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The Glennie School Council 

Mrs K Cohen  
(Head of School) 
Dr A Dashwood * 
Mrs M Garner 
Mrs E Gillam (Chair) 
Mr M Norman 
Mrs K Venables 
Mr T Wright 

The Southport School Council 

The Rev’d H Reuss** Prof M Blumenstein  
Ms L McColl  
Dr C Mirakian* 
Dr A Paxton-Hall  
Mr N Quartermaine 
Mr F Perrin (Chair) 
Mr G Rix  
Mr N Sharpe 
Mr A Twemlow  
Mr G Wain (Headmaster) 

The Toowoomba Anglican College & Preparatory School Council

Mr K Drysdale 
Mr R Lawrence 
Mr S Lees (Head of School) 
Mr J Rawlings 
Mr H Rose (Chair) 

West Moreton Anglican College Council 

Mrs T Chilcott 
Mr M Flanderka 
Mrs V Gallinaro  
(Business Manager & 
Council Secretary) 
Dr C Hester 
Dr I Lupton (Chair) 
Mr G McLay (Principal) 
Wing Commander  
B Nanson 
Mr B Sackson 
Ms AM Troutman 
Dr A Ward 
Mr A West 
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Anglican Community Services Commission 

The Rt Rev’d CD Venables Mr G Brady 
Ms C Grant (Chair) 
Dr K Forrester 
Prof K Healy 
Mr A McNab 
Ms K Rayner 
Mr K Thomson 

Parishes & Other Mission Agencies Commission 

The Most Rev’d Dr PJ 
Aspinall, 
Archbishop of Brisbane (Chair) 
The Rt Rev’d J Greaves  
The Rt Rev’d AJ Roundhill 
The Rt Rev’d CD Venables  
The Ven O Anderson 
The Ven M Carlyon  
The Ven K Dean-Jones 
The Ven M Faragher 
The Ven D Ferguson 
 The Ven V Hoare  
The Ven C Johnson 
The Ven J Worrall 
The Ven R Winterton 
(Resigned 2018) 

Mr N Crisp 
Dr S Harrison 
Dr J Murray 
Dr C Raymont 
Mrs S Taylor 
Ms S Vigar 

The Hospital Ministry Steering Committee (Closed 2018) 

The Rev’d Canon C Selvage 
The Rev’d A Shepperson 

Mrs S Isles 
Mrs J O’Shannassy 
Mrs M Philip 
Dr C Raymont (Chair) 

Archbishop’s Advisory Committee on Building & 

Furnishings 

The Rev’d Canon G Harch 
(Chair) 

Mr R Allom 
Mr R Heathwood 
Mrs J Marshall 
Mr TC Reid 
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Anglican Board of Mission Committee 

The Most Rev’d Dr PJ 
Aspinall, Archbishop of 
Brisbane 
The Rev’d P Doulin  
The Rev’d R Gardiner 
The Rt Rev’d J Holland  
(Episcopal contact) 
The Rev’d R King 
The Rev’d C Middleton 
The Rev’d B Pagram 
The Rev’d A Schmidt  
The Rev’d KJ Spreadborough 
(Chair) 
The Rev’d J Van den Bos  

Mr C Gehrmann 
Mrs S Gover  
Mr S Harrison  
Mr G Henderson  
Mr A Jayasundera 
Mrs L Keyes  

Social Responsibilities Committee 

The Very Rev’d Dr P Catt 
(Chair) 
The Rev’d T Eichler 
The Rev’d P Moore 
The Rev’d B Pagram 
The Rev’d R Wolff 

Ms E James 
Dr R Kerr 

Anglican Committee for Ecumenical Affairs 

The Most Rev’d Dr PJ 
Aspinall, Archbishop of 
Brisbane 
The Rev’d Canon BW Boase 
The Rev’d SM Hooper 
The Rev’d GM Hoyte 
The Rev’d HM Paget 
The Rt Rev’d D Stevens 
(Chair) 

Mr T Coates 
Mrs J Markotsis 
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Clergy Biographical Information 

† ASPINALL, The Most Rev'd Dr Phillip John b.59; B Sc (Univ of Tas) 80; Grad Dip RE 
(BCAE) 85; BD (Hons) (MCD) 88; PhD (Monash Univ) 89; MBA (Deakin Univ) 98; D.88, 
P.89 Dio of Tas; Asst C. St Mark's, Launceston 88-89; Asst P. Brighton 89-91; P.
Bridgewater/Gagebrook 91-94; Dir Anglicare Tas 94-98; Adn Church/Society 97-98; Dio
of Tas; Consecrated Bishop on St Peter's Day, 29 June 1998 in St Peter's Cathedral,
Adelaide by the Archbishop of Adelaide (George), assisted by the Bishops of Willochra
(McCall), Tasmania (Newell), the Assistant Bishop of Melbourne (Curnow) and Bishops
Challen, Smith and Jerrim; Asst Bishop, Dio of Adelaide 98-02; Elected Archbishop of
Brisbane on 12 November 2001 and Installed in St John's Cathedral on 2 February 2002;
Abp Metropolitan Prov Qld 2002. Elected Primate of Australia on 9 July 2005; Re-elected
Primate 23 October 2008 to 4 July 2014. Member of the Standing Committee of the
Primates' Meeting of the Anglican Communion and member of the Anglican Consultative
Council (ex-officio) 2007-2010. Member of Central Committee World Council of Churches
2004 - .Chair General Synod Ecumenical Relations Commission from 2016; Member
International Anglican Orthodox Commission for Theological Dialogue from
2017.Archbishop of Brisbane GPO Box 421, Brisbane 4001 Tel: 3835 2222(BH) Fax:
3832 5030 email: ajoseph@anglicanchurchsq.org.au;  S: Christa:        Archbishop

† GREAVES, The Rt Rev'd Jeremy David b.69; BTh (Flinders Uni) 97; D.97; (Adel); 
P.98(Adel); AsstCSt John's, Salisbury 97-98; Vincent Fairfax F'ship 99-2000; AssC ChCh
Nth Adel 99-2000; R. St Michael & All Angels, Ceduna 2000-04; Chair Anglicare Willochra
03-04; Future Summit Leadership Award 05-07; R. St Paul's, Katherine 04-07; Chpln
Police, Fire & Emergency Svces 06-07; Dio NT: Dean ChCh Cathedral, Darwin 07-13;
Police Chpln Darwin 09-13 Administrator Dio of NT 2010-2013; (Dio Bne) PinC. St Marks,
Buderim 13-14; Rector, St Marks, Buderim 2014-17; Archdeacon Sunshine Coast
Archdeanry 15-17; Consecrated Bishop on The Feast of St Matthias, Apostle and Martyr,
24 February 2017 in St John's Cathedral by the Archbishop of Brisbane (Aspinall)
assisted by Bishops of Nth Qld (Ray); Rockhampton (Robinson), Northern Territory
(Anderson), Grafton (Macneil), Melbourne (Billings), Sydney (Forsyth), Ballarat
(Weatherill), Adelaide (McLeod), the Assistant Bishops of Brisbane (Taylor and Venables)
and Bishops Fryar, Smith, Holland, Wood, Williams, Eacott, Clark & Nolan. Assistant
Bishop of the Nth Region from 17  GPO Box 421 Brisbane 4001 Tel: 3835 2252(BH) Mbl:
0428 315 763 email: jgreaves@anglicanchurchsq.org.au;  S: Josie:               Active

† ROUNDHILL, The Right Reverend Andrew John b.65; MA (Hons) Corpus Christi Coll, 
Univ of Cambridge 87; B Th (Hons) Ripon Coll, Cuddesdon, Oxford 93; D.93; P.94; A.C., 
Ch Ch, Lancaster; Chapl, Loretto School, Musselburgh, Scotland 97-02; Chaplain, St 
John's Cathl, Hong Kong 02-04; Sub-Dean 04-06; R. Aspley-Albany Creek from 06; Area 
Dean of Brisbane North West 07-08; Archd of Lilley 08- 2012; Dean Bendigo Cathedral 
12 -18. Vicar General Bendigo 12 - 18. Assistant Bishop Southern Region Brisbane 
Diocese from 18. St Martin's House GPO Box 421 Brisbane 4001 Tel: 3835 2213 (BH): 
Mbl: 0418 743 045 email: jroundhill@anglicanchurchsq.org.au;  S: Frances:          Active 

† VENABLES, The Rt Rev'd Cameron David b.65; St Francis' Coll; BA (Hons) 
(Wolverhampton Polytechnic UK) 86; BTh (BCT) 94; D.93; P.95; A.C., ChCh, Bundaberg 
94-95, Foundation Chpln St Luke's Angl Schl 94-95; PNG Popondota Diocesan Yth Co-
Ord. 96-2000; Assoc P Lismore 2000-03; Chpln SCU Lismore Campus 2001-03; Priest
Min Co-Ord Fitzroy Min Cluster 2004-05; Can St Paul's Cthdrl Rockh 2008-12; Chpln
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Anglicare CQ 2010-12; Chpln Rockh GS 2010-14; Achdcn & Vicar Gen Rockh 2012-14; 
Rector All Saints Comm Nth Rockhampton 2005-14; Consecrated Bishop on the Feast 
of the Birth of St John the Baptist, Tuesday 24 June 2014, at 7.00 pm by the Archbishop 
of Brisbane (Aspinall) assisted by the Bishops of: North Qld (Ray); Adelaide (Driver); 
Bishops, Brisbane (Holland, Smith, Taylor and Stevens); Ballarat (Weatherill) Newcastle 
(Stuart); Sydney (Forsyth); Tasmania (Jones); and retired Bishops Clark, Eacott, Nolan, 
Meredith, Williams and Wood; Bishop for the Western Region from 2014; Episcopal 
Overseer for Cursillo (Dio. Of Brisbane). Anglican Bishop for the Western Region, PO 
Box 2600, Toowoomba 4350) Tel: 4614 7050(BH) Mbl: 0419 784 456 email: 
cvenables@anglicanchurchsq.org.au;  S: Kate:                   Active 
 
ADAMS, The Rev'd Trevor Bruce b.51; St Paul's Th Coll, Grahamstown, Sth Africa; Dip 
Th 80; Cert Ang St (GTS New York) 85-86; D.80; P.81; Dio of Port Elizabeth, Sth Africa; 
A.C. Christ the King, 80-85; R. St Simon of Cyrene 86-87; Assoc P. St Peter's, Upper 
Riccarton, Christchurch, NZ 87-90; Assoc P. St Luke's, Woy Woy, Dio of Newcastle 90-
92; PTO Dio of Bris 92; R. Ch of the Good Shepherd, Bundaberg West 92-95; R. St 
Mary's, Bardon 95-99; To Dio of NQ R. Townsville - Parish of Heatley 99-08; Dio of 
Brisbane R. Parish of Sunnybank 08-2016; R. Parish of Kingaroy 16-18; Area Dean 
Bunya Deanery from 17-18.  10 Whetton Court Boronia Heights 4124 Tel: 4162 1231(BH) 
4162 1071(AH) Mbl: 0438 176 828 email: smadarovert@yahoo.com;  S: Sharon:  PTO 
 
AILWOOD, The Venerable Frederick Charles b.37; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 81; 
Dip Th (ACT) 75; D & P 63; A.C. St Alban's, Auchenflower 63-65; A.C. St Andrew's, 
Lutwyche 65-68; Chpln AngSoc Kedron Tchrs Training Coll. 1967;V. St Lawrence, 
Caboolture 68- 74; R. Holy Trinity, Goondiwindi 74-80; R.D. Warwick 78-80; R. St 
Andrew's, Pittsworth 80-84; R. St Peter's, Gympie 84-92; A.D. of Wide Bay 87-89; Hon 
Canon St John's Cathl 88-92; Archd of Burnett 89-93; R. St Andrew's, Caloundra 92-
2000; Archd of Wide Bay 93-2000; R. St James', Toowoomba 2000-06; Archd of The 
Downs 2000-06; Archdeacon Emeritus from 06; Diocesan responsibilities: Member Board 
DDF; ADIF; AnFin; Chair Diocesan Super Fund; Chair Diocesan Stewardship Comm. Mbr 
St Francis' College; Rtd 2006;  Lcm Chap English Church Heidelberg, Germany Summer 
03, Winter 05-06, 07-08; 10; 11.PTO St Luke's, Toowoomba from 06.  "Tongala" 13 
Hickey Street, Toowoomba 4350 Tel: 4639 6306 Mbl: 0408 739 757 email: 
fandbailwood@bigpond.com.au;  S: Barbara:           Retired PTO 
 
ALLEN, The Rev'd Karen Lorette b.65. B.Bus. (Griffith Uni) 07; BTh (CSU) 2016; D.16; 
P.17. Assist Curate Bundaberg from 2016.  8 Hodgetts Close, Bundaberg North 4670 
Tel: 4151 3128 Mbl: 0435 266 217 email: assistpriest@bundaberganglican.org;   Active 
 
ALLTON, The Rev'd Derek Roland b.32; SSM St Mich Th Coll, Crafers; ThL (ACT); D.54; 
P.55 Perth; Titular C. St George's Cathl 54; A.C. St John's, Northam and P-in-C St 
James', West Northam 55-58; First R. St Mary in the Valley, Kelmscott 58-60; R. St 
James', North Midlands 60-65; Dio of Perth; R. St Paul's, Proserpine 65-66, Dio of NQ; 
First V. 66-68 and R. 68-97, Parish of Aspley, St Paul's/The Church of the Resurrection; 
Hon Chapl St Paul's School 66-68; Pilot Chapl to Abps of Bris 66-80; R.D. of Bris Nth 
West 86-89; PTO 97- 04; Abp's Cert for Officiating on Special Occasions from 04.  Symes 
Grove, 333 Handford Road, Taigum 4018 Tel: 3865 6005 :            Archbishop's Cert 
 
ANDERSON, The Venerable Olaf Emanuel b.64; St Francis' Coll; BA (Hons) (Univ of Qld) 
86; Grad Dip Counselling (QUT) 04; D.87; P.88; Hon A.C. Holy Trinity, Woolloongabba 
87-88; A.C. St Paul's, Cleveland 88-91; Dio of Bris; A.C. St Peter's, Petersfield, Hants, 
Dio of Portsmouth, UK 91-93; Relief Chapl, Moreton "B" Correctional Centre 98-2000; P-
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in-C St Alban's Goodna 94-2000; P-in-C, St M & AA, New Farm 2000-2011; Area Dean 
of Brisbane North 02-07; Archdeacon of Brisbane from 07; Special Licence Relating to 
Penitents in cases of Child Sexual Abuse from 2010. Rector New Farm from 2011; 
Chaplain St Francis Theological College from 17.  655 Brunswick Street New Farm 4005 
Tel: 3358 1555(BH) email: stm.newfarm@bigpond.com.au;  S: Gillian:                 Active 

 
 ANDREWS, The Rev'd Frances Mary b.54; St Francis' Coll; EHCC 1996, EfM 2003, BTh 

(BCT) 2009; D.& P. 07; Hon Dcn, St James', Toowoomba 07; Hon A.C. 07-08, Assist 
Curate St James', Toowoomba 08-09; PinC Boonah-Harrisville 09-2013; PinC Brisbane 
Valley  2013-2015; PTO Parish of Toowoomba St Bartholomew 2015-2016; Assist Priest 
(P/T) Toowoomba, St Luke's from 16-17; Assist Priest (P/T) Toowoomba St Bartholomew 
16; PTO Parish of St James' Toowoomba 17-18; Priest in Charge (P/T) Parish of 
Pittsworth from July 18.  18 Murray Street Pittsworth 4356 Tel: 4693 1029 Mbl: 0438 463 
435 email: stanpittpriest@gmail.com;  S: Gary:                   Active 
 

 ARNOLD, The Rev'd John Frederic b.38; Moore Coll, Syd; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) 60; BA 
(Univ of Syd) 60; BD (Univ of Lond) 61; Dip RE (Melb Coll of Div) 62; Th Schol 73; D.61, 
P.62 Syd; C. St Clement's, Mosman 61-65; Asst Chapl for Yth and Dir CEBS Dio of Syd 
65-67; R. ChCh, Blacktown 67-74; Dio of Syd; Gen Sec, CMS Qld and Nthn NSW Branch 
75-79; V. St Andrew's, Lahore, Pakistan (CMS) 79-84; R. St Andrew's, South Brisbane 
85-92; A.D. of Brisbane A 87-92; V. St Thomas', Islamabad, Pakistan (CMS) 92-95; R. St 
Peter's, Bribie Island 96-03; Area Dean of Redcliffe 01-03; PTO from 03; L/T Yeppoon 
05; Yeronga 07; Coorparoo 09, Wishart 11, Kenmore 14 & 16, The Gap 16, Edge Hill 17.  
43 Gertrude Street, Highgate Hill 4101 Tel: 3844 4264 Mbl: 0406 856 486 email: 
jdarnold2@bigpond.com;  S: Diana:           Retired PTO  
 

 AROK, The Rev'd Simon Goch b.57. Sudanese Cert. Ed., D. 2000; P.2004; Hon Assistant 
Priest Parish of Ipswich from 2015.  16 Waxberry Court, Redbank Plains 4301  Mbl: 0470 
304 869 email: atem_maguer2003@yahoo.com.au;  S: Elizabeth:                         Active  
 
AUSTIN, The Rev'd Trevor Albert b.26; Moore Coll, Syd; ThL 55; D.56 Gippsland; P.57, 
Grafton; A.C. St John's, Bairnsdale, Dio of Gippsland, 56-57; A.C. St Mark's, Casino, 57-
59; A.C. All Saints', Murwillumbah, 59-60; V. St James', Bellbrook, 60-62; R. St Mark's, 
Nimbin, 62-66; R. St Matthew's, Wauchope, 66-87; R.D. Hastings-Macleay 81-84; Hon 
Canon ChCh Cathl, Grafton 81-91; R. All Saints', Kempsey, 87-91; Dio of Grafton; PTO 
Dio of Bris 92-2017; Archbishop's Cert. to Officiate on Special Occasions from 2017.  53 
Buderim Garden Village, Mooloolaba Road, Buderim 4556 Tel: 5444 7024 : Retired PTO 
 
BAHRE, The Rev'd Gerard Antonius b.53; St Francis' Coll; Electronics Engnr 75; Dip Min 
(SFC) 99; D.99; Hon Dcn St Laurence's, Caboolture 99-02; Hon Dcn, Parish of 
Freshwater 02-09; Hon Dcn Mitchell from 09.  "Epiphany" 6 Ann Street, Mitchell 4465 Tel: 
4623 7959 Mbl: 0409 615 438 email: gerardb_adsl@bigpond.com;  S: Rose:         Active 
 
BAILEY, The Rev'd Ian Clive b.47; ThDip; DipMin (Morpeth) 82; D.82; (Newc); P.82 
(Newc); AsstP Scone 82-83; AsstP Gosford 84-85; V UClarence 85-87; HonAsst Coraki 
87-88; Chpln Tamworth Hosps 90-96; Hon Ambulance Chpln Tamworth 94-98; V Uralla 
96-02; Chpln Corrective Svces 02; Chpln Grafton Gaol 02-08; PinC Moama 08-11; R 
Uniting Church Mathoura 08-11; (Dio Bunbury) R. Parish of Collie, Mines Chpln Collie 
11-14; (Dio Brisbane) PTO Nanango from 2014; L/T Goondiwindi 2014; Kingaroy & 
Brisbane Valley 16-18. PinC Parish of Brisbane Valley from Nov 18.  13 Keeley Place 
Esk 4312  Mbl: 0428 481 474 email: iansrs@bigpond.com;  S: Robyne:                  Active  
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BAIRD, The Rev'd Sharon Leanne b.74; BA (Creative-Music) (USQ 94); Grad Dip Ed 
(Sec) (USQ 96); BTh (CSU) 2011; D.11; P.11. P/T Stip Lay Min. Gold Coast North and 
Coomera Anglican College 10-11; P/T AC Gold Coast North and Chaplain Coomera 
Anglican College 2011; Chaplain Hillbrook Ang School 12-17. Hon Assist Priest Aspley 
Albany Creek 12-15. Hon Assist Priest St John's Cathedral from 16. School Chaplain, 
The Glennie School from 18.  7 Cullen Court Rockville 4350 (C/- The Glennie School 
246a Herries Street Toowoomba 4350) Tel: 07 4688 8808(BH) Mbl: 0407 735 327 email: 
bairds@glennie.qld.edu.au; sharonbaird@me.com:                  Active  
 
BALASINGH, The Rev'd Asirvadam Samuel Bennett b.34; D.72, P.73 Colombo, Ceylon; 
Curate-Dcn Holy Emmanuel, Moratuwa 72-73; Curate-Dcn St Michael and All Angels', 
Colpetty 73; P. 73-77; Curate-Priest St Mary and St John, Nugegoda 77-78; Vicar, Ch 
Ch, Galle Face (Tamil) 78-83; V. All Saints', Pettah 84-89; V. St John's, Jaffna 90; V. Ch 
Ch, Dickoya 91-94; V. St Michael and All Angels, Colpetty 95-02; V. St Mary and St John, 
Nugegoda 03-05; V. Ch Ch, Mutwal 06-07; Dio of Colombo; PTO, Mt Gravatt 08-2017  
19, Affleck Way, Rowville 3178 Tel: 03 9752 7497 email: benjul16@gmail.com S: 
Julienne:             Retired PTO 
 
BALDOCK, The Rev'd Graheme Peter b.54; St Francis' Coll; ThL 86; D.84; P.85; A.C. St 
Peter's, Southport 85-87; P-in-C St Peter's, Millmerran 87-91; R. St M & AA, Kingaroy 91-
96; R. St Mary's, Redcliffe from 96; Area Dean, Redcliffe Dnry from 2015.  Parish Office: 
97 Sutton Street, Redcliffe 4020 (PO Box 439, Redcliffe 4020) Tel: 3284 2393(BH) 3889 
3348(AH) Fax: 3284 4380 Mbl: 0407 328 423 email: frgpb@priest.com; 
redang@westnet.com.au S: Marilyn:                    Active  
 
BALNAVES, The Rev'd Jeffery Bruce b.54; BTh (BCT) 09. D.11.P.11. A.C. Leichhardt 
11; Assist Priest Leichhardt 11-12; PinC Leichhardt 2012-2015; PinC (P/T) Parish of 
Oakey Oct 15 - Sept 16; R. Mundubbera-Eidsvold-Monto from 2016.  78-80 Lyons Street; 
Mundubbera  4626 (PO Box 68, Mundubbera 4626) Tel: 4165 4665(BH) Mbl: 0407 150 
889 email: jeff.balnaves@bigpond.com S: Sue:                   Active  
 
BARKER, The Rev'd Susan Alexandra b. 55. Honorary Lay Chaplain (Prison Ministry) 
Southern Queensland Correction Centre from 18. D. 18. Ass Curate (part time) Parish of 
Fortitude Valley from 19. email: suebarker@optusnet.com.au:                 Active 
 
BARRACLOUGH, The Rev'd Dr Raymond George b.41; Moore Coll, Syd 69; BA (Univ 
of Qld) 62; Dip Ed (Qld) 63; ThL (1st Cl Hons; Hey Sharp Prize; John Forster Prize) (ACT) 
68; BD (2nd Cl) (Lon) 69; PhD (Macquarie Univ) 77; D.74; P.75; A.C. St James', 
Toowoomba 74- 77; R. St John's, Upper Mt Gravatt 77-79; P-in-C St Peter's, West End 
79-82; Chapl to Univ of Qld 79-86; Lect in NT, St John's Coll Morpeth 86; Chapl to Univ 
of Qld 86-88; Miss Chapl (Lect, St Francis' Coll) 89; Snr Lect, St George's Coll, Jerusalem 
89-93; Miss Chapl (Lect, St Francis' Coll) 93-06; PTO Maleny 06-15; PTO Parish of 
Caloundra from 2015.  25 Buderim Street, Currimundi 4551 Tel: 5437 2381 Mbl: 0451 
049 516 email: raybarraclough@icloud.com;  S: Dorothy:         Retired PTO 
 
BARRETT, The Rev'd Derek Leonard b.25; St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 57; D.57; P.58; 
A.C. St Paul's, Maryborough 58-59; Miss Chapl 59; A.C. St James', Toowoomba 59-61; 
P-in-C St John's, Biggenden 61-62; R. 63; to UK 63; C. St George's, Ramsgate; Dio 
Canterbury 64- 65; C. St Mary's, Putney; Dio of Southwark 65-67; V. St John's, 
Kidderminster, 67-77; V. St Thomas', Stourbridge 77-90; RD Stourbridge 83-89; Hon Can 
Worc Cathl 87-90; Ret 90; Dio of Worcester; PTO Glouc from 90; PTO Worc from 90; 
PTO Dio of Maleny 97.  Lot 11, Crystal Waters, Conondale 4552 Tel: 5494 4710(BH) 
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5494 4868(AH) email: barrettd754@gmail.com;: Retired PTO

BATE, The Rev'd Christopher John b.85; Cert 3 Asset Maintenance (Pest Management) 
(MPL Training Cntre) 09; BTh (CSU) 2017; D.16. P.17. Assist Curate Parish of Ipswich 
2016-2017; Assist Priest Parish of All Saints, Booval (under the supervision of the Rev'd 
Stephen McMahon, Rector Parish of Ipswich) 17-19. PinC Parish of Booval from 19.  15 
Katrina Way, Raceview 4305 Mbl: 0429 112 127 email: 
priest.allsaintsbooval@gmail.com;  S: Juliana: Active

BAYTON, The Rt Rev John Bishop Bayton is Administrator of St John's Cathedral during 
the period of Dean Arthur Grimshaw's long service leave and after the Dean's retirement, 
the interregnum until the new Dean takes up his appointment.  Sunnybank Hills 
Residential Care 330 Jackson Road Sunnybank Hills 4109 Tel: 3276 9132 Mbl: 
0423 495 559 email: annopappy@hotmail.com;  S: Anne:                Bishops Ret PTO 

BEER, The Rev'd Kenneth Gordon b.39; St Francis' Coll; D & P 63; A.C. St Barnabas' 
Sunnybank 63-64; A.C. St Nicolas', Sandgate 64-67; R. St Paul's, Winton 67-69; St 
James', Yeppoon 69-70; Dio of Rockptn; Bro of St Paul 72-74; A.C. St Clement's, Stafford 
71; Dio of Bris;  Brotherhood of St Paul - Bourke Dio of Bathurst 72; Katherine Dio of NT 
73-75; Chapl Warrnambool Tech 75-79; Dean Ballarat 79-84; Chapl Ballarat & Queens
AGS 82-99; Dio of Ballarat; P-in-C Palmwoods 2000-01; PTO Buderim from 02.  16 
Savilles Road, Nambour  4560  Mbl: 0499 001 972 email: kenbeer16@gmail.com:

Retired PTO

BEGBIE, The Rev'd Hugh McKay b.49; Moore Coll, Syd; BA (Macquarie Univ) 70; BD 
(2nd Hons) (Univ of Lond) 76; ThL (2nd Hons) (ACT) 76; BD (London Uni. 76); M Litt 
(Dist) (Univ of NE) 87, D.Min (ACT) 96; D.76, P.77 Dio of Armidale; A.C. St Cyprian's, 
Narrabri 77-78; V. St John's Collarenebri 79-81; Univ Chapl, St Mark's Chapel, Univ of 
NE 82-89; Dio of Armidale; Chapl ARA 89-94; PTO Dio of Bris 95-10. Principal, Cromwell 
Coll, Univ of Qld 1995-2010; PTO St Lucia from 2010; L/T Chelmer-Graceville 2012; L/T 
Kenmore- Brookfield June, July 2013; L/T North Pine July/September 14; L/T Kenmore-
Brookfield 14-16. L/T Kenmore-Brookfield from Nov 17 - Sept 18.  8/11 Holland Street, 
Toowong 4066 (PO Box 194, Toowong 4066) Mbl: 0419 656 377 email: 
oliver1954@gmail.com:   PTO 

BELL, The Rev'd Beverley Nora b.46; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 93; B Th 
(BCT) 03; D.93; P.98; Hon Dcn, St Mark's, Slacks Creek 93-98; Hon A.C. 98-2000; Asst 
P. Parish of Logan 2000-02; P-in-C Kenmore-Brookfield 02-05; R. 05-2014; Area Dean
of Brisbane West 08-11;. Area Dean Brisbane West 2012-2014; PTO Parish of Inala from
2014.  9 Skyline Avenue, Springfield Lakes 4300 Tel: 3288 1567 Mbl: 0415 728 696
email: beverleybell28@gmail.com;  S: Paul:          Retired PTO

BELL, The Rev'd John Charles b.51; St Francis' Coll; QCH (QAC) 70; QACA (QAC) 77; 
D.96; Hon Dcn, St Colomb's, Clayfield 96-97; Hon Dcn, Christ Church Boonah from 98-
99; Hon Dcn Rosewood from 09.  2 Wernowski Road Fernvale 4306 Tel: 5426 6107 Mbl:
0423 324 454 email: john.bell@live.com.au;  S: Jacquie:                  Active

BELL, The Rev'd Malcolm Francis b.44; St Francis' Coll; ThL 71; D.68; P.86; A.C. St 
Luke's, Toowoomba 68-69; PTO Dio of Bris 69-70; A.C. St Paul's, Ashgrove 70-71; Hon 
A.C. St Peter's, West End 71-72; PTO Dio of Bris 86; Hon A.C. St George's, Birkdale-
Capalaba 87- 88; Duty Chapl Boggo Road Correctional Centre 87-92; Priest in Murri
Anglican Fellowship 87-04; P-in-C St George's, Windsor 88-05; Duty Chapl Arthur Gorrie
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and Moreton A Correctional Centres 92-97; Hon Chapl Sir Leslie Wilson Youth Centre 
89-96; pt St Mark's, Dunwich, Stradbroke Island 94-96; PTO Sandgate Northpoint from
05. 38 Raymond Street, Shorncliffe 4017 (PO Box 36 Sandgate 4017) Tel: 3869 3452
Mbl: 0418 791 307 email: frbell@ecn.net.au;:          Retired PTO

BENNETT, The Rev'd Michael Lindsay b.39; Dip Arch (QIT), ThL (ACT); D.69; P.70 Bris; 
A.C. St Stephen's Coorparoo 70-71; A.C. ChCh, St Ives 73-74; R. St Mark's, Yagoona
75-78; Evangelist, St Philip's, Caringbah 79-80; R. St George's, Earlwood 81-84; Dio of
Syd; PTO Dio of Bris 85-96; PTO Dio of Bris 01-04; PTO South Brisbane 04-05; PTO
Rochedale from 05.  85 Ferndale Street, Annerley 4103 Tel: 3892 3668 email:
mbennett@powerup.com.au;  S: Marion:          Retired PTO

BERRIS, The Rev'd Daniel John b.75; St Francis' Coll; Ad. Cert Christian Stud (Tabor 
Bible Coll) 97; BTh (BCT) 09; D.10; P.10; Lay Minister (Youth), St Jude's, Everton Park 
04-05; Lay Minister (Youth), The Church of the Resurrection, Aspley-Albany-Creek 06-
08; Stip Lay Min Parish of Bulimba 08-09. D.10; A.C. Ipswich 2010-2012; PinC Prov
Parish of North Lakes from 2012; Hon Police Chaplain from 2012.  Parish Office/Rectory
4 Walowa Street, North Lakes 4509 Tel: 3482 4493(BH) 3482 4357(AH) Mbl: 0403 977
512 email: dan@thelakesanglican.org.au; S: Kerry:                  Active

BIRD, The Rev'd Deborah Leanne Talitha b.73; BA(Mus) (QUT) 93; GradDipFET (USQ) 
03; BTh (CSU) 17; D.17 P. 18; A.C. Buderim 17- 18; Ass. Priest Parish of St James, 
Toowoomba from Dec 18  Mbl: 0400 816 202 email: priest2@stjames.org.au;    Active  

BLACK, The Rev'd Dianne Elizabeth Nellie b.45; St Francis' Coll; D.05; P.06; Hon A.C. 
St John's, Bulimba 05-08; Hon Asst Priest, Waterloo Bay 08-09; Hon Asst Priest, 
Wynnum 2010-2012; PtoO Bulimba 2012-2016; PTO Manly from 2017.  3 Eccles Street, 
Wynnum West 4178 Tel: 3348 7298 Mbl: 0422 336 849 email: 
dianne.black@ozemail.com.au: Retired PTO

BLACKBURN, The Rev'd Robert Le Fleming b.41; St Francis' Coll; EHMPCC (Trinity Th 
Coll) 04; Dip Th (ACT) 05; BTh (CSU) 2011; D.04; P.05; Hon A.C. St Matthew's, Drayton 
04-07; PTO Gatton with Ma-Ma Creek 07-15; PTO (Rtd) L/T Parish of Laidley from 2015.
"Aeolian Brow", 10 Mountain Road, Laidley 4341 Tel: 5465 2546 Mbl: 0403 376 589
email: bob.blackburn@bigpond.com;  S: Valerie:         Retired PTO

BLAND, The Rev'd Paul Thomas b.50; BA (Hons) (Univ of Qld) 71; Dip Ed (Univ of Qld) 
72; B Ed Stud (Univ of Qld) 82; M Litt (James Cook Univ) 88; F.A.C.E. (2004) F.A.C.E.L. 
(2007), D.92, P.93 Dio of NQ; Headmaster, Canterbury Coll from 94; Miss Chapl 94-02; 
To Dio of Nth Qld - Principal Trinity Anglican School 03-07; Assoc Chapl, ACGS 08-11; 
Acting Chpln St Aidan's Anglican Girls' School 2011-2013; PTO Parish of East Brisbane 
2014-2017; Hon. PinC (2 days per week) Parish of East Brisbane 17. PTO Parish of East 
Brisbane from 18.  3/31 Gibson Street Annerley 4103 Tel: 3392 9121 Mbl: 0419 653 123 
email: paul@blandfamily.us;  S: Christine:        PTO 

BLAXLAND, The Rev'd Gregory Montgomery Alfred b.32; Moore Theol Coll; ThL (ACT) 
58; D & P 59, Dio of Sydney; C. Manly 59-60; CiC The Oaks 60-62; OMS SAMS 62-66; 
CiC Keiraville 66-69; OMS SAMS 69-73; Can Chile Bolivia/Peru 72; Commissary for Bp, 
Chile 73-84; Gen Sec SAMS 73-78; Order of Bernardo O'Higgins, Chile 79; Fed Sec 
SAMS 78-84; OMS SAMS 84-92; P-in-C Church Planting Caracas Venezuela 84-88; Nat 
Dir Iglesia Angl Episc de Bolivia 89-92; Assoc M Littleton 93-95; Hon Asst P. Avalon/Palm 
Beach 96-04; GL Dio of Syd from 73; PTO Palmwoods Dio of Bris 05 - 17. Archbishop's 
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Certificate for Special Occasion Palmwoods from 17.  5 Tia Close, Palmwoods 4555 Tel: 
5478 9562 email: blessedblaxland@gmail.com;  S: Judith:                Archbishop's Cert  
 
BLUNDELL, The Rev'd Gary James b.49; Coll of St John the Evang, Auckland NZ; L Th 
(St John the Evang, NZ) 73; D.73; P.74 Auckland, NZ; A.C. St Saviour's, Kaitaia 73-75; 
A.C. St Mark's, Remuera 76-77, P-in-C 78; V. St Paul's Te Atatu 78-82; Chapl, Auckland 
City Miss 82-83; P-in-C Marsden-Waipu Miss Dist 83-86; Dio of Auckland NZ; A.C. St 
John's, Hendra 86-87; Hon A.C. ChCh Milton 87-91; Hon A.C. St M & AA, New Farm 97-
99; PTO Dio of Bris 14 April 99 - 09. PTO Green Hills Anglicans 09-12; PTO Ithaca-Red 
Hill 2012-2016; PTO Parish of Lutwyche from 2016.  11 Crowther Street, Windsor 4030 
(PO Box 725, Lutwyche 4030) Tel: 3357 5631 email: revfrgjb@bigpond.net.au;        PTO 
 
BOASE, The Rev'd Canon Bruce Wayne b. 54; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 04; D.04; 
P.05; A.C. St Mark's, Buderim 04-06; P-in-C, Goonaneman 06-12. Area Dean Burnett 
Deanery 09-12; PinC Green Hills Anglican Community from 2012; Hon Canon, Cathedral 
of St John the Evangelist from 2014.  42 Harding Street, Enoggera 4051 (181 Wardell 
Street, Enoggera 4051) Tel: 3355 1431 (BH) Mbl: 0448 206 312 email: 
greenhillsanglicancommunity@gmail.com;  S: Patti:                  Active  
 
BOOTH, The Rev'd Terrence Richard b.44; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThDip (ACT) 70; 
Assoc Dip in Arts (Human Service Admin) Edith Cowan Univ 89; BA (Psych) (Edith 
Cowan Univ) 98; D.69; P.70 Dio of Riv; A.C. Corowa 69-71; Asst P. Broken Hill 72-74; P-
in-C Urana/Jerilderie 74-79; Chapl "Bishopswood", Maine USA 79; A.C. 
Chesterfield/Chapl Chesterfield Royal Hosp, Derby UK 79-81; LT Ganmain 81; R. 
Coolamon/Ganmain 82; RD Murrumbidgee 83-84; Dio of Riv; Chapl Bunbury Cathl GS 
85-93; pt Chapl Edith Cowan Univ, Bunbury Campus 86-92; Dio of Bunbury; R. Casino 
94-98; Reg Min Co-ordinator Upper Richmond 94-96; Dio of Grafton; R Ithaca- Ashgrove 
98-12;  Co-ord, Continuing Personal and Ministerial Review 2000-06; Area Dean of Bne 
Nth West 01-04; Cursillo Diocesan Spiritual Advisor 03-06; PTO (Rtd) Cathedral from 
2012 L/T the Church of the Ascension, Alice Springs, July/October 2013  L/T St Alban’s 
Wilston March/October 2014. L/T Holland Park 15-16. L/T Eastern Hills 17-18  17 Cobble 
Street, The Gap 4061 Tel: 3300 7111  email: terrybooth44@bigpond.com;  S: Margaret: 
              Retired PTO  
 
BOOTH, The Rev'd Timothy John b.68; St Francis' Coll; BHMS (Ed) (Univ of Qld) 90; 
Gdip Th (BCT) 98; D.97;Dip Prof Counselling (AIPC) 08; MODHRM (UNE) 17. Hon 
Deacon, St Alban's, Wilston 97-98; Chapl Canterbury Coll 97-2000; PTO 2000-01; 
Mission Chaplain from 01; Hon Dcn Annerley 01-05; Hon Dcn Stafford 05-09; Hon 
Deacon New Farm from 09..  , Wavell Heights, Q 4012  (GPO Box 45, Wavell Heights, Q 
4012 Brisbane 4001) Tel: 3253 4517(BH) Mbl: 0408 460 687 email: 
revtbooth@gmail.com;  S: Karen:                    Active  
 
BOTTOMLEY, The Rev'd Anne Patricia b.47; St Francis' Coll; D.& P. 07; Hon A.C., 
Bramble Bay 07-11; Hon Assist Priest Redcliffe from 2012.  2/49 Margate Parade, 
Margate 4019 Tel: 3889 3537 Mbl: 0419 655 192 email: apbottomley@gmail.com;  S: 
Allan:                       Active 
 
BOURKE, The Rev'd Kevin George b.60. AssocDipComputing (Uni Central Q) 1990; 
CertTh (Moore) 93; BTh (Flinders) 2011; D.89 (NQ) P.90 (NQ); Asst Sarina 89; AsstC 
Gordonvale 91; PinC 92-93; R.94-95; R HT Ingham 95-2000; Chpln Townsville Gen Hosp 
2000-02; Adn NQ 01-06; R Mundingburra 01-06; (Dio Grafton) R Tweed Heads 07-14; 
(Dio Brisbane) PinC Stafford 2014-2015; Rector Stafford from 2015 Area Dean Brisbane 
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N W Deanery from 2017.  2 Eudunda Street, Stafford 4053 Tel: 3356 4300(BH) 3352 
5549(AH) Mbl: 0419 693 552 email: kevin@stclements.org.au;  S: Carolynne:        Active  
 
BOWER, The Rev'd Thomas Graham b.53; Cert MI (STC) 79; Adv Cert MT (Moorabbin 
TAFE) 92; B Th (BCT) 08; D.08;P.08; A.C. St Mary's, Redcliffe 08-09; PinC Dalby 09-13; 
Rector, Parish of Dalby from 13..  PO Box 1263, Dalby 4405 Tel: 4662 2071(BH) 0428 
776 451(AH) Fax: 4622 2071 Mbl: 0428 776 451 email: dalbyang@westnet.com.au; S: 
Lyn:                       Active  
 
BOWIE, The Rev'd Dr Richard John b.45; St Michael's House, Crafers; Dip Mus Ed 
(Newcastle Conservatorium and Tchrs Coll) 69; ThL (ACT) 88; D Min (Virginia Episcopal 
Seminary) 96; D.78, P.80 Dio of Grafton; D. Grafton 78-80; P-in-C St Paul's, Moa Island 
and Diocesan Ed Officer 80-83; Dio of Carpentaria; R. All Saints, Clermont; Area Dean 
Central Highlands 87-89; R. St James, Yeppoon 89-94; Dio of Rockptn; R. Holy 
Covenant, Cook 94-01; Lecturer, Faculty St Mark's, Canb and Supervsr Clergy Formation 
98-01; Dio of Canb/Goulb; PTO Dio of Bris 03-06; R. Bundaberg West 06-09; PTO 
Coolum 10-2016; Archbishop's Certificate to Officiate on Special Occasions from 2016.  
23 Mt Ninderry Court Coolum Beach 4573 Tel: 5471 6815 email: rick.bowie6@gmail.com;  
S: Joyce:                       Archbishop's Cert  
 
BOWIE, The Rev'd Dr Richard William b.31; Bps Coll Calcutta, India; Dip Th (Bps Coll 
Calcutta) 58; Dip Th (St Augustine's Coll Canterbury, Eng) 61; BD (Serampore Univ, 
India) 64; M Th (Serampore Univ, India) 66; DD (Honoris Causa) (Hindustan Bible 
Institute, Madras, India) 91; D.58; P.59 Calcutta; C. of The Old Miss Ch Calcutta 58-64; 
St Mark's, Dalston, East London 62; St Paul's Cathl, Calcutta 66-68; Lecturer Bps Coll, 
Calcutta 68-70; Principal 70-74; V. St Mary's, Bardon 74-77; R . 77-86; Dio of Bris; Haggai 
Inst, Singapore 86-96; Exec Dir Haggai Inst, Bris 96-01; PTO Dio of Bris 96-2017; 
Archbishop's Certificate from 2017.  6 Bridle Street, Mansfield 4122 Tel: 3420 5860 email: 
auric1938@gmail.com;  S: Audrey:               Archbishop's Cert  
 
BOWLES, The Rev'd Canon Dr Ralph Gordon b.53; Moore Coll Syd; BA (Hons) (Univ of 
Syd) 75; BD (Hons) (Univ of Lond) 79; ThL (ACT) 79; Dip Arts (Moore Coll) 80; D Min 
(San Francisco Theol Sem) 95; D & P 80, Dio of Syd; C. St Clement's, Lalor Park 80-81; 
C. St Barnabas', Broadway 82-83; R. St Andrew's w St Stephen's, Dundas/Telopea 83-
90; Dio of Syd; R. St Stephen's, Coorparoo 90-09; PTO The Gap from 09; Brisbane 
Anglican Natural Church Development Program Project Officer, (PMC) 09-13; PTO 
Lutwyche from 11; Mission Chpln - Parish Health Officer (NCD) from 2013 - 17; Hon 
Canon, Cathedral of St John the Evangelist from 2014. PTO North Pine from 17.  Unit 8, 
49-53 Bilyana Street, Balmoral 4171  Mbl: 0400 962 626 email: 
rgbowles@optusnet.com.au;  S: Sylvia:         PTO  
 
BOYCE, The Rev'd Christopher Allan b.44. Dip.Arch. (Bright.Coll.Art UK) 66; Assoc. 
Royal Inst British Architects (Brighton Coll. Art UK) 68; Gen. Min. Exam (Salisbury & Wells 
Theol Coll) 87. D.87. P.88. Dio Bris. Chapln The Springfield Ang College 2011-2013; P/T 
Chpln Springfield Ang College 2014; PTO Parish of Wishart.  Unit 4, Freshwater 
Pavilions, 92 Sturgeon Street, Ormiston 4160 Tel: 3821 6904  Mbl: 0435 648 834 email: 
christopher.boyce468@gmail.com;  S: Lynda:         Retired PTO  
 
BRANSGROVE, The Rev'd Canon Geoffrey Kench b.42; Primary Tchrs Cert (Coburg 
Melb) 62; B Th (Ridley Coll) 79; D.79, P.80 Dio of Grafton; C. Lismore 79-82; R. Maclean 
82-86; V. Coffs Harbour TM/P-I-C Sawtell 86-89; Chapl GFS 82; Spir Dir Cursillo 88-91; 
R. Mullumbimby 89-92; Dio of Grafton; R. Winton 93-96; Dio of Rockptn; R. Furneaux Is 
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97-2000; R. Parish Longford 2002-06; Parish Evandale 01-06; Parish Westbury 04-06;
Cursillo Spir Dir 01-05; Dio Mssn Support Off 01-06;Canon Emritus Jan 2006 Dio of
Tasmania; Priest in the Parish of Mudgeeraba 06-13. PTO (Rtd) Parish of Mudgeeraba
from 2015.  1/1 Glenside Drive Robina 4226 Mbl: 0418 306 576 email: 
geoffreybransgrove@bigpond.com;  S: Gill:  Retired PTO 

BRAUN, The Venerable Robert Roy b.46; St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 71; BD (Univ of 
Qld) 77; D & P 72; Mem OGS from 72; A.C. St Clement's, Stafford 72-74; A.C. ChCh 
Bundaberg 74-76; Chapl St Francis' Coll 76-77; P-in-C St Alban's, Cunnamulla 78-82; 
Dio of Bris; Chapl British Embassy, Bucharest and Abp of Canterbury's Apocrisiarius to 
Patriarchs of Romania and Bulgaria 82-84; Precentor, St John's Cathl 84-94; Chair: Ang. 
Refugee and Mig. Ser 84-94; 98-07; Minor Canon 90-94; Area Dean of the Inner City 92-
93; Area Dean of Brisbane North 93-94; Dio of Bris; Anglican Chapl St Mark's, Alexandria, 
Dio of Egypt 94-98; Abp of Canterbury's Apocrisiarius to Greek Patriarch of Alexandria 
95-98; R. St Augustine's, Hamilton 98-07; Archdeacon of Brisbane 04-07; PTO Annerley
from 07; Archdeacon Emeritus 07.  5 "Beaumont", 91-97 Dornoch Terrace, Highgate Hill
4101 (PO Box 5819, West End 4101) Tel: 3217 2656 email: braun.ogs@internode.on.net:

  Retired PTO 

BRAY, The Rev'd Lima Houston b.37; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 97; D.94; P.96; Hon 
Deacon, Holy Spirit, Surfers Paradise 94-96; Hon A.C. from 96; Assoc P. 99-02; PTO Dio 
of Bris 02-11; PTO Surfer's Paradise from 2011..  14 Pall Mall Golden Crest Manors 
Highland Park 4211 Tel: 5630 8184 email: limabray@hotmail.com;  S: Richard:  

 Retired PTO 

BRETZ, The Rev'd John Joseph b.63; St Francis' Coll; B Eng (Civil) (QUT) 84; B Th 
(BCT) 91; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 94; MTh (BCT) 2000; MBA (UQ) 2009; MIE Aust, CPEng., 
RPEng, IntPE (Aus), NPER, RPEQ; IVMA; MIML; D.94; Hon Deacon, St Alban's, Wilston 
94-96; Hon Dcn, All Saints', Chermside 96-97; Hon Dcn St Paul's, Cleveland 98-03; Hon
Dcn, St George's, Birkdale (renamed Waterloo Bay 05) from 03.  21 Queensbury Court,
Wellington Point 4160 Tel: 3822 7792 Mbl: 0417 612 595 email: johnjbretz@gmail.com;
S: Li-Yea:                     Active

BRIGGS, The Rev'd Keith Norman b.35; St Francis' Coll; CertT (Qld Tch Coll) 53; DipT 
(BCAE) 80; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 94; D.94; Hon Deacon, St Matthias', Zillmere 94-05; 
PTO Zillmere 05-16; PTO Nundah from 2016;  21 Borrows Street, Virginia 4014 Tel: 3266 
9842  Mbl: 0412 898 475 email: keithb35@bigpond.com;  S: Harelle:        Retired PTO 

BRIGGS, The Rev'd Stephen Peter b.68; TSSF; BFET (USQ) 2010; BTh (CSU) 2015; 
D.14; P.15; A.C. Parish of Hamilton from 2014 (with special responsibility for ordained
ministry Parish of Banyo); Assist Priest St Oswald’s Church, Parish of Banyo 2015-2016;
P in C Parish of Banyo from 2016; Chaplain (CHAP) Royal Australian Navy Reserve
RANR, HMAS Moreton from 2017; Honorary Chaplain to The Mission to Seafarers from
2017 9 Froude Street, Banyo 4014 Tel: 3267 5329 (BH) Mbl: 0428 136 116 email:
stephen.stoswalds@gmail.com;  S: Barb:                   Active

BRIGHT, The Rev'd Jonathan Irwin b.52; Ridley Coll; B Th (ACT) 79; D & P 80 Dio of 
Wang; A.C. Holy Trinity Cathl 80-81; P-in-C Holy Trinity, Nathalia 82-84; R. All Saints', 
Bright 84-95; Dio of Wang; A.C. St Stephen's, Coorparoo 98-2000; PTO Dio of Bris 01; 
P-in-C Alexandra Hills from 01 PO Box 5413 Alexandra Hills 4161  Mbl: 0409 277 521
email: jib3741@gmail.com;                            Active
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BROOK, The Rev'd Jonathan Peter b.62. Cert.GN 89; Cert Psych Nursing 92; B. VA Fine 
Art 2000; Cert IV Wk Plc Trning & Assessment 07; BTh (CSU) 2012; D.10; P.10; Assist 
Curate Hervey Bay 2010-12; Assist Priest, Surfers Paradise 2012-2013; Assoc. Priest 
Surfer's Paradise & 'Mission & Ministry Coordinator SPACC Crisis Care from 2013.  10 
Poinciana Crescent Bundall 4217 Tel: 5592 1543(BH) Mbl: 0477 120 513 email: 
jobro7@bigpond.com:                      Active  

BROWNE, The Rev'd David Christopher b.87. B.Econ (UQ) 09; BTh (SFC) 16; D.16. 
P.17. Assist Curate Toowoomba St Bartholomew from 2016.  4 Arthur Street, East
Toowoomba 4350 (C/- PO Box 11390 Centenary Heights Toowoomba 4350) Tel: 4636
2922(BH) Mbl: 0421 708 117 email: david@stbarts.com.au;  S: Zoe:                      Active

BROWNE, The Rev'd Zoe Jane b.88; BA (French/History) (UQ) 2010; BEd (Secondary) 
(UQ) 2010; BTh (CSU) 2017; D.17 P.18; Mentored Chaplaincy (P/T) Canon Hill Anglican 
College 15-16; Mentored Chaplaincy (P/T) TACAPS 17. Chaplain TACAPS from 18. Hon. 
AC St Bartholomew’s Toowoomba 18. Hon Ass Priest St Bartholomew's Toowoomba 
from Dec 18. Chaplain Toowoomba Ang College from Dec 18.   (4 Arthur Street, East 
Toowoomba 4350)  Mbl: 0434 520 848 email: zoe.browne@mail.com; 
zbrowne@tacaps.qld.edu.au;  S: David:                   Active  

BUNDY, The Rev'd Canon Ronald Andrew b.47; Moore Coll, Syd; B Th (2nd Cl Hons) 
(ACT) 77; Dip Arts (Moore Coll) 78; Th Schol (ACT) 91; D & P 79, Dio of Syd; C. St 
Stephen's, Willoughby, Dio of Syd 79-80; C. Holy Trinity, Adelaide 81-85; R. St Luke's, 
Palmerston, Dio of NT 85-92; R. St Mark's, The Gap 93-07; Area Dean of Brisbane North 
West 97-2000; Abp's Exam Chapl from 2000; Res Canon, St John's Cathl from 06; P-in-
C, Biggera Waters-Coomera Valley (known as Gold Coast North) 07-16; Canon Emeritus 
St John's Cathedral from 2016; PTO Parish of Robina from 2016.  6 Edgeworth Place, 
Helensvale 4212 Tel: 5529 9355 Mbl: 0497 953 519 email: r.m.bundy@bigpond.com;  S: 
Margaret:              Retired PTO  

BURGESS, The Rev'd Alfred Victor b.45; Dip Bible/ChMins Rhema, Townsville 88; D.98, 
P.01, Dio of NQ. PTO Hervey Bay from 09.  23 Jocelyn Drive Point Vernon Hervey Bay
4655 Tel: 4124 3138 Mbl: 0477 736 244 email: vicburgess45@gmail.com;  S: Tu-le:

  Retired PTO 

BURNETT, The Rev'd Canon Ross Ridley b.40; St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 63; D & P 
64; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 64-66; Chapl The Southport School 66-72; R. St Alban's, 
Gatton 72-75; R. St Paul's, Roma 75-84; Archd of the West 82-84; R. St Mary's, Kangaroo 
Point 84- 93; Archd of Bris 84-93; R. St Catherine's, Centenary Suburbs 93-98; Archd of 
Oxley 93-98; Priest Director, Trinity Anglican Mission, Robina-Mermaid Beach 98-09. Res 
Canon St John's Cathl from 99-09; PTO Nerang from 09; Canon Emeritus from 09; Locum 
Chaplain All Saints' Anglican School 2012-2013.  9 Glastonbury Drive Mudgeeraba 4213 
Tel: 5522 9967 Mbl: 0423 868 353 email: rlburnett@bigpond.com;  S: Laurel: Retired 
PTO  

BUSK, The Rev'd Ingrid Ann b.51; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 05; D & P 01; Chapl, St 
Luke's Nursing Service from 01; Hon A.C., St George's, Maleny 01-03; Asst P. St Mark's, 
Buderim 03-05; Hon Asst P. 05; P-in-C St George's, Maleny 25 Jan 06 - 24 Aug 09. R St 
George's Maleny 09-2013; Hon Assoc. Priest Buderim 2013-14; PTO Parish of 
Palmwoods 2014-17; Assist Priest Parish of Gympie 2017- 2019.  11 Avocado Lane, 
Maleny 4552  Mbl: 0429 995 323 email: ingbusk@icloud.com;  S Ian:                   Active  
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BUTLER, The Rev'd Trevor John b.46; St Francis' Coll; D.85; P.86; A.C. St Peter's, 
Wynnum 85-87; C-in-C ChCh, St George 87-88; P-in-C 88-91; PTO Dio of Bris 91; Hon 
Asst P. St Bartholomew's, Mt Gravatt 97-08; P-in-C, Christ Church, Yeronga 08-2015; 
PTO Parish of Mt Gravatt from 2016.  5 Pandora Street, Rochedale South 4123 Tel: 3411 
0154 email: revbutler@optusnet.com.au;  S: Sandra:         Retired PTO 

BUTTON, The Rev'd Helen Lesley b.70. BTh (CSU) 2010; D.13; P.14. AC (P/T) Parish 
of Chermside 2013-2014; Assist Priest Parish of Mt Gravatt 2015.- 2016; Mission 
Chaplain -Parish of Zillmere 17. Priest in Charge - Parish of Zillmere from 17.  47 Nilkerie 
Street, Carseldine 4034 (PO Box 1123, Aspley 4034) Tel: 3151 3955 Mbl: 0431 766 941 
email: revhelenbutton@gmail.com;  S: Keith:                   Active  

CAIRNS, The Rev'd Robyn Gaye b.47; St Francis' Coll; D.01; Hon Deacon, Parish of 
Logan from 01-18. Deacon Retired PTO, Parish of Logan from 18.  4 Paterson Street, 
Woodridge 4114 Tel: 3290 0842 Mbl: 0410 329 236 email: rcairns4@optusnet.com.au:

PTO

CALDER, The Rev'd Mark Norman b.59; MTC 1984-87, BTh 86; DipA 87; D.88; P.88 
(Dio Sydney); AM St Clement's Lalor Park & Kings Langley 88-90; AM St Thomas’, North
Sydney 1990-91; R. Roseville 91-2009; R. Noosa from 2009; Area Dean Sunshine Coast 
Deanery 14-17; PinC Cooroora from 2016.  4 Mulberry Close Noosaville 4566 (PO Box 
342 Tewantin 4565) Tel: 5449 8009(BH) Mbl: 0412 585 686 email: mncalder@gmail.com; 
S: Susan:                      Active  

CALLARD, The Rev'd Jamee-Lee b.93; Cert IV Vet.Nursing (TAFE) 2012; BTh (CSU) 
2015. D.2015. Assist Curate Parish Kenmore- Brookfield 15-16; Assistant Curate Parish 
Bulimba 16-17; Assist Priest Parish of Bulimba 17-18. PTO Parish of Wynnum from Sept 
18. Locum Priest Manly Parish from Sept 18.  66 Grenade Street Cannon Hill 4170 Tel:
3399 1508(BH) Mbl: 0452 338 933 email: locumjamee@gmail.com;
jameec27@gmail.com:        PTO

CAMERON, The Rev'd Ross Donald b.40; St Francis' Coll; B Ag Sc (Univ of Qld) 62; BD 
(Univ of Qld) 69; ThL (ACT) 72; D.69; P.70  Rockptn; A.C. Park Ave, Rockptn 69-72; A.C. 
Barcaldine 72-73; A.C. St Paul's Cathl 73-75; R. Longreach 75-83; Dean of Western Area 
82- 83; Dio of Rockptn; R. St Colomb's, Clayfield 83-90; R. St Augustine's, Oakey 90-02;
P-in-C Brisbane Valley 02-06; PTO Brisbane Valley from 06.  8 Ann Street, Esk 4312 Tel:
5424 2553 email: rossandjocelyn8@bigpond.com;  S: Jocelyn:       Retired PTO

CAMPBELL, The Rev'd Donald George (Bro Donald Campbell, SSF) b.50; St John's 
Coll, Auckland, NZ; B Theol (Univ of Auckland) 91; Dip Litt Stud (Melb Coll of Div) 93; M 
Ed (ACU) 02; MAICD; D.94; P.96; Member SSF 72-78 and from 89; Hon A.C. St Paul's, 
Ipswich 94-96; Chapl, Cannon Hill Anglican College 96-02; PTO Dio of Bris 02-03; P-in-
C, St Philip's, Annerley from 03; Chapl, Univ of Qld 04-07; Area Dean of Brisbane South 
East 05-07; Examining Chapln from 2010. PinC Parish of East Brisbane from Nov 17. 
(remaining PinC Parish of Annerley).  (Bro Donald Campbell SSF), 115 Cornwall Street, 
Annerley 4103 (PO Box 6134, Buranda 4102) Tel: 3391 3915 Fax: 3391 3916 Mbl: 0410 
444 502 email: brdonald@franciscan.org.au; brotherdonald@hotmail.com:            Active 

CAMPBELL, The Venerable Donald Keith b.39; Moore Coll, Syd; B Sc (Univ of Qld) 64; 
ThL (ACT) 68; Dip RE (MCD) 70; Th Schol (ACT) 72; D.68; P.69 Bris; A.C. St Stephen's, 
Coorparoo 68-70; A.C. All Saints', Booval 70-73; R. Kilkivan 73-79; Miss Chapl (Gen Sec 

49

mailto:revbutler@optusnet.com.au
mailto:revhelenbutton@gmail.com
mailto:rcairns4@optusnet.com.au
mailto:mncalder@gmail.com
mailto:jameec27@gmail.com
mailto:rossandjocelyn8@bigpond.com
mailto:brdonald@franciscan.org.au
mailto:brotherdonald@hotmail.com


 

CMS Qld) 79-93; R. Holy Spirit, Surfers Paradise 93-04; Archd of the Gold Coast 95-04; 
PTO Biggera Waters-Coomera Valley from 04; Archdeacon Emeritus from 05.  41 Rix 
Drive, Upper Coomera 4209 Tel: 07 55 805 814(BH) 5580 0692(AH) Mbl: 0412 277 737 
email: dlcampbe@onthenet.com.au;  S: Lurline:         Retired PTO  
 
CARLYON, The Venerable Mark Douglas b.59; St Francis' Coll; B Bus (QIT) 82; BA (Univ 
of Qld) 88; D.85; P.86; A.C. St James', Toowoomba 85-87; A.C. St Paul's, Maryborough 
87-88; P-in-C St George's, Crows Nest 88-90; PTO Dio of Bris 90-15; PinC Toowoomba 
St James' from 15; Archdeacon of the Downs from 2016; Rector from 2017.  145 Mort 
Street, Toowoomba 4350 (PO Box 2004, Toowoomba   4350) Tel: 4639 1858(BH) 4639 
1858(AH) Mbl: 0419 729 233 email: rector@stjames.org.au;  S: Sian:                 Active  
 
CATT, The Very Rev'd Dr Peter Charles B.60; B Sc (Hons)(UNSW) 82; PhD (UNSW) 86; 
BD (Morpeth MCD) 89; D & P 89, Dio of Newcastle; A.C. Ch Ch Cathl, Newcastle 89-91; 
R. Beresfield 91-97; Area Dean Maitland 93-97 Dio of Grafton; Dean ChCh Cathl, Grafton 
97-07; Bp's Commissary 04-07; Dir of Formation 05-07; Dio of Brisbane; Sub Dean and 
Minor Canon, St John's Cathl 07-08; Presentation Board from 2008; QCT Exec from 
2008; Camerata Committee member 2008-2014; General Synod Representative from 
2004; Dean of St John's Cathedral from 08.  The Deanery, 417 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000 
St John's Cathedral GPO Box 421, Brisbane  4001 Tel: 3835 2239(BH) Fax: 3832 3173 
Mbl: 0404 052 494 email: pcatt@stjohnscathedral.com.au:                 Active  
 
CHAMBERS, The Rev'd Ellen Jilleen b.50; Assoc Dip Appl Sc Lt stud (Coll Art) 1990; 
BAD VocEd (Griffith) 2000; CPE (Bris) 2000; MTh (St Mark's) 2013; Dip Angl Orders (St 
Mark's) 2008; GradDipTheol (SFC) (BCT) 2003; D.07 (Grafton). P.08 (Grafton). AsstP 
Bellinger 2008-10; Asst P Grafton 2010-12; PinC Macksville 2012-13; R Macksville 2013-
15; PTO Dioc Bne, Redcliffe Parish from 2016. L/T Kilcoy 17-18; PinC Parish of Kilcoy 
from 2018.  PO Box 86 Kilcoy 4515  Mbl: 0419 676 180 email: 
j.chambers@westnet.com.au:                     Active  
 
CHANT, The Rev'd Maurice Ronald b.26; Chichester Th Coll 51; D.54; P.55; C. St Mark's, 
Mitcham 54-57; C. St Matthew's, Surbiton 57-60; P-in-C Holy Trinity Cookridge 60-64; V. 
Holy Trinity Cookridge 64-67; Chapl Missions to Seamen, Tilbury 67-71; Great Yarmouth 
71-77; Brisbane 77-84; Singapore 84-85; Geelong 85-91; PTO Dio of Bris 91-15; 
Archbishop's Certificate from 2015.  15 Marcel Place, Wellington Point 4160 Contact via 
Daughter (Brenda Davis Mbl: 0419798205):              Archbishop's Cert  
 
CHARRINGTON, The Rev'd Marjorie Louise b.43; St Francis' Coll; Tchg Cert (KGTC) 62; 
B Ed St (Univ of Qld) 75; M Ed St (Univ of Qld) 88; Grad Dip Th (BCT) 99; D.2000; P.01; 
Hon A.C. St Andrew's, Lutwyche 2000-02; A.C. St Alban's, Wilston 02-03; Priest in the 
Parish of Laidley 04-08; Priest in the Parish of Crows Nest 08-13. PTO Retired Parish of 
Crow's Nest from 13. Tel Fri pm to Mon am 4698 1403; Mon pm - Fri am 3265 1271.  Villa 
126/274 Roghan Road TAIGUM 4018 Tel: 3265 1271(BH) 3265 1271 email: 
anglicanchurch1priest@bigpond.com:          Retired PTO  
 
CHEVIS, The Rev'd Ian Richard b.50; St Francis' Coll; D.02; Hon Dcn, Parish of Logan 
from 02.  219/74 Beutel Street , Waterford West  4133 Tel: 3200 5583 email: 
ijchevis@tpg.com.au S: Judy:                     Active  
 
CHIPLIN, The Venerable Michael Alfred b.50; St John's Coll, Morpeth; Dip Th (Morpeth) 
76; D.76; P.77 Dio of Newcastle; D. Asst Wallsend 76; Asst P. Toronto 77-79; Asst P. 
Mayfield 79-81; Bp's Chapl/Media Offcr/Chapl RNH 81-84; P-in-C Tumbi Umbi 84-89; P-

50

mailto:dlcampbe@onthenet.com.au
mailto:rector@stjames.org.au
mailto:pcatt@stjohnscathedral.com.au
mailto:j.chambers@westnet.com.au
mailto:anglicanchurch1priest@bigpond.com


in-C Bateau Bay 90 Exchange Parish of Leesburg USA 90; R. Toronto 90-92; Dio of 
Newcastle; Memb OGS from 92; 95 Sub Chap The Most Ven Order of the Hospital of St 
John of Jerusalem; Dean ChCh Cathl; R. Darwin 92-97; Dio of Nthn Terr; R. St Andrew's, 
Indooroopilly from 98; Abp's Exam Chapl 2000-05; Area Dean of Bne West 01-03; Chapl 
SSA 03-12; Archd of Oxley 06 - 17; Prior OGS Brisbane from 2013. Archdeacon Emeritus 
from 17. PTO Annerley from 18.  19/580 Seventeen Mile Rocks Road Sinnamon Park 
4073 (PO Box 3176 Darra 4076) Tel: 3279 0745 Mbl: 0448 898 713 email: 
mchiplin@ogs.net:  PTO 

CHIPPENDALE, The Rev'd Robert William b.42; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip 68; BA (OU) 
Eng 79; DipT 85; D.67; P.68; C. St Paul's, Maryborough 67-69; C. St Margaret's, 
Hollinwood 70-72; V. Holy Trinity, Shaw 72-78; Dio of Manchester; R. St Thomas', 
Beaudesert 79- 84; PTO Dio of Bris 84; Chapl St Hilda's School, Southport 85-03; PTO 
Kawana Waters from 04. L/T Nanango Parish from 17.  110 Burnett Street Nanango 4615 
Mbl: 0411 200 838:                Retired PTO 

CHOL, The Rev'd Elizabeth Adol b.68; Dinka Knowledge, Sudan, Kenya; D.06; P.07; 
Kakuma Refugee Camp, Kenya (Dio Bor)06-09; (Dio Brsbn) Parish of Ekibin, St Aidan's 
Ang Girls' School 09-13; Parish of Ipswich 2013-15; Hon Assist Priest Parish of St Paul's 
Ipswich from 2015.  16 Waxberry Court, Redbank Plains 4301  Mbl: 0469 372 890 S: 
Simon:                       Active  

CLACK, The Rev'd Elsie Veronica Mary b.44; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 99; 
CPE 2000; B Th (BCT) 03; CPE2 2005; D.99; P.04; Hon Dcn St Thomas', Toowong 99-
04; Hon A.C. 04-2014; Locum Tenens Chapl, Royal Brisbane Hospital 05; Locum Tenens 
Chapl, Greenslopes Private Hospital 06-06; PTO (Rtd) Parish of Toowong from 2014. 
Unit 5, Hilltop Gardens, 23 Rochester Terrace, Kevin Grove 4059 Tel: 3831 4656 Mbl: 
0418 659 882 email: clack7@bigpond.com:         Retired PTO  

CLARK, The Rev'd Danielle Louise b. 73. BTh CSU 19. Ass Curate St John's Cathedral 
from 19.   (105 Cobb Road BURPENGARY EAST  4505)  Mbl: 0473 149 451 email: 
danni@newbyclark.com;  S: David:                    Active  

CLARK, The Rt Rev'd Bruce Quinton b.39; St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 62; D& P 63; A.C. 
All Saints', Chermside 63-65; A.C. St Matthew's, Grovely 65-67; V. St Luke's, Miles 67-
70; R. St Matthew's, Gayndah 70-76; R. St Peter's, Gympie 76-83; R. St Paul's, 
Maryborough 83-89; R.D. of Wide Bay 76-83; R.D. of Burnett 83-85; Archd of Wide 
Bay/Burnett 85-89; R. Holy Spirit, Surfers Paradise 89-93; Archd of Moreton 89-91; Archd 
of the Gold Coast 91-93; Cons Bp of Riverina 11June 93; Bp of Riverina 93-04; PTO 
Bribie Island from 04.  6 Green Street,  Banksia Beach 4507 Tel: 3408 7618 email: 
bqne@bigpond.com;  S: Betty:                  Bishops Ret PTO 

CLIFTON, The Rev'd Raymond Henry b.57; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 87; Grad Dip 
Arts (RE) (ACU) 94; CPE 96; M R Ed (ACU) 06; TSSF; D.87; P.88; A.C. St Mark's, 
Warwick 87-90; A.C. St James', Toowoomba 90-91; P-in-C St Peter's, Millmerran 91-92; 
Miss Chapl 92-94 (LT The Gap 92-93, Sandgate, Fortitude Valley, Camp Hill-Norman 
Park 93-94; Locum Chapl Mater Hospital 94); Chapl, Mater Hosp 95-02; P-in-C, Prov Par 
of St Paul's, Samford 2000-03; Miss Chapl 03; Assoc P. Hervey Bay 04-08; Hon Padre 
Hervey Bay RSL Sub- Branch 07-08; R. Drayton 09-14; Exam. Chpln from 2012; Mission 
- Chpln Mgr Spiritual & Pastoral Care from 2014. Regional Minister - Qld B/NNSW Third
Order SSF 16-18. Co-Regional Minister - Qld B/NNSW Third Order SSF 2018.  PO Box
1213, Stafford 4051 Tel: 3838 7558(BH) Fax: 3838 7654 Mbl: 0403 754 462 email:
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rclifton@anglicaresq.org.au; raymondclifton@australis.net;  S: Roslyn:  Active 

CLIFTON, The Rev'd Roslyn Margaret b.57; St Francis' Coll; Dip Tchg (NBCAE) 77; CPE 
98; B Th (BCT) 98; D.98; P.99; Hon A.C. St Clement's, Stafford 98-99; A.C. St Mark's, 
Warwick 99-2000; PTO Dio of Bris 2000-03; Asst Chapl, Fraser Coast Anglican College 
04-07; PTO Hervey Bay 07-09. PTO Drayton 09-14. Assistant Priest (P/T) Parish of
Kenmore-Brookfield 2014. PTO Parish of Clayfield, St Mark's from 2015.  26 Bohland
Street, Kedron 4031 (PO Box 1213, Stafford 4053)  email: roslynclifton@australis.net;  S:
Ray:          PTO

COLBERT, The Rev'd Canon Keith Stanley William b.40; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 
73; Grad Dip RE (MGCAE) 81; MA (ACU) 2000; D.63; P.64; A.C. Holy Trinity, Fortitude 
Valley 63; A.C. St Peter's, Wynnum 64-66; M. Bush Bro St Paul 67-68; L/T Katherine NT 
67. R. ChCh, Childers 69-73; R. St John's, Mundubbera 73-80; R. St Matthew's, Grovely
80-2005; Hon Canon, St John's Cathl from 04; R. St Paul's, Manly 05-2010; L/T Gayndah
2011. Canon Emeritus from 2010; PTO(Rtd) Wynnum from 2010; Sept 2014 L/T
Muswellbrook (Dio of Newcastle). Oct-Nov 2014 LT Morningside;. Dec 2014-April 2015
L/T Wynnum; May-June 2015 L/T Waterloo Bay; July-Sept 2015 L/T Inala. Dec 15 - Nov
16 L/T Sunnybank. L/T St Gabriel's Carindale from July 18.  24 Calloway Place, Manly
West 4179 Tel: 3393 6899 Mbl: 0419 174 741 email: kcolbert@powerup.com.au;  S:
Carmel:                            Retired PTO

COLBRAHAMS, The Rev'd Jennifer Anne b.55; St Francis' Coll; B Sc (Univ of Qld) 76; 
Dip Ed (Univ of Qld) 77; B Th (BCT) 93; D.92; P.93; A.C. St Mark's, Slacks Creek 92-93; 
A.C. ChCh, Bundaberg 94-95; Joint P-in-C Prov Par Park Ridge-Browns Plains 95-98;
PTO 98-99; Joint P-in-C Prov Par Moggill-Mt Crosby 99-04; PTO Moggill-Mt Crosby 05-
09; PTO Goodna 09-12; PinC Gatton from 2012.  15 Duncan Street, Chuwar 4306 (PO
Box 373 Gatton 4343) Tel: 5462 1006 (BH) AH) Fax: 5462 1795 email:
jcolbrahams@bigpond.com;  S: Bill:                  Active

COLBRAHAMS, The Rev'd William Francis b.52; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 74; B 
Com (Univ of Qld) 81; Dip Adv Acc (Univ of Qld) 84; B Th (BCT) 93; D.92; P.93; A.C. St 
Andrew's, Indooroopilly 92-94; A.C. ChCh, Bundaberg 94-95; Joint P-in-C Prov Par Park 
Ridge- Browns Plains 95-98; PTO 98-99; Joint P-in-C Prov Par Moggill-Mt Crosby 99-04; 
Area Dean of Brisbane West 03-07; P-in-C Prov Par Moggill-Mt Crosby 05-09; PTO 
Goodna 09-2011; Locum Assoc P Cleveland 09; L/T Logan 10; L/T Rosewood 10-11; 
PinC Rosewood 2011-2016; Hon Assoc Priest Gatton with MaMa Creek from 2016. L/T 
Ithaca-Red Hill from 2017.  15 Duncan Street, Chuwar 4306 Mbl: 0409 071 215 email: 
bcolbrahams@bigpond.com;  S: Jennifer:                   Active  

COLEMAN, The Rev'd John Anthony b. 63. M Litt (CQU) 1999; GradCertMgt (UWS) 
2000; Mth (CSU) 2012; Companion (CQU). D. 88. P. 88 (Roman Catholic, Diocese of 
Rockhampton). CRC Emerald 89-91; C RC Rockhampton 92-93; R RC Barcaldine 93-
95; Rec Anglican Communion 2010; PinCMoranbah 10; PinC Clemont/Moranbah 2000-
13; R Callide Valley 13-18; Dir Ordained Min Formation Rockhampton; Police Chaplain 
Biloela, Diocesan Administrator Rockhampton 14; Archdeacon and Vicar General 
Rockhampton 14- 18; Bne Dio. PinC Parish of Centenary Suburbs from 19.   (43 
MacFarlane Street Middle Park 4074)  Mbl: 0414 722 008 email: 
jcoleman_47@bigpond.com;  S: Margaret:  Active 

COLLEDGE, The Rev'd Nicole b.72; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 92; Grad Dip Ed 
(ACU) 93; Grad Dip Th (BCT) 97; MTh (BCT) 2000; MEdLead (ACU) 2016; D & P 2000; 
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Chapl, St Paul's School, Bald Hills 2000-06; Hon A.C., St John's, Enoggera 2000-02; Hon 
A.C. Burpengary-Deception Bay-Narangba (Freshwater) 02-03; Assoc P., Chermside 07-
09; Chapl, St Margaret's Angl Girls Schl from 07; PTO Aspley-Albany Creek from 09. 
Hon. Canon St John's Cathedral from 18.  5 Brook Street, Nundah 4012 Tel: 3862 
0716(BH) 3266 7222(AH) Mbl: 0405 354 035 email: ncolledge@stmargarets.qld.edu.au;  
S: Richard:                Chaplains  
 
COLLINS, The Rev'd Maurice Frank b.44; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 72; D.69; P.71; 
A.C. All Saints', Chermside 69-70; A.C. St Peter's, Southport 71-73; V. All Saints', Mitchell 
73-77; V. St Gabriel's, Carina-Belmont 77-79; R. 79-2012; (Parish re-named Carindale 
99); PTO Parish of Alexandra Hills 2013-2016; PTO Parish of Jimboomba from 2016..  
73 Friar Street, Munruben 4125 Tel: 3297 0842 Mbl: 0478 634 126 email: 
mfcdec@iinet.net.au;  S: Denise         Retired PTO 
 
COLYER, The Rev'd Alan Stewart b.46; Ridley Coll, Melb 74; Dip RE, AASA, ThL; D.75; 
P.76; A.C. St Mark's, Launceston 75-76; P-in-C St Peter's, Fingal Valley 76-78; R. St 
James', Franklin Valley 78-80; Chapl ARA 80-82; R. St Alban's, Claremont w Chigwell 
82-86; Dio of Tasmania; R. St John's, Dalby 86-91; R. St Lawrence's, Caboolture 91-98; 
Police Chapl, Caboolture 91-98; ARes Chapl 83-02; Miss Chapl from 98 (LT Stanthorpe 
2000-04); P-in-C St Paul's, Stanthorpe 04-05; Police Chapl, Warwick District 04-05. (Dio 
of Melb) V.Moonee Ponds 05-15; PinC Ascot Vale 06-08; Police Chap Vic 08-12; AD 
Essendon 09-15. PTO Melbourne 15-16. (Dio Bris) PTO Stanthorpe from 16;  9 Maria 
Court Stanthorpe  4380 Tel: 4681 4808 Mbl: 0418 708 610 email: colyer@outlook.com;  
S: Heather            Retired PTO  
 
COOPER, The Rev'd Clive Anthony Charles b.38. B.Ed (Hons) Religious Studies & Ed. 
(London Uni) 74; A.L.C.D. Theol. (London Coll of Divinity) 62; Tchrs Cert. Ed. Relig. 
Studies (London Uni) 73; Dip English (Argentine Assoc. of English Culture, Buenos Aires) 
67; Spanish (GCE A Level) 86. D.62; P.63; Royal Artillery Far East MoD 57-59; AC Parish 
of Morden (Dio Southwark) 62-65; Mission Partner Sth American Mission Society 65-71; 
Teacher/Governor/Religious Studies Advsr. St Nicolas Schoo 74-92; Hon Curate St 
Nicolas Church Cranleigh 78-79; Hon Curate St Peter & St Paul Ewhurst 80-82; Hon 
Chpln Duke of Kent Schl. 83-92; Served on Latin-American Cttee of World Affairs Group; 
Management Cttee of Stapleford House Education Centre, Nottingham; Tchng Chpln 
Felixstowe Coll. (St Edmundsbury & Ipswich Exeter Dio.) 92-93; PTO Hartland Deanery 
94-95; Chpln St Andrew's Puerto Pollensa & St Philip & St James Palma de Mallorca 95-
02; Priest in the Spanish Episcopal Reformed Church 95-02; PinC St John the Baptist, 
Instow (Dio Exeter) 03-07; PinC St Peter Westleigh 03-07; PTO (Dio of Europe) 08-12; 
PTO Hartland Deanery (Dio Exeter) 09-12; PTO Parish of Wynnum (Dio Brisbane) 12-
17. PTO Parish of Cleveland (Dio Brisbane) from 17.  64 Benfer Road, Victoria Point 4165 
Tel: 3820 7088 Mbl: 0435 413 206 email: clivecooper141@yahoo.com.au;  S: Sally-Ann: 
              Retired PTO  
 
CORNER, The Rev'd John Peter Alison b.42; St Francis' Coll; B Eng (Univ of Qld) 66; M 
Eng Sc (Univ of NSW) 78; B Th (BCT) 92; D.90; P.92; Hon A.C. St Andrew's Lutwyche 
90-93; A.C. St John's, Dalby 93-94; P-in-C St Martin's, Tara 95-98; P-in-C St George's, 
Crows Nest 98-02; R. St David's, Chelmer 02-12; PTO Tamborine Mtn from 2012.  33 
Dapsang Drive Eagle Heights 4271 Tel: 5545 4778 Mbl: 0477 839 136 email: 
johncorner@people.net.au;  S: Kaye:          Retired PTO  
 
CORNISH, The Rev'd John William b.48;BBus. 1976, DipTech (NSWIT) 1974; BTh. 
DipMin (ACT) 1982; D.81; (C&G) P.82,C&G) AsstC. St Paul's, Cooma, 81-84; P-in-C 
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StJames', Keppel, Dio of Rockptn, 84-86; R. 86-89, Tutor GBRE 86-89; Snr AsstP St Jas 
(Syd) 89-92 Pres St L Ho 90-92; R Indooroopilly (Bris) 92-97) Pres Anglicans Together 
99-05; (Dio Syd) R St Alban's Epping 97-2015; General Licence (Dio Sydney) 2015; (Dio 
Bris) PTO Buderim from 2015.  67 Karawatha Drive Mountain Creek 4557  Mbl: 0421 310 
126 email: john@cornish.biz;  S: Christine:                         Retired PTO  
 
COSGROVE, The Rev'd James Edward b.56. Grad.Dip RE(Univ SA) 94; D83. P83. Pius 
XII Seminary 74-80; 1982. Ordained RC Dcn 83; Ordained RC Priest 83; Chap Gres (PT) 
1988-92 HQ 7 Bde, 25 RQR 92-93; HQ7 Bde Coord Chap 93-97; 7CSSB 97-98; DFHQ 
98.  Chap ARA (FT) 98 HQ 5 Bde Coord Chap 98-01; Op Bel Isi Bogainville, Dec 98; 
May-October 99; Dec 2000-Jan 2001 UNAME, East TimorT May-June 2001; HQ 1 Bde 
Coord Chap 02-03; RTC (NQ) Area Spt Chap 2004-05. RMC Duntroon 2006; Senior 
Chap AHQ 2007- 09; Senior Chap 1st Division 2009; Received into Anglican Church 
October 2003 by Bp Tom Frame; Defence Force Chplain; Snr Mission Chpln ADF HQ 1st 
Div. Gallipoli Barracks Enoggera from 09-12; Operation Slipper, Afghanistan April to 
November 2011-12. Trnsfrrd to Sydney from 2013-2016.  78 Mooroondu Road, Thornside 
4158 Tel: 3822 4624 Mbl: 0412 960 894 email: jim.cosgrove@defence.gov.au; 
jimcoz@bigpond.com;  S: Jeanette:                        PTO  
 
COX, The Rev'd David Percy b.48; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 93; D.87 Dio of NQ; P.92 
Dio of Bris; Dcn, Holy Trinity, Mackay, Dio of NQ 87-90; Hon A.C. St Clement's, Stafford 
90-92; Hon Miss Chapl (St Francis' Coll) 92; A.C. St Paul's, Cleveland 93-94; P-in-C Prov 
Par of Jimboomba 94-98; P-in-C St Margaret's, Nerang 99-08; Duty Chapl, Numinbah 
Correctional Centre 2000-01; R. St Paul's, Cleveland 08- 13; Examining Chapln from 
2010; PTO Nerang from 13.  1 Eden Park Court Mt Nathan 4211 Tel: 55337501 Rector's 
Office: Mbl: 0439 963 203 email: davphylcox@bigpond.com;  S: Phyl:       Retired PTO  
 
CRAIG-LEAVES, The Rev'd Julie Elizabeth b.63. BTh. (Southampton Uni) 1987; D.87; 
P.92; Curate St Mary's Thatcham (Dio Oxford) 86-88; Chaplain St John's Cath. (Dio Hong 
Kong) 88-92; PTO (Dio Perth) 92-92; Assoc.P Fremantle 92-95; Chapln St Mary's AGS 
96-09; Lcm St Margaret's Nedlands 5/09-6/09; Lcm Amana Living 5/09-7/09; R. 
Sandgate-Northpoint (Dio Brisbane) from 9 Aug. 09.  103 Denham Street, Bracken Ridge 
4017 (Locked Bag 8004 Ipswich 4350) Tel: 3269 1148(BH) 3269 0463(AH) Fax: 3869 
2100 Mbl: 0481 533 123 email: jewlz636@bigpond.com;                    Active  
 
CRAWFORD, The Rev'd Jillian Joyce b.39. D. 96 (C&G), P. 97 (C&G); Dio C&G: ATO 
C&G 04; Hon AsstP Jamison 99. (Dio Bris) PTO Jimboomba from 16.  461 Stockleigh 
Road Stockleigh 4280  Mbl: 0421 166 492 email: jill.crawford4@gmail.com; :  
             Retired PTO  
 
CROMBIE, The Reverend Jan Mary b.55; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 76; Grad Dip 
Sec St (RMIT) 77;Grad Dip Th (BCT) 98;  M.Theol (CSU) 2011; D.99; P.2000; A.C. St 
Andrew's, Indooroopilly 2000-02; R. St John's, Enoggera 02-06; Diocesan Nominator 02-
05; Area Dean of Brisbane North West 04-07; R. St Matthew's and All Saints, Grovely 06-
2011; Exec Director Parishes and Other Mission Agencies Commission 11-14; Diocesan 
Nominator 08-14. Dio. of Melbourne, Archdeacon, Diocesan Partnerships 14-18. Rector 
Kenmore-Brookfield Parish from 2018.   (PO Box 1090 Kenmore 4069)  Parish Office:: 
Mbl: 0439 222 112 email: rector@kenbrookang.org.au;  S: Graham:               Active 
 
CROSSMAN, The Rev'd Canon Elisabeth Fancourt b.47; St Mark's Canb; RGN (RMH) 
68; B Th (Syd Coll of Div/St Mark's Canb) 94; Cert Min (St Mark's Canb) 94; Grad Dip 
Pastoral Counselling (Charles Sturt Univ) 01; D.92 Dio of NQ; P.97 Dio of Bris; Hon A.C. 
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St Mary Magdalene, Pioneer Valley 92-94; Hon A.C. St Charles, West Mackay 94-95; Dio 
of NQ; PNG 95-97; PTO Dio of Bris 97; Hon A.C. Kingaroy 97-2000; Mission Chaplain 
2000-02; Assoc P. St Andrew's, Caloundra 02-06; R. Holy Trinity, Goondiwindi 06-09; 
Hon Canon, St John's Cathl 06 PinC Freshwater 09-13; Prov President MU Australia from 
2011; PTO St John's Cathedral from 2014; Canon Emeritus St John's Cathedral from 
2017.  83/316 Long Street East, Graceville 4075 Tel: 3278 1013 Mbl: 0407 131 488 email: 
libbiecrossman47@gmail.com;  S: Bill:            Retired PTO 

CROSSMAN, The Rev'd William David b.48; St Mark's Canb; BPharm (Univ of Qld) 68; 
Grad Dip Appl Sc (Swinburne Coll Melb) 79; ThL (St Mark's Canb) 90; B Th (St Mark's 
Canb) 95; Cert Min (St Mark's Canb) 95; D.90, P.91 Dio of NQ; A.C. St Charles' West 
Mackay 90-92; R. 92-94; Dio of NQ; Gen Lic ACPNG (Nat Health Sec, Ang Ch of PNG) 
95-97; P-in-C Kingaroy 97-2000; Area Dean of Bunya 97-2000; R. St Andrew's,
Caloundra 2000-06; Abp's Exam Chapl 03-13; Priest in the Parish of Texas-Inglewood
06-09 R. Bribie Island April 09- Dec. 2013; PTO St Lucia from 2014.  83/316 Long Street
East, Graceville 4075 Tel: 3278 1013 Mbl: 0417 795 824 email: 
billcrossman48@gmail.com;  S: Libbie:  PTO 

CROTHERS-ROBERTSON, The Rev'd Susan Janet b.60; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 
98; MA (Leadership)(ACU) 06; Grad Cert (Higher Ed) (Griffith) 2011; D.97; P.98; A.C. St 
Paul's, Maryborough 97-2000; P-in-C Burpengary-Deception Bay-Narangba 2000-02; 
Freshwater 02- 05; Abp's Exam Chapl 02-08; Minor Canon (Canon Pastor) St John's 
Cathl 06-09; Dir Ministry Formation, Lecturer Pastoral Theology SFC, MEC 09-13; 
Mission Chaplain, St John's Cathedral 2013; Chpln St John's Anglican College from 2014 
PO Box 4078, Forest Lake  4078 Tel: 3372 0147(BH) Mbl: 0413 553 223 email: scrothers-
robertson@sjac.qld.edu.au;  S: Craig:              Chaplains  

CUFFE, The Rev'd John Norman b.44; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT); CPE (Bris) 81-82; 
QICPE Cert 03; D.80; P.81; Asst P. St Stephen's, Portland and Asst Chapl Missions to 
Seamen Dio of Ballarat 80; A.C. St Andrew's, Lutwyche 80-82; Precentor, St John's Cathl 
82-84; V. St John the Divine, Ipoh, Dio of West Malaysia 84-86; PTO Dio of Bris from 86.
(LT Woolloongabba 92-93; pt St Hugh's Inala 94-97); P-in-C St Hugh's, Inala 97-02;
Locum Chapl Wolston Park Hosp 02; Chapl Mater Hosp 03-07; P-in-C, Christ Church,
Milton 07-09. P-in-C Auchenflower-Milton 09-2014; PTO(Rtd) Parish of Indooroopilly from
2014. L/T Fortitude Valley 16. L/T Eastern Hills Anglicans 17; L/T Rosewood Parish from
Aug 17.  121 Bullock Dray Drive, Mt Crosby    4306 Tel: 3201 2968 Mbl: 0488 668 218
email: jcuffe44@bigpond.net.au:            Retired PTO

CULLEN, The Rev'd Marilyn Ann b.50; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Th (ACT) 94; B Th 
(BCT) 01; D.99; Hon Dcn St Catherine's, Centenary Suburbs 99; Hon Dcn St Mary's, 
Kangaroo Point 2000-05; Abp's Exam Chapl 04-2010; Hon Dcn St Matthew's, Holland 
Park 05-08. Hon Deacon Bribie Island from 09. Deacon PTO Bribie Island from 16.  4/15 
First Avenue Bribie Island Woorim 4507 Mbl: 0412 473 539 email: 
macullen59@gmail.com;  S: Rod:   PTO 

CURRY, The Rev'd David Leslie b.54; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip; D.79; P.80; A.C. St Peter's, 
Gympie 79-81; A.C. ChCh Bundaberg 81-82; Assoc P. St Paul's, Roma 82-83; V. St 
Matthew's, Gayndah 83-85; R. 85-90; Assoc P. ChCh Bundaberg 90-93; Assoc P. Hervey 
Bay 93-99; Asst P. St Andrew's, Caloundra 99-2000; PTO Dio of Bris from 2000.  28 
Cooroora Street, Caloundra  4551 Tel: 5492 5888                       PTO  

CUSSEN, The Rev'd Colin Francis b.31; St Michael's House, Crafers; CertT (Qld) 49; 
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ThL 56; BA (Univ of Qld) 69; MA (Theol) Uni Qld 1995 GBRE 1972-89 D.55; P.57 Dio of 
NQ; Asst P. St Matthew's, Mundingburra 57-60; Yth Dir & Miss Sec St Peter's, West End, 
Townsville 60-61; Co-Principal St Mary's School, Herberton 61-65; R. St Luke's, Sarina 
65-70; R. Holy Trinity, Ingham 70-74 (incl LT St John's, Tully 72-73); Res Canon St James
Cathl 72; R. St John's, Cairns and Archd of Cairns 74-78; R. St Matthew's, Mundingburra
and Archd of Central Region 78-89 (incl LT St Paul's, Charters Towers 78-79 and Chapl
St Anne's School, Townsville 78-79); Bp's Commissary 78-89; Dio of NQ; R. St Thomas',
Toowong 89-01; Area Dean of Brisbane West 93-96; PTO (Ret) Kangaroo Point 01-17'
Archbishop's Certificate to Officiate on Special Occasions from 2017.  87 Broomfield
Street, Taringa   4068 (PO Box 260, Toowong   4066) Tel: 3878 6493 Mbl: 0407 488 882
email: colin.cussen@bigpond.com;  S: Deirdre:          Retired PTO

DALE, The Rev'd Alan Arthur b.46; St Francis' Coll; BA (Hons) (Univ of Qld) 68; Dip Ed 
(Univ of Qld) 69; B Ed (Univ of Qld) 72; MACE 78; B Th (BCT) 96; MA (Theol) (ACU) 03; 
FACE 2012; SCP (Society of Catholic Priests) D.79; P.80; Hon A.C. St Thomas', Parish 
of Toowong 79-17; Retired PTO St Thomas', Parish of Toowong from 17.  2 Quinty Street, 
Fig Tree Pocket 4069 Tel: 3878 1825 Fax: 3832 6097 email: alanadale46@hotmail.com; 
S: Jane:                Retired PTO 

DANIEL, BROTHER   Bro SSF. See Matthews, D F    (   ) :  Active 

DANIELS, The Rev'd Dorothy b.45; ITE; DipTh (ACT) 99; Cert Past Min (GBRE) 99; D.92, 
P.94 Dio of NQ; Hon Dcn St John's, Cairns 92- 94; Hon Asst R. 94-95; LT All Saints,
Gordonvale 95; R. 95-2000; Dio of NQ; PTO Parish of Drayton from 01.  9 Perrins Road,
Cambooya   4358 Tel: 4696 1625 Mbl: 0429 472 468 email: rd_daniels@bigpond.com:

 Retired PTO 

DARBYSHIRE, The Rev'd Brian b.48; Territorial Dec. 03; BA (Oak Hill Theol Coll) 83; 
DipTh (UofKent) 81; D.83 (Lond); P.84 (Lond.); Church Army Evangelist (UK) 68-83; C. 
Enfield St James (UK) 83-86; R Slaidburn (Dio Bradford UK) 86-92; V St John, Great 
Harwood ( Dio Blackburn UK) 92-2002; Chpln Royal Army (UK) 90-03; V St Ninian 
Douglas, Isle of Man, (Dio of Sodor & Man) 02-08; (Dio Armidale) V. Bingara 08-13; (Dio 
Brisbane) PTO Sunnybank from 2013.  27/91 Dorset Drive, Rochedale South 4123 Tel: 
3423 2529 Mbl: 0456 397 867 email: darbyshirebrian@hotmail.com;            Retired PTO 

DAUGAARD, The Rev'd Peter William b.41; Moore Coll; ThL (ACT) 70; Dip Th (Moore 
Coll) 71; Dip RE (Melb Coll of Div) 76; D.70, P.71, Dio of Syd; A.C. St John's, North Ryde 
70-71; A.C. St Ann's, Ryde 71-72; A.C. All Saints, Nowra 72-74; Dio of Syd; Chapl ARA
74-82; A to O Dio of NQ 74-77; Bris 78; Riverina 79-82; Canb-Goulb 79-82; R. St
Andrew's, Strathfield 82-97; pt Chapl Lidcombe Hosp 84-94; Dio of Syd; PTO Dio of Bris
97-2012; PTO (Rtd) St Mark's, Clayfield 2012-2016.  401 Sandgate Road, Albion  4010
Tel: 3256 0005 Mbl: 0421 603 259 email: restawhile@ozemail.com.au;  S: Rosalie:

 Archbishop's Cert 

DAVIDSON, The Rev'd Robert John b.44; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 92; D.88; P.89; 
A.C. St Matthew's, Sherwood 88-91; A.C. St George's, Birkdale 91-92; P-in-C St
Matthew's, Gayndah 92-96; R. St George's, Maleny 96-05; Area Dean of the Sunshine
Coast 01-05;  Parish Exchange Blaydon on Tyne Dio Durham UK Sept 04-Mar 05; PTO
Maroochydore from 06; LT Mundubbera-Eidsvold-Monto July 11 - Mar 12; L/T Cooroora
14-16; L/T Maroochydore 16-17.  54 Avocado Lane, Maleny  4552 Tel: 5494 2054 Mbl:
0477 428 732 email: rjhdavidson@bigpond.com S: Heather:                       Retired PTO
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DAVIS, The Rev'd Brenda Mary b.56; Cert Theol (CSU) 2010; AssocDegTh (CSU) 2014; 
D. 2012; Stip Lay Min Parish of Mt Gravatt 09-11, Stip Lay Min Parish of Mt Gravatt 2012-
2014.; Hon AC Mt Gravatt 2012-2014; Chaplaincy Supp. Officer/Hon Deacon West 
Moreton Ang Coll. from 2015.  12 Calimon Court Coalfalls 4305 Tel: 3497 8700 Mbl: 0419 
798 205 email: bmd56@tpg.com.au:                                    Active  
 
DAWSON, The Rev'd Lorraine June b.50; St Francis' Coll; Dip T (Newcastle CAE) 71; 
Dip Sp Ed (Newcastle CAE) 71; Grad Dip Ed St (Newcastle CAE) 81; Th Dip (ACT) 93; 
Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 93; Grad Dip Min (BCT) 95; M Ed St (RE) USA 97; D.92; P.95; Hon 
A.C. ChCh, Bundaberg 93; PTO Dio of Bris 94-95; Hon A.C. ChCh, Bundaberg 95-97; 
Chapl, St Luke's Anglican Schl 95-98; Chapl, Perth Coll, WA 99-02; Chaplain, Anglican 
Church Grammar School 03-06; PTO (Kangaroo Point) 06; Assoc Priest, Kenmore-
Brookfield 06-08; P-in-C, St Hugh's Inala 08-015; Rector Parish of Drayton 2015-2016; 
PTO Hervey Bay from 2016.  10 Crescent Street Urangan 4655 Tel: 0432 457 935 Mbl: 
0466 079 839 email: revlorraine@hotmail.com;  S: Philip:                   Active  
 
DEAN, The Rev'd Robert George b. 45; D. 03 (N.Z); P. 04 (N.Z); Deacon St Paul's 
Auckland NZ 03; Assisting Priest St Paul's Auckland NZ 04; ICHC Hospital Chaplain for 
WDHB NZ 04-08; All Saints Nth Rockhampton Assist. Priest 08-15; St John's Parkhurst 
Rockhampton p/t Priest 08-14; PTO Caboolture from 18.  214/176 Torrens Road 
Caboolture South 4510 Tel: 5355 7018 Mbl: 0458 755 963 email: 
dean308@westnet.com.au;  S: Sharron          Retired PTO  
 
DEAN, The Rev'd David Edward b.45; St Francis' Coll; ACIS 75; FIPA 78; B Th (BCT) 
94; D.94; P.99; Hon Deacon, Holy Spirit, Kenmore- Brookfield 94-99; Hon A.C. from 99; 
(LT 01-02). Hon Asst P. Kenmore-Brookfield 08-15; PTO (Rtd) Kenmore-Brookfield.  
8/117 Indooroopilly Road Taringa 4068 (PO Box 11 Indooroopilly 4068)  Mbl: 0407 152 
083 email: dmdean@optusnet.com.au;  S: Mary:          Retired PTO  
 
DEAN-JONES, OGS, The Venerable Keith Michael OGS; b.52; BA Dip.Ed (Macquarie 
University) 73; ThL (Hons) Morpeth ACT 76; D.76; P.77; Prec. Cathl 77-79; Assist E 
Maitland 79-81; OL 81-82; (Asst Leic UK); R Glos 82-87; OGS 85; R Wyoming 87-96; 
Provincial Aust OGS 96-2000; Rector Cardiff/Chapl Lay Litur/Chalice Assts 96-05; Adn 
Lake Macquarie 03-05; Chapl MVAC 06-08; (Dio Newc) Can 2000; Rector Taree 05-15; 
Provincial for Oratory of the Good Shepherd from 08. PinC Parish of Bundaberg 2015-
2016; Rector 2016-2017; Archdeacon Burnett from 2017..  2 Meilene Street, Kalkie 
Bundaberg 4670 (PO Box 275 Bundaberg 4670) Tel: 4151 3128(BH) 4151 2467(AH) Mbl: 
0407 693 897 email: rector@bundaberganglican.org:                  Active  
 
DEARDEN, The Rev'd Heather Bertha b.51. BTh (CSU) 16; D.16; P.17; Assist Priest 
Parish of Warwick from 2016.   (10 Panorama Court, Warwick 4370) Tel: 4661 3179 Mbl: 
0417 609 745 email: hbdearden@gmail.com;  S: George:                         Active  
 
DENG, The Rev'd David Aleer b.61; Dip.Theol (Timothy Training College,Sudan) 03; 
Malek Bible School Cert Ordination (Dio of Bor Sudan) 06; D.04; P.05; (Dio Perth) Assist 
Priest Kingsley North-Woodvale 10-11; (Dio Brisbane) Hon Assist Priest, Caboolture from 
2012. 6 McCallum Street, Caboolture 4510  Mbl: 0469 380 442 email: 
aleerdavid.deng@gmail.com;  S: Bol:                    Active  
 
DIERY, The Rev'd Barbara Janet b.47; St Francis' Coll; Cert Tchg (KPTC) 66; BA (Univ 
of Qld) 81; D.02; P.03; Hon A.C., St Mark's, Warwick 02-07; Hon Assoc P. 07-14; PTO 
St Mark's, Warwick from 2014..  Unit 145, 5 Regency Drive Warwick  4370 Tel: 4661 
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8885  Mbl: 0431 211 776 email: be_diery@bigpond.com;  S: Ed:   Retired PTO 

DOAK, The Rev'd Wilbur Angus b.27; Moore Coll, Syd; ThL (ACT) 50; D.50; P.51 
Grafton; A.C. Casino 50-53; Lismore 53; V. Mallanganee 53-55; R. Bowraville 55-56; R. 
Nimbin 56-61; Tweed Heads 61-66; Ballina 66-85; Hon Canon Grafton 76-90; R. Lower 
Macleay; Dio of Grafton; PTO Dio of Bris from 90.  352 Buderim Garden Village, Buderim  
4556 Tel: 5478 0278 S: Una:             Retired PTO 

DONALD CAMPBELL, Brother   Bro SSF. See Campbell, D G    (   ) :  Active 

DONALDSON, Michael Philip b.56; Ridley Coll, Melb; Dip Th, Dip Min; D & P 84; A.C. St 
James', Toowoomba 84-85; A.C. St Paul's, Roma 85-87; V. St Alban's, Gatton 87-88; R. 
88-92; Chapl RAAF Special Reserve from 89; R. Hervey Bay 92-02; Area Dean of Burnett
01-02; Rector of Keppel Dec 02-17, Canon of St Paul’s Cathedral 12 to 17; PTO St Mark's
The Gap from 18. 3 Avondale Road, Warner 4500  Mbl: 0439 391 226 email: 
donaldson56@icloud.com;  S: Lynette:    PTO 

DORMAN, The Rev'd Bruce Robert b.45; St Francis' Coll; D.98; P.99; Hon A.C. St 
Peter's, Gympie from 98 - 18 ; Police Chapl from 2000;  Retired PTO St Peter's, Gympie 
from 18. 5 Edina Court, COOLOOLA COVE 4580 Mbl: 0419 165 947 email: 
brucepam@spiderweb.com.au;  S: Pam: 
Retired PTO 

DORMAN, The Rev'd Graham George b.42; TSSF; St Francis' Coll; CertT (KGTC) 63; 
Dip T (DDIAE) 83; B Ed (DDIAE) 86; B Th (BCT) 95; D.94; P.96; A.C. St Bartholomew's, 
Mt Gravatt 94-96; P-in-C St Matthias', Zillmere 97-99; R. 99-02; Area Dean of Bris Nth 
East 99-02.  R. St John's, Nambour 02-08; Area Dean of the Sunshine Coast 04-08; LT 
Chapl, Nambour Hosp 06-08; Chaplain at PA Hospital and the Mater Hospitals 08-11; 
PTO (Rtd) Goodna from 2011-2015; Cursillo Diocesan Spiritual Advisor 2011-2014; L/T 
Parish of Goodna 2013- 2014; PinC Provisional Parish of Springfield from Feb 15-16. 
PTO St John's Cathedral from 17.  6 Buckwood Court, Springfield 4300 Tel: 3818 2545 
Mbl: 0488 180 542 email: g.a.dorman@bigpond.com;  S: Alison:        Retired PTO 

DOUGHERTY, The Rev'd John Anthony b.79; B.Econ (UQ) 99; B.Ed (USQ) 05; B.Th 
(CSU) 12; D.2012; P.2012; Stip Lay Youth Min St Mark's, The Gap 09-11; Stip. AC 
Bundaberg 2012; Assist. Priest Bundaberg 2012; Assist Priest GC North 2013-2014; 
PinC Parish of Toowoomba West 14-17; PinC GC North from 17.  PO Box 810 Oxenford 
4210 Tel: 5580 5814(BH) Mbl: 0417 190 817 email: revjohndougherty@gmail.com;  S: 
Felicity:                       Active  

DOULIN, The Rev'd Patrick Brian Harry b.36; Lincoln Th Coll; D.70; P.71 Dio of 
Chichester; A.C. Holy Trinity, Hurstpierpoint, Chichester 70- 73; A.C. St Peter's, 
Southport 73-74; Dio of Bris; R. Holy Trinity, Madang, Dio of PNG 74-75; PTO Dio of Bris 
76; Chapl St Hilda's School, Southport 77; P-in-C St Mark's, Slacks Creek 77-83; PTO 
Dio of Bris 83; Miss Chapl 83-88; (Reg Fld Cons, Dept of Ch Ed 85-88); R. St Mark's, 
Warwick 88-90; R.D. of Warwick 89-90; Miss Chapl (Nthn Fld Offcr; SAMS) 90-94; Co-
ord, Abp's Cert Prgm, St Francis' Coll from 93, P-in-C Prov Par of Samford 94-2000 and 
also Hosp Chapl (RBH pt) 99-2000; On Missionary Service (ABM-Aust) (R. St Martin's, 
Boroko, PNG) 2000-2002; Archdeacon Pt Moresby 2000-2002; Assoc.P. Grafton Dio. St 
Andrew's Lismore 2002-2004; Rector (Dio. North Qld) St Ambrose, North Mackay 2005-
2012. PTO Coolum (Dio Brisbane) from 2012; L/T Christ Church Bundaberg 13-15. L/T 
Hervey Bay 17.  2/52 Jarnahill Drive, Mount Coolum 4573  Mbl: 0458 411 652 email: 
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padoulin@gmail.com;  S: Adele:    Retired PTO 

DOW, The Rev'd Jasmine Rose b. 84. Dip Ang Orders St Marks NTC; Bth CSU 2007; 
MTh CSU 2012; D. 2008 (Grafton) P. 2009 (Grafton).  HonD Holy Cov Jamieson ACT 08-
09; AsstP Grafton 09-11; AsstP Ballina 11-13; Chapl Canterbury Fell Parkville 13; Moma 
Sturrock Fell Trinity College TS 13-14; Assoc Chaplain Trinity Coll Uni Melbourne 13-14; 
Dio. Melbourne Trinity Cert Co-ord & Noel Carter Assoc Lect Prac Theol Trinity Coll Theol 
Sch 15-18; Syprvr STFE 114-18; Community Chaplain - Mission Chaplain St Francis' 
College from July 18.  St Francis' College 233 Milton Road Milton 4064 (St Francis' 
College PO Box 1261 Milton 4064)  Mbl: 0404 384 181 email: jazzdron@gmail.com;  S: 
Samuel :                            Active  

DOW, The Rev'd Samuel George b. 82. BHortSc (Uni West Sydney 2004); Dip AO St 
Mark's 2010; BTh CSU St Mark's 2011. D 2010 (Grafton), P 2011 (Grafton). Hon. AssD 
Holy Covenant Jamieson 2011; Asst D Sth Grafton 2011; Asst Chapl Emmanuel Anglican 
Coll. Ballina 2012; AsstP Ballina 2012; AsstC St Peter's Melbourne 2013-14; Chapl ACU 
St Patrick's Campus 2013-14; Dio Melb Suprvr STFE 2014-17; PinC St Andrew's 
Aberfeldie 2014-15; Coll. Chapl, Trinity Coll. Uni Melb 2015-2018; Hon. AssP St Francis' 
College Brisbane from Nov 18.  St Francis' College 233 Milton Road Milton 4064 (St 
Francis' College PO Box 1261 Milton 4064) Tel: 3163 3920 Mbl: 0425 252 318 email: 
samuelgdow@gmail.com;  S: Jasmine :                    Active  

DUCKWORTH, The Rev'd Patrick Richard Stephen b52, BA (Syd); DipEd (Uni of Adel.) 
88; BTh (Hons) (Aust Coll of Div) 77; D.77; P.77; (Bend); AssistC St Paul's Bend 77-79; 
Assist C Swan Hill 80; R Ouyen (Bend) 80-83; Chpln L'ceston Ch GS 88-98; Exam Chpln 
92-98; Can 97-98; Chpln St Peters Coll 99; PinC Wakefield 10-13; Dio Perth PTO, Chpln
All Saints Coll 14-16;(Dio Bris) Chpln St Hilda's School from 2017.  34 Heeb Street,
Bundall 4217  Mbl: 0499 243 954 email: pduckworth@sthildas.qld.edu.au;  S: Kerri:

 Active 

DUNGLISON, The Rev'd Edmond Francis b.34; St Francis' Coll; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) (ACT) 
59; BD 74; MACE 78; B Ed St 79; M Ed Stud 82; D.57; P.58; A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich 58-
60; M. Bush Bro St Paul 60-63; L of A Dio of Bris 63; A.C. Holy Trinity, Fortitude Valley 
64; Chapl to the Abp 64; Dio Youth Chapl 64-66; R. St Cecilia's, Chinchilla 66-71; R. 
ChCh Boonah 71-73; Chapl St Paul's School, Bald Hills 74-78; Miss Chapl (Tert Ecum 
Chapl) 78-80; PTO Dio of Bris 80-84; P-in-C St John's, Hendra 84-86; PTO Boonah 87-
18. Arch Cert from 18.  3023/3 Parkland Boulevard Brisbane 4000 Tel: 3221 5102 Mbl:
0477 773 077 email: teddandbess@gmail.com;  S: Diane:             Archbishop's Cert

DUNN, The Rev'd Lynette Dorothy b.48; EFM 2001; CPE 2001; St Francis' Coll; D.05; 
Spiritual Direction (MEC) 2010; Hon Dcn, Biggera Waters-Coomera Valley from 05;  6 
Emerson Way, Oxenford  4210 Tel: 5573 2968 Mbl: 0413 528 670 email: 
rev.lyn.dunn@bigpond.com;   S: Bruce:  Active 

† EACOTT, AM, KSJ,, The Rt Rev'd Leonard Sidney (Len) B.47; St Francis' Coll; Cert 
Rural Tech (QAC) 74; BA (Univ of Qld) 82; Grad Cert Chapl 92; Grad Dip Ed (RE) (Univ 
Sth Aust) 98; AM 2007; KSJ 2012; D & P 83; C.07; A.C. St Andrew's, Indooroopilly 83-
84; Chapl Active Army Reserve 84-90; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 85; P-in-C St 
Augustine's, Oakey 86-87; R. 87-90; Chapl, ARA from 90; 3 Brigade Townsville 90-92; 
LWC Canungra 93-95 (UNTAC Cambodia Mar to Oct 93); Snr Chapl 1 Div 96; Chapl to 
Qld Branch HQ Scouts Aust 96- 2000; Snr Chapl DJFHQ 97-2000; Snr Chapl INTERFET, 
East Timor Sep 99 to Feb 2000; Snr Chapl, Logistic Support Force 01; Command Chapl, 
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Land HQ, Vic Bks, Syd 02; Archdeacon to Army 02-07; Principal Chapl-Army 18 Nov 02 
- 21 Jan 07; Cons Bp by the Primate, The Most Rev Dr P J Aspinall on 29 June 2007 and
appointed Bishop to the Defence Force and a Bishop Assistant to the Primate; Retired
ADF 31 December 2012; Diocese of Brisbane from 2013; Asst Ptriest Biggera Waters-
Coomera Valley from January 2013; PTO Gold Coast North Parish from 2013; L/T Bishop
of the Western Region from 1/3/14 - 20/4/14.  6 Springwood Avenue, Pacific Pines 4211
Tel: 5502 9511 Web: Mbl: 0400 408 415 email: eacottls@icloud.com;  S: Sandy:

Bishops Ret PTO

EDGERTON, The Rev'd Edwin Charles b.31; D.83, P.84 Dio of NQ; Asst P. Holy Trinity, 
Bowen 84-92; Asst P. St Ambrose Nth Mackay 93-05; Dio of NQ; PTO Bundaberg West 
from 05.  3 Shaun Crt, Kalkie 4670 Tel: 4152 7759  S: Pamela:        Retired PTO 

EDSON, The Rev'd James Royston George b.29; St Francis' Coll; Dip Th 64; D.86; P.87; 
A.C. St Luke's, Ekibin 86-88; A.C. Surfers Paradise 88-89; Miss Chapl (LT Mermaid
Beach-Robina) 90; PTO Dio of Bris 91-93; P-in-C, Prov Par of Park Ridge-Browns Plains
93- 95; PTO Dio of Bris 95-2015; Archbishop's Cert to Officiate on Special Occasions
from 2015..  Unit 124, Ashmore Retreat, 19 Allunga Avenue, Ashmore 4214 Tel: 5656
1124 email: jedson91@hotmail.com;  S: Joan:                    Archbishop's Cert

EDWARDS, The Rev'd Canon Dr Donald Ross b.47; St Francis' Coll; BD (1st Cl Hons) 
(Univ of Qld) 73; PhD (Univ of Qld) 84; Grad Cert Ed (QUT) 95; D & P 73; A.C. St Francis', 
Nundah 73-76; P-in-C St Paul's, Taringa 76-80; Chapl St Francis' Coll, 80-82; On 
Missionary Service, Manila, Philippines 82-85; R. St Oswald's, Banyo 85-88; Exam Chapl 
to Abp 86-90; Vice Principal St Francis' Coll 88; Academic Dean, St Francis' Coll 89-93; 
P-in-C ChCh, Milton 92-95; Miss Chapl (Lecturer, SFC) 94-2000; Res Canon St John's
Cathl (Canon Theologian) 99-09; Co-ordinator of Theological Education 2000-03; Co-
ordinator, Ministry Formation and Principal, St Francis' College 03; R. Bramble Bay 03-
10; Canon Emeritus from 09; PTO Parish of Chermside from June 2010.  79A Kate Street,
Woody Point  4019 Tel: 3889 5703 email: donaldedwards4@bigpond.com;  S: Janet:

Retired PTO

EICHLER, The Rev'd Tania Ann b.70; St Francis' Coll; Abp's Cert (Yth Min) (SFC) 92; B 
Th (Yth Min) (SFC) 95; Cert Couns (Bible Coll) 97; Lifeline Counselling Course 02; Cert 
IV Workplace Assessment & Training (Line Management Pty Ltd) 05; Hospital Ministry 
and Pastoral Care Course, Bundaberg Base Hospital 08;Psych Recovery Training, Qld 
Health 2011; Coordinator ACSQ Clergy Wellbeing Sponsor Group 2014; D. 08; P.08; Lay 
Min (Yth and Children) St Michael & All Angels Moggil 94-97; Full Time Chapl Kenmore 
State High School 97-2000; Lay Min Yth, Moggil Parish 2000-03; Lay Min (Yth Min, Ang 
Yth Ministries - Events Co-ordinator) 03-06; Lay Min (Yth), Christ Church, Bundaberg 07; 
A.C. Christ Church, Bundaberg 08-2010; PinC Centenary Suburbs 2010-13;Chair
Centenary Recovery Group 2011; Rector Centenary Suburbs 13-17; 2013 National
Disaster Resilience Leadership Training (with Volunteering Qld); Area Dean Brisbane
South West from 2013; Rep to the Australian Church Women, (Qld unit) 2015-2017; Pers
coach (CoachNet) 2016. Rector Maroochydore from 17.  PO Box 243 Maroochydore
4558 Tel: 54 432 133(BH) 54 434 271(AH) Mbl: 0401 690 127 email:
rector@anglicanmaroochydore.org.au; teichler@bigpond.net.au;  S: Mark:             Active

ELLEM, The Rev'd Kevin George b.44; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThL; BA 78; Grad Dip 
Ed 90; D.69; P.70; C. ChCh Cathl Grafton 69-70; C. St Andrew's, Lismore 70-73; R. St 
Ambrose's, Mallanganee 73-76; Dio of Grafton; PTO Dio of Bris 76-78; R. All Saints, 
Booval 78-90; PTO Dio of Bris 90-07; Hon Chapl St Luke's Herzlia Petuah, Israel 95; P-
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in-C, Rosewood 07- 2010; PTO Ipswich from 10.  163 Diamantina Circle, Karalee 4306 
(163 Diamantina Circle Karalee 4306) Tel: 3294 6352 email: ellemclan@aapt.net.au;  S: 
Jenny:              Retired PTO 

EVERS, Rev'd Moira Patricia b. 67 BA Syd 88; DipEdSec ACU 90; Grad Cert RE ACU 
94; MEd ACU 95; BTh Melb Coll Div 07, Dip Min Melb Coll Div 07; D 07 (Melb) P 07 
(Melb) AssC Mornington/Mt Martha 07-08; PinC Footscray Vic 09-11; PinC St Albans Vic 
11-13; PinC Telarah-Rutherford 13-17; PinC Buderim from 18  24 Wilguy Cres Buderim
4556  Mbl: 0413 004 192 email: reverendmothermoira@gmail.com:                 Active

FAIRHURST, The Rev'd Mark Andrew b. 59. B.Com (Acc,Fin&Mgmt) 80; BTh Moore 
Theological College 87; DipA(Min) Moore Theological College 87; MA (Anc. Hist) 
Macquarie University 92. Asst.Min. St Stephen's Normanhurst, Sydney 88-91; Asst.Min. 
St Philip's Eastwood 92-93; Rector St Philip's Eastwood 93-06; CMS NSW & ACT Mission 
Education Secretary 06-11; CMS NSW & ACT Partnership Support Co-ordinator 12-17; 
Sydney Diocese Licence to Present 92-18; CMS Qld & Nth NSW General Secretary 17 - 
Church Missionary Society PO Box 617 Fortitude Valley 4006  Mbl: 0400 070 044 email: 
mfairhurst@cms.org.au;  S: Leanne:                                    Active  

FARAGHER, The Venerable Michael Allan James b58:  FTCL (Trin.Coll. Lond) 87; BMus 
(Hons) (UQ) 92; MMus (UQ) 95; MEd (Deakin) 02; GradDipTh (CSU) 08; DipAngOrd 
(SMTC) 10) D.07 (C&G) P.08 (C&G); D Holy Covenant Jamison 07-08; R. Parish of 
Temora 08- 10; R. Parish of Ainslie 2010-2014; (Dio Brsbne) PinC Parish of St Lucia 
2014 - 2016; Rector Parish of St Lucia from 2016. Archdeacon of Oxley from 17.  3 Baty 
Street, St Lucia 4067 Tel: 3870 8887(BH) 3870 4456(AH) Fax: 3870 8893 Mbl: 0424 344 
273 email: rectorcc@anglican-stlucia.org; michael.faragher@gmail.com;  S: Rhonda:

 Active 

FARRELL, The Rev'd Graham Robert b.38; TSTC (Vic) 59; ThL (ACT) 68; BA (Univ of 
Qld) 77; Grad Dip Mgt (CIAE) 79; B Econ (Qld) 86; AFAIM 80; D.63; P.64 Ballarat; D-in-
C Creswick w Clunes 63-64; P-in-C 64-66; Chapl RAAF (Res) 64-68; P-in-C Dimboola 
66-68; R. 68- 70; PTO Dio of New Guinea 70-73; Chapl ACMF 68-73; PTO Dio of Bris
74-94; Hon Asst P. St James' Cathl, Townsville 94-99; Dio of NQ; PTO Dio of Bris 99-02;
Abp's Cert for Officiating on Special Occasions from 02.  33/34 Albicore Street, Mermaid
Waters  4218 Tel: 5526 0875 Mbl: 0417 718 031 email: gralda@bigpond.net.au;  S:
Ralda:                   Archbishop's Cert

FELLOWS, The Rev'd Canon Arthur Gregory b.22; St Francis' Coll, ThL (2nd Cl Hons) 
(ACT) 50; John Forster Mem Prize; D.50; P.51 Rockptn; C. Nth Rockptn 50-53; V. 
Springsure 53-57; V. Callide Valley 57-59; Dio of Rockptn; R. St Augustine's, Oakey 59-
62; R. St Paul's, Roma 62-68; R.D. of the West 65-68; R. St Alban's, Auchenflower 68-
73; Org Sec ABM 73-83; Hon Canon St John's Cathl 75-90; R. St Francis', Nundah 83-
90; R.D. Brisbane North East 84-90; PTO Dio of Bris from 90; Canon Emeritus from 08. 
28 Grenoble Street, The Gap 4061 Tel: 3511 1868 :        Retired PTO  

FERGUSON, The Venerable Denise Robin b.57; Cert.Supervisary Mngment (NZIM) 91; 
BTh (U.Auck) 99; M.Min (U Otago) 07; D.99; P.2000; (Dio Wellington NZ) D. Parish of 
Levin 99-2000; Asst P. Levin 2000-01; Vicar Parish of St Matthew, Palmerston North 02-
06; Achdcn Manawatu 04-06; Chpln GS 08; Canon Wellington Cathdrl 07-09; Bishops 
Chpln 07-09; Vicar Parish of Kapiti 06-09; Canon Waikato Cathdrl and Taranaki Cathedral 
09-14; (Dio Brisbane) PinC Cleveland 2014-2015; Archdeacon of Moreton from 6
December 2014; Rector from 2015; Hon. Chpln Redlands RSL from 15; PinC Provisional
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Parish of Stradbroke Island from 16. Rector East Redland Anglican Church from 17. Hon 
Chpln AWAMO from 17.  76 Shore Street East, Cleveland 4163 Tel: 3821 2443(BH) Mbl: 
0458 589 739 email: rector@anglicancleveland.org.au;  S: Mark:                 Active  
 
FINLAY, The Rev'd Welburn Charles b.34; Vision Coll (NSW); Dip Th (Vision) 82; D.86, 
P.87 Dio of Waikato NZ; C ChCh, Taumarunui- Ohura 86-94; Chapl Ohura Prison, 
Waikato 87-94; V. St John's, Waihi-Whangamata 94-97; PTO Waikato 97-99; Dio of 
Waikato NZ; PTO Dio of Bris from 99-18. Archbishop Certificate for Special Occasion 
from 18.  80 Pacific Palms Home Village, 98 Service Road East, Burpengary 4505 Tel: 
3888 0009 email: finlaywjc@gmail.com;  S: Wilma:              Archbishop's Cert  
 
FLORENCE, The Rev'd Canon Mary b.46; St Francis' Coll; RN 68; BA (Univ of Qld) 77; 
Grad Dip Psych (Univ of Qld) 84; Grad Dip Min (SFC) 97; MAPS; D.97; P.98; Hon A.C. 
St Barnabas', Ithaca-Red Hill 97-99; ITIM Chapl 90-98; A.C. St Clement's, Stafford 99-
01; Chapl to Kinections 01-05; P-in-C ChCh, Boonah-Harrisville 02-04; Abp Examining 
Chapl from 02; R. St Clement's, Stafford 04-13; Res Canon St John's Cathl Bris from 
2010; Chpln Uniting Care Community 2013-2014; Canon Emeritus from 2016; Retired 
PTO Parish of Annerley from 18.  32 Newington St, Tarragindi 4121 (32 Newington Street, 
Tarragindi 4121) Tel: 3892 3359 Mbl: 0437 016 390 email: rubyscottage@gmail.com: 
               Retired PTO  
 
FOOTE, The Rev'd Keith Athelstane b.43; St Francis' Coll; CPE 92-93; D.66; P.67; A.C. 
St Peter's, Wynnum 66-70; A.C. St Mark's, Warwick 70; PTO Dio of Bris 70-82; P-in-C 
Birkdale-Capalaba 82-85; PTO Dio of Bris 85-87; V. St George's, Windsor 88; Chapl 
Royal Bris Hosp 88-04; PTO Wilston 04-09; PTO Stafford from 09.  3/50 Denman Street, 
Alderley  4051 Tel: 3856 5630 Mbl: 0429 633 410 email: footeka@gmail.com;  S: Julie:
              Retired PTO  
 
FRANCES, The Rev'd Stephanie Helen b.55; St Barnabas' Th Coll, Adel; B Th (Flinders 
Univ) 93; Dip Min (St Barnabas' Coll) 93; D & P 93 Adel: Chap St Andrew's Hosp, All 
Hallows Nursing Home 93; A.C. St Matthew's, Kensington 93-94; A.C. St Jude's, Brighton 
94-95; PinC St Augustine's, Para Hills 96-99; Dio of Adel; Hosp Chapl Toowoomba 
Hospitals 99-04; PTO Allora-Clifton 04-06; PTO Parish of Warwick from 2015.  105 Forest 
Springs-Goomburra Road, Goomburra 4362 (PO Box 1 Allora   4362) Tel: 4666 6092 
Fax: 4666 6020 Mbl: 0418 850 293 email: stephaniehf@icloud.com;  S: Cyril:             PTO  
 
FREE, The Rev'd Canon Dr Marian Judith b.55; St Francis' Coll; BA (Psychol, Bibl St) 
(Univ of Qld) 76; Dip Ed (Syd Tchrs Coll) 77; PhD (Univ of Qld) 97; D.93; P.95; PTO Dio 
of Bris 93; A.C. Slacks Creek 94; A.C. St Barnabas', Sunnybank 95-96; Lecturer St 
Francis' College P/T from 97 .P-in-C St Luke's, Rosewood 96-99. R. St Luke's, Rosewood 
99-01; R. St Thomas', Toowong 01-08; Res Canon, St John's Cathl from 04; Abp's Exam 
Chapl from 06; Area Dean of Bris West 07-08; R. St Augustine's, Hamilton from 08.  9 
Charlton Street,  Hamilton  4007 (PO Box 202, Hamilton Central  4007) Tel: 3268 
3935(BH) Mbl: 0402 985 593 email: marian.staugust@bigpond.com;   S: Michael: 
                       Active  
 
FREWIN, The Rev'd Terence Gwynne b.49 ThDip ACT 75. D. 73. P. 76 Newcastle. 
Deacon Taree New Castle 73-74; Deacon and Assoc P Singleton Newcastle 75-77; Ass 
P Hamilton Newcastle 77-79; PinC West Wallsend New Castle 79-83; Principal Cathedral 
College Carpentaria 83-86; PTO Newcastle 87; Ass P Blayney Bathurst 87-89; Locum 
Coolah Bathurst 89; Rector Bourke Bathurst 90-94; Assoc P Cowra Bathurst 94-95; 
Locum PTO East Orange Bathurst 95-97; Rector Molong Bathurst 98-01; Rector West 
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Wyalong Bathurst 01-07; Rector Cockle Bay Newcastle 07-10; Chaplain Anglican Care 
Newcastle 10-14; PTO Newcastle 14-18; PinC Leichhardt Chinchilla Anglican Mission 
Area from 18.  24 Mann Street Chinchilla 4413 Mbl: 0429 699 995 email: 
terry.frewin@bigpond.com:  Active 

FRITH, The Rev'd Douglas William b.44; St Francis' Coll, Th Dip 80; D & P 81; A.C. St 
Luke's, Toowoomba 81-83; A.C. St Peter's, Gympie 83-84; P-in-C Brisbane Valley 84-85; 
R. 85-89; R. St Paul's, Stanthorpe 89-2000; Area Dean of the Southern Downs 97-2000;
P-in-C Toowoomba West 2000-2010; Area Dean of Toowoomba 04-07; Area Dean
Toowoomba and Bunya Deanery 07-2013; R. Toowoomba West 2010-2014 (Rtd); PTO
Parish of Freshwater from 2014.  67 Phillip Parade, Deception Bay 4508 Tel: 3092 2185
Mbl: 0412 573 210 email: family.frisco@gmail.com;  S: Kris:                        Retired PTO

FRIZZELL, The Rev'd Graham b.42; St Francis' Coll; Dip EV (Syd Coll of Evang); D.86; 
P.87; A.C. St Mark's, Slacks Creek 86-89; P-in-C St Alban's, Goodna 89-93; Duty Chapl
Moreton Correctional Centre, Wacol 90-93; R. St Mary's, Kilcoy 93-98; Area Dean of
Redcliffe 95-98; R. Ch Ch, Yeronga 98-07; Area Dean of Bris Sth West 98-01; PTO
Caboolture 07-17; Locum Parish of Caboolture 2008 - 2009 PTO Parish of Goodna from
17. 2 Manning Court, Collingwood Park 4301 Tel: 3381 8966 Mbl: 0437045457 email:
sandygrah01@gmail.com;   S: Sandra:                         Retired PTO

† FRYAR, The Right Rev'd Godfrey Charles b.50; St Francis' Coll; Th.L (ACT) 72; D.73; 
P.74; Miss.Chpln 73; M.Bush Bro. Of St Paul 73-76; Longreach (Dio Rockhampton) 73-
74; Cunnamulla, 75; PinC Quilpie 75-76; (Dio Bris) R. Dawson Valley 76-79; R. St
Barnabas', Nth Rockhampton 79-82 (Dio.of Rockhampton); R. St Ambrose, Nth Mackay
83-86 (Dio North Qld); R. St Clement's on the Hill, Stafford 87-93 (Dio of Brisbane); Dean
Cathedral C&G 93-98;Consecrated Bishop Diocese of Canberra and Goulburn 13-12-98,
, by The Archbishop of Sydney (Goodhew) Assisted by Archbishop of Brisbane
(Hollingworth) Bishops of Bathurst(Wilson) Canberra and Goulburn (Browning)
Riverina(Clark) Gippsland(Jones) Wangaratta (Farrer) Assistant Bishops
Melbourne(Grant) South Sydney (Watson) Paramatta and Defence Force( King)
Canberra and Goulburn (Randerson) and Retired Bishops (Chynoweth and Butterss)
Regional Bishop/Rector Wagga Wagga 98-03; Vicar General C&G 2000-03 (Dio
Canberra and Goulburn); (Dio Rockhampton) Bishop Rockhampton 2003-2013. (Dio
Brisbane) PTO  Parish of Annerley from 2014 (Dio of Brisbane). Provincial Minister Asia
Pacific Franciscan Third Order from 2014; Locum Bishop for the Northern Region Oct
2016. Locum Bishop for the Southern Region Feb-April 18.  9 Stonebridge Place, Aspley
4034  Mbl: 0417 730 541 email: gcfryar@iinet.net.au;  S: Bronwyn:   Bishop Retired PTO

FURBY, The Rev'd Iain b.59; St Francis' Coll; B Sc (Griffith Univ) 83; BA (Univ of Qld) 
86; Dip Ed (Univ of Qld) 87; MACE 98; D.87; P.88; A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich 87-89; Chapl 
to the Preparatory School, TSS 89-92; Asst P. St James' Toowoomba 92-93; Dir of CEBS 
93-03; P-in- C St Andrew's, Pittsworth 93-94; R. 94-96; ; Provincial Chairman CEBS (Qld)
from 95-98; Chapl to CEBS 91-08,Chapl West Moreton Anglican College and Hon Asst
P. St Paul's, Ipswich 97-2000; Chaplain, Qld Branch Scouts Aust from 99; R. Holy Trinity,
Woolloongabba 2000-03; Assoc P. Ch Ch, Bundaberg 03-10; Chpln St Luke's Anglican
School Bundaberg from 2011.  2 Heritage Drive Bargara 4670 Tel: 4132 7521(BH) 4159
2629(AH) Fax: 4132 7556 Mbl: 0467 717 608 email: itfurbs5@bigpond.com; iain-
furby@stlukes.qld.edu.au;  S: Tanya:              Chaplains

GABI, The Rev'd Ibrahim Kornolios Toto b.77; DipTheol (Gereif West Bilbe School) 2000; 
D.2000; P.2001; Priest (Dio.Kadugli) in (Nuba Mountans) Southern Kordofan State; St
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Stephen's Church Kadugli 2000-01; Priest Jerusalem Cathedral Kadugli 01-03; Priest 
Good Shepherd Church Kadugli 03-05; Priest Saviour Church Khartoum 05-06; Hon 
Assist Priest (Dio Brisbane) Parish of Yeronga from 11.  10 Boodie Close, Doolandella 
4077  Fax: 3848 1648 email: revtutujabi6@gmail.com;  S: Liedia:                 Active  

GADD, The Rev'd Bryan Stephen Andrew b.56; Chich Th Coll; BA (Dur Univ) 77; PGCE 
(Ox Univ) 78; M.Phil (UQ) 08; M.Litt (CQU) 14;  D.81; P.82; C Newlyn St Pet Truro 81-
86; R. St Mawgan w St Ervan and St Eval 86-90; Chapl Summerfields Sch Ox 90-01; 
PTO Truro 90- 01; Chapl The Southport School 02-09; Senior Chapl Anglican Church 
Grammar School from 2010..  18 Bunderoo Circuit, Pimpama 4209 Tel: 3896 2281(BH) 
Fax: 3891 5976 Mbl: 0411 749 020 email: Bryan.Gadd@Churchie.com.au;  S: Susan:

     Chaplains  

GAITSKELL, The Rev'd Elizabeth Lucia b.72; St Francis' Coll; BRTP (Univ of Qld) 93; 
Grad Dip Th (BCT) 99; M Th Stud (BCT) 05; D.03; P.04; A.C. St Mark's, Buderim 03-04; 
A.C. St James', Toowoomba 04-07; Chapl, Toowoomba Preparatory School 05; PTO St
Paul's Ipswich 08-09, Chaplain WMAC 09-2016; Chapln Matthew Flinders Ang Coll
(MFAC) from 2017.  3 Perlan Street, Nambour 4560 Tel: 5477 3262(BH) Mbl: 0498 880
046 email: lgaitskell@mfac.edu.au;:              Chaplains

GALLOWAY, The Rev'd Denis Gilbert b.51; St Francis’ Coll; BTh (BCT); Mmin (CSU) 
2010; D.91; P. 92 A.C. St James’, Toowoomba 91-93; Defence Force Chapl (Reserve)  
9 Royal Qld Regt; A.C. St Paul’s, Cleveland 94-95; P. Assoc Biggera Waters 95-96; P-
in-C Prov Par of Alexandra Hills 96-2000 Defence Force Chapl Regular Army 2000; First 
Combat Engineer Regt + First Armoured Regt (Tank) 2000- 2001; Deployed East Timor 
March 2001; First Armoured Regt (Tank) + 8/12 Medium Regt (Artillery) 2002; First 
Armoured Regt (Tank) + First Combat Service Support Battalion 2003; First Combat 
Service Support Battalion 2003-2005; Headquarters One Brigade 2006; Special Air 
Service Regt 2007-2009; Deployed Afghanistan May 2007, February 2009; First Signal 
Regt (Brisbane) 10-13; First Intelligence Battalion (Army Reserve) 14-16; PTO Ekibin 
from 2017.  3 Lothian Street, Annerley 4103 Tel: 3342 6084 Mbl: 0457 212 588 email: 
dgal74@optusnet.com.au;  S: Donna:       PTO  

GARDINER, The Rev'd Gillian Hilda Christina (Sister Gillian SSA). B.39; St Francis' Coll; 
B Sc (Univ of Qld) 62; Dip Ed (Univ of Qld) 77; B Th (BCT) 01; Sister of the Society of the 
Sacred Advent; D.98; P.99; Hon A.C. St Colomb's, Clayfield 97-2000; Hon A.C. St 
Augustine's, Hamilton 2000-04; Mission Chaplain until 2016; PTO (Rtd) Parish of Zillmere 
from 2016.  30 The Village Taigum 333 Handford Road, Taigum 4018 Tel: 3865 7604 
email: gillian@stmargarets.qld.edu.au:           Retired PTO 

GARDINER, The Rev'd Rosemary Claire b.88; BA (Hons) (UQ) 09; BTh (CSU) 2018 D.17 
P.18; Yth Worker Aspley-Albany Creek 09-10; AC St Augustine's, Hamilton from 17-18.
AssP (P/T) Hamilton from 19.  5 Ivor Church Ct, 233 Milton Road, Milton 4064 (PO Box
1261 Milton  4064)  Mbl: 0415 421 341 email: rosemary.staugust@gmail.com;  S:
Lindsay:                       Active

GATE, The Rev'd Alan Bertram b.35; St Francis' Coll; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) (ACT) 60; BA 
(Univ of Qld) 62; D.60; P.61; A.C. All Saints', Chermside 60-62; A.C. St James', 
Toowoomba 62-64; V. St Luke's, Miles 64-67; Dio of Bris; New Guinea Mission 67-69; 
Miss Chapl Dio of Bris 69; R. St John's, Mundubbera-Eidsvold 69-73; R. St Paul's, 
Cleveland 73-83; Dio of Bris; Dio Sec Dogura and Par P. Dogura Cathl 83-84; Provost 
and R. St George's Cathl, Rabaul 85-89; Dio Sec Dio of Dogura 89-94; Dean of Dogura 
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Cathl 90; Chapl Holy Name Schl 90-94; Rector, St George's, Crows Nest 95-97; P-in-C, 
Holy Spirit, Coolum 97-2001; Area Dean of the Sunshine Coast 99-01; PTO (Ret) from 
01. 262a Flinders Parade, Sandgate  4017 Tel: 3269 3314 Mbl: 0415 720 633 email: 
jagate39@tpg.com.au;  S: Jan:           Retired PTO

GATER, The Rev'd Alexandra Hazel b.44; Nungalinya Coll; Assoc Dip Soc Sc (KPTAFE) 
91; Cert Th (Nungalinya Coll) 95; Assoc Dip Theol (Nungalinya Coll) 01; D.97; P.03; 
Deacon, Murri Anglican Fellowship 97-2000; Murri Chaplain, Brisbane Women's and Sir 
David Longland Correctional Centres 92-2000; Hon Dcn, St Hugh's, Inala 2000-03; Murri 
Chaplain, Brisbane Women's and Sir David Longland Correctional Centres 03-08; Hon 
Asst C. St Hugh's, Inala 03-07; Hon Murri Chaplain, Brisbane Women's and Sir David 
Longland Correctional Centres 08.-15; PTO (Rtd) Parish of Inala from 2015.  59 
Chardean Street, Acacia Ridge  4110 Tel: 3277 1873+Fax  S: Jeffrey:        Retired PTO 

GAULD, The Rev'd Lee Patricia b.49; St Francis' Coll; Spiritual Direction Training 
Program (MEC) 2011; D.01; P.02; Hon A.C., St Clement's-on-the-Hill, Stafford from 01. 
Practice of Supervision Program MEC 2016.  27 Parkdale St, Kedron 4031  
Mbl: 0415 150 358 email: leegauld@bigpond.net.au;                      Active  

GEHRMANN, The Rev'd Jeremy b.66; B Agr Sc (Univ of Qld) 89; B Th (2nd Cl 
Hons)(ACT) 98; Dip Min (Moore Coll) 98; Grad Cert Bus (QUT) 05; D & P 98; Miss Chapl 
(Gen Sec CMS Qld with Nthn NSW) 98 - 2017; PTO South Brisbane 17. P-in-C Coorparoo 
from 18.  18 Ettie Street, Sherwood  4075  Mbl: 0412 528 758 email: jeremy@st-
stephens.org.auS: Sheilas:                     Active  

GERLACH, The Rev'd Alfred John b.24; Moore Coll Syd; ThL 50; ASTC (Sc) 47; D & P 
50, Syd; C. Eastwood 50-51; C. Cammeray 51-52; Dio of Syd; V. Wyan-Rappville 52-58; 
R. Bellingen, Dio of Grafton 58-63; R. Kilkivan 63-73; V. St Augustine's, Palmwoods 73-
74; R. 74-81; R. St Peter's, Maroochydore 81-90; R.D. of the Sunshine Coast 87-90; PTO 
Dio of Bris from 90 (LT Childers; Maleny; Oakey; Toowoomba St Luke's); PTO 
Toowoomba St James, from 2012.  8 Lucinda Avenue, Highfields   4352 (PO Box 229, 
Highfields  4352) Tel: 4615 5226  Mbl: 0407 751 377 email: alfredgerlach@iinet.net.au 
S: Shirley:            Retired PTO

GIBSON, The Rev'd Dr Richard John b.60; B SW UNSW 1982; PhD 06; BTh Moore 89; 
MTh. 95; D.90; (Syd); P.90 (Syd): Asst M Mt Druit 90-93; Lect MTC 94-14; Dio Bris. PTO 
South Bris from 2015.  337 Sumners Road Riverhills 4074  Mbl: 0413 033 117 email: 
rgibson@bst.qld.edu.au;  S: Kim:        PTO  

GILBERT, The Rev'd Andrew b.30; GBRE ThA 52; St Francis' Coll ThL 56; Seabury-
Western (Evanston) BD 67; MA 68; D.56; P.57 Bathurst; M. Bush Bro of Good Shepherd 
54-60; C. Dubbo 58-60; P-in-C Stuart Town 60; R. 61-67; Dio of Bathurst; PTO Dio of 
Chicago 67-68; DCE Melbourne 69-70; R. Blackall 70-72; Dio of Rockptn; R. Hopetoun 
72-79; Dio of Ballarat; PTO Dio of Bris from 80; (pt Caloundra 81- 87; pt Redcliffe 87-95; 
pt All Saints' Wickham Tce 96).  3 Wyllie Street, Redcliffe  4020 :                 Retired PTO

GILLIAN (See Gardiner SSA), Sister  :   Active 

GILMOUR, The Rev'd Godfrey Joseph Charles b.44; St Francis' Coll; CertT (Port 
Moresby) 70; DipT (KGCAE) 76; Grad Dip Tch-Lib (BCAE) 82; AALIA (Canberra) 91; B 
Th (BCT) 92; D.90; P.91; A.C. St Andrew's, Indooroopilly 90; PTO Dio of Bris 91; A.C. St 
Thomas', Beaudesert 91; A.C. St Paul's, Maryborough 93-97; PTO Dio of Bris 97-03; P-
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in-C Goonaneman 03-05; PTO Maryborough from 06.  67 John Street South, 
Maryborough  4650  Mbl: 0437 636 041 email: ggi00239@bigpond.net.au;  S: Angela:

  Retired PTO 

GOLDSWORTHY, The Rev'd Dr Graeme Lister b.34; Moore Coll., Syd.; Th.L. (A.C.T.) 
57; B.A. (Univ of Syd) 56; B.D. (Univ of Lon) 59; B.A.(Univ of Cam) 61; M.A.65; 
Th.M.(Union Theol. Seminary, Virginia) 70; Ph.D.73; D.& P.58, Syd.; A.C. St Paul's, 
Chatswood 58-59; PTO. Dio. of Ely 59-61; Chapl St Barnabas' House, Dio. of New York 
61-62; Lecturer Moore Coll. 63-69; PTO Dio. of Virginia 69-72; R. St Mark's, Yagoona,
Dio. of Syd. 72-74; PTO Dio. of Bris. 75-81; A.C. St Stephen's, Coorparoo 81-85; Assoc.
Priest St Stephen's, Coorparoo 85-94; (Dio Syd) Lecturer Moore College 95-01; (Dio Bris)
PTO Parish of Wishart from 2013.  97/28 Sunningdale Avenue, Rochedale South 4123
Tel: 3340 0697 email: graeme.goldsworthy@moore.edu.au;  S: Miriam:       Retired PTO

GOMERSALL, The Rev'd Clarence Edgar b.30; St Francis' Coll 64; ThL (ACT) 68; D.66, 
P.67 Grafton; A.C. Lismore 66-70; Hosp Chapl Lismore 68-70; V. Mid-Clarence 70-73;
Dio of Grafton; Chapl Wolston Park Hospital, Wacol 73-78; R. ChCh Milton 78-84; R. of
Ithaca 84- 97; R.D. Brisbane Nth West 90-91; PTO Dio of Bris from 97.  4/555 Sherwood
Road, Sherwood  4075 (PO Box 463, Sherwood  4075) Tel: 3379 9912 Mbl: 0467 081
596 email: father.clarrie@gmail.com;  S: Alison:          Retired PTO

GOODWIN, The Rev'd Allan Frederick b.40; St Francis' College; D.99; Hon Dcn St 
Luke's, Ekibin 99-11; Hon Pastoral Asst to the Chapl, Princess Alexandra Hosp 84-2011; 
PTO (Dcn) Retired Cleveland from 2011.  Tranquil Waters Retirement Village, Villa 17, 
31 Thompson Street, Victoria Point 4165 Tel: 3820 8003 Mbl: 0408 719 593 email: 
aj.goodwin@bigpond.com;  S: Jill:          Retired PTO  

GOWTY, The Venerable Richard Newton b.43; St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 72; Assoc Dip 
App Sc (RMIT); D & P 72; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 72-75; Asst P. St Cuthbert's, Nth 
Wembley, London 75-76; P-in-C St Alban's, Gatton 76; R. 77-80; R. St Andrew's, 
Indooroopilly 80-92; R.D. Bris B 89-92; Assoc R. St David's Episc Ch, Austin, Dio of 
Texas, USA 92-94; PTO Dio of Bris 94; R. St Mark's, Buderim 94-2012; Archd of Wide 
Bay 2000-12; Archdeacon Emeritus 2013; PinC Palmwoods (P/T) from 2013.  21/596 
David Low Way, Pacific Paradise 4564 Tel: 5442 1283 Mbl: 0411 236 650 email: 
rgowty@gmail.com;  S: Margie:                    Active  

GRAHAM-FREEMAN, The Rev'd John Phillip b.50; St John's Coll, Morpeth; D & P 78 
Dio of Newcastle; A.C. Wallsend 78-80; A.C. Hamilton 80-82; SL 82-83; Hon A.C. 
Adamstown 82-83; R. Murrurundi 83-88; R. Kincumber 88-90; R. Clermont 90-94; P-in-C 
Gracemere/Mt Morgan 95-96; P-in-C Noosa 97-08; Dio Tas. R. City of Devonport 2009-
2010; Network Chapl, Nt West Mssn Network 2009-10; R. Strathpine 2011-2015; Assist 
Priest Parish of Cooroora from 2017.  1901 Noosa Road, Traveston 4569  Mbl: 0438 124 
694 email: frjohngf@icloud.com;    bronwyngf@icloud.com; S: Bronwyn:               Active 

GRAYDON, The Rev'd Christine Valerie b.47; SFC; BA (Univ of Qld) 87; B Th (BCT) 90; 
Grad Cert Asylum Seekers and Refugees (CSU) 01; D.90; P.92; A.C. St Paul's, 
Maryborough 90-92; P-in-C Prov Par of Alexandra Hills 92-96; PTO 96-97; Miss Chapl 
(QCT) 97-02; Gen Sec, Tasmanian Council of Churches 02-05; P-in-C Brighton 02-05; 
Dio of Tasmania; Locum Tenens Holy Trinity, Goondiwindi 05; Assoc P. Warwick 06-08; 
R. St Cecilia's, Chinchilla 08-12; Archd of The West 08-12; PTO Drayton 12; Ass P St
Lukes, Toowoomba 12-14; PTO Drayton 14-16; Retired PTO Warwick from 2016.;
Accredited Spiritual Director (Brookfield) 2014.  8 Ailanthus Street, Killarney 4373 Tel:
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4664 1741 Mbl: 0427 168 913 email: val.graydon@bigpond.com;:   Retired PTO 

GREAVES, The Rev'd Gerald Raymond b.32; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 70; Cert 
Hort (Amenity) 83; D.69; P.70; A.C. Toowoomba 69-70; V. Taroom 71-74; R. Nanango 
74-77; Dio of Bris; Lic to Assist Rector, St James' Mount Isa 80-88; Dio of NQ; PTO Dio
of Bris 89-91; (Hon AP Kingaroy 90; LT Kilkivan 91); P-in-C St Mary's, Wondai 92-93;
Miss Chapl 93-03. (LT Jandowae 93; Kingston- Woodridge 93; Tara 94; Childers 94;
Miles 95; Chinchilla 95; Mitchell 95; Roma 96-97; Dalby 96-97; Mundubbera 98); PTO
Bunya Deanery from 03.  1 Macaulay Drive, Kingaroy  4610 Tel: 4162 7929 Mbl: 0438
646 121 S: Rita:              Retired PTO

GREEN, The Rev'd Avriel Rhonda b.61, B.Bus (Man) (/QUT) 80; BThl.(BCT) 07; D.09; 
P.09; Lay Min, Caloundra-Glasshouse Country 08- 09. AC Caloundra-Glasshouse
Country 09-10; PinC Nanango 10-15; Rector Parish of Caboolture from 2015. Area Dean,
Deanery of Redcliffe from 18.  6 Park Lane Court, Bellmere Caboolture 4510 Tel: 5419
0835(BH) Mbl: 0421 951 696 email: greenanglican@gmail.com;  S: Tony:             Active

GREVETT, The Rev'd Peter Ross b.53; St Francis' Coll;  Com of Dec; D. 01; Hon Dcn 
Parish of Logan from 01.  10-12 Netherby Street,  Rochedale  4123 (PO Box 775, 
Rochedale South 4123) Tel: 0409 792 035(BH) 3841 2725(AH) Mbl: 0409 792 035 email: 
pgrevett@gmail.com;  S: Debbie:                       Active  

GRIGG, The Rev'd Ronald Henderson b.46; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 78; Basic CPE 
Bris 79-80; D.79; P.80; A.C. St Andrew's, Lutwyche 79-80; A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich 80-82; 
V. St Mary's, Gin Gin 82-83; P-in-C St Matthew's 83-93/Ang Ch of the Risen Christ,
Deception Bay 93-2000; R. St Oswald's, Banyo 2000- 2011; Archbishop's Certificate from
2012.  8 Measberg Road, Witta 4552 Tel: 5435 8894 Mbl: 0414 904 378 email:
r.grigg25@hotmail.com;  S: Linda:  Archbishop's Cert 

GRIMSHAW, The Very Rev'd Arthur John b.33; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThL (2nd Cl) 
(ACT) 56; BA (Univ of Melb) 57; D.57; P.58 Melb; C. of Surrey Hills 57-59; Asst Chapl 
Geelong Grammar Schl 59-61; Dio of Melb; V. of Romsey and Sunbury w Lancefield 61-
64; Prec St George's Cathl, City and Dio of Perth 64-68; R. Holy Trinity, Fortitude Valley 
68-75; R. St Paul's, Ipswich 75-80; Archd of Moreton 75-83; R. St Augustine's, Hamilton
80-85; Qld Chapl Guild of Air Pilots and Air Navigators from 82; Res Canon of St John's
Cathl 83-85; Archd of Lilley 83; Archd of Moreton 85; Chapl Order of St Lazarus; Chapl
Sovereign Order of St John of Jerusalem; Dean of Brisbane 85-98; PTO (Ret) Dio of Bris
98-18; Dean Emeritus from 98. Arch. Cert from 18.  81 Lilley Street, Hendra  4011 Tel:
3268 5321 email: agrimsh@bigpond.net.au S: Mary:             Archbishop's Cert

GUMMOW, The Rev'd Richard Peter b. 61. BTh CSU 2018. D. 18. Ass Curate Maranoa 
Warrego Anlgican Mission Area from 19.   (7 Gaydon Street Toowoomba 4350) Tel: 4638 
3768 Mbl: 0478 616 655 email: ric.gummow@gmail.com;  S: Tracey:                       Active 

GUNTHORPE, The Rev'd Scott William John b.74. BTh (BCT) 09; D.10. P.10; AC 
Kenmore-Brookfield 2010-2011; PinC Roma 2011-2015; Rector Parish of Waterloo from 
2015.  33 Thorne Road Birkdale 4159 Tel: 3822 1110(BH) Mbl: 0431 494 012 email: 
rector@apwb.net;  S: Gisela:                                    Active  

GUTTORMSEN, The Rev'd Colleen Ann b.44; St Francis' Coll; Ecum Hosp Chapl Cert 
(TTC) 93; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 96; Ed Min Cert (GBRE) 96; D.96; P.03; PTO Dio of Bris 
96-97; Hon Dcn, St Alban's, Cunnamulla 97-2000; PTO 2000-01; Hon Dcn, Cooroora 01-
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03; Chapl at Nambour General Hospital 03-05; Hon A.C. Cooroora 03-05; Hon Asst P. 
Cooroora 05-06; PTO Cleveland from 06.  114 Panorama Drive, Thornlands  4164 Tel: 
3286 6913 email: billcolleen@yahoo.com.au;  S: Bill:         Retired PTO  
 
GUTTORMSEN, The Rev'd William James b.41; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Civ Eng (QIT) 
70; B Th (BCT) 94; CPE 94; D.94; P.96; A.C. St Catherine's, Centenary Suburbs 94-96; 
A.C. St Andrew's, Indooroopilly 96-97; P-in-C St Alban's, Cunnamulla 97-2000; R. Good 
Shepherd, Cooroora 2000-06; PTO Cleveland from 06.  114 Panorama Drive, Thornlands  
4164 Tel: 3286 6913 Mbl: 0405 925 295 email: billcolleen@yahoo.com.au;  S: Colleen: 
              Retired PTO  
 
HALL, The Rev'd James Matthew b.79; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 03; D.03; P.04; A.C. 
St Paul's, Maryborough 03-05; P-in-C, All Saints', Mitchell 05-09. R. Nambour 09-18; 
Reserve Army Chpln 9RQR 2013-2014; 20 STA 14-18; PTO Parish of Noosa Sept 18 - 
Jan 19.  4 Perlan Street, Nambour 4560 Tel: 5441 1018(BH) 5441 1018(AH) Mbl: 0427 
101 070 email: jmbhall@hotmail.com;  S: Helen:                   Active  
 
HALL, The Rev'd Thomas Bartholomew Berners b.39; St Francis' Coll 63; QDH (2 Cl 
Hons) (Qld Ag Coll) 62; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) 65; D.65; P.66 Rockptn; C. St James' Cathl, 
Townsville 65-66; Dio of NQ; C. St Paul's Cathl, Rockptn 66-69; P-in-C Emerald 69-70; 
R.70-75; Dio of Rockptn; P-in-C Whitehawk, Brighton, Dio of Chichester 75-82; V. 
Inglewood and Texas 82-84; P-in-C (LT) St Andrew's Lutwyche 84; V. St Faith's, Pine 
Rivers South 85-89; R. St Faith's, Strathpine 89- 09; Area Dean of Redcliffe 03-09. PTO 
Retired Caboolture 09-2011; L/T St Bart’s. Mt Gravatt 10; 11; 12; Promoter Bush Ministry 
Fund 2010-2014; PTO Lutwyche 2011-2015; L/T Charters Towers NQ 2013-2014; PinC 
Parish of Goondiwindi 15.; L/T Stanthorpe 16; PTO Nambour from 2016.  6 Gladdon 
Street, Bald Hills 4036 Tel: 3261 4643 Mbl: 0428 711 719 email: 
tombbhall@bigpond.com;  S: Wendy:           Retired PTO  
 
HALL, The Rev'd Wayne Malcolm (Ben) b.56; St Francis' Coll; BTh (BCT) 96;M.Min 
(CSU) 2008; D.96; P.97; A.C. St Thomas', Ipswich North 97-98; ARA 78-94; GRES 96-
97; DJFHQ, Enoggera, Qld; Defence Chaplain ARA, 3RAR, Holsworthy, NSW 98-01; 
INTERFET East Timor Sep 99-Jan 01; Exercise Longlook, UK May-Oct 01; Co-Ord 
Chapln, HQ 5 Bde Holsworthy, NSW, 02-03; Co-Ord Chapln, HQ ALTC, South Bandiana, 
VIC 04-06; Pastoral Chapln, ALTC, Latchford Barracks, Bonegilla, 07 Long Term 
Schooling, M.Min, CSU, 08; Chapln Trg, ARTC, Blamey Barracks, 09; Co-Ord Chapln 
Kapooka 10-12; Co-Ord Chapln CATC, Bridges Barracks, Puckapunyal 13; Pastoral 
Chaplain, ALTC, Latchford Barracks, Bonegilla 14-17. Pastoral Chaplain Reservist (p/t) 
GRES at Army School of Health Latchford Barracks Bonegilla VIC 17. Pastoral Chaplain 
GRES Army School of Logistics South Bandiana Vic 18-19.  Pastoral Chaplain, ALTC, 
Lartchford Barracks, Bonegilla 3691 Tel: (02)-6024-4450 Mbl: 0408 372 694 email: 
wayne.hall1@defence.gov.au; tirra.lirra@bigpond.com;  S: Maxcelle:         Missionary  
 
HALLIN, The Rev'd Anthony Ernest b.35; B Soc Sc (Human Services) (QUT) 93; Grad 
Dip Soc Sc (Counselling) (QUT) 95; D & P 62 by Bp J Kavanagh, Wellington, NZ; 
Received as a Priest into Ang Ch of Aust by Abp of Bris Oct 94; Hon Asst P. Bramble Bay 
94-97; Hon Asst P. St Margaret's, Sandgate 97-99; P-in-C St James', Kelvin Grove 99-
03; PTO from 03.  307/2141 Sandgate Road, Boondall 4034 Tel: 3265 4202 Mbl: 0410 
623 367 email: ajhallin@bigpond.com:           Retired PTO  
 
HALSTEAD, The Rev'd Anthony James b.40; Dip Res Care; Dip Tchg; Cert Past Min 
ITE; D.89, P.90 Dio of NQ; Asst R. Charters Towers 90, 91-993; Chapl All Souls/St 
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Gabriels Sch 89, 91-93; Hughenden 90; R. St Mary the Virgin, Atherton 93-02; R. St 
Paul's Proserpine, Canon, St James' Cathl, Townsville 02-07; Dio of NQ; PTO Caloundra 
from 07.  44 Whites Road, Landsborough  4550 (PO Box 460, Landsborough  4550) Tel: 
54941367 Mbl: 0455 554 930 email: tandrhalstead@bigpond.com; 
 S: Rosemary:                           Retired PTO  
 
HAMMER, The Rev'd John Laun b.46; St Francis' Coll; BA (ACU) 95; Grad Dip Th (BCT) 
96; MA (Theol) (ACU) 02; D.96; P.97; A.C. St Mark's, Warwick 96-99; P-in-C St David's, 
Allora-Clifton 99-01; LT St David’s, Allora-Clifton 02-04; Hon Assoc P. St Paul's, Samford 
04- 05; Hon Assoc P., Leichhardt from 05-13; PTO Ithaca-Ashgrove from 13.  10 Burrowa 
Street, Stafford 4053 Tel: 3356 8119 Mbl: 0427 137 788 email: 
rev.jack.hammer@gmail.com;  S: Kathy:         Retired PTO  
 
HAMMER, The Rev'd Katherine Mary b.50; St Francis' Coll; B Th (ACU) 04; BSSc (ACU) 
04; D.03; P.04; Hon A.C. St Paul's, East Brisbane 03-05; A.C. Leichhardt 05; P-in-C 05-
12; Area Dean Maranoa Deanery 2011-2012; PTO Ithaca-Ashgrove from 2013.  10 
Burrowa Street, Stafford 4053 Tel: 3356 8119 Mbl: 0418 600 212 email: 
hammer.katherine@gmail.com;  S: Jack:                      PTO 
 
HANLEY, The Rev'd Brian b.28; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 92; D.92; P.93; 
A.C. St Jude's, Everton Park 92-93; Hon A.C. 93-98; PTO 98-08; Retired.Abp's Cert for 
Officiating on Special Occasions from 09. PTO (Retd) Chermside from 09.  87 Jacaranda 
Apartments The Boulevard Chermside 4032 Tel: 3359 8519 email: 
b.hanley@bigpond.net.au;  S: June:                Archbishop's Cert  
 
HANSEN, The Rev'd Kenneth Roderick b.52; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 99; 
EFM (GBRE) 2000; D.99; Hon Dcn St Mark's, Warwick 99-02; PTO 02-03; Hon Dcn, St 
John's, Dalby from 03; Police Chapl, Dalby/Burnett Patrol Group from 05.  Unit 3/18 
Condamine Street Dalby  4405 (PO Box 957, Dalby  4405) Tel: 4662 2202 email: 
dken@anglicandalby.org.au;  S: Julie:                   Active  
 
HARCH, The Rev'd Canon Gary Frederick b.56; St Francis' Coll; B Surv (Univ of Qld) 76; 
BA (Univ of Qld) 84; D.84, P.85 Rockptn; C. St Paul's Cathl, Rockptn 85-87; P-in-C 
Middlemount Dio of Rockptn 87-90; R. St Colomb's, Clayfield 90-96; Area Dean of 
Brisbane North East 93-96; Archd of the West 96-06; R. St Paul's, Roma 97-06; R. St 
James' Toowoomba 06-2014; Archd of the Downs 06-2014; Residentiary Canon, 
Cathedral of St John The Evangelist from 2014; PinC Parish of Kangaroo Point from 
2014; Chair Parishes Building & Furnishing Advis. Cttee from 2017.  The Priest-in-
Charge, St Mary's Anglican Church, 455 Main Street, Kangaroo Point 4169 (PO Box 7050 
East Brisbane 4169) Tel: 3391 4071(BH) Mbl: 0487 414 068 email: 
pic@saintmarys.org.au;  S: Marie-Claire:                    Active  
 
HARDIE, The Rev'd Phillip Sheridan b.1952; ThL ACT; D.1981; P.1982; (Graft) Asst P 
Murwillumbah 1981-83; OL 1984. Dio. Graft: GL, Chapl Lindisfarne AS 1997-2008; Assoc 
Priest All Souls Bangalow 08-09; Chapl Hillbrook Ang. School 2010-2011;  Rector All 
Souls Bangalow 11-13; PTO St Paul's, Palm Beach-Coolangatta 2013.-2015; PinC (P/T) 
from 2015.  112(b) Botanical Circuit, Banora Point  2486 Tel: 5534 2115(BH) 5524 
2586(AH) Mbl: 0414 761 804 email: Phillip.hardie@yahoo.com; 
coolpalmang@gmail.com;  S: Dianne:                   Active  
 
HARLEY, The Rev'd Pauline Sondra b.74; BTh (SFC) 2016; D.16; P.17. Assist Curate 
Parish of Mt Gravatt 16-18. PinC. Parish of Toowoomba West from 19.  373 Pine 

69

mailto:tandrhalstead@bigpond.com
mailto:rev.jack.hammer@gmail.com
mailto:hammer.katherine@gmail.com
mailto:b.hanley@bigpond.net.au
mailto:dken@anglicandalby.org.au
mailto:pic@saintmarys.org.au
mailto:coolpalmang@gmail.com


 

Mountain Road, Mansfield 4122 Tel: 3849 5370 Mbl: 0406 249 282 email: 
pharleyp@gmail.com;  S: Peter:                    Active  
 
HARRIS, The Rev'd Ian Frederick b.41; St Francis' Coll; QDA (Qld Ag Coll) 59; B Th 
(BCT) 93; D.93; P.94; A.C. St James', Toowoomba 93- 96; P-in-C All Saints', Mitchell 96-
04; Area Dean of Maranoa 99-04; PTO Dalby from 04.  3374 Bunya Mts Road, Bunya 
Mountains 4405 Tel: 4668 3015+Fax Mbl: 0417 869 716 email: ifnmaharris@gmail.com; 
S: Margaret:             Retired PTO  
 
HART, The Rev'd Kay Gillian b.60; BTh (CSU) 2010; D.2011; P. AC Warwick 2011; Assist 
Priest Warwick 2011-2013; Priest-in-Charge Chinchilla from 2013-2016; Area Dean 
(Maranoa) & (Bunya) 2015.-2016; PinC Parish of Goondiwindi 16-17, Rector Parish of 
Goondiwindi from 17.  90 Frideswide Street, Goondiwindi 4390 (PO Box 37 Goondiwindi 
4390) Tel: 4671 4151(BH) Mbl: 0407 526 325 email: kandal1@bigpond.com;  S: Alan:
                       Active  
 
HAY, The Rev'd Amy Deborah Griffith b.46; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 67; Cert Th 
(Newnham Coll, Univ of Cambridge) 69; BD (Univ of Qld) 74; ADVA (QUT) 84; D.05; 
P.06; Hon A.C., St Alban's, Wilston 05-2013; PTO St Alban's, Wilston from 2013-2014; 
PTO Parish of Grovely from 2014.  28 Crowther Street, Windsor 4030 Tel: 3357 5755 
email: rd_hay@bigpond.net.au;  S: Robert:          Retired PTO 
 
HAY, The Rev'd Robert b.53; Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 76; Dip.Ed. (Univ of Qld) 77; 
B.Ec (UQ) 83; Th.Dip. (ACT) 84; D.84; P.85; A.C. Surfers Paradise 85-86; A.C. St Luke's, 
Toowoomba 86-88; P-in-C ChCh, Boonah 88-90; R. 90-96; R. Bramble Bay 96-03; Area 
Dean of Redcliffe 98-01; P-in-C St Alban's, Wilston 03-2014; Warden SSA 05-06; Area 
Dean Brisbane North West 11-2014; PTO Parish of Grovely from 2014.  28 Crowther 
Street, Windsor 4030 Tel: 3357 5755 Mbl: 0438 005 750 email: robert53hay@gmail.com;  
S: Deborah:          PTO  
 
HAYES, The Rev'd Alwyn Breta b.36; St Francis' Coll; CertT (KGTC) 55; Grad Dip Educ 
Stud (Armidale CAE) 79; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 91; D.91; Hon A.C. Holy Trinity, Fortitude 
Valley 91-93; Hon A.C. St David's, Chelmer 93-98; Hon Dcn 98-06; PTO Chelmer-
Graceville 06- 2011; PTO Cathedral Parish from 2011  5/239 Small Street, Teneriffe  4005 
Tel: 3216 1216 email: alwynha1@gmail.com: Retired PTO-- --- Hebron, The Rev'd Dr 
Carol Anne b.51; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 89; Grad Dip T (ACU) 90; Assoc Dip 
Min (SFC) 92; B Th (BCT) 98; M Th (BCT) 08; PhD (CSU), 13. D.92; P.99; Hon A.C. St 
John's Cathl from 92; Hon Chapl Rochedale State High Schl 93-95; Chapl Canterbury 
Coll 96-98; Hon Dcn, St John's Cathl 98-99; Hon Dcn, St Mark's, Slacks Creek 99; Hon 
A.C. 99-2000; Hon Asst P., Parish of Logan 2000-02; P-in-C, Holy Trinity, Goondiwindi 
02-03; Hon Assoc P. St Paul's, Roma 04-05; Asst P. Logan 05-09; PTO Logan from Oct 
09.  F2 Yurana Retirement Village 129 Dennis Road Springwood 4127 Tel: 3299 4548 
email: revheb@hotmail.com:          PTO  
 
HENRY, The Rev'd Dr George William b.49; St Francis' Coll; BD (Univ of Qld) 76; Grad 
Dip T (NBCAE) 79; PhD (QUT) 09; D.86; P.87; Hon A.C. St David's, Chelmer 86-87; A.C. 
St Augustine's Hamilton 87-88; Hon A.C. St Margaret's, Sandgate 88-91; PTO Dio of Bris 
91; Chapl St Paul's School 92-03; PTO Sandgate Northpoint 04-06; P-in-C, St Mary's, 
Kilcoy 06-12; PTO Sandgate-Northpoint from 2013.  99 Baskerville Street Brighton 4017  
Mbl: 0458 660 140 email: george_henry@gmx.com;  S: Karen:                     PTO  
 
HENZELL, The Rev'd Canon Bruce Edgell b.42; St Francis' Coll; B Surv (Univ of Qld) 64; 
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B Div (Univ of Qld) 70; Dip Ed (Univ of Qld) 71; D.70, P.71 PNG; A.C. St Andrew's, 
Indooroopilly 71; Dio of Bris; PNG-Managalas 72; Newton Coll, Dogura 73-74; Dio of 
PNG; A.C. ChCh, St Lucia 75; A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich 75-78; R. All Saints', Charleville 
78-83; R.D. of the West 82-83; Assoc P. St Bartholomew's, Mt Gravatt 83-85; R. 85-02; 
Area Dean of Moreton 91-02; Hon Canon St John's Cathl from 95; Co-ordinator, Ministry 
Discovery and Discernment 03-05; PTO St John's Cathedral 05-14; Canon Emeritus from 
2014; PTO Rtd Parish of Cleveland from 15.  32 Egret Drive, Victoria Point 4165 Tel: 
3207 0805 Mbl: 0405 089 867 email: bruce.henzell@gmail.com;  S: Rhyl:    Retired PTO  
 
HERBERT, The Rev'd Ronald Walter b.27; Moore Coll Syd 55; B Sc (Univ of Qld) 51; 
ThL (ACT) 57; BD (Univ of Lond) 58; D.57; P.58 Adel; A.C. Holy Trinity, Adel 57-60; Asst 
Chapl CEGS 60-68; PTO Dio of Bris 68-09. Abp's Cert for Officiating on Special 
Occasions from 09.  60 Prospect Street, Wynnum North 4178 Tel: 3396 4354  S: 
Bronwyn:                   Archbishop's Cert  
 
HEUSSLER, The Rev'd David Nicholson b.48; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThL (ACT) 76; 
D.76; P.77; A.C. St Cuthbert's, Tweed Heads 76-79; Asst P. St Andrew's, Lismore 79-80; 
Asst P. St Mark's, Casino 80-82; Dio of Grafton; Asst P. St Peter's, Box Hill 82; (INSTEP) 
Dio of Melb; Asst P. All Saints', Kempsey 83; Dio of Grafton; P-in-C, St Matthew's, Quilpie 
(BCA) 84-85; PTO Dio of Grafton 85-87 (PTO St Mary's, Ballina); Asst P. Holy Trinity, 
Moe, Dio of Gippsland 87-88; P-in-C Church of the Resurrection, Loxton, Dio of The 
Murray 88-93; PTO Dio of Bris from 96.  135/53 Old Coach Road, Mudgeeraba 4213 Tel: 
5530 2943 :             Retired PTO  
 
HILL, The Rev'd Pamela Jean b.41; St Francis' Coll; RN 63; RM 65; Assoc Dip Th (ACT) 
79; EHCC (Trinity) 97; B Th (BCT) 04; D.98; P.99; Hon A.C. St Andrew's, Caloundra 98; 
Assoc P. 99-06; PTO Kawana Waters 06-08. PTO Buderim from 09.  Unit 6, 40 
Esplanade, Golden Beach 4551 Tel: 5492 2367 Mbl: 0407 625 837 email: 
p.jhill@bigpond.com;           Retired PTO  
 
HILL, The Rev'd Violet b.30; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 92; D.92; Hon A.C., 
Christ Church, Bundaberg 92-98; Hon Dcn Ch Ch, Bundaberg 98-2000; Hon Hosp Chapl, 
Bundaberg Base Hospital from 98; PTO from 2000 (Hon Chapl, Bundaberg Base Hosp 
2000-04); Ret 05. Abp's Cert for Officiating on Special Occasions from 08.  121 Elliott 
Heads Road, Bundaberg  4670 Tel: 4152 4103 email:  revlettyhill@gmail.com 
                         Archbishop's Cert  
 
HOARE, The Venerable Valerie Ann b.49; St Francis' Coll; Cert Tchg (KGTC) 68; BA 
(Univ of Qld) 74; Grad Dip Sp Ed (MGCAE) 87; Grad Dip Th (BCT) 97; M Th (BCT) 98; 
Hey Sharp Prize 98; D.97; P.98; A.C. Holy Spirit, Kenmore 97-2000; P-in-C St Alban's, 
Goodna from 2000; Ang Spiritual Development Co-ord (Chaplain), The Springfield Coll 
03-06; Area Dean Brisbane South West 04-13; P-in-C Parish of Tamborine Mountain from 
2013; Archdeacon of the Gold Coast from 2014.  2 Dapsang Drive, Tamborine Mountain 
4272 Tel: 5545 2919(BH) 5545 2919(AH) Mbl: 0487 117 662 email: 
anglicantamborine@bigpond.com;  S: Doug:                   Active  
 
HOBBS, The Rev'd Daniel Wayne 80. ; MJ (QUT) 08; DipJourn (ACJ) 08; Cert IV 
Wkplace Trning & AssesMNT (TAFE) 09; AFAIM MAICD; BTh (CSU) 15; D.15; P.16; Stip 
Lay Min P/T Parish of Cleveland 2015; Assist Curate Parish of Cleveland 2015.-2016; 
Assist Priest Cleveland from 2016.  PO Box 2 Cleveland 4163  Mbl: 0400 531 837 email: 
curate@anglicancleveland.org.au; ; S: Kylie:                    Active  
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† HOLLAND, The Rt Rev'd Dr Jonathan Charles b.56; BA (Hons) (Univ of WA) 78; BA 
(Hons) (Oxford) 81; Oxf Cert of Theol (Ripon Coll, Cuddesdon) 82; MA (Oxford) 85; MA 
(Univ of Qld) 99; PhD (Univ of Qld) 06; D.82, P.83 Perth; A.C. St Luke's, Mosman Park 
82-84; Dio of Perth; Asst P. St James' King St 84-89; Dio of Syd; R. Ch of the Ascension,
Midland 89-93; Dio of Perth; R. ChCh, St Lucia 93-06; Dio of Brisbane; Abp's Exam Chapl
95-06; Area Dean of Bris West 98-01; Archdcn of Oxley 01-06; Res Canon, St John's
Cathl 04-06; Consecrated Bishop on The Feast of the Presentation of Christ in the
Temple, 2 February 2006 in St John's Cathedral by the Archbishop of Brisbane (Aspinall)
assisted by the Archbishop of Perth (Herft), Bishops of Canberra-Goulburn (Browning),
Newcastle (Farran), Rockhampton (Fryar), Grafton (Slater), the Assistant Bishops of
Brisbane (Appleby, Williams and Nolan), Sydney (Forsyth), Melbourne (Hale) North
Queensland (Mabo) and Retired Bishops Bayton, Charles, Clark, Holland, Hollingworth,
Mason, Meredith, Smith and Wood; Assistant Bishop, Diocese of Brisbane (Bishop of the
Northern Region) 06-2016; Episcopal contact for ABM from 18. (Miss. Chpln) Executive
Director MEC/Principal St Francis' College from 16. PO Box 1261, Milton 4064 Tel: 3514
7401(BH) Mbl: 0406 425 826 email: jholland@anglicanchurchsq.org.au; S: Kerry:

Bishops

HOOPER, The Rev'd Stephen Martin b64. LLB(Hons) (Univ. Canterbury) 86; Solicitor 
(Victoria Univ. Wellington) 96; Mjur (Waikato Univ) 99; BTh (CSU) 2012; D.12; P.13. 
Families Minister, Parish of Cleveland 2010-2011; Lay Min Biggera Waters 2012; Assist. 
Curate Mt Gravatt 2012.-2013; Assist Priest Mt Gravatt 2013-14; Associate Priest Parish 
of Gold Coast North 2014.2016; PinC Parish of Sunnytbank from 16.  54 Cooberrie Street, 
Cornubia 4130 Tel: 3287 7268 Mbl: 0411 579 954 email: hoopertribe@gmail.com;  S: 
Robyn:                       Active  

HOPE, The Rev'd Martyn Campbell 45; Trinity Coll; B Th (MCD) 88; Grad Dip Min (MCD) 
02; D.& P. Dio of Melb 86; SSF 69-80; A.C. All Saints', Geelong 86-88; P-in-C Heathmont 
88-92; I. 92-95; I. Holy Trinity, Kew 96-98; Dio of Melb; P-in-C Swanbourne 2000, Dio of
Perth; R. Hindmarsh 01-03; R. Camperdown 03-05; Canon, Ch Ch Cathl 04-05; Dio of
Ballarat; R. Camp Hill with Norman Park 06-2015; (Parish known as Eastern Hills
Anglicans 2007); Area Dean, Brisbane South West 07-2015; Priest-in-Charge, Eastern
Hills 3 October 2015 - 2017; PinC (P/T) Parish of Morningside from 17  PO Box 27,
Morninside 4170 Tel: 3399 4129(BH) Mbl: 0418 177 785 email: fr.hope@bigpond.com;
S: Catherine:                      Active

HOPPER, The Rev'd Kenneth David b.52; Moore Coll, Syd; B Th (ACT) 87; D.82; P.82; 
A.C. All Saints', Booval 82-84; A.C. St John's Dalby 84-85; R. St George's Mareeba,
(Prison Chap Lotus Glen) 85-90; Chapl ARA from Jan 90; Puckapunyal 90-92 (PTO Dio
Wangaratta); 3rd Bde (4th Fd Regt RAA) Townsville 93-94 (PTO Dio NQ); Aust Medical
Support Force UNAMIR II Rwanda Feb 95-Aug 95 (PTO Dio Kigali, Episcopal Church of
Rwanda); BASC NQ, Lavarack Barracks, Townsville, Aug 95-Jan 97, 1st Battalion, RAR
Jan 97-Jan 98, Co- ord Chapl HQ 3rd Brigade 98-99; Co-ord Chapl HQ INTERFET Sep
99-Feb 2000; Chapl 3rd Brigade Administrative Support Battalion 2000-01; Co-ord Chapl
2nd Health Support Battalion 01-03; Chief Instructor, ADF Chaplains Coll, Bonegilla Vic
04-06; Snr Chapl, Land Warfare Centre, Canungra 06; Chapl Greenslopes Private Hosp
07; Rector, St Mark's, The Gap from 08. Parish Office: 1073 Waterworks Road, The Gap
4061.  26 Morningvale Place, Mitchelton 4053 (PO Box 22, The Gap  4061) Tel: 3300
1502(BH) Fax: 3300 9597 Mbl: 0439 722 210 email: Kenneth.hopper@tgac.org.au;  S:
Dianne:                         Active

HORTON, The Venerable Bruce Robert AM 02; b.39; Moore Theol Coll; ThL (2nd Cl 
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Hons) 63; D.63; P.64 Dio of Syd; C. Pittwater 63-67; C- in-C Newport 67-70; C-in-C 
Ermington 70-72; Dio of Syd; ARA Chapl 72-95; Archdcn to Army/Principal Chapl 93-01; 
Mission Chaplain (Defence Force) Dio of Bris 01-02; Archdeacon Emeritus from 01; Asst 
P. Robina-Mermaid Beach 02-10' PTO (Rtd) Robina-Mermaid Beach from 10..  211/60
Riverwalk Ave Robina 4224 Tel: 55621846 Mbl: 0438 731 194 email: 
b.m.horton@bigpond.com: Retired PTO

HOWIE, The Reverend Lindsay b. 52. BA UQ 83; BTh BCT 83; D. 92 P. 92 
(Rockhampton). Methodist HMs 75-76; Wondai HMs 77; Trinity College UCA 78-82; 
Ordnd UCA 83; Middlemount 83-85; Barcaldine 86-90; Rockhampton 91; PinC Dawson 
Valley 92-95; R Keppel 95-01; Chapl A Res 96-06; R HT Mackay 01-06; AD Southern 
Reg 01-06; Chap Good Shepherd Lodge 01-06; Reg Police Chap Townsville 06- 10; Dio 
Rockhampton Chapl Mater hops; Dean and R St Paul's Cathedral Rockhampton 10-18; 
AD City Rockhampton 11-18. Brisbane Dio. PTO Inala from 18.  58 Lanata Forest Lake 
4078 (58 Lanata Crs Forest Lake 4078) Mbl: 0490 950 893 email: 
howiejenlin@hotmail.com;   S: Jenny: PTO

HOYTE, The Rev'd Geoffrey Miller b.62; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 88; MA (Stud Rel) 
(Univ of Qld) 02; D.88; P.89; A.C. St Paul's, Maryborough 88-91; P-in-C St John's, 
Mundubbera-Eidsvold 91-92; R. 92-96; Chapl Univ of Qld 96-03; Miss Chapl 03-04; R. St 
Mark's, Warwick from 04-10; Area Dean of the Southern Downs 04-10; P-in-C, Killarney 
06-10; R. Parish of Logan from 10; Area Dean Logan Deanery from 2012.  7 Olympia
Street, Marsden 4132 (PO Box 5085, Daisy Hill 4127) Tel: 3290 3718(BH) Mbl: 0409 669
904 email: ghoyte@tpg.com.au; rector@logananglican.com.au;  S: Frances:          Active

HUGHES, The Rev'd Brian James b.40; BA (Univ of Syd) 61; NSW Tchrs Cert 62; B Th 
(BCT) 93; D.90; P.91 Dio of Grafton; Asst P. Port Macquarie 92; R. Sth Grafton 93-01; 
Ecum Off 95-01; Canon ChCh Cathl, Grafton 97-01; Dio SpDir Cursillo 2000-01; Dio of 
Grafton; R. St Catherine's, Centenary Suburbs 01-09; Abp's Exam Chapl 06-09; Retired 
2 November 09; PTO (Retd) Ipswich 09-12; PTO (Rtd) Booval from 2012.  66 Harold 
Street, Bundamba 4304 Tel: 3436 5768 Mbl: 0437 640 821 email: 
brianhughes3@bigpond.com: Retired PTO

HUMPHRIES, The Rev'd Warwick Arthur b.40; ThA (ACT) 59; St Johns College Morpeth 
62-64; D.64; P.69; A.C. Adamstown 64-66; Christ Coll, Hobart 67-68; A.C. St James, New
town 68-69; P-in-C Geeveston/Port Esperance 69-73; Chapl Missions to Seamen, Hull,
Yorkshire UK 73; R. Queenstown/Strahan 74-75; R. Sorell/Tasman Pen/Richmond 76-
80; R. St Aidan's, Launceston 80-90; R. St Helen's 90-95; Dio of Tasmania PTO 95-03;
PTO Maryborough 05-06; PTO Mt Gravatt 06-07; PTO Wishart 07-10; Archbishops Cert.
to Officiate on Special Occasions 10-13; PTO Auchenflower-Milton from 13.(Locum) PTO
(Rtd) Parish of Morningside from 16 (Locum) PTO Parish of Yeronga from 16 (Locum).
21 Cresthaven Drive, Mansfield  4122 Tel: 3420 3805 Mbl: 0417 103 203 email:
warwick.humphries@gmail.com; S: Marilyn:          Retired PTO

HUNNYBUN, The Rev'd Martin Wilfrid b.44; D,70; P.71; Oak Hill Theol. Coll. 70. C.Ware 
(Dio St Albans) 70-74; C. Exe. Valley Team Ministry (Dio Exeter) 74; TeamV 1975-1980; 
R. Braunston (Dio Peterborough) 80-85; AsstChpln HMP Onley 80-85; R. Berry/Kangaroo
Valley (Dio Sydney) 85-94; SenChpln ARV 94-98; TeamV Hartland Coast Team M (Dio
Exeter) 98-2000; Dio Ecum Off (Exeter) 99-2000; (Dio Sydney) R. St John's Glebe 2000-
03; AD Leichhardt 02-03; PTO (Dio Tas) Co-ord of Admin. Channel-Cygnet 03-08; PTO
Tamborine Mountain (Dio Bris) from 09.  8 Tweed Heads Ave, Tamborine Mountain 4272
Tel: 5545 4310 email: m.hunnybun@bigpond.com;  S: Thelma:          Retired PTO
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HURREN, The Rev'd Jacqueline Mary b.50; St Francis' Coll; B Ed (BCAE) 86; B Th (BCT) 
92; M Theol (BCT) 04; D.97; P.98; Hon A.C. St Luke's, Rosewood 97-98; A.C. Ch Ch St 
Lucia 98-2000; P-in-C Texas-Inglewood 2000-2005; Area Dean of the Southern Downs 
01-03;  Archd of Cunningham 03-05; Snr. Chaplain, St Hilda's School 05-07; R. St Mary
Magdalene, Moorooka-Salisbury 07-14; Army Reserve Chaplain, Gallipoli Barracks
Enoggera 09-14; Army CFTS 10FSB Ross Island Barracks, Townsville 2014; Army
Reserve HQ LWC Kokoda Barracks, Canungra from 2014.  48 Bidder Street, Salisbury
4107  Mbl: 0428 961 950 email: jmhurren@gmail.com;  S: John:                 Active

HYND, The Rev'd Pamela Ruby b.46; St Francis' Coll; B Sc (Hons Maths) 67; Assoc Dip 
Min (SFC) 93; D.93; P.98; Hon Dcn, Ithaca- Ashgrove and Hon Chapl St Andrew's Hosp 
93-98; Hon Assoc P. Ithaca-Ashgrove 98-03; , P-in-C St Alban's, Auchenflower 03-
08;Chapl St Andrew's Hosp 98; PTO (Rtd) Ithaca-Ashgrove from 11.  28 Wienholt Street,
Auchenflower  4066 Tel: 3870 1436 Mbl: 0431 424 737 email: pamhynd@hotmail.com;
S: John: Retired            Retired PTO

INKPIN, The Rev'd Dr Josephine McDonnell b.60. BA (Hons) Modern History (Oxford 
Univ) 81; MA (Hons) Modern History (Oxford Univ) 84; BA (Hons) Theol. (Oxford Univ) 
85; MA (Hons) Theol. 86; Cert Theol (Oxford Univ) 86; Ph.D (Durham Univ) 96; D.86; 
P.87; C. Hackney Team Ministry (Dio London) 86-88; AC & Lecturer in Church History,
Ripon College, Cuddesdon & AC Cuddesdon with Denton 88-90; Team V. (Dio Durham)
90-95; (Dio Durham) Social Responsibility Adviser (Rural & Environmental Officer) &
Assoc P. Stanhope with Frosterley, Eastgate and Rookhope 95-01; Area Dean
(Stanhope) 2000-2001; Assoc. P. (Dio Newcastle) Central Coast Deanery 01- 02; NCCA
Program Mgr (Decade to Overcome Violence) & Education Officer National Aboriginal &
Torres Strait Islander Ecumenical Commission, NCCA 02-07; Gen Sec. NSW Ecumenical
Council 07-10; Sec. Faith & Unity Commission NCCA 07-10; R. (Dio Brisbane)
Toowoomba St Luke's 10-17; Area Dean (Toowoomba Deanery) 2015-2016; Lecturer
SFC from 17.  233 Milton Road, Milton 4064 (PO Box 1261, Milton 4064)  Mbl: 0488 333
169 email: jinkpin@ministryeducation.org.au;  S: Penny:                  Active

IRVINE, The Rev'd Dr Roderick David b.47; Moore Coll.; B.Sc. 68, Hons. 69; Dip.Ed. 70; 
Ph.D. 76 (Univ of Qld); Th.L.(A.C.T.)79; B.D.(Hons)(Univ of Lond)79; MBA Wollongong 
96, D.79; P.80; A.C. All Saints', Booval 79-82;  P.to O. Dio.of Bris. 82-87, R All Saints 
Figtree Dio Sydney 87-08; PTO St Andrew's Sth Bris Dio of Bris. from 08.  8/19 O'Connell 
Street, Kangaroo Point 4169 (PO Box 15648, City East 4002) Tel: 3411 6600 Mbl: 0412 
777 833 email: roddirvine@gmail.com; S: Helen:                     Retired PTO 

IVEY, The Rev'd Christopher Henry b.70; BCT; B Ed (Univ Tas) 92; Grad Dip Ed (Univ 
SA) 95; Dip Th (BCT) 99; D.95; P.96; A.C. Good Shepherd, Cairns 95-98; Chapl Trinity 
Anglican School 95-98; Dio of NQ; PTO Dio of Bris 99; Hon A.C. Mudgeeraba from 99 
(Chapl Somerset Coll 99-02); Principal, Clarence Valley Anglican School, Dio of Grafton 
03-07; PTO Noosa from 07, Principal, St Andrew's Anglican College, Peregian from 07.
28 Gweneth Road, Peregian Beach 4573 (Principal, St Andrew's Anglican College, 40
Peregian Springs Drive, Peregian Springs 4573) Tel: 5471 5555(BH) 5471 3542(AH) Fax:
5471 5500 Mbl: 0439 247 472 email: civey@saac.qld.edu.au;  S: Elizabeth:         Active

JAMIESON, The Rev'd Jeanette Anna b.50; Dip Sch. Mus. (Tas Con Music 71); Grad 
Dip Mus.Ed. (BCAE 82);A Mus A (83); B.Ed Studies (UQ 85); M. RE (ACU 03); MA (Th) 
(ACU 05); B.Th. (BCT 08); D.10; P.10; AC Aspley-Albany Creek 2010-2012; PinC Parish 
of Kilcoy 2012. - 2017. PinC Parish of Maleny from 2017. Area Dean Sunshine Coast 
Deanery from 18.  2 Walkers Drive, Maleny 4552 (PO Box 265, Maleny 4515) Tel: 5499 
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9130(BH) Mbl: 0429 073 262 email: j-a-jamo@bigpond.net.au;:                Active  
 
JANE, The Rev'd Dr Beverley Lois b.46; TSTC 1966; BEd (Latrobe) 1986; MEd (La 
Trobe) 1990; PhD (Monash) 1996; DipMin (UFT) 2010; BTh (MCD Trinity) 2003; MTh 
(MCD YTU) 2009; D.2009 (Melb). P.2014 (Melb). D St Mark's Dromana w St George's 
Red Hill 2009; AC St John's Flinders W St Mark's Balnarring 2010; AsstM Frankston 11-
14; Memb Bp Perry Inst Steer Cttee 11-12; Asst C St Paul's Frankston 14-15 Memb 
MOWatch Aust Cttee 13-15; Memb Perry Institute Training Cttee 13-15; Mission Chpln 
(Pastoral Care Co-ord) (PCC) Gold Coast (P/T) 2016. Assistant Priest P/T Parish of 
Cooroora from 2016.  PO Box 277 Cooroy 4563  Mbl: 0417 034 301 email: 
beverley.lois.jane@gmail.com;:                    Active  
 
JARVIS, The Rev'd Jeffrey Wallace b.45; Sarum Wells Th Coll UK; ThL (Sarum); Hosp 
Chapl Cert (Univ Hosp of Wales); B Ed (CHC) 95; D.75; P.76; A.C. St Andrew's, 
Cambridge 75-77; A.C. St Mary's, Nottingham, Hosp Chapl and Dir Job Creation Scheme 
77-78; Dio of Southwark; R. Greenwood 78-80; Chapl ChCh Grammar School 80-84; Dio 
of Perth; R. Good Shepherd, Edgehill, Cairns and Chapl Base Hosp 84-86; Chapl RAN, 
HMAS Cairns 85; Dio of NQ; PTO Dio of Bris 86-91 (Ang Chapl Brisbane Boys Coll); 
Chapl Naval Reserve Cadets T/S "Paluma" from 87; Hon Chapl St Mary's Home 87; 
Chapl St Margaret's School 91-94; PTO Dio of Bris 94; Chapl HMAS Cerberus 94; HMAS 
Watson 95; Chapl, Fraser Coast Ang Coll from 96-08; (CFTS 07-08) Chap HMAS 
PENGUIN & St Vincent's Hospital Darlinghurst; HMAS WATERHEN, 07-10; HMAS 
PARRAMATTA (08); HMAS MANOORA (09); HMAS KANIMBLA, Op INDONESIA 
ASSIST (09); HMAS COONAWARRA, Chap Fleet North, Chaplain Patrol Boats, 2010-
13; HMAS SUCCESS (11); HQ JTF633 Al Minhad (MEAO) (13); HMAS MELBOURNE 
Op SLIPPER (ISAF)2013-14; Active Reserve South Qld to 15; PTO Hervey Bay from 15-
18. Chaplain Fraser Coast Anglican College from Aug 18 - Aug 19.  6 Bamboo Street, 
Point Vernon 4655 Tel: 4124 4506 Mbl: 0477 704 112 email: jjar0930@bigpond.net.au;  
S: Helen:                       Active  
 
JAYARAJ, The Rev'd Daniel Paulraj b.70; BSc (Madras Uni)91; BD (Senate & 
Serampore Uni) 97; MA Arts (Sydney Coll. Div.) 08; D.97; P.98; (Dio. Madras India) 
Misson Chpln Home for Aged 98-98; Changan/Pattu Pastorate (PinC 2000-2006; (Dio 
Rockhampton) Chpln RSL from 12; Police Chpln from 2013; R. Gladstone 16-18; PTO 
Tamil Ministry Parish of Annerley 17-18. Priest in Charge Parish of Chermside from Dec 
18.  70 Auckland Street, Gladstone 4680 Tel: 4972 4754(BH) 4972 0578(AH) Mbl: 0435 
867 166 email: daniel@anglicanchurchcq.org.au:        PTO  
 
JEFFERY, Mr Peter b.82; BTh (CSU) 17; Lay Chpln TSS 15; Lay Chpln Churchie 16; Lay 
Chpln St John's Anglican College 17; D.17 P.18; AC Parish of Sunnybank 17-18. Ass 
Priest Parish of Sunnybank from Dec 18.   (St Francis College PO Box 1261 Milton 4064)  
Mbl: 0423 363 558 email: revpetesbac@outlook.com;  S: Karen:                       Active  
 
JOHNSON, The Rev'd Arthur Ernest b.25; St Francis' Coll; ThL; D.48; P.50; A.C. St 
Mark's, Warwick 48-52; A.C. St Colomb's, Clayfield 52; A.C. Holy Trinity, Fortitude Valley 
53-54; V. St Cecilia's, Chinchilla 54-55; R. 55-60; R. St John's, Nambour 60-67; R. St 
Andrew's, Pittsworth 67-71; R. St Paul's, Stanthorpe 71-75; R. St Colomb's, Clayfield 75-
83; Hosp Chapl, Prince Charles Hosp Chermside 83-87; PTO Dio of Bris 87-02. Abp's 
Cert for Officiating on Special Occasions from 02.  76/100 Aveo Aspley Court, Albany 
Creek Road, Aspley  4034 Tel: 3863 3402  S: Joy:             Archbishop's Cert  
 
JOHNSON, The Rev'd Lynda Beth b.59; St Francis' Coll; Dip Bib St (Ridley Coll) 85; B 
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Th (BCT) 01; D.2000; P.01; A.C. St Peter's, Bribie Island 2000-04; Mission Chaplain 04; 
Asst P. St John's, North Pine 05-16; Assoc.P. North Pine from 2016..  2 Wyllie Street, 
Petrie  4502 Tel: 3285 6333 Mbl: 0438 120 459 email: lynda@northpineanglican.org.au ; 
admin@northpineanglican.org.au;  S: Chris:                   Active  
 
JOHNSON, The Venerable Christopher Delpratt b.56; Ridley Coll Melb 83-85; St Francis' 
Coll 86; B Th (ACT) 86; Dip Min 86; B Bus (QIT) 78; D.85; P.86; A.C. Church of the Holy 
Spirit, Kenmore 85-91; P-in-C St Matthias', Zillmere 91-93; R. 93-96; R. St John's, North 
Pine from 96; Area Dean Redcliffe 10-15; Archdeacon of Lilley from 2015..  2 Wyllie 
Street, Petrie  4502 Tel: 3285 6333 Mbl: 0427 586 568 email: 
rector@northpineanglican.org.au;  S. Lynda:                       Active  
 
JOHNSTONE, The Rev'd David b.36; Moore Coll, Syd; ThL (2nd Cl) 59; B Th (Melb Coll 
Div) 78; Dip Ed (Monash Univ) 78; B Ed St (Qld) 82; MACE 79; D & P 60 Syd; A.C. All 
Saints, Nth Parramatta 60-61; A.C. St Luke's, Mosman 61-62; Dio of Syd; A.C. St 
Andrew's, Willesden Green, 62-65; Hon A.C. St Mary's, Munster Square and Chapl Int 
Students' House 65; Dio of Lond; Prec St James' Cathl Townsville 66-69; Chapl CMF 69; 
Chapl RAAF from 70; Dio Sec Dio Nth Qld 70-74; Canon to the Ordinary, Dio Nth Qld 70-
74; Chapl Mentone Girls' Grammar School, Dio of Melb 74-78; Asst Chapl The Southport 
School 79-83; Chapl Anglican Church Grammar School 83-05; PTO St John's Cathedral 
05-07; Assoc P. Christ Church, St Lucia 07-10; PTO(Retired) from 11.  73 Lancaster 
Street, Coorparoo 4151 Tel: 3397 0980 Mbl: 0439 669 695 email: 
revdjohnstone@gmail.com;  S: Jennie:                         Retired PTO  
 
JONES, The Rev'd Penelope Howson b.58. BA (Hons) English Lit. (Cambridge Univ) 80; 
MA (Hons) English Lit. (Cambridge Univ.) 83; BA (Hons)Thl (Oxford Univ) 85; MA (Hons) 
Theology (Oxford Univ) 86; Cert Theol. (Oxford Univ) 86; Cert Further Ed. (Sunderland 
Univ.) 93; D.87; P.94; (Dio London) Deaconess Hackney Team Ministry 86-87; Parish 
Dcn 87-88; (Dio Oxford) Tutor in Pastoral Theol. & Parish Dcn Ripon College, Cuddesdon 
w Denton 88-90; Dir. Practical Theol. Nth East Ordination Course 93-97; PinC Stanhope 
with Frosterley & Eastgate w Rookhope (Dio Durham) 97-01; Woman Adviser in Min. 
Bishop's Senior Staff 97-01; Hon Canon Durham Cathedral 97-01; Assoc P. Gosford (Dio 
Newcastle) 01-05; R. Woy Woy 05-10; Assoc P. Toowoomba St Luke 10-17; P/T Chpln 
the Glennie School 2012-17; PinC Auchenflower-Milton from 17; Director of Formation 
SFC from 17.  233 Milton Road, Milton 4064 (PO Box 1261 Milton 4064) Tel: 3369 
1700(BH) Mbl: 0477 444 095 email: penehj24@gmail.com;  S: Jo:                 Active  
 
JORGENSEN, The Rev'd Drew Ronald b.43; Moore Coll; ThL (ACT) 68; B Bus (UCSQ) 
89; D.69; P.70; A.C. St Luke's, Ekibin 70-72; V. Mary Valley 72-76; R. St George's, Crows 
Nest 76-81; PTO Dio of Bris 81-06; Abp's Cert for Officiating on Special Occasions from 
06.  8 Maitland Street, Gatton  4343 (PO Box 149, Gatton  4343) Tel: 5462 3668 email: 
dajorgensen@bigpond.com;  S: Annette:               Archbishop's Cert  
 
JOSEPH, The Rev'd Shaji b.70. BA (NEHU Uni Shillong, India) 91; BEd, (NEHU Uni 
Shillong, India) 93; BTh (Salesian Uni Rome-UPS) 97; MTh (Salesian Uni Rome-UPS) 
2000; D.97 (India); P 98 (India) P. Port Pirie (2000-09; Rec Angl Ch 2010; Multi-faith 
Chpln 09-10; Industrial Chpln & DF Chpln 09-10; PP Woomera 03-09; PP Cummins, 
Tunby Bay, Lock & Elliston 02; Asst P. Joseph's Schl Port Lincoln 01; AsstP St Mark's 
Cathl Port Pirie 01; Chpln/Councillor St Marks Coll Port Pirie 2000; Moamoa Theol Coll, 
Samoa; AsstP Nth Rockh 2010;PP St Luke's Parish Wandal, Rockhampton 2010-16, 
Multi-Faith Chaplain CQUniversity 2010-16; PTO (Dio Brisb) Multi-Faith Chpln to 
Malayalam community within Parish of Eastern Hills (monthly basis) from 16-18. Priest in 
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Charge, Parish of Gympie from Nov 18.  15 Amy Street Gympie 4570 Tel: 4922 1971(BH) 
4722 1971(AH) Mbl: 0428 762 195 email: shajipadi@gmail.com;  S: Syafrida:         Active  
 
JUDGE-MEARS, The Rev'd Peter Roland b.70;Moore Theol. Coll. B.Th. 98; Dip.Min 
Moore Theol. Coll. 98; Dio Nelson St Christopher's Blenheim Sth Youth Worker 98-99; 
D.99; P.99; Curate 99-00; St John's Wakefield; V 00-04; Nativity Ang Church Dio Nelson 
AP 04-08; Dio Brisbane, Assist Priest Wishart 08-2011; PinC Wishart 2011-13; Rector 
Parish of Wishart from 2013..  23 Lancelot Street, Rochedale South 4123 (10 Greenwood 
Street, Wishart 4122) Tel: 3849 5444(BH) Mbl: 0403 413 478 email: 
peter@stjohnswishart.com.au;  S: Sybil:                    Active  
 
KEELEY, The Rev'd John Robin b.38; G & C Coll Cam BA 62; Clifton Th Coll 62; MA 96; 
D.64; P.65; C. Onslow Square St Paul, London 64- 66; C. Hove Bp Hannington Memorial 
Church, Chichester 66-69; C. Harborne Heath, Birmingham 69-72; V. Leic Holy Trinity, 
Leicester 72-74; V. Holy Trinity w St John, Leicester 74-80; PTO St Alban's 81-86; NSM 
Carterton Oxford 89-95; Tutor EAMTC, Ely 95-99; TV Bishopsnympton, Rose Ash, 
Mariansleigh etc Ex 99-03; RD S Molton 01-03; Rtd 03; UK; PTO Tamborine Mountain 
06-11; Archbishop's Special Certificate 2011.  Unit 3, 27-29 Capo Lane, Tamborine 
Mountain 4272 Tel: 5545 0966 email: robandpaulkeely1@bigpond.com;  S: Pauline: 
                   Archbishop's Cert  
 
KEYT, The Rev'd Fitzroy John b.34; Lincoln Th Coll; D.67 P.68 Dio of Birmingham; V. St 
Luke's, Miles 73-76; R. St Matthew's, Drayton 76- 86; R.D. of Toowoomba 86; R. St 
Peter's, Coolangatta 86-98; P-in-C St Colomb's, Clayfield 98-01; PTO Zillmere from 01.  
58 Thompson Street, Zillmere  4034 Tel: 3314 3011 email: dskeyt@optusnet.com.au;  S: 
Dorami:              Retired PTO  
 
KING, The Rev'd Rebecca Charles b.70; BA.Thl (Evang Theol Seminary) Cairo 96; 
DipThl (Bible Coll.) 09; BA.Thl (CSU) 15; D.16. P.17. Youth Activities All Saints Cathedral, 
Khartoom, Sudan 89-92; Relief Ministry for Sudanese refugees All Saints Cathedral, 
Zamalek, Cairo 97-98; Dep. Leader Evang Committee (Dio Mundri) Nairobi 99-2000; LA 
Parish of Yeronga 04-08; Children's Ministry Parish of Bardon 2015-16; Assist Curate 
Parish of Bardon 2016-17; Assist Priest Parish of Bardon from 2017  Parish Office  290 
Simpsons Road, Bardon 4065) Tel: 3369 3301(BH) Mbl: 0436 359 126 email: 
r.king@bardonanglican.org.au;   rebecca.king39@yahoo.com.au:                 Active 
 
KJELLGREN, The Rev'd Sandra Elizabeth b.52; St Francis' Coll; Ecum Hosp Chapl Cert 
(TTC) 92; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 93; Ed Min Cert (GBRE) 93; B Th (BCT) 98; MA (Th) 
(ACU) (2004); D.93; P.98; Hon Dcn, St John's Cathl 93-98; Hon Asst Chapl St Andrew's 
Hosp 94- 97; Hon Chapl Yth Synod Stdg Ctee 95-96; A.C. Centenary Suburbs 99-2000; 
Assoc P. (with responsibility for Forest Lake) 2000-02; R. St Andrew's, Lutwyche from 
02;Chapl, The Most Excellent Order of the British Empire (Qld Assc) from 08; Area Dean 
Brisbane North East Deanery 08-2012; Re-elected AD Bris Nth East Dnry from 2012..  
673 Lutwyche Road, Lutwyche  4030 Tel: 3857 5734(BH) 3374 4968(AH) Fax: 3357 1797 
Mbl: 0404 623 423 email: rector@lutwycheanglican.org.au;  S: Ian:                 Active  
 
KNIGHT, The Rev'd Michele Anne b.51; B Soc.Sc (QUT 96). D 2010; Hon Assist. Curate 
Ipswich North 2010-2011; P/T Stip Lay Minister Parish of Gatton from 2011; Hon AC 
Ipswich from 11.  655 Mt Crosby Road, Mt Crosby 4306 (PO Box 7152, Mt Crosby 4306) 
Tel: 3201 2985 Mbl: 0419 656 037 email: bob.michele.knight@gmail.com;  S: Bob: Active  
 
KNOTT, The Rev'd Canon Neville James b.37; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThL (2nd Cl 
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Hons) (ACT); B Com (Univ of Qld); AAUQ; D.65; P.66; A.C. St Luke's, Ekibin 65-69; A.C. 
St Peter's, Southport 69-71; Dio of Bris; A.C. Stretford, Dio of Manchester 71; V. 
Moranbah, Dio of Rockptn 72-75; R. Holy Trinity, Fortitude Valley 75-83; R.D. Brisbane 
Central North 82-83; Res Canon of St John's Cathl 82-04; R. St Paul's, Cleveland 83-95; 
R.D. Brisbane East 83-91; Archd of Moreton 91-95; R. St Peter's, Southport 95-05; Canon 
Emeritus from 04; PTO St John's Cathedral from 05-18. Retired PTO Parish of East 
Redland from 18.  4/192 Long Street, Cleveland   4163 Tel: 3821 2492  email: 
nknott@tpg.com.au;  S: Evelyn:           Retired PTO  
 
LACEY, The Rev'd Charles Richard b.76; B.A. (Hons) Th.Min. (St Mellits Coll.) 13; D.13 
(London) P.14 (London); Curate, St Ann's Tottenham UK 10-16; PinC Prov. Parish 
Springfield from 16;  94 James Josey Avenue Springfield Lakes 4300 Tel: 0476 818 
763(BH)  Mbl: 0476 818 763 email: charlie@standrewsspringfield.org.au;  S: Tisa: Active  
 
LAKE, The Rev'd Dr Stephen James b.59; Dip T (KGCAE) 80; B Ed (BCAE) 89; M Ed 
(QUT) 99; EdD (QUT) 06; D.87 Dio of Rockptn; Hon Chapl CIAE 88-89; Hon Asst D. St 
Paul's Cathl 88-91; Hon Asst D Gracemere-Mt Morgan 91-94; Dio of Rockptn; Hon Asst 
Chapl Anglican Church Grammar School 95-98; Hon Asst Chapl St Paul's School 98-01; 
A.C. St Mark's, Clayfield 02-06; Leader of the Household of Deacons 03-05; Hon Dcn, St 
Mark's, Clayfield from 06.  14 Miles Street, Clayfield  4011 Tel: 3862 2991 Mbl: 0410 102 
756 email: lakemail59@gmail.com;  S: Stephanie:                   Active  
 
LAKE, The Rev'd Jacqueline b.37; St Francis' Coll; Cert Tchg (KGTC) 55; B Th (BCT) 
92; D & P 92 Dio of Rockptn; A.C. Keppell/Yeppoon/Emu Park 92-94; P-in-C 
Middlemount/Dysart 94-96; Dio of Rockptn; P. Assoc Ballina/Lennox Head 96-98; Dio of 
Grafton; PTO Dio of Bris 99-06; PTO Redcliffe from 06-08. PTO Northpine 08-13; PTO 
(Rtd) Parish of Clayfield St Mark's 2013-2017; Archbishop's Certificate to Officiate on 
Special Occasions from 2017.  C/- Seasons Aged Care 1321 Anzac Avenue, Kallangur 
4503 Tel: 3862 4881 :            Retired PTO  
 
LAMONT, The Rev'd David Phillip b.40. BA (Deakin) 98; GradDipEd (Monash) 05; ThDip 
(ACT; INSTEP Melb 80; D.81; (Melb), P,82 (Melb). A.C. Mt Waverley; A.C. Box Hill; V 
Beechworth 84-86; Chapl. ARA (Class 4) 86-88; V. Burra 88-93; R Heywood 93-97; PinC 
Bright 2000-04; RD Ovens Valley 02-04; AssocP St George the Martyr Queenscliff 04-
08; AsstP Pt Lonsdale/Queenscliff 05-08; Hon Ass Bellarine 09-16; LT Bellarine 10; LT 
Skipton/Beaufort 12; LT Grovedale/Mt Duneed 12-13; Hon Asst Bellarine 09; Ret 2008; 
PTO Melb 08; (Dio Bris) Retired PTO Cleveland from 2016. Assoc Priest, Parish of Manly 
15/01/18 to 17/06/2018.  18A Yeo Street, Victoria Point 4165  Mbl: 0408 547 072 email: 
rhonda.david@bigpond.com.au:           Retired PTO  
 
LANDER, The Rev'd Dr Cecilie Marion b.48; St Francis' Coll; MBBS (1st Cl Hons) (Univ 
of Qld) 71; FRACP 78; B Th (BCT) 99; FRCP (Edin) 06; D.94; P.96; Hon Deacon Holy 
Spirit, Kenmore 94-96; Hon Asst P. Brookfield Centre for Christian Spirituality 96-01; Hon 
Asst P. East Brisbane 98-99; Joint P-in-C East Brisbane 99-05; P-in-C 05-09; Joint P-in-
C 09-11; PTO St John's Cathedral 11-18; Retired PTO Parish of East Brisbane from 18.  
(PO Box 246, Aspley  4034) Mbl: 0408 788 882 email: cecilielander@bigpond.com;  S: 
Mervyn:            PTO  
 
LANDER, The Rev'd Dr Mervyn Meredith b.44; St Francis' Coll; MB, BS (Univ of Qld) 69; 
FRACS 75; Dip Ter Ed (Univ of New Eng) 85; B Th (BCT) 98; D.92; P.96; Hon A.C. Holy 
Trinity, Woolloongabba 92-94; Hon Deacon St George's, Windsor 94-96; Hon A.C. St 
Clement's, Stafford 96-98; Chapl, Mayne Medical School, Univ of Qld from 97; Hon Asst 
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P. East Brisbane 98-99; Joint P-in-C East Brisbane 99-05; P- in-C St George's, Windsor
05-08. Joint P in C East Brisbane 09-11; PTO St John's Cathedral Parish 11-18; Retired
PTO Parish of East Brisbane from 18.  12 Luckins Street, Aspley  4034 (PO Box 246,
Aspley  4034) Tel: 07 32637693 Mbl: 0418 882 432 email: mmlander@bigpond.net.au
S: Cecilie:             Retired PTO

LAUFER, The Rev'd Dr Catherine Ella b.54; B Sc (ANU) 76; Grad Dip Psych (WAIT) 77; 
M Ed (Melb) 95; B Theol (MCD) 95; PhD (Monash) 08; D & P 2000, Dio of Melb; p/t A.C. 
Vermont Sth 2000; A.C. St Peter's, Box Hill/ St Aidan's, Box Hill Sth/ St Philip's, Box Hill 
Nth 01; Asst P. 03-04; Dio of Melb; Mission Chaplain (Lecturer, St Francis' College) 04-
07; Assoc. P. St Mark's, Buderim 07-10; PinC (half-time) Coolum from 10.  18 Edith Place, 
Coolum Beach 4573 (PO Box 5, Coolum Beach 4573) Tel: 0447 002 573(BH) 5351 
1215(AH)  Mbl: 0400 618 073 email: celaufer54@gmail.com:                 Active 

LEAM, The Rev'd Mark Kevin b.60; B Theol (Murdoch Univ WA) 2000; D.99, P.2000 Dio 
of Perth; Chapl Peter Moyes Anglican Community School and Assoc P. Quinns-Mindarie 
2000-04; Dio of Perth; Chapl, St Paul's School from 04 and Chair Dio ABM 08-11..  3 
Santa Cruz Street, Bray Park 4500 (St Paul's School, 34 Strathpine Road, Bald Hills 
4036) Tel: 3261 1388(BH) email: m.leam@stpauls.qld.edu.au;  S: Robyn:    Chaplains  

LEISEMANN, The Rev'd Canon Sarah Patricia b.73; St Francis' Coll; B App Sc (QUT) 
93; Grad Dip Ed (QUT) 96; BTh (CSU) 10; D.04; P.05; Chaplain at All Saints' Anglican 
School 04-06; PTO Wynnum 06-08; Assoc Chapl, Anglican Church Grammar School 08-
09; Chaplain Cannon Hill Anglican College from May 09; Hon Canon, Cathedral of St 
John the Evangelist from 14-18; Residentiary Canon, Cathedral of St John the Evangelist 
from 18.  69 Watervale Parade, Wakerley  4154 (Cannon Hill Anglican College PO Box 
3366 Tingalpa Dc 4173) Tel: 3896 0444(BH) 3890 2076(AH) Mbl: 0407 494 479 email: 
sleisemann@chac.qld.edu.au;  S: Scott:             Chaplains 

LEITCH, The Rev'd Dianne Dorothy b.38; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 94; B Th 
(BCT) 2000; D.94; P.01; Hon Deacon, All Saints', Booval 94; Hon Chapl, Ipswich Hosp 
95-01; and Hon Deacon, St Paul's, Ipswich 96-01; Hon A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich 01-04;
Chapl, Ipswich Hosp 01-05; Hon Assoc P. St Paul's Ipswich 04-08 PTO Ipswich from 08.;
62 River Road, Bundamba  4304 Tel: 3812 0377(BH) 3282 3121(AH) Mbl: 0407 026 753
email: dileitch@bigpond.com;  S: Doug:           Retired PTO

LEONARD, The Rev'd Terry Gregory b.48; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 83; D & P 83; 
A.C. St Peter's, Maroochydore 83-84; A.C. All Saints', Booval 85-86; P-in-C St Anne's,
Nanango 86-89; PTO Dio of Bris 89-91; P-in-C St Martin's, Tara 91-94; P-in-C, St
Matthew's, Quilpie 94-97; R. St John's, Mundubbera 97-98; PTO 98-04; Asst P. St
Bartholomew's, Toowoomba 04-05; PTO St Luke's, Toowoomba from 05. Retired PTO
St Luke's Toowoomba from 18.  PO Box 7969, Toowoomba South 4350 email:
sherryleonard@bigpond.com;  S: Sherry:          Retired PTO

LEONG SSF, Brother Alfred George Boonkong b. 56. B Hort Sc Lincoln Uni NZ 79; M 
Hort Sc Lincoln 82; BTh MCD 95; D. 99 (Kuching) P. 2000 (Kuching). Memb Soc of St 
Francis 85 -; Guardian Stroud Hermitage 95-98; Chapl & Lect House of the Epiphany 
Theol Coll Kuching 98-03; Ass St Thomas Cathl Kuching 99 -03; M Provincial Soc of St 
Francis 03-12; PTO Dio of Newcastle St Bernardine's Hermitage Stroud (year); Dio 
Brisbane PTO Parish of Annerley from Dec 18.  SSF - St Philip's Friary 115 Cornwall 
Street Annerley 4103  Mbl: 0422 340 727 email: bralfred@francican.org.au;:     PTO  
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LEWIS, The Rev'd Kevin Lesley b.43; JP(Qual); 98; D.82, P.83 Dio of Nth Qld; Asst to R. 
West Cairns 82-84; Asst C. Pioneer Valley 84-85; R. 85-89; R. St John's, Cairns 89-02; 
Co-ord Chapl Police Service Cairns 92-01; Res Canon St James' Cathl 93-01; Area Dean 
Nthn Region 94-01; Dio of Nth Qld; R. Bundaberg West 02-06; Area Dean of Burnett 03-
06; R. Kawana Waters 06-10; Abp's Exam Chapl from 06. Area Dean Sunshine Coast 
Deanery 08-10; PTO (Rtd) Gympie from 11.  65 Louisa Street, Gympie 4570 Tel: 5482 
4261 Mbl: 0414 563 173 email: kevlewis@ozemail.com.au;  S: Judy:        Retired PTO  
 
LIONEL, SSF (See Peiris), Brother       :                   Active  
 
LIVINGSTONE, The Rev'd Alathea Mary Scott b.37; St Francis' Coll; Dip N Admin 76; 
FRCNA; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 94; D.94; Hon Hosp Chapl at Redcliffe Hosp 94-96; Hon 
Deacon, St Andrew's, Caloundra 94-97; Mission Chaplain 97-01; PTO (Ret) 01-09. Abp's 
Cert for Officiating on Special Occasions from 09  55 Mark Street New Farm 4005  Mbl: 
0412 780 943 email: alathea8@gmail.com:              Archbishop's Cert  
 
LLOYD, The Rev'd Douglas Edwin b.34; AMusA 56; BA (Univ of Adel) 66; B Ed (Univ of 
Qld) 70; MACE 71; Dip RT (Sec) (BCAE) 77; BTh (BCT) 89; D.88; P.89; Hon A.C. St 
Augustine's, Hamilton 88-89; A.C. 89-90; P-in-C St Matthew's, Gayndah 90-91; R. 91-92; 
R. St Peter's, Gympie 92-94; P-in-C, Cooroora 95-97; R. 97-2000; PTO (Ret) 2000-07; 
PTO(Ret) Nambour 07-2014; PTO (Rtd) Buderim 14-16; Archbishop's Certificate from 
2016.  Buderim Gardens Retirement Village, 85/405 Mooloolaba Road, Buderim  4556 
Tel: 5477 5234  S: Margaret:                 Archbishop's Cert  
 
LOCKYER, The Rev'd Peter Eric b.39; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) (ACT); 
D.63; P.64 Armid; A.C. Gunnedah 63-68; A.C. Glen Innes 68-69; P-in-C Delungra 69-71; 
A.C. Tamworth 71-73; Dio of Armid; A.C. Lismore 73-75; Dio of Grafton; R. St Luke's, 
Rosewood 75-78; V. Pine Rivers South 78-85; V. St George's, Windsor 85-87; Chapl 
Prince Charles Hosp 87-05; PTO Sandgate Northpoint 05-10; PTO Aspley-Albany Creek 
from 2010..  88/131 Quinlan Street, Bracken Ridge  4017 Tel: 3269 5903 Mbl: 0439 834 
478 email: lockyerp88131@gmail.com;  S: Pat:         Retired PTO  
 
LONG, The Rev'd Robert Milton b.35; St John's Coll, Morpeth; D & P 59, Dio of Perth; 
A.C. Wembley-Floreat Park 59-60; Asst P. St David Applecross-Mt Pleasant 60-61; Dio 
of Perth; Asst Chapl, Missions to Seamen (Vic) 62-64; C-in-C St James the Great, East 
St Kilda, 64; Dio of Melb; LT Yackandandah-Kiewa, Wangaratta 65; LT Ganmain 65; P-
in-C Tocumwal-Finley 65-68; Dio of Riverina; Asst Chapl Missions to Seamen (Vic) 68-
85; LT Ascot Vale; All Saints', Preston; Altona 85; Asst Chapl, Heidelberg Repat & Gen 
Hosp 85; P-in-C St Paul's, Kingsville w Yarraville 86-89; Dio of Melb; I, St Philip's 
Rupanyup 89-99; L to O 99-2000; Dio of Ballarat; PTO Dio of Bris from 1999; Asst Pr. 
L/T. All Saints' Brisbane 09-10.  50 Hoopers Road, Curra 4570 Tel: 5483 1335 Mbl: 0411 
627 753 email: r.long18@bigpond.com;  S: Helen:          Retired PTO  
 
LOUMEAU, The Rev'd Gregory Marc Joseph b.77, B.Bus.,(Griffith) 2000; M.B.A., 
(Griffith) 2003; B.Ed. (QUT) 2005;GradDipTh (BCT) 2009; BTh (CSU) 2016. D.09; P.09; 
Hon. AC Parish of Eastern Hills 09; Assist Chpln, ACGS 2010-2013; Assoc Priest Hervey 
Bay 14 - 17,  FCAC Chaplain from 14-17. Priest in Charge, Hervey Bay from 17.  205 
Doolong Road Wondunna 4655 ( PO Box 35 HERVEY BAY  4655) Tel: 07 4124 3105 
Mbl: 0431 065 118 email: priest@anglicanherveybay.org.au;  S: Lauren:               Active  
 
LOVELUCK, The Rev'd Allan Illtyd b.30; St Michael's, Llandaff, Wales; BA St David's 
Coll, Lampeter 53; B Soc W (Univ of Qld) 72; M Soc W (Univ of Qld) 79; D.55; P.56 
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Llandaff, Wales; A.C. St John & St Mair, Dowlais 55-58; Dio of Llandaff; Member SSF 58-
79; PTO Dio of Bris 65-79; L to O, St James' Cathl, Townsville 79-86; St Peter's, West 
End, Townsville 86-89, Dio of Nth Qld; Miss Chapl Dio of Bris 89-2000 (Director of Tufnell 
89-94; LT Auchenflower 99-2000); Hon Canon St John's Cathl 92-2000; PTO 2000-01; 
P-in-C St Alban's, Auchenflower 01-03; PTO 03-12; Archbishop's Cert to Officiate on 
Special Occasions from 12..    :               Archbishop's Cert  
 
LOWE, The Rev'd Adam Michael b.79; BBehSc (Griffith University) 1999; BPsych(Hons) 
(Griffith University) 2000; BTh (BCT) 2009; MOrgPsych (Griffith University) 2010; MA 
Theology and Religion (Durham University) 2010; MAPS; D.09; P.10; Lay Minister, St 
Mark's Clayfield 04-09; Part-Time A.C. St Mark's, Clayfield 02/09 - 06/09; A.C. Noosa 
from 2010-2013; Sessional Lecturer (New Testament), St Francis Coll 2011-2012; 
BIBLE360 Project Officer 2013; PinC St Bartholomew, Toowoomba 2013.-2016; Rector, 
St Bartholomew's from 2016.  103 Stenner Street, Middle Ridge 4350 (PO Box 11390, 
Centenary Heights 4350) Tel: 4636 2922(BH) Fax: 4636 2972 Mbl: 0410 512 782 email: 
adam@stbarts.com.au;  adammlowe@me.com;  S: Bettrys:                  Active  
 
LUNNISS, The Venerable David Oliver b.51; St Barnabas' Coll; Grad Dip Art (RE) (ACU) 
93; D.78, P.79 Dio of Adel; A.C. Mitcham, SA; A.C. Alice Springs NT; P-in-C Tennant 
Creek, NT; Asst Chapl Pulteney Grammar, SA; R. Naracoorte, SA; Chapl, Radford Coll, 
Dio Canb-Goulb; R. St Andrew's, Pittsworth 90-93; R. St Luke's, Toowoomba 93-97; R. 
All Saints', Chermside 97-01; A D Bne Nth West 2000- 01; Dean, St James' Cathl, 
Townsville 01-04; PTO (St John's Cathedral) 04-06; P-in-C St Thomas', Beaudesert 06-
07; R. 07-13; Area Dean of Logan 07-13; Archdcn Gold Coast 09-13; Co-Ord Ang. 
Correctional Service Ministry (Qld) from 11-18; Ang. Rep. on Qld State Chaplaincy Board 
- Corrections from 11-18; Chaplain all Correctional Centres 11-18; Assoc Priest, Parish 
of Beaudesert 2013-2014; Archdeacon Emeritus 2013; Hon Assist Priest, Parish of 
Cooroora 14-18; Chaplain Brisbane Correctional Centre. Permission to Officiate, Parish 
of Jimboomba from 18.   (79 Bushman Drive Jimboomba 4280) Tel: 07 5517 9868 Mbl: 
0417 196 284 email: lunnissd@bigpond.net.au;  S: Helen:       PTO  
 
MACQUEEN, The Rev'd Kenneth Alexander b.41; Moore Coll, Syd; BA (Univ of Qld) 82; 
ThL (ACT) 67; D.65; P.67; A.C. St Bartholomew's, Mt Gravatt 65-67; A.C. All Saints', 
Booval 67-68; A.C. St John's, Dalby 68-72; P-in-C All Saints', Monto 72-73; R. All Saints', 
Monto 73-82; R. St Peter's, West End 82-95; P-in-C Prov Par of Burpengary-Narangba 
95-2000; Miss Chapl 2000-03; PTO 03-08; Minister to The International Anglican Church 
of Amman, Jordan in the Dio of Jerusalem 07-2013; PTO(Rtd) Parish of South Brisbane 
from 13.  PO Box 3788, West End 4101 Mbl: 0417 710 700 email: 
lexmacqueen@bigpond.com;  S: June:          Retired PTO  
 
MAGEE, The Rev'd John Wallace b.44; Moore Coll, Syd; ThL 73; D & P 75; A.C. Epping 
75-76; Dio of Syd; A.C. St Andrew's, South Brisbane 77-78; V. St Luke's, Rosewood 78-
83; R. St George's, Beenleigh 83-2015; PTO Carindale from 2017.  49/40 Hargreaves 
Road, Manly West 4179  Mbl: 0407 653 416 email: john_magee44@hotmail.com;  S: 
Lyndal:              Retired PTO  
 
MANCINI, The Rev'd Eleanor Luti b.46; BTh (Auckland Uni) 01; MTH (Syd Coll Div) 06; 
D.03; P.04; AP (Dio Polynesia in Auck) Holy Spirit (OFKLM) 04-011;St Paul's-by-the Sea 
(Tokelau Hahake) North Shore, Auckland 07-11; St Albans (Ngoue Iteni), Auckland 09-
11; Chpln Polynesian Children's Ministry & Communication, Auckland 09-11; (Dio 
Brisbane) PTO Sandgate Northpoint from 2013.  17 East Avenue Brighton 4017 Tel: 3869 
0206 email: eleanor_mancini@outlook.com;  S: Angelo:         Retired PTO 
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MARCH, The Rev'd Gregory John b.60; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 89; Grad Dip Arts 
(Syd Coll Div) 04; D.89; P.90; A.C. Holy Spirit, Surfers Paradise 89-92; A.C. St John's, 
Nambour 92-93; first P-in-C Prov Par of Coolum 93-97; P-in-C Par of Coolum 97; R. 
Aspley 97; R. Aspley-Albany Creek 98-06; Archdeacon of Lilley 04-06; R. St Peter's 
Wynnum 06-15; Archdeacon of Moreton 2010-2015. Mission Chaplain ED Parishes and 
Other Commission Agency Commission 15-17; Archdeacon for Parish Development 15-
17; PTO Bulimba Parish from 17.  6 Cedar Street, Cannon Hill 4170  Mbl: 0417 616 256 
email: bushwalkingreg@gmail.com;  S: Georgina:        PTO  
 
MARKOTSIS, The Rev'd George William b.48; BEc (Monash); BTh (ACT); Assoc ThDip 
(Morpeth) 86; GradCert Ch L'Hip/Mgment 98; D.86 Graft; P.87 Graft; C Lismore 86-91; 
RMC Clarence 93-03; Can Cathl 02-03; R Maclean 91-03; Hon CEO Anglicare North 
Coast 2000-03; Dir Anglicare NthQld from 06 Dio NQ. R St Marg West Cairns 03-10; 
Police Chpln Cairns 03-10; R. Ekibin Dio Brisbane from 10-18.  Retired Permission to 
Officiate, St John's Cathedral from 18.  16 Leah Avenue, Salisbury 4107 Tel: 3848 
2123(BH) 3272 9100(AH) Mbl: 0421830778 email: markotsis.gj@westnet.com.au;  S: 
Jane:             Retired PTO  
 
MARRE, The Rev'd Rex Michael b.43; Th Dip (ACT) 91; D.88, P.89 Dio of NQ; Asst to 
R. Heatley 88-92; Asst to Exec Off, NQ Coll Min 92; P-in-C Mt Isa 93; LT Townview 93-
95; R. St James/St Luke's Mt Isa 94-02; Dio of NQ; R. St Mary's, Bardon 02-2011; PTO 
Rosewood from 2011.  60 Elm Road, Walloon 4306 Tel: 5464 5168 Web:: Mbl: 0411 162 
517 email: rex.marre@gmail.com;  S: Christina:         Retired PTO  
 
MARSHALL, The Rev'd Ian James b.51; MBI Dip 72; Th Dip (Crafers) 78; DipMin (ACT) 
78; DipLS (MCD) 82; DipPs (MCD) 86; D.78, P.79 Hobart; A.C. Burnie 78-80; P-in-C St 
Helen's 80-83; R. Longford/Perth 83-86; Prec St David's Cathl 86-88; Exam Chapl 87-94; 
R. West Hobart 88-94; Dio of Tas; Dean Carp 94-96; Chapl RANR 94; R. Balhannah 96-
97; R. Kempsey 97-03; Exam Chapl 2000; RMC Hastings/Macleay 03; Dio of Grafton; R. 
Hervey Bay 03-2011; Abp's Exam Chapl 04-2011; Area Dean of Burnett 06-09; 
Archbishop's Chaplain 2011-2015.  U139 Hibiscus Retirement Resort, 52 University Way 
Sippy Downs 4556 Tel: 5445 6899 Mbl: 0448 899 226 email: ianjmarshall@iinet.net.au;  
S: Fay:             Retired PTO  
 
MARTIN, The Rev'd Canon Richard Gibson b.50; CStB (Ghana) 94; St Francis' Coll; Th 
Dip (ACT) 78; BA (Univ of Qld) 82; Hon Ed D (Warnborough, Oxford) 94; D.78; P.79; A.C. 
St Barnabas', Sunnybank 78-80; A.C. St Peter's, Southport 80-81; V. St Mary's, 
Moorooka 81- 84; Hon Chapl Griffith Univ 82-84; R. Holy Trinity, Goondiwindi 84-89; PTO 
Province of Canterbury from 87; Chapl Warnborough Coll, Oxford 87-98, London 98-00 
& Canterbury from 01; Hon A.C. St Francis', Nundah 89-94; PTO Dio of Maryland USA 
91-93; Pastoral Advisor to Baltimore Actors' Conservatory School 91-94; (LT St M & AA, 
New Farm 92; LT St Mary's, Kangaroo Point and St Paul's, East Brisbane 93); Assoc P. 
St Peter's, Southport 94-95; Chapl Royal, Boakye Owoahene Royal House of Abuohia-
Ashanti, Royal Osombuo Dynasty 94-01; R. St Peter's, Gympie 95-05; R. All Saints' 
Brisbane from 05; Hon Canon, St John's Cathl from 06.  Res: 101/301 Ann Street, 
Brisbane 4000  Parish Office: , Wickham Terrace, Brisbane   4000 (PO Box 574, Spring 
Hill   4004) Tel: 3236 3692(BH) 3211 9143(AH) Fax: 3236 3693 email: 
rector@allsaintsbrisbane.com;:                    Active  
 
MARTIN, The Rev'd Michael Winnington b. 32; St Michael's House, Crafers; ThL (ACT) 
58; BA (Hons) (ANU) 97; D.57, P.58 Dio of Wangaratta; A.C. Corryong 58-60; Dio of 
Wangaratta; Chapl Mitchell River (Kowanyama) 60-66; Chapl Edward River 

82

mailto:bushwalkingreg@gmail.com
mailto:markotsis.gj@westnet.com.au
mailto:rex.marre@gmail.com
mailto:ianjmarshall@iinet.net.au
mailto:rector@allsaintsbrisbane.com


 

(Pormpuraaw) 66- 74; Archd Cape York Pen 69-74; Admin/Archd Carp 74-84; Regstr 75-
84; P-in-C Weipa 75-76; V. Gen (Commssy) 72-80/82-84; Dio of Carp; On Leave (PTO 
New Jersey USA) 81; R. Nathalia 84-86; P. Queanbeyan 86-88; R. Karabar 88-97; Dio 
of Canb/Goulb; ATO Dio of Canb/Goulb 97-03; Hon Ecum Min "Pastor to Pastors" 
Queanbeyan 97-01; P-in-C Tuggeranong Sth 98; (LT Port Fairy/Merimbula 99; Port 
Macquarie/Singleton/Lower Macleay 2000; Port Macquarie/Tuggeranong Sth 01; Yass 
02; East Orange 02-03; Boorowa 03); Hon Chapl, Currimundi Retirement Village from 03 
(LT Kawana Waters 04-06; Glasshouse 06-08); Interim Hon P-In-C Anglican Torres Strait 
Islander Community 09-12; L/T Kawana Waters 2011.  28/28 Saffron Street, Currimundi  
4551 Tel: 5493 6985 Mbl: 0402 660 241 email: michaelmartin27@outlook.com;   
              Retired PTO  
 
MASLIN, The Rev'd Andrea Lorraine b.45; D.92 (NQ); Dip. Chaplaincy 2015;Hon Dcn. 
Asst to Dean Cathl 92-98; Hon Dcn Asst to Dean Cathl with PTO Nthn Beaches Comm 
(St Peter's) 98-2000; Hon Dcn Nthn Beaches Comm (St Peters) 2000-2003; Hon Dcn 
Church of Ascension Heatley with PTO Nthn Beaches Comm 2003-2007; Hon Dcn 
Church of the Ascension Heatley 07-13; Chpln P/T Townsville Hosp 2010-13; Professed 
Third Order Society of St Francis 2011; (Dio Brisbane) Hon Dcn Parish of Maryborough 
from 13-18; Chpln Maryborough Base Hosp from 15. Deacon PTO, Parish of 
Maryborough from 18.  35 Panorama Drive Maryborough 4650 Tel: 4123 1087  Mbl: 0417 
889 684 email: andrea.maslin@westnet.com.au:          Retired PTO  
 
MATTHEWS, The Rev'd Daniel Fairbairn (Brother Daniel SSF). B.36; Bp Patteson Coll, 
Kohimarama, Solomon Islands; M Inst Mar Eng 59; D.73, P.74 Dio of Melanesia; A.C. St 
Barnabas' Cathedral, Melanesia 73-74; P-in-C All Saints', Honiara 75-79; P-in-C St 
Stephen's, Taroaniara, 79-81; P-in-C St Clare's Hosp, Taroaniara 79-81; Dio of Central 
Melanesia; P-in-C Popondetta C C Centre 81-82; Dio of PNG; PTO Dio of Auckland 83-
90; P-in-C Ch of the Transfiguration, Windale 90-92; Dio of Newcastle; PTO Dio of 
Newcastle 93-95; SSF- Guardian Solomon Island 75-81; Prov Min ANZ 87-97; Min Gen 
97-07; P-in-C St Philip's, Thompson Estate (Parish renamed Annerley 97) 96-99; Hon 
Asst P. St Philip's, Annerley 99-06; PTO, St Phillip's, Annerley from 06.  (Brother Daniel 
SSF), 115 Cornwall Street,  Annerley  4103 ((Brother Daniel SSF), PO Box 6134, 
Wooloongabba 4102) Tel: 3391 3915 Fax: 3391 3916 email: brdaniel@franciscan.org.au:  
              Retired PTO  
 
MAUGHAN OAM RFD, The Rev'd Canon Emeritus Bruce Edward b.35; BA (Univ of Qld) 
57; Dip Ed 58; MACE 79; Th Dip (ACT) 82; Fellow of Kings College (Univ of Qld) 86; 
D.79; P.89; PTO Dio of Bris 79-86; Hon Asst to the Chapl of The Southport School 79-
88; Miss Chapl 86-88; A.C. St Andrew's, Indooroopilly 88-90; P-in-C St George's, Crow’s 
Nest 90-92; R. 92-94; Res Canon St John's Cathl from 92; Conventual Chapl Qld Priory 
of Order of St John of Jerusalem Knights Hospitaller 92-15; Prelate of the Grand Priory 
of Australasia from 14. R. Annunciation, Camp Hill with Transfiguration, Norman Park 94-
05; PTO(Retired) St John's Cathedral from 05; Canon Emeritus from 05; L/T Morningside 
09-12, 16.   (122 Shrapnel Road, Cannon Hill 4170) Tel: 07 3395 6256 Mbl: 0409 893 
129 email: bruce.maughan@bigpond.com:          Retired PTO  
 
MAYEN, The Rev'd Peter Deng b.75 Cert Ed. Kakuma Refugee Camp; BTh (QCT) 2016; 
D.04 (Twic East Diocese ); P.17; Hon Deacon, St Paul's Ipswich from 2009; Assist P. 
Twmba St Luke's from 2017.  5 Vanham Close Middle Ridge 4350 (C/- Parish Office PO 
Box 2434 Toowoomba 4350)  Mbl: 0410 488 195 email: 
peter@stlukestoowoomba.org.au;  S: Rachel:                   Active  
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MCCLELLAN, The Rev'd Gary James b.68; B.Build (Uni.Tech.Syd) 93; BTh (Moore Th 
Coll) 99; Dip.Min (Moore Th Col) 99; Grad.Dip.ED (USQ) 17; D.08; (Melb) P.08; (Melb) 
Stdnt Min p/t St John's Mona Vale 95-96; Stdnt Min p/t St Paul's Oatley 97-98; Yth Min 
St Philip's Caringbah 99-2000; Yth Min St Clement's Jannali 01-03; Yth Min St Barnabas' 
Glen Waverley 04-08; Ass Cur St Barnabas' Glen Waverley 08-11; AssP St Barnabas' 
Glan Waverley 12-16; Suprvr Suprvsd Theol Ed. 12-17; (Dio Bris) PTO Parish of Noosa 
17. Community Chaplain, St Andrew's Anglican College from 18.  21 Maddens Crescent 
Peregian Springs 4573  Mbl: 0409 717 464 email: gjmcclellan@gmail.com; S: Bek:
                       Active  
 
MCGILVRAY, The Rev'd Ian Roy b.46; DipAppSc (Marine) (Britannia Royal Naval 
College; DipAdvCouns. (Syd Tech College); DipBibS (Adult Christian Ed Found); 
B.SocSc (Uni New England); CertTh (Moore Theol College) D.04, P.04; Field Leader, 
Red Sea Mission Team, Zanzibar 92-03; Chaplain, Dampier Mission to Seafarers DNWA 
03-16; PTO Bne Dio from 17.  Unit 74/116 Station Road Loganlea  4131 Tel: 3200 4895 
Mbl: 0417 263 436 email: insmcgilvray@bigpond.com;  S: Sue:        Retired PTO  
 
MCGRATH, The Rev'd Ian James b.60; Moore Coll, Syd; B Th 86; M Min (St Mark's) 01; 
B.Couns 09; D.87, P.88 Dio of Bris; A.C. St John's, Dalby 87-89; P-in-C Holy Trinity, 
Bowen, NQ 89-90; R. 91-94; V. Upper Clarence (BCA) Grafton 94-96; BCA Missioner, 
Roxby Downs and Mid West Mission, Willochra 96-01; V. Moree 01-07; Archd Barwon 
05-07; Dio of Armidale 01-07; Mission Chapl (BCA Reg Offcr) Dio of Bne 07-2014; Assoc 
Priest Parish of South Brisbane from 2015.  10a Gloucester Street Highgate Hill 4101 
Tel: 3844 3808(BH) Mbl: 0475 941 280 email: ian@st-andrews.org.au;  S: Glenda: Active  
 
MCGRORY, The Rev'd Gregory Wayne b.51; St Francis Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 74; Cert STD 
(Wollaston, Perth) 90;  M.Min (CSU) 2013;  D.74; P.75; A.C. St Paul's, Roma 74-
75; A.C. St Mark's, Warwick 75-77; P-in-C All Saints', Mitchell 77-81; R. 81-82; V. 
Bundaberg West 82-87; R. St Faith's, East Avon 87-90 and Area Dean Avon Deanery, 
Dio of Perth 88-89; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 90-93; R. St Margaret's, Sandgate 93-
01; R. St John's, Burleigh Heads 02-2017; Abp's Exam Chapl 05-17; PTO Gold Coast 
South from 2017.  Miami Links One Unit 4, 160 Bardon Avenue, Miami 4220  Mbl: 0403 
769 283 email: gmcg@winshop.com.au;:        PTO  
 
MCGUINNESS, The Rev'd Ann Irene b.57. DipTh(TEEC) 1997; D.97 (Highveld) Sth 
Africa P.97. (Highveld) Sth Africa; Curate Cathedral Parish St Dunstan, (DioHighveld) 97-
01; Rector Parish of Northmead 02-13; Chaplain All Saints Anglican School from 2014.  
All Saints' Anglican School, 92 Highfield Drive, Merrimac, 4226 Tel: 5587 0376(BH) Fax: 
5530 3314 Mbl: 0408 249 300 email: amcguinness@asas.qld.edu.au;  
annmcguinness@outlook.com.au;  S: Frank:             Chaplains  
 
MCKENNAY, The Rev'd Robert Colin b.47; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 96; M Min (CSU) 
01; M Ed (USQ) 02; D.95; P.96; A.C. St Matthew's, Sherwood 95-97; Chapl ARA from 
97; BASC NQ/DCSC 97; 5 Avn Regt 97-99; Op Ples Drai PNG 97-98; Miss Chapl 2000 
(HQ JTS (Joint Telecommunications School) Cabarlah) (LT Laidley 2000); Hon Assoc P. 
Plympton, Dio of Adel 01 (Co-ord Chapl HQ 9BDE, Adelaide); Mission Chapl (Defence 
Force) 02-03 (Co-ord Chapl DDMA and HQ 16BDE(AVN)Oakey); Directorate of Mental 
Health, Canberra 04-06; CoOrd Chap MEAO - OP Catalyst 06-07; Chapl, Royal Military 
College Duntroon, Canberra 07-08. Reserve Chapl Royal Military College Duntroon 08 
QUR 09-11; Co-ordinating Chaplain HQ 11 Bde Oct 2011 – Jan 2013; HQ 1 DIV/DJFHQ 
2013- 2014; Retired from Active Reserve 09 Dec 14; Chaplain Qld Police Ser (Gold 
Coast) 09-10; MNR (Brisbane10-12; PTO Kangaroo Point 2010-2011; PTO Sherwood 
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from 2011; retired from fulltime Qld Police Chaplaincy 30 Apr 2012.  2 Delapine Place 
Seventeen Mile Rocks  4073 (PO Box 3189, Darra 4073)  Mbl: 0418 654 380 email: 
bobmckennay@gmail.com;  S: Donna:          Retired PTO  
 
MCMAHON, The Rev'd Stephen b.66; B.Sc.(Hons) (Univ Newcastle Upon Tyne) 87; 
M.Sc (Univ Newcastle UponTyne) 89; B.A. (Hons) (Univ Leeds) 03; D.03; P.04; (Dio 
Blackburn UK); M.Sc. (Sc. Theol.) (Uni Endinburgh) 17; A.C. Lancaster, St Mary 03-07; 
PinC (Dio Carlisle) North Westmorland Missn Unit 07-09; (Dio Blackburn) Yth Worker & 
Schl Chpln St Peter & David Rossall School 2010; Assoc Priest St Mary (The Priory) 10-
11; (Dio Newcastle) Vicar, St Cuthbert, Blyth 11-16; (Dio Bris) PinC Parish of Ipswich 16-
18. Rector Parish of Ipswich from April 18.  11 Baystone Place, Raceview 4305 (PO Box 
168, Ipswich 4305) Tel: 3812 0377(BH) Mbl: 0415 771 345 email: 
therector@stpaulsips.org.au;  S: Wendy:                   Active  
 
MCNAMEE, The Rev'd John Daniel b.42; St Francis' Coll 66; 76; M Ed 97; Dip.Couns. 
(AIPC) 2012; D & P 79 NQ; A.C. St James' Cathl 79-80; Asst Chapl All Souls' School, 
Charters Towers 81; Dio of NQ; A.C. St James', Toowoomba 81-83; V. St Martin's, Tara 
83-85; PTO Dio of Bris 85-89; P-in-C St Paul's, Jandowae 89-97; PTO Dio of Bris 97-08 
(retired). PTO (Ret.) Mudgeeraba from 09 Acting Priest in Charge (Locum) Mudgeeraba 
16-17.  49 Wallaby Drive, Mudgeeraba  4213  Mbl: 0479 035 636 email: 
jgmcnamee@bigpond.com;  S: Glynis:           Retired PTO  
 
MCNEILL, The Rev'd Andrew James b.59; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 93; M.Min (CSU) 
2009; D.88; P.89; Hon A.C. St Barnabas', Sunnybank 88-89; Hon A.C. St Paul's, Ithaca 
89-90; A.C. St John's, Nambour 90-92; A.C. Holy Spirit, Surfers Paradise 92-94; Dio of 
Bris; Chapl Trinity Ang Sch, Cairns 94; Dio of NQ; PTO Dio of Bris 95-99; (LT Asst P. 
Gympie 96); Chapl ARA from 96; Miss Chapl (Defence Force) from 99; Darling Downs 
Logistic Battalion (DDLB) and Joint Telecommunications School (JTS) Cabarlah 96-99; 
3BASB and 2RAR with 3CER Townsville 2000-02; 3CSSB 2003; DFSS EWW Cabarlah 
04; RTC (SQ), Gallipoli Barracks, Enoggera 05-06; 1CSSB Darwin Jan 2007- Dec 2010; 
Chapln School of Artillery, CATC Co-ord Chpln Puckapunyal from 2011-12; Area 
Chaplain WA from 2013- 2015. Coord Chaplain DCSTC Simpson Barracks Macleod Vic 
from 16.   (Coord Chaplain DCSTC Simpson Barrakcs PO Box 7035 Banyule 3084)  
Personal Mobile: 0409 627 058 Mbl: 0420 981 267 email: 
andrew.mcneill@defence.gov.au:                 Mission Chaplain  
 
MCPHERSON, The Rev'd Canon Dr James Murdoch b.46; Canb Coll of Min; B Sc (Hons 
1) (Univ of NSW) 66; B Th (Hons 1) (ACT) 77; M Litt (Durham Univ) 83; PhD (Univ of 
NSW) 70; D & P 78 Dio of Canb-Goulb; A.C. St Paul's, Manuka, Dio of Canb-Goulb 78-
80; Lucas- Tooth Scholar, Univ of Durham, Hon Asst P. St Oswald's, Durham, Dio of 
Durham 80-82; P-in-C St Simon's, Giralang, 82-87; R. St Stephen's, Kambah 87-91; R.D. 
Canb Sth 89-91; Dio of Canb-Goul; Principal, St Francis' Th Coll 92-99; Res Canon St 
John's Cathl 92- 99; Canon Emeritus 99; Dio of Bris; Dir Min St James' Precinct/Legal 
Profn 99-01; Chair Christian Studies ACT 98-02; R. St Mark's, Granville 01-08 Dio of Syd; 
Delegate ACT 02-07; Distinguished Academic Vis. Vaughan Park Retreat Ctre, Dio 
Auckland 08; R. St Paul's, Maryborough 08-14; Examining Chapln 10-15; Chair, FCAC 
Council 11-13; Rtd PTO Parish of Coolum from 14.  39 Lagoda Drive, Mt Coolum 4573 
Tel: 5471 7170 Mbl: 0408 225 157 email: frjim.mcpherson@gmail.com;  S: Marcia: 
              Retired PTO  
 
MCWILLIAM, The Rev'd Canon Linda Maree Maree b.53; St Francis' Coll; Cert Ed Min 
(GBRE) 93; EHCC (TTC) 94; CPE 2000; B Th (BCT) 01; M Couns (ACU) 06; Cert IV 
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Training & Assessment (MCO) 07; Cert Mediation Skills Training (QUT) 07; Cert. EF & T 
Expressive Therapies 08, Dip.Man. 2013; BTh (Hons) CSU 2016. D.99; P.2000; Hon Dcn 
St Clement's, Stafford 99-2000; Hosp Chapl from 99; Hon A.C. St Paul's, Cleveland 2000-
02; Hon Chapl Ang Singles from 01; Asst P. Sandgate Northpoint 02- 09; Hon Assist 
Priest Chermside from 09; Co-Ord Chpln Anglicare 2010-1013; Director of Mission, 
Anglicare from 2013. Hon Canon St John’s Cathedral from 2014.  80 Kenna Street, 
Aspley 4034 Tel: 3838 7554(BH) 3862 9152(AH) Fax: 3838 7654 Mbl: 0408 395 369 
email: lmcwilliam@anglicaresq.org.au; ian-lindamcw@bigpond.com;  S: Ian:  
                    Mission Chaplain  
 
MCWILLIAM, The Rev'd Ian Douglas b.46; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Min 94; CPE 01; 
B Th (BCT) 02; D.94; P.2000; Hon Deacon, St Clement's, Stafford 94-2000; A.C. St 
Paul's, Cleveland 2000-02; P-in-C Sandgate Northpoint 02-05; R. 05-08. Retired 3 Feb 
09; PTO Aspley-Albany Creek from 09.  80 Kenna Street Aspley 4034 Tel: 3862 9152 
Mbl: 0417 015 363 email: ian-lindamcw@bigpond.com;  S: Linda:        Retired PTO  
 
MEE, The Rev'd Elroy Suzanne b.44; Ridley Coll, Melb; BA (Monash Univ) 65; Dip Ed 
(Monash Univ) 66; B Th (Hons) (Ridley Coll) 91; Dip Min (Ridley Coll) 93; Preaching and 
Ministry Prize, Ridley Coll 93; D.98; P.99, Brisb; Hon A.C. Robina-Mermaid Beach 98-05; 
Chapl, Canterbury College 05-2014; PTO Parish of Robina from 2015.  Unit 4, 1 Acacia 
Court Robina 4226 Tel: 5575 8014 Mbl: 0409 277 234 email: elroymee@bigpond.com:  
             Retired PTO  
 
† MEREDITH, The Rt Rev'd Bevan Stanley b.27; St Francis' Coll; D.61; P.62 Brisbane 
for PNG; A.C. St Thomas', Toowong 61-62; P-in-C St Colomb's, Managalas Dio of New 
Guinea 63-67; Con Bp in St John's Cathl, Bris on 26th Feb 1967; Asst Bp PNG (Reg Bp 
Northern Archdcnry) 67-77; Dio Bp NG Islands 77-95; Abp and Primate Province of PNG 
90-95; Ret 95; PTO Dio of Bris 96-17; Arch Cert from Oct 17.  Symes Grove 333 Handford 
Road, Taigum 4018 Tel: 3865 6770 :                Archbishop's Cert  
 
MIDDLETON, The Rev'd Claye Ernest b.87; BTh (CSU) 2014; D.14; P.15. A.C. Parish of 
Bundaberg 2014-2015; Assist Priest Bundaberg 2015-2016; PinC Parish of Freshwater 
from 2016.  90 Central Green Drive, Narangba 4504 Tel: 3203 2440(BH) Mbl: 0429 628 
213 email: clayeemiddleton@gmail.com;  S: Kylie:                  Active  
 
MILBURN, The Rev'd John Frederick b.56; Salisbury and Wells Th Coll; MA (Hons) 
Westminster Coll, Oxford 84; D.86; P.87 UK; C. All Saints', Leavesden, 86-89; P-in-C St 
Laurence's, Wormley 89-93; CF (TA) 90-93; Dio of St Alban's, UK; P-in-C St John's, 
Texas- Inglewood 93-98; P-in-C St Matthew's, Holland Park 98-04; R. St John's, Bulimba 
from 04; Abp's Exam Chapl from 06; Director of Ordinands from 09.  171 Oxford Street, 
Bulimba  4171 (PO Box 271, Bulimba  4171) Tel: DDO 3902 1814(BH) Mbl: 0415 838 
239 email: john.milburn@stjohnsbulimba.org:                   Active  
 
MILTON, The Rev'd Thomas Charles b.39; Moore Coll Syd; ThL (ACT) 64; Moore Dip 
66; ThSchol (ACT) 67; BD (Univ of London) 68; D.66, P.67 Dio of Tas; C. St George's, 
Burnie 66-68; P-in-C King Is 68-69; Dio of Tas; Snr Lctr Qld Bible Inst 70; P-in-C 
Biggenden 71-72; Dio of Bris; C. Liverpool 72-73; P-in-C Greenacre 73-75; C. St Mary's 
75; C. Green Valley 75-77; Res Min 78-84; C-in-C Rose Bay 85-89; O.A. Dio of Syd 90-
02; Dio of Syd; Hon Assoc P. St John's, Wishart 03-18. PTO St John's Wishart from 18.  
6 Pannikin Place, Thornlands  4164 Tel: 3821 4203 email: whalefish@bigpond.com;  S: 
Anne:              Retired PTO  
 

86

mailto:ian-lindamcw@bigpond.com
mailto:ian-lindamcw@bigpond.com
mailto:elroymee@bigpond.com
mailto:clayeemiddleton@gmail.com
mailto:john.milburn@stjohnsbulimba.org
mailto:whalefish@bigpond.com


 

MISSO, The Rev'd Karol Christopher b.38; Div Sch Colombo; BD (2nd Cl Hons) (Univ of 
Serampore) 70; Grad Dip R Ed (Griffith Univ) 84; Grad Dip Counselling (BCAE) 86; BA 
Psych (Univ of Qld) 92; M So Sc (Couns) (QUT) 96; D.64; P.65; A.C. ChCh Cathl 
Colombo 64-68; A.C. ChCh Dehiwala 68-70; Dio Adv in Relig Educn, Dio of Colombo 70-
72; A.C. St Matthew's, Grovely 72-74; R. St Lawrence's, Caboolture 74-80; R. All Saints', 
Chermside 80-87; Miss Chapl (Ecum Chapl, BCAE) 87-90; On Leave 90-94; Dir St John's 
Counselling Service, St John's Cathl, Hong Kong 90-94; PTO Dio of Bris from 94.  17 Lilly 
Pilly Cres, Fitzgibbon  4018 (PO Box 250, Zillmere   4034) Tel: 3216 2980 Home Fax: 
Mbl: 0402 442 306 email: kmisso@bigpond.com;  S: Deanna:        Retired PTO  
 
MITCHELL, The Rev'd Jane Louise b.50; B Th (BCT) 07; D.08; P.08; Hon A.C., St Mary's, 
Kangaroo Point 08-09; Part Time P-in-C Moggill- Mt Crosby 2010-2014; Rector, Parish 
of Algester from 2014.  17 Macquarie Circuit Forest Lake 4078 Tel: 3273 7169(BH) Mbl: 
0438 184 148 email: janemitchell3@bigpond.com;  S: Les:                  Active  
 
MITCHELL, The Rev'd Paul Bentley b. 63. BA (Flinders Uni SA) 84; BTh (Flinders Uni 
SA) 89; GradDip (Pastoral) (Adel Coll Div) 90; GradDipEd (RE) (Uni SA) 97. D.89; P.89 
(Adel.) AssC Modbury Adel 89-90; AssChap Modbury Hospital 89-90; AssC St Jude's 
Brighton Adel 91; Paternity Leave 92; R. Kambalda Perth 93-96; R. Guildford Perth 96-
04; R. Hawthorn Adel 04-13; Archdeacon Torrens SA 08-13; Archdeacon of The Para 
Adel 13-14; Archdeacon of The City Adel and The Port 14-15; P-in-C Prospect SA 13-17; 
P-in-C St Luke's Toowoomba from 17. Area Dean, Toowoomba Deanery from Jan 18.  3 
Wirreanda Drive, Rangeville 4350 (PO Box 2434, Toowoomba  4350)  Mbl: 0437 391 910 
email: rector@stlukestoowoomba.org.au:                   Active  
 
MONAGHAN, The Rev'd Leslie Frank b.35; Moore Coll; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) (ACT) 62; Dip 
RE (Melb Coll of Div) 68; Th Schol (ACT) 69; D.63, P.64 Dio of Syd; A.C. All Saints', 
Albion Park 63-65; P-in-C St Stephen's, Villawood 65-70; R. Emmanuel Church, Lawson 
70-73; R. Holy Trinity, Panania 74-77; Dio of Syd; V. St John the Baptist, Dongara, Dio 
of NW Aust 77-80; R. St Philip's, Auburn 82-90; Careforce Co-ord, Staff Chapl and Field 
Rep, Anglican Home Miss Soc 90-93; Dio of Syd; Miss Chapl (BCA State Sec for Qld) 
93-2000.(Ret to Dio of Grafton); PTO Mitchell 09-10; PTO Allora-Clifton 10-11; PTO 
Freshwater from 2013.  236/1 Webster Road, Deception Bay 4508 Tel: 3385 9710 email: 
ruthandles2@bigpond.com;  S: Ruth:         PTO  
 
MONSIEGNEUR, The Rev'd Stephen Emmanuel b.66; DipHlthSc (nursing) (UWS) 92; 
BHlthSs (SCU) 95; BTh (CSU) 17; TAE40110-Cert IV in Training and Assessment, 
Registered Nurse (Psych) AFANZMHA; D.17 P. 18. AC Parish of Ipswich 17-18. Ass 
Priest, Parish of Ipswich from Dec 18  PO Box 3214, West Ipswich 4305 Tel: 3201 8475 
Mbl: 0439 070 299 email: curate@stpaulsips.org.au;  S: Ursula :                 Active  
 
MOODY, The Rev'd Craig William Joseph Allan b.54; St John's Coll, Morpeth; BA (Univ 
of Qld) 74; Grad Dip T (MGCAE) 75; B Ed Stud (Univ of Qld) 81; B Div (MCD) 88; M.Ed. 
(Research) (ACU 2010); CPE 88; D & P 89, Newcastle; C. St Thomas', Cardiff 89-90; P-
in-C Telarah/Rutherford 90-91; R. 92-94; Dio of Newcastle; P-in-C Prov Par of 
Toowoomba West 94-98; Parish of Toowoomba West 98-99; Area Dean of Toowoomba 
98-99; R. Ch Ch Bundaberg 99-01; Chapl, St Luke's Ang Sch 2000-01; Abp's Exam Chapl 
2000-09; R. All Saints' Chermside 02-09; Canon Rector Dubbo; Regional Ministry Co-
Ord. of the Slopes; (Dio Bathurst) 27/11/09-2014; Rector, Parish of Caloundra (with 
Glasshouse Country) 2014-2017; PTO Noosa Parish from 17-18. Arch. Cert. from Nov 
18.  3/47 Nelson Street, Golden Beach 4551  Mbl: 0413 472 002 email: 
cjmoody@tpg.com.au;  S: Jenny:                Archbishop’s Cert  
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MOORE, The Rev'd Alan Keith b.50; Moore Coll, Syd; B Sc (Univ of Qld), Dip Ed 71; ThL 
(ACT) 80; BD (Univ of Lond) 81; D.80; P.81; A.C. St John's, Dalby 80-82; Assoc P. St 
John's, Dalby 82-84; R. ChCh St George 84-87; R. St John's, Burleigh Heads 87-92; R. 
St Andrew's, South Brisbane from 92; Area Dean of Brisbane South East 99-04; Area 
Dean Brisbane South East from 15.  Unit 25, 34 Dornoch Terrace, West End 4101 (Parish 
Office:, 160 Vulture Street, South Brisbane  4101) Tel: 3844 3808(BH) 3846 4497(AH) 
Fax: 3217 2294 Mbl: 0409 062 156 email: alan@st-andrews.org.au;  S: Judith:        Active  
 
MOORE, The Rev'd Iain Allan b.64; B.Tch. (Griffith Uni 90); Grad Cert. Applied Linguistic 
(Jap) (Griffith Uni 91); BTh (BCT 09). D.10; P.10; AC St Lucia 10-11; PinC Hendra-
Clayfield 11-15; Rector Hendra-Clayfield from 2015..  12 Burilda Street, Hendra 4011 (PO 
Box 2298, Ascot 4007) Tel: 3268 3092(BH) 3268 3092(AH) Fax: 3268 2876 Mbl: 0407 
382 647 email: revnd.iain@gmail.com;  S: Jacki:                   Active  
 
MOORE, The Rev'd Peter Albert b.44; St Francis' Coll; BE (Univ of Qld) 69; Dip Th (ACT) 
75; BD (Univ of Qld) 76; D.75; P.76 Dio of Nth Qld; A.C. St John's, Cairns 75-78; A.C. St 
Paul's, Charters Towers 78-79; R. 79-84; OMS SAMS Argentina, Uruguay 84-98; Assoc 
Min Lomas de Zamora, Buenos Aires 85; R. Bahia Blanca 86-90; R. Cathl Montevideo, 
Uruguay 90-98; R. Gilgandra 99-03; R. Blayney 03-04; Dio of Bathurst; PTO Sunnybank 
07-2011; PTO Mitchell, Charleville and Cunnamulla March 2011- Nov 2011; PinC 
Maranoa-Warrego Anglican Mission Area (Incorporating Parishes of Charleville, 
Cunnamulla, Mitchell) from Nov. 2011-Oct 2014; Area Dean Maranoa Deanery 2013-
2014; PTO Parish of Logan from 2015. Locum Goodna Apr 2015 - Oct 2016 and Dec 16-
Jul 17.Chair Angligreen from 2017 - ; Locum Sandgate Northpoint Jan - Aug 18.  27 
Dandenong Street, Forest Lake 4078 Tel: 3278 8629 Mbl: 0429 679 011 email: 
peterm44@bigpond.net.au’  S: Alison:           Retired PTO  
 
MORGAN, The Rev'd Canon Prof John Laurence b.41; Univ of Melb; Trin Coll, BA (Hons) 
62; Dip Ed 63; Lady Rosa Turner Fellowship 67; Oxford Univ, Oriel Coll, BA Hons 69; MA 
73; D Phil 76;Dr of the University, honoris causa, UQ 07; Acad Fell Univ of Qld Medical 
Sch; Hon Professor of Ethics, Univ of Qld; D. Gippsland 68; P. Oxford for Gippsland 69; 
Actg Chapl to Oriel Coll, 69; Chapl 70-76; Dio of Oxford; Actg Assoc R. to Calvary Church, 
Memphis, Tennessee 77; Hon Asst P. of St John's, Georgetown, City and Dio of 
Washington 77- 78; Ecum Chapl to Univ of Melb 78-81; Warden of St John's Coll, Univ 
of Qld from 82; Exam Chapl to Abp of Bris from 82; Res Canon St John's Cathl Bris 84-
12; PTO St John's Cathedral from 2013; Canon Emeritus from 2013;  24 High Street, Moe 
3825 (PO Box 918, Moe  3825) Tel: 03 51 273091 Mbl: 0412 389 174 email: 
john.morgan@uq.edu.au:            Retired PTO  
 
MORRIS, The Rev'd Canon Dr Montague b.35; St Francis' Coll; PhD, B Sc, BA (Relig) 
(Univ of Qld); MA (Educ) (Calif State Univ USA); CertEd (TC); D.85; P.86; A.C. Holy Spirit, 
Kenmore 85-86; Hon Miss Chapl Dio of Bris 86-94; Vicar of Bangkok 86-94; Canon of 
Rangoon 91; Dean of Thailand and the Mekong 88-92; Dean of Thailand and Laos 92-
94; Canon Emeritus of Rangoon 94; P-in-C, Mermaid Beach 94; Priest Director, Trinity 
Anglican Mission, Robina-Mermaid Beach 95-98; Archbishop's Medal 1998; PTO Dio of 
Bris 98-16; Headmaster, All Souls' and St Gabriel's School, Charters Towers 1999-2000; 
PTO (Rtd) Parish of Buderim from 2016. Coaldrake Award ’18.  118/27 Waigani Street, 
Bli Bli 4560  Mbl: 0438 582 565 email: montymorris639@gmail.com;  S: Barbara:  
             Retired PTO  
 
MOSES, The Rev'd Gillian Fiona b.65; BA (Univ of Qld) 85; LLB (Hons) (Univ of Qld) 87; 
B Th (BCT) 07 BTh Hons (CSU 2011); D.08; P.08; A.C., St John's Cathedral 08-09. Hon 
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A.C. St John's Cathedral 09-10; Hon Assist Priest St John's Cathedral 2010-2011;. 
Executive - Research Assistant to the Primate 09-2011; PTO Maleny 2012; PinC Parish 
of Cooroora 12-14; Chpln St Aidan's Anglican Girl's School from 2014.  Tel: 3373 
5915(BH) Mbl: 0414 373 151 email: g.moses@staidans.qld.edu.au;;  S: Olaf: Chaplains 
 
MOSS, The Rev'd Peter Lindsay b.42; Ridley Coll Melb; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) Ridley 70; 
D.72, P.72 Dio of Melb; A.C. St Mark, Camberwell 71-72; OL 72-74; A.C. Kensington 
(Adel); A.C. Greensborough 74-80; P-in-C Wattle Park 80-83; R. Sth Hedland 84-88; PTO 
Perth 88; R. Coastlands 89-95; Chapl Missions to Seamen Dampier 97-98; LT 
Kalgoorlie/Boulder 99-2000; PTO Perth; P-in-C Narembeen 2000; Area Dean Eastern 
2001; PTO Dio of Bris 02-03; Assoc P. St James', Toowoomba 03-04; PTO Drayton 04-
06; PTO Coorparoo 06-2014; PTO Parish of Cleveland from 2014.  Unit 1 42-44 Longland 
Street, Cleveland 4163 (P.O. Box 8055, Cleveland 4163) Tel: 3286 3312 Mbl: 0428 647 
546 email: mossps@bigpond.com;  S: Samantha:          Retired PTO  
 
MUNDY, The Rev'd Ian Arthur b.40; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 83; B Th (BCT) 89; 
D.88; P.89; A.C. ChCh St Lucia 88-91; P-in-C Childers 91-92; R. 92-95; Area Dean of 
Burnett 93-95; Area Dean, Brisbane South West 95-98. R. St Luke's, Ekibin 95-2010; 
PTO (Rtd) New Farm from 2010; PTO (Rtd) Anglican Church Grammar School from 11; 
LT East Brisbane 11; LT Kangaroo Pt 2014.  23 Mulsanne Street, Holland Park 4121 (PO 
Box 25, Wellers Hill 4121) Tel: 3422 2045 Mbl: 0419 673 763 email: 
jiretmundy@bigpond.com;  S: Janice:           Retired PTO  
 
MUNRO, The Rev'd Dr Howard Richard John b.60; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 85; 
LLB (Univ of Qld) 86; B Th (BCT) 89; BA (1st Cl Hons) (Univ of Qld) 92; PhD (Griffith 
Univ) 01; LL.M (QUT) 09; Certificate of Royal College of Organists (CertRCO) 2014; D.87; 
P.88; Hon A.C. St Mary's, Kangaroo Point 87-88; Dcn Asst St John's Coll 88; Chapl St 
John's Coll 88-94; Dean St John's Coll 92-94; Hon A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich 94-98; Miss 
Chapl from 98 (Aust Inst Ethics & Professions, St John's College); Dean of St John's Coll 
from 2000-2014; PTO St John's Cathedral 2014-2016; Archbishop's Chpln from 2016.  
Tel: 3157 7735 Mbl: 0410 372 501 email: hmunro@anglicanchurchsq.org.au;  S: 
Katherine:                Chaplains  
 
MURPHY, The Rev'd Dianne Mary b.48; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 68; Dip Ed 
(Univ of Qld) 69; Grad Dip Th (BCT) 06; D.01; P.02; Hon A.C., Parish of Logan 01-2014; 
Chapl at St Hilda's School 02-05; Chapl at St Margaret's Anglican Girls School 06-2014; 
PTO Parish of Logan from 2015. Professional Standards Committee member from 17.  
63 Trevallyan Drive, Daisy Hill  4127 Tel: 3209 1768 Mbl: 0417 631 202 email: 
tinybozo@hotmail.com;  S: Rod:           Retired PTO  
 
MURRY, The Ven Charles William b.69; St Francis' Coll; B Mus (Qld Con) 99; Bth (BCT) 
03; D.04; P.05; A.C. St Peter's, Wynnum 04-07; P- in-C, All Saints', Charleville 07-10. AD 
Upper Hunter 11 -14; R Singleton from 10. Archdeacon Upper Hunter from 14.  Moving 
to Singleton NSW to become Rector  (40 High Street, Singleton 2330) Tel: 02 6571 
1414(BH) Mbl: 0407 726 490 email: c.murry@bigpond.com;  S: Melissa:         Missionary  
 
NAIRN, OAM, The Rev'd Canon Leonard Hilton OAM. B.41; St Francis' Coll 65; BA (ANU) 
75; ThL (ACT) 66; MACE; OAM 99; D.65; P.66; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 65-67; A.C. 
St Paul's, Ipswich 67-69; Asst Chapl CEGS Brisbane 69; Chapl Canberra Grammar 
School 70-79; Fulbright Scholarship USA 80; Housemaster and Asst to the Headmaster, 
Canberra Grammar School 81-86; PTO Dio of Bris 86-94; Foundation Headmaster, All 
Saints' Anglican School 86-2001; Miss Chapl 94-09; Hon Canon St John's Cathl from 97; 
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Canon Administrator, St John's Cathl 03; Dir, Min Ed Comm 04-05; Principal, Cathedral 
School of St Anne & St James, Townsville Dio of NQ 06- 08; Acting Principal, Emmanuel 
Ang Coll Balina (Dio Grafton) from 09; PTO Surfer's Paradise from 09; Interim Principal 
FCAC 11/12; Canon Emeritus St John's Cathl from 2014; A/g Principal St Luke's Anglican 
School, Bundaberg 2016.  28/129 Surf Parade Broadbeach  4218 Tel: 5539 0227 Mbl: 
0434 387 367 email: lhnairn@bigpond.com;  S: Vada:         Retired PTO  
 
NEEVE, The Rev'd Eric John b.26; St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 55; D & P 56; A.C. St 
Matthew's, Sherwood 56-57; A.C. ChCh Bundaberg 57-59; A.C. St James', Toowoomba 
59-60; V. Mary Valley 60-61; R. Noosa 61-67; R. St Thomas, Nth Ipswich 67-84; V. 
Moorooka 84-91; PTO Dio of Bris from 91.  67 Ormonde Road, Yeronga  4104 Tel: 3848 
4264 email: ericneeve@optusnet.com.au:          Retired PTO  
 
NEIL, The Rev'd Canon Allen George b.47; Christchurch Coll, St John's Th Coll, NZ; BA 
(Canterbury Univ) 72; L Th (St John's Coll) 73; S Th (St John's Coll) 75; RNZAF 
Command and Staff Coll, Auckland, PSC 90; Queen's Hon Chapl 99; NZ Armed Forces 
Award 99; Aust Active Service Medal with Clasps ('IRAQ 2003'); (ICAT (International 
Coalition Against Terrorism)) D.73, P.74 Dio of Christchurch NZ; A.C. St Paul's, Papanui 
73-75; A.C. St Stephen's, Shirley 75-76; Co-Vicar, St John's, Rangiora 76-79; Chapl NZ 
Army Reserve 76-83; V. St Ambrose's, Aranui 79-83; Chapl, RNZAF Christchurch 83-85; 
Auckland 86-93; Principal Chapl, RNZAF Wellington 94-99; Exam Chapl, Wellington 99; 
Principal Chapl, NZ Defence Force Wellington 99-02; Canon, Wellington Cathedral 2000-
02; Canon Emeritus, Wellington 02; V. All Saints', Ngaio 02-03; Chapl RAAF Amberley 
03-04; Returned from Active Service Badge 04; Iraq Medal 05; Australian Defence Medal 
07; to Dio of NQ; RAAF Base Townsville0 5-07; RAAF Base, Amberley 07-08; New 
Zealand Defence Service Medal with clasp National Service/Territorial Force/Regular 
Force 16. R. Gympie 08-11; PTO Parish of Kawana Waters from 2015.  3 Blue Fin Circuit, 
Mountain Creek 4557 Tel: 5493 5959 Work Direct Line: Mbl: 0405 652 003 email: 
allen.neil@icloud.com; S: Lynette:           Retired PTO  
 
NEIL, The Rev'd Lynette Christine b.49; Dip Tchg (Auckland Tchrs Coll) 71; TTC 
(Christchurch Tchrs Coll) 87; B Ed (Massey Univ) 97; MNZAC (Massey Univ) 99; Grad 
Dip Th (BCT) 09; D.02. Dio of Wellington NZ 02; Dcn Asst, All Saints', Ngaio, Dio of 
Wellington 02-03; Hon Dcn, St Catherine's, Centenary Suburbs 03-04;. Dio of Bris; P.05. 
St James' Cathl. Hon P. 05; Chapl pt St Mark's Coll, James Cook Univ 05; Actg Principal 
and Chapl St Mark's Coll 06; Dio of NQ; Chapl, Matthew Flinders Anglican College 06-
2015; PTO Parish of Buderim from 2015; Spiritual Director MEC; Rep to the Australian 
Church Women, (Qld unit) from 2017.  3 Blue Fin Circuit, Mountain Creek 4557 Tel: 5493 
5959 Mbl: 0477 321 341 email: lynette.neil@icloud.com;  S: Allen:      PTO  
 
NIESLEN, The Rev'd Beryl b. 47. BTh BCT 99; Spiritual Direction Grad. SFC 18. UCA 
Minister of the Word 2000 - 2019 (Narangba, Deception Bay and Morayfield Uniting 
Churches). Hon. Ass. Curate Parish of Strathpine from 19.   (7 Wright Court Bray Park 
4500)  Mbl: 0438 488 843 email: berylnielsen@outlook.com;:        Retired PTO 
 
NGWESO, The Rev'd Masanja Malili Emmanuel b.46; Moore Coll Syd; ThL (ACT); D.72, 
P.73 Dio of Victoria Nyanza; Pastor, Sengerema, Dio of Victoria Nyanza 73; Lecturer, St 
Philip's Th Coll, Church of the Province of Tanzania 76-78; Lecturer, Bible College, 
Mwanza 78-85; Assist M. Botany-Mascot-East Lakes, Dio of Syd 86-88; PTO Dio of Bris 
from 03-13; PTO Parish of Freshwater from 2013.  91 Mackie Road, Narangba  4504 Tel: 
3888 5007 email: masabig@hotmail.com;  S: Abigail:         Retired PTO 
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NICHOLSON, The Rev'd Dr Colin Lionel b.49; St Francis' Coll; B Com (Hons) (Univ of 
Newc) 76; Grad Dip Econ Stats (UNE) 81; PhD (Univ of Qld) 88; B Th (BCT) 90; CPA. 
D.89; P.90; A.C. St Luke's, Ekibin 89-91; A.C. Holy Spirit, Kenmore 91-92; P-in-C, Prov 
Par of Moggill- Mt Crosby 93-99; Miss Chapl 99-03; Hon Asst P. St Mary's, Bardon 03-
05; Chapl at West Moreton Ang Coll 05-09; AP Parish of Bardon 09-11; Rector Bardon 
from 11-18. Ret PTO Parish of Kenmore-Brookfield from 19. 123 Grandview Road 
Pullenvale  4069 Tel: 3202 9669 Mbl: 0400 407 395 email: colinnich@bigpond.com;  S: 
Anne:              Retired PTO  
 
NICHOLSON, The Rev'd Dr Timothy Michael b.62; MA (Camb) 84; PhD (Camb) 88; Cert 
Learn & Teach Higher Ed (Uni.Leeds) 96; GDipTh (BCT) 07; BTh (CSU) 17; MInstP 
FRACI CChem. D.17 P.18; AC Parish of Caloundra-Glasshouse 17-18. Ass Priest Parish 
of Caloundra-Glasshouse from Dec 18.  46 Upper Gay Terrace, Caloundra 4551 (PO Box 
52, Caloundra 4551) Tel: 5491 1736(BH) Mbl: 0439 090 827 email: curate@cgca.com.au;  
S: June:                       Active  
 
NOLAN, The Rt Rev'd Robert William b.47; St Francis' Coll; D.70; P.71; A.C. St Paul's, 
Ipswich 70-74; P-in-C ChCh, Childers 74; R. 74-77; P-in-C Miss Dist Jindalee-Middle Park 
77-80; V. St Catherine's, Centenary Suburbs 80-82; R. 82-83; R. All Saints', Charleville 
83-85; R.D. of the West 84-85; P-in-C Algester 85-89; R. St David's, Chelmer 89-99; Area 
Dean Brisbane South West 93-95; Archd of Moreton 95-03; R. St Mary's, Kangaroo Point 
99-03; Consecrated Bishop on the Feast of St Cyril of Alexandria, 27 June 2003 in St 
John's Cathedral by the Archbishop of Brisbane (Aspinall) assisted by the Bishops of Nth 
Qld (Noble), Rockhampton (Stone), Willochra (Weatherill), the Assistant Bishops of 
Brisbane (Appleby, Williams and Smith), the Assistant Bishop of Sydney (Tasker) and 
Bishops Meredith and Charles.  Assistant Bishop (Bishop for the Western Region) 
Diocese of Brisbane 03.- 2014; PTO Moggill-Mt Crosby 2014-2015; Priest in Charge, 
Parish of Moggill (P/T) from 2015.  (PO Box 168, Bellbowrie 4070) Tel: 3432 9364 Mbl: 
0439 784 457 email: rw.nolan@bigpond.com;  S: Jan:                  Active  
 
NOLAN, The Venerable Clifford James(Jim) b.42; St Francis' Coll; D.69, P.70 Dio of NQ; 
A.C. All Saints', Ayr 69-72; Asst P. Holy Trinity, Ingham 72-73; P-in-C St Thomas', 
Hughenden and St John the Baptist, Richmond 73-76; R. Holy Family, Charters Towers 
77-78; Asst P. St James' Cathl, Townsville 83-86; P-in-C St Peter's, Collinsville 86-88; 
Canon St James Cathl, Townsville 87-93; R. Pioneer Valley Parish, Walkerston 89-94; 
Archd NQ 93-98; P-in-C St Helen's, Home Hill 94-98; Dio of NQ; R. St John's, Dalby 98-
03; Area Dean of Bunya 01-03; P-in-C Samford 03-08; Archd of Lilley 06-08; PTO Everton 
Park 08; Archdeacon Emeritus 08; PTO Aspley-Albany Creek 08- 2013; PTO Redcliffe 
2013-2016; PTO (Rtd) Chermside from 2016..  5 Olympus Court, Eatons Hill  4037 Tel: 
3325 2854 Mbl: 0428 762 803 email: fay.nolan@bigpond.com;  S: Fay:         Retired PTO  
 
NYE, The Rev'd Gay Annette b.48; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 89; Grad Dip Ed 
(QUT) 91;Grad Dip. Thl (BCT) 08; D.99; Hon Dcn All Saints', Chermside from 99; Deacon 
Assisting the Leader of the Household of Deacons 03-05; Leader of the Household of 
Deacons 06- 17.  17 Boulter Street, Aspley  4034 Tel: 3514 7462 (Tues)(BH) 3263 
2822(AH) Mbl: 0407 235 458 email: gaynye@gmail.com;   
hod@ministryeducation.org.au:                    Active  
 
NYRENE, The Rev'd Miriam b.69. Dip T (Primary) (BCEA 89); B Sc (AES) (Griffith Uni 
95); M Environ Ed (Griffith Uni 05); Grad.Dip.Theol (CSU) 2014; TSSF 16. D.2010; Hon 
AC Parish of Inala 2010-2013; Hon. Dcn Parish of Boonah-Harrisville from 2013.  110 
Frenches Creek Road, Frenches Creek 4310 Tel: 5463 4279 Mbl: 0447 828 699 email: 
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deaconmiriam@gmail.com;:                     Active  
 
OATES, The Rev'd Graham Mitford b.41; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 87; D.86; P.87; 
A.C. St Andrew's, Indooroopilly 86-89; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 89-90; P-in-C Holy 
Trinity, Goondiwindi 90-92; R. 92-96; Area Dean of Warwick 92-94; Area Dean of 
Southern Downs 94-96; R. St Paul's, Maryborough 96-2001; Area Dean of Burnett 98-
2001; R. St Cecilia's, Chinchilla 01-07; Abp's Exam Chapl 03-07; Area Dean of Maranoa 
04-07; P-in-C Leichhardt 05-06; PTO Chinchilla 07-2016.  16 Pendula Circuit Forest Lake 
4078 Tel: 3879 7279 Mbl: 0400 707 148 email: grahamoates41@gmail.com;  S: Caryl:  
              Retired PTO  
 
O'LOUGHLIN, The Rev'd Dr Imelda Mary b.53; MB BS (UQ) 76; GradDip Bus Admin 
(UQ) 94; FRACGP (RACGP) 98; M.Med Sc (Newcastle Uni) 98; BTh (CSU) 16; D.16. 
P.17. Hon Assist Deacon Roma 2016-2017.  13 Taylor Street East, Roma 4350 (PO Box 
37 Roma 4455)  Mbl: 0409 665 300 email: grahamandimelda@gmail.com;  S: Graham:  
                       Active  
 
OSBORNE, The Rev'd Dr Jonathan Michael b51.MBBS (UQ) 76; FRANZCR (RANZCR) 
85; MTh (BCT) 01; 'Grad.Cert.Legal Studies (QUT) 08; Grad.Cert.Law (Health Law) 
(QUT) 09; D.13. P.14; Hon AC to the Chaplain Prince Charles Hosp; Hon AC Sandgate- 
Northpoint 2013-14; Hon Assist Priest Sandgate-Northpoint 14-17;Hon Assistant Chpln 
Prince Charles Hosp 2014-2016; Hon Assoc. Priest Sandgate-Northpoint from 2017.  28 
Lunn Street, Sandgate 4017 Tel: 3269 2753 Mbl: 0448 596 414 email: 
jon_rae@bigpond.net.au;  S: Rae:                    Active  
 
OTT, The Rev'd Canon Gavin Melville b.38; St Francis' Coll; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) (ACT) 
65; BA (Deakin Univ) 85; D.65; P.66; A.C. All Saints, Chermside 65-68; A.C. ChCh 
Bundaberg 68-70; Dio of Bris; R. Dimboola, Dio of Ballarat 70-74; L to O Dio of Rockptn 
74-80; (Comm Devt Offcr, Aust Assist Plan 74-76; Hon P. St Saviour's, Gladstone 74-80; 
Ind Chapl ITIM 76-80); Dio of Rockptn; R. Holy Trinity, Bowen, Dio of Nth Qld, 81-85; 
Assoc P. St Paul's, Ipswich 85-87; R. 87-01; R.D. of Ipswich 90-94; Hon Canon St John's 
Cathl 92-04; Area Dean of West Moreton 94-02; Chapl West Moreton Anglican College 
01-04; Canon Emeritus from 04; Locum Tenens Priest in the Parish of Rosewood 05; 
PTO Gatton-Ma Ma Creek 06.-2017; Archbishop's Cert to Officiate on Special Occasions 
from 2017.  216 Cascade Street, Raceview 4305  216 Cascade Street, Raceview 4305) 
Tel: 3288 0593  S: Andrea:            Retired PTO  
 
OULDS, The Rev'd Canon Terence James Gregory Ayland b.49; St Paul's Th Coll, 
Grahamstown, Sth Africa; D.75, P.76 Natal, Sth Africa; Dip Th (St Paul's Th Coll, Sth 
Africa) 75; Grad Dip Ed (Univ of Sth Aust) 92; C. St Paul's, Durban, Natal, Sth Africa 75-
77; Dio of Natal; LT Hawera, Taranaki 77; C. All Saints', Palmerston Nth 78; V. All Saints', 
Eltham, Taranaki 78-81; V. St John the Evangelist, Johnsonville 81- 86; Chapl Royal NZ 
Police Coll 82-86; Chapl NZDF 82-86; Dio of Wellington NZ; R. St John the Baptist, 
Warren 86-87; Dio of Bathurst; R. St Ambrose, North Mackay 87-94; Area Dean 93-94; 
Police Chapl QPS 88-94; Dio of NQ; Chapl, Missions to Seamen, Gladstone 94-99; Dio 
of Rockptn; R. St Francis', Nundah from 2000; Commissary in Aust for Abp of Melanesia 
from Aug. 09; Hon Canon St Barnabas Cathedral, Honiara from 2010.  68 Cavendish 
Street, Nundah  4012 (PO Box 165, Nundah  4012) Tel: 3266 2174 Fax: 3266 2174 Mbl: 
0408 876 301 email: jamesoulds61@gmail.com;  S: Marilyn:                  Active  
 
PAGET, The Rev'd Helen Maree b.58; Saint Francis College. Gen Nursing Cert 
(Greenslopes Repat Hosp) 76; Dip.Legal Sec. (Lorraine Martin Bus Coll.) 83; 
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Adv.Cert.Disabilities (Bremer TAFE) 94; BTh (CSU) 2011; MTh (CSU) 14; D.2012; P. 
2012; Stip AC Ipswich 2012; Assist. Priest Ipswich 12-14; PinC Parish of Boonah-
Harrisville from 14; Area Dean West Moreton from 16  10 Church Street, Boonah  4310 
(PO Box 55, Boonah 4310) Tel: 5463 1879(BH) 5463 1041(AH) Mbl: 0409 474 276 email: 
priest@bhanglican.org.au;  S: Robert:                    Active  
 
PAGET, The Rev'd Robert John b.56; St Francis' Coll; THDip (ACT) 1994; BTH (CSU) 
2013; D.80; P.81; A.C. ChCh, Bundaberg 80-81; A.C. St Barnabas', Sunnybank 81-84; 
P-in-C St Alban's, Cunnamulla 84-87; Dio of Bris; R. St Francis', Moranbah 87-90; Dio of 
Rockptn; PTO Dio of Bris 90-91; A.C. Christ Church, St Lucia 91-94; Chapl RAAF from 
94; Wagga 94-96; Amberley 97-98; PTO Dio of Bris 97-98;  Pearce 99-03; Tindal 04-05; 
Darwin 06-07; Amberley 08-10; Mission Chapl (Defence Force) 08-10; Wagga Wagga 
RAAF Base 2010; Chpln RAAF Base Amberley 10-11; Edinburgh SA 12-13; Chpln RAAF 
Base, Amberley from 2013. RAAFSR (RAAF Specialist Reserve) from 17.  10 Church 
Street, Boonah 4310 (Chaplains Office, RAAF Base Amberley 4306) Tel: (07) 5463 1041 
Mbl: 0428 293 050 email: r_and_h_paget@internode.on.net;  S: Helen:  
                    Mission Chaplain  
 
PAGRAM, The Rev'd Bronwyn Frances b.67; B.E. (Hons) (UQ) 87; MEngSc. (UNSW) 
92; GCert.Mgmt (UNE) 01; Cert.Th.St; (Ang. Dio Bristol & Methodist Ch Bristol, UK) 07; 
EFM (Sewanee USA) 11; ACert.Proj.Mgmt, (GWU USA) 11; MSc. (U.Birm, UK) 16; B.Th 
(CSU) 17; Reader (UK) 07. D.17 P. 18; AC St John's Cathedral 17-18. Ass P St John's 
Cathedral from Dec 18.  GPO Box 421, Brisbane 4001  Mbl: 0439 777 992 email: 
bpagram@stjohnscathedral.com.au;  S: Paul :                  Active  
 
PAINE, The Rev'd Peter Cecil b.35;St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 59; D.59; P.60 Bathurst; 
BGS 57-64; A.C. Darwin 60-61; P-in-C Katherine, Dio of Carp, 62-64; LT Upper Hastings, 
Dio of Grafton 65; R. ChCh, Childers 66-69; R. Ch of the Annunciation, Camp Hill 69-79; 
PTO Dio of Bris from 79.  Unit 50/9 Salford St Victoria Point 4165 Tel: 3820 9113 email: 
prpai7@bigpond.com;  S: Rita:          Retired PTO  
 
PALMER, The Rev'd Carol Lind b.48; BA (Uni of Otago NZ 1971) DipTchng (Christchurch 
Teachers Coll, 1971); CPE Syd Adventist Hosp 1972; BTh (Sydney Coll of Div 1996); 
GradCert Diaconate Studies (CSU 2000); Abp's Cert in Church Music, (Morpeth 1995); 
Cert of Prof.Min (Morpeth) 2001; D.05 (Graft), P.06 (Graft). D. Hunters Hill, Syd. 06; Assist 
P. Murwillumbah 07-08; PinC Mid Richmond 09-12; R.Mundubbera-Eidsvold-Monto 
2012-2016; PinC Parish of Inala from 2016 PO Box 32, Inala  4077 Tel: 3372 1216(BH) 
Fax: 3278 8738 email: rev_carol@bigpond.com:                   Active  
 
PALMER, The Rev'd Peter Wayne b.62; Adv DipTh 2001; D.01; (NWA), P.03; (NWA). 
YW Dept Children's Services Qld 86-89; Mssnry CMS (Numbulwar) 91-96; Anglicare Brsb 
97-01; MiC Wyndham/Oombulgurri 01-07; PinC Coober Pedy & Far Nth SA 07-11; (Dio 
Willochra); FIFO Mine to Mine Sites SA, Adel. 2011-16; PinC Parish of Beenleigh (Dio 
Bris) 16-17; R Parish of Beenleigh from 17.  10 Tansey Street, Beenleigh 4207 Tel: 3287 
2326(BH) Mbl: 0402 062 842 email: minechaplain@westnet.com.au; 
stgeorgesbeenleigh@westnet.com.au;  S: Joy:                   Active  
 
PAMFLETT, The Rev'd Thomas Macdonald b. 36. (St John's College Morpeth) ThL 60; 
D. 1960. P. 1961. AssC Warrnambool Ballarat 61-63; R Nhill Ballarat 63-71; R Beaufort 
Ballarat 71-76; R Ballan Ballarat 76-85; R Wonthaggi Gippsland 85-92; Rdean Sth 
Gippsland 88-92; PTO Mlb 92-16; PTO Bne from 17.  218/50 Riverwalk Ave Robina 4226  
Mbl: 0418 362 360 email: tom.pamflett@optusnet.com:         Retired PTO  
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PARKER, The Rev'd Donald Lewis b.60; BA (VUW) 1980; L.Th (St John's Auckland) 
1984; Dip Analytical Psych (Albany Trust ChCh N.Z) 1996; Grad.Dip.Arts (Psych) 2004; 
Curate, St Mary's Levin, Wellington 84-87; Chpln St Peter's School, Waikato 87-88; V. 
Manaia- Opunake 88-92; V. Oxford, Nth.Cant., Christ Church 92-98; Chpln - Burnham 
NZDF Christ Church 98-99; NZDF Chpln to INTERFET, East Timor Sep 99 - Mar 00, 
Chpln - Linton, PN NZDF Wellington 00-05; NZDF Chpln to Banda Aceh humanitarian 
relief - Boxing Day Tsunami - Feb 05, Principal Chpln Army NZDF Wellington Dec 05-08; 
Principal Def. Chpln NZDF Wellington 08-12; Chpln ADF Canungra (Dio Brisbane) April 
2012-Dec. 2104; Chpln Gallipoli Barracks Jan 2015 - Dec 2015. PinC Parish of Southport 
2015-16; Rector from 2016.  Rectory 26 Water Street, Southport 4215 (83 Nerang Street, 
Southport 4215) Tel: 5532 8978(BH) 5531 1702(AH) Fax: 5564 0870 Mbl: 0434 040 138 
email: rector@stpetersgc.com.au; psychpadre@gmail.com;  S: Jill:                 Active  
 
PASCHKE, The Rev'd Ronald John ASM; b.46; St Francis' Coll; ThDip (ACT) 84; Grad 
Dip Ed (RE) (Univ of SA) 94; D & P 83; A.C. St Paul's Cathl, Rockptn 83; A.C. St Peter's, 
Wynnum 83-84; A.C. St Barnabas', Sunnybank 84-85; A.C. St Jude's, Everton Park 85-
86; Assoc P. St John's, Burleigh Heads 86-87; P-in-C Mermaid Beach 87-89; Chapl ARA 
from 89; PTO Dio of Bris 89-92; BASC Puckapunyal 93-94; BASC Darling Downs 95; 
PTO Dio of Bris 95-99; Sth Qld Logistic Group, Bulimba from 96-98; Chapl, 2 Fd Hosp, 
Enoggera 98-99; Chapl Land Warfare Centre, Canungra from 99; Miss Chapl (Defence 
Force) from 99; Co-ord Chapl Defence Intelligence Training Centre from 92; Chapl, 
Operation Op Belisi, Bougainville 03; Chapl, School of Infantry, Singleton 04-05; Chapl, 
2nd Health Support Battalion Enoggera 05-06; Chapl, Mission to Seafarers from 06 - 08; 
P-in-C Woolloongabba 08 - Aug 19 email: rjpaschke@bigpond.com;  S: Jenny:  
                       Active  
 
PASCOE, The Rev'd Joan b.39; St Francis' Coll; CertT (KGCAE) 59; Grad Dip Sp Ed 
(MGCAE) 77; MACE (ACE) 78; B Ed 81; B Th (BCT) 91; D.91; P.92; A.C. St Oswald's, 
Banyo 91-92; P-in-C Prov Par of Samford 92-94; Miss Chapl 94 (LT Allora); P-in-C, St 
John's, Biggenden 95-99; P-in-C Nanango 99-04; PTO Caloundra 04-16; Archbishop's 
Certificate to Officiate on Special Occasions from 16.  13/74 William Street, Moffat Beach  
4551 (PO Box 101, Caloundra  4551) Tel: 5491 5510 :              Archbishop's Cert  
 
PATTISON, The Rev'd John Brack b.56; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 96; D.96; P.97; A.C. 
St Bartholomew's, Mt Gravatt 96-2000; Duty Chapl, Arthur Gorrie Correctional Centre 
from 98; Asst P. Hervey Bay 2000-03; P-in-C Allora-Clifton 08; Police Chapl Warwick 
District 07-08. P-in-C Caboolture 09-10; R Caboolture 10-2014; PTO Parish of Bribie 
Island 14-18; PTO Parish of Caboolture from 18.  8 Arthur Street Caboolture 4510  Mbl: 
0467 483 086 S: Lorna:        PTO  
 
PATTISON, The Rev'd Lorna Margaret b.57; St Francis' Coll; D.2000; Dcn Hervey Bay 
2000-03; Hon Dcn, Allora-Clifton from 04-08; (Chapl at Allora State School 05-08); Hon 
Dcn, Caboolture from 09.  8 Arthur Street, Caboolture 4510  email: 
lornapattison@hotmail.com;  S: John:                    Active  
 
PAULSEN, The Rev'd Allan John b.54; BA (Univ of Qld) 86; Grad Dip Th (BCT) 01; M Th 
Stud (BCT) 04; D.77, P.78 by Abp Francis Rush, Brisbane; Received into Anglican 
Church of Australia by Bishop of Southern Region, Oct 05; PTO (Jimboomba) 06; Assoc 
P., St Barnabas', Sunnybank 06-07; P-in-C, St George's, Tamborine Mountain 07-13 
Area Dean Logan 2009-13; Rector, St John's, Wondunna, Parish of Hervey Bay 2013-
2017; Archdeacon Wide Bay 2013-2015; Archdeacon Burnett from 2015-2017; PinC 
Parish of Holland Park from 2017.  13 Orchard Place, Eight Mile Plains 4113 (PO Box 
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248, Holland Park 4121) Tel: 3397 0390(BH) Mbl: 0401 570 534 email: 
ajpaulsen@bigpond.com;  S: Michele:                    Active  
 
PAYNE, The Rev'd Carolyn Ann b.52; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 94; Grad Dip Th (BCT) 
98; C.Dec; D.97; P.98; A.C. Ch of The Resurrection, Aspley 97-98; Aspley-Albany Creek 
98-2000; Director of Youth Ministries 2000-06; Asst P. Sandgate Northpoint 07-08; PTO. 
St Peter's Bribie Island from 08.  28 Clayton Street Woorim 4507 Tel: 3408 4191 Mbl: 
0447 542 950 email: cpayne52@bigpond.com.au:       PTO  
 
PAYNE, The Rev'd Dr Robin Ashley b.46; Moore Coll; Ridley Coll; BA (Univ of Syd) 67; 
Dip Ed (Univ of Syd) 68; ThL (ACT) 75; BD (London Univ) 76; Dip RE (MCD) 79; M Th 
(ACT) 86; D Min (Fuller Seminary) 01; D.87 P.92 Dio of Melb; A.C. St John's, Heidelberg 
87-88; Hon Ass Min St John’s West Brunswick 88-92; Lecturer, Ridley Coll 85-96; P-in-C 
St Augustine's, Moreland 93-02; Co-ord Supervised Theol Fld Ed 98-02; Dio of Melb; 
PTO Dio of Bris 03-04 (Lecturer, Bible Coll of Qld); To theological Lecturer Central Asia 
c/- Interserve from 05.   (c/- Northa Burnett, PO Box 369 Gympie 4570)  email: 
robinp@securenym.net:             Missionary  
 
PEARSON, The Rev'd William Robert b.36; RFD 93; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 70; 
D.59; P.60 NQ; A.C. St John's, Townsville 59-62; R. 62-66; Chapl Miss to Seamen, 
Townsville 59-62; R. W. Cairns 67-71; Dio of NQ; Chapl RANR 68; HMAS Moreton Port 
Chapl, Bris 74; R. St Francis', Nundah 71-83; R. St Mary's, Redcliffe 83-96; Police Chapl 
Redcliffe Dist 94-96; Chapl, Missions to Seamen (from April 2000 known as The Mission 
to Seafarers) 96-06; PTO All Saints', Brisbane from 06; Hon Chaplain the Mission to 
Seafarers 2012-2016; Chaplain Emeritus - Mission to Seafarers 2016.  4/2 Masthead 
Drive, Raby Bay Harbour Apts, Raby Bay 4163 (4/2 Masthead Drive, Raby Bay Harbour 
Apts, Raby Bay 4163) Tel: 3286 4515 Mbl: 0412 202 691 email: 
wavy.navy@optusnet.com.au;  S: Lorna:          Retired PTO  
 
PEDWELL, The Rev'd Aubrey Graham b.41; Dip Th (ACT) 02; D.99; P. 01 Dio of 
Rockptn; Hon Asst C. Keppel, Dio of Rockptn 99-01; Asst  M. St Alban's Epping, Dio of 
Syd 01-03; Assoc P. St Paul's, Cleveland 03-2010; PTO Mt Gravatt 2010-2012; PTO 
(Rtd) Cleveland 2012; PinC Parish of Goonaneman 2012-2015; PTO Parish of Cleveland 
from 2016.  37 Spinnaker Circuit, Redland Bay 4165  Mbl: 0418 188 180 email: 
aubrey@milne.net.au;  S: Veronica:          Retired PTO  
 
PENNY, The Rev'd Richard George b.30; St Francis' Coll; ThDip (ACT) 85; D.82; P.84; 
Hon A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich 82-85; A.C. 85-91; P- in-C St Luke's, Miles 91-96; PTO Dio 
of NQ (attached to St James Cathl, Hon Asst P. St Margaret's, Magnetic Island) 96-01; 
PTO Dio of Bris (pt St Matthew's, Drayton) from 01. Diocesan Secretary AMUA (Anglican 
Mothers Union Australia) from 17.  Room 61, Symes Thorpe, 69 Stenner Street 
Toowoomba 4350 Tel: 4635 6142 Mbl: 0439 589 663 email: 
richardpenny6@bigpond.com:          Retired PTO  
 
PERRY, The Rev'd Eron Avenel b. 76; B.AppSci (Coastal M'ment) Southern Cross 
University; BTh (CSU St John's College Morpeth); Cert Min (CSU, St John's College 
Morpeth); CCPE (NSW College CPE); D.2001 (Grafton); P. 2002 (Grafton); AsstP Tweed 
Heads 02-03; AsstP Port Macquarie 04-06; Synod Clerical Sec Grafton 11-13; RMC 
Tween/Byron 11-12; R. Kingscliff 07-17; PinC Parish of Burleigh Heads from 17.  PO Box 
375 Burleigh Heads 4220  Mbl: 0411 417 779 email: pezzmondo@gmail.com;  S: Jane:  
                       Active  
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PERRY, The Rev'd Robert Arnold b.37; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) (ACT) 
83; Dip Min (ACT) 83; Assoc Dip Th (Morpeth) 83; D & P Newcastle 83; Asst P. St Alban's, 
Charlestown 83-85; Asst P. All Saints' Singleton/Jerry's Plains 86-87; R. Holy Trinity, The 
Camden Haven 87-94; Dio of Newcastle; R. St Ambrose, Gilgandra 94-99; Dio of 
Bathurst; Asst P. Ch Ch Bundaberg 99-2000; Assoc P. 2000-01; R. St Matthew's, 
Gayndah 01-11; PTO (Rtd) Parish of Bundaberg West from 2011; L/T Hervey Bay 2011, 
2012,2013; L/T St Bartholomew's, Toowoomba 2013; Hon Asst P. Ch Ch Bundaberg 
2014. L/T Bundaberg West 2015. L/T Mundubbera-Eidsvold-Monto 2016.  5 Camplin 
Court, Branyan 4670 Tel: 4155 0724 Mbl: 0407 901 735 email: 
revrobert.gayndah@bigpond.com;  S: Beverley:          Retired PTO  
 
PERRY, The Rev'd Stewart Robert b.72. B.Comm (Newc) 93; CPA (Aust.Soc of CPA) 
97; BTh (CSU) 08; D.07; (Newc), P.07. (Newc); DAsst St John's Newcastle 07; AsstP St 
John's Newc, 08; Rector St John's, Newc. 09-13; A.D. Newc 13; (Dio Bris) PinC Robina- 
Mermaid Beach 2013-2014; Rector Robina-Mermaid Beach from 2015. PinC 
Mudgeeraba from 17. (Remaining Rector of Robina- Mermaid Beach)  20 Lyra Court, 
Robina 4226 (PO Box 3065, Robina Town Centre 4203) Tel: 5578 7444(BH) 5580 
8987(AH) Mbl: 0421 421 521 email: stewart@robinaanglican.com;  S: Leanne:       Active  
 
PETERS, The Rev'd Dr Andrew Emmanuel b.50; Trinity Coll Melb; ThL (ACT) 78; Bromby 
Greek Prize (Trinity College, Melbourne, 1979); B Th (MCD) 80; Cert Accounting (TAFE 
Wimmera) 94; MA (Theol) (Ridley ACT) 96; Cert IV Assessment and Workplace Training 
(GCCOM) 2000; FAIM/IML- 02; PhD (ACU 2011); D.80, P.81 Dio of Ballarat; Dir Evang 
Teen Challenge NSW 75-77; A.C. Colac 80-82; A.C. Horsham/Natimuk 82-83; P-in-C 
Sthn Mallee 83-85; R. Ballan/Bungaree 85-96; Dio of Ballarat; Chairperson - Education 
Commission – (Dio of Ballarat 1990-1994); V. St Luke's, Sydenham 96-98; LT St Chad's, 
Chelsea 99; Police Chapl, Keilor 97-99; Lect/Hd Min Formn Sthn Cross BCM 98-99; 
Administrator, Vital Youth Vic 99; Dio of Melb; PTO Dio of Bris 2000-03; (Principal, 
Garden City College of Ministry 99-02; Min Devt Pastor Garden City Christian Church 
2000-02); Assoc P. Everton Park 03-09; PinC P. Parish of Everton Park 29 Nov 09-11; 
PinC Everton Park Nov 11-Nov 13; Rector Parish of Everton Parks from 14.  1 Lorinya 
Street, Mansfield  4122 (PO Box 231 Everton Park 4053) Tel: 3353 2020(BH) Fax: 3353 
8877 Mbl: 0418 500 148 email: apeters@tpg.com.au;  S: Lynette:                 Active  
 
PETERSEN, The Rev'd Donna Elizabeth b.65; Cert II and III Business (Qld TAFE) 2000; 
BTh (CSU) 2010;obl OSB; D. 2011; P.2012; Deacon Bundaberg 11; Hon AC Goodna 
2011; A.C. (P/.T) Goodna 2012.; Assistant Priest Parish of Warwick 2012-2015; PinC 
Parish of Wynnum 15-18, Rector Parish of Wynnum from 18.  81 Charlotte Street, 
Wynnum 4178 ( PO Box 1097 Wynnum 4178) Tel: 3901 0821 Mbl: 0435 023 184 email: 
stpeterskingdomkeys@gmail.com;  S: Rick:                   Active  
 
PETERSON, The Rev'd Rosemary Elizabeth May b.42; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Min 
(SFC) 92; D.92; P.95; Hon A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich 92- 94; A.C. St Mark's, Warwick 94-
99; P-in-C Ch Ch, Killarney 99-05; PTO Warwick from 06.  1966 Condamine River Road, 
The Head  4373 (PO Box 111, Killarney 4373) Tel: 4664 7161 Mbl: 0418 741 942 email: 
oaklea@skymesh.com.au;  S: Neil:          Retired PTO  
 
PHILLIPPS, The Rev'd Judith Helen b.33; St Francis' Coll; TTC (W'ton NZ) 54; Dip Tchg 
(ChCh NZ) 74; Dip Tchg (NZ Dept of Ed) 78; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 92; B Th (BCT) 94; 
D.92; P.95; Hon A.C. St Mary's, Kangaroo Point and St Paul's, East Brisbane 92-98. Hon 
Chapl Mt Olivet Hosp 95-98; PTO (Ret) 98-2010; Archbishop's Certificate 2010-2016; 
Parish of Bulimba from 2017.  Unit 10/162 Oceana Terrace Manly 4179 Tel: 3393 5131 
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email: judith.phillipps@bigpond.com:               Archbishop's Cert  
 
PHILLIPS, The Rev'd Frank Austin b.43; ThDip 79; CCM/DipMin 98; D & P. 79 Dio of 
Canb-Goulb; D. Kambah 79; A.C. 79-81; R. Koorawatha 81-84; R. Braidwood 84-87; R. 
Kaleen/Giralang 88-94; Rural Dean Canberra North 91-94; R. Bodalla/Narooma 95-03; 
RD Sth Coast 99-03; PTO Gatton Dio of Bris 04-06; PTO Logan 06-09; R. Algester 09-
13.. PTO (R) Mt Gravatt 2013-2015; PTO (Rtd) Beenleigh from 2015.  Villa 230 Ruby 
Gardens, 225 Logan Street, Eagleby 4207  Mbl: 0497 836 658 email: 
frankphillips301279@gmail.com S: Margaret:         Retired PTO  
 
PHILP, The Rev'd Michelle Maree    (10 Greenwood Street Wishart 4122)  Mbl: 0418 783 
553 email: michelle.m.philp@gmail.com;:                   Active  
 
PINSON, The Rev'd Wilfrid John b41: BA Deakin 1984; Assoc Aust Library/Inf Assocn; 
BD Univ Sth Pacific Suva 1970; D.1971 (Newc), P.1971 (Newc); Asst C Maitland 71-72; 
Sub Warden Bp Patterson Theol Cent Melb 73-75; Hon Chapl Bp Ball 76-93; AR Fred's 
Pass 93- 94; R 94-95; Hon Asst P W'bool 96-97; Asst P Graft 97; LT Benara, Bellingen 
99-2000; LT Clarence, Goondiwindi 2001; LT Sth Grafton, St George 02; LT Warwick, 
Maclean 2003; LT Mitchell 04; LT Kempsey Townsville Cathl 2005; LT Woolgoolga 2005-
06; Lt Parkes 07-08; Dio Grafton Ret. 1998; ATO Grafton; PTO Bath., Dio Archivist (Graft) 
p/t 07; LT Parkes (Bath) 08-10; PTO Southport (Dio Brisb) from 2010; L/T Warwick 2010-
2011; L/T Mudgeeraba 2013-14; L/T Southport 14-15. L/T Burleigh Heads 17.  18 
Christina Ryan Way Arundel  4214 Tel: 5571 6630 Mbl: 0416 792 640 email: 
johnandsharonp@gmail.com;  S: Sharon:         Retired PTO  
 
PITMAN, The Rev'd Kaye OAM  b.36; B Ed (Univ of Qld) 67; MA (Ed) (Calgary Univ) 76; 
B Th (BCT) 90; D.90; P.92; A.C. St Matthew's, Drayton 90-92; Hon Chapl GFS from 92; 
Mission Chaplain (Lecturer, St Francis' Coll) 92-01; Mission Chaplain 01-04; Hon Chapl, 
Clergy Spouses from 03; PTO Maleny from 04.  PO Box 1048, Maleny  4552 Tel: 5499 
9361 Mbl: 0402 014 547 email: kaye.pitman@bigpond.com:        Retired PTO  
 
PITT, The Rev'd Jocelyn Anne b.40; St Francis' Coll; Cert Tchg (KGTC) 58; B Ed St (Univ 
of Qld) 77; Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 94; B Th (BCT) 98; D.93; P.97; Asst Chapl Anglican 
Church Grammar School 93-03; PTO 03-04; Assoc P., Holy Spirit, Kenmore-Brookfield 
04-05; PTO Kenmore-Brookfield 05-07; PTO Algester 07-08. PTO Coolum from 09  10 
Peatling Lane, Twin Waters 4564 Tel: 07 5448 8059 Mbl: 0412 116 547 email: 
thepitts8@bigpond.com;  S: Gordon:          Retired PTO  
 
POPE, The Rev'd David John b.36; Ridley Coll; ThL (2nd Cl Hons)(ACT) 60; D.59, P.61 
Dio of St Arnaud; A.C. Maryborough 60-61; Dio of St Arnaud; A.C. Cheltenham 62-63; V. 
Nth Richmond 64-69; L/T Wentworth Dio Riverina 69-70; ABC, Journalist and 
Broadcaster 71-77; V. Brighton Beach 77-79; Dio of Melbourne; PTO Dio of Bris 79-81; 
P-in-C Ithaca-Ashgrove 81-84; Dio of Bris; LT East Mandurah 91-92, Dio of Bunbury; 
PTO Wilston from 04.  Unit 2, 39 Theodore Street, Stafford 4053  Mbl: 0409 719 539:  
             Retired PTO  
 
POTTER, The Rev'd Desmond b.54; (St Paul's Theol Coll), Grahamstown Sth Africa; Dip 
Eng (Witwatersrand Tech) 75; Dip Th (St Paul's Theol Coll) 87; B Th (Hons)(Liverpool 
Univ) 03; D & P 88, Dio of Johannesburg, Sth Africa; C. St Dunstan's, Benoni 88-90; C. 
St Peter and St Paul, Springs 90-91; Asst P. St Thomas', Linden 91-93; Dio of 
Johannesburg; R. St Edmund's, Kempton Park, Dio of Sth Eastern Transvaal 93-97; V. 
St Michael and All Angels, Newton, Dio of Chester, UK 98-06; Asst P. St Bartholomew's, 
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Toowoomba 06 - 08. R. Parish of Callide Valley, Biloela, Dio of Rockhampton 08-2013; 
(Dio Wang) R. St Augustine's, Shepparton 2013-2017; PTO Hervey Bay Dio Bne 17. PinC 
Strathpine Dio Bne from 17.  1 Sutherland Dve Strathpine 4500 Tel: 3889 8562 Mbl: 0400 
650 647 email: qldpotters@bigpond.com;  S: Joke:                  Active  
 
POWELL, The Rev'd Katherine b.56; Wycliffe Hall, Oxford; Dip Th (All Souls Coll Lond) 
84; Cert Th (Oxford Univ) 86; B Soc Stud (Syd Univ) 79  Deaconess 86; D.87, P.93 Dio 
of Chichester; C. St Mary's, Broadwater 87-91; Asst Chapl Christ's Hosp Schl, Chichester 
91-96; Dio of Chichester; Chapl The Glennie Schl from 96; Grad Dip Teaching and 
Learning (USQ) 08;.  1/2G James Street, Toowoomba  4350 (1/2G James Street 
Toowoomba  4350) Tel: 4637 9359 Mbl: 0437 379 359 email: revkate@bigpond.com:  
           PTO  
 
PRIESTLEY, The Rev'd Anne-Marie b.39; Bed NT Univ 94; CPE RMH 85; D.93; P.99; 
(NT). Hon Asst D Alice Springs NT 93-99; PinC Tennant Creek N.T. 99-02; PTO Glen 
Osmond Dio Adelaide 03-08; PTO Cleveland Dio Brisbane 09-2017.  Unit 35 Salford 
Waters Retirement Estate 9 Salford Street Victoria Point 4165 (Taking Maried Name : 
Collins 100 Shannon Drive, Port Sorrell 7307) Tel: 3207 6501 email: 
revamp08@bigpond.com:            Retired PTO  
 
PRITCHARD, The Rev'd Desmond Albert b.34; BA (ANU) 68; ThL Morpeth (ACT) 63; 
D.63.(C&G), P.64 (C&G); Asst P St Jn Canb 64-65; Yass 66; R Gunning 66-70; Sc Mstr 
Canb GS 70-72. (Dio NQ) R. Atherton 73-82; LT Mareeba 79-81; Staff Tchr The Cathl 
Sch 82-86; Asst Chpln 83-86; PTO, Asst P Atherton Tableland 87; OSL Chpln 2000; OSL 
Snr Chpln 02-16; (Dio Bris) PTO Mudgeeraba from 2016.  Estia Lodge, 21-25 Old Coach 
Road, Mudgeeraba 4213  Mbl: 0402 169 031 S: Irene:         Retired PTO  
 
PROSSER, The Rev'd James Arthur b.36; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThL (ACT) 67; D.67 
Bris; P.68 Rockptn; A.C. St Stephen's, Coorparoo 68; Dio of Bris; Asst P. St Luke's, 
Wandal 69; Asst P. St Andrew's, Longreach 69-70; P-in-C St George's, Aramac 70-72; 
Pilot Anglican Far West Aerial Mission 69-72; V. St Peter's, Springsure 72-73; Dio of 
Rockptn; V. St John's, Inglewood 73-77; Asst P. St James', Toowoomba 77-81; R. St 
George's, Crows Nest 81-88; Asst P. St Mark's, Warwick 88; Dio of Bris; R. St Mark's, 
Nyngan, Dio of Bathurst 88-96; PTO Dio of Bris from 96.  7 Batten Court, Toowoomba  
4350 Tel: 4633 4079 email: dkprosser1@bigpond.com;  S: Dianne:        Retired PTO  
 
PRYCE-DAVIES, The Rev'd John b.47; BA (Univ of Qld) 72; BD (Univ of Qld) 75; Dip RE 
(Melb Coll of Div) 75; M Lit St (Univ of Qld) 81; M Th (BCT) 01; M.Phil (Griffith Univ) 07; 
D.84, P.85, Dio of NQ; A.C. Holy Trinity Ingham, Dio of NQ 84-86; PTO Dio of Bris 86; 
(LT All Saints', Mitchell 86); A.C. St Mark's, Warwick 87-88; P-in-C Maleny 88-93; R. 93-
96; Area Dean of the Sunshine Coast 94-96; P-in-C Holy Spirit, Northpoint 96-02; Hon 
Chapl St Martin's Nursing Home 96-02; PTO 02-05 (LT Yeronga 03, Barambah 03-05); 
Chapl, Royal Brisbane and Women's Hospital 05-10; PTO Bramble Bay 2011-2013; L/T 
Banyo 2011, Roma 2011, Brisbane Valley 2012; PTO Toowoomba, St James from 2013; 
L/T Drayton from 2013-5; L/T St George, 2015..  25 Merrol Street, Highfields 4352 Tel: 
4615 5963(BH) 4615 5963(AH) email: gerriepd@gmail.com;  S: Geraldine:   Retired PTO  
 
PYECROFT, The Rev'd Canon Josephine Margaret b.36; St Francis' Coll; SRN (UK) 58; 
Obst (Canada) 66; B Th (BCT) 93; CPE 93; D.93; P.95; Hon Deacon St John's Cathl 93-
95; Hon Asst Chapl Princess Alexandra Hosp 93-96; Hon A.C. St John's Cathl 95-96; 
Asst P. St Matthew's, Sherwood 96-99; Precentor and Minor Canon, St John's Cathedral 
99-03; PTO Dio of Brisbane from 03; PTO Dio of Tas from 04; Chapl AMS Tas from 06; 
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Supervisory Priest, Quamby, Tas 06-09; Co-Incumbent Parish of Quamby 09-13; PinC 
Parish of Quamby from 2013.  28 Goderich Street, Longford  7301 (PO Box 227, Longford  
7301) Tel: (03) 6391 1042 Mbl: 0412 202 563 email: revjo1@bigpond.com;  Retired PTO  
 
QUESTED, The Rev'd Fang Ling Liaw b.64; St Francis' Coll; Dip Int Trade (Ming Chuan 
Taipei) 84; B Th (BCT) 94; MA Phil (Univ of Qld) 96; JP (Qual) 97; D.95; P.96; Hon A.C. 
St David's, Chelmer 95-96; Hon A.C. St Paul's, Cleveland 96-97; Miss Chapl 97-99; Dio 
of Bris; Diocesan Cross Cultural Co-ord 99-2000; Hon Asst P. Holy Trinity, Balaclava 
2000-02; Dio of Melb; Missionary, Taiwan 02; Locum Tenens at Barambah 07; Hon Assoc 
P. Nanango 03-10; Chapln NT 10-11; Rector St Luke's Palmerston NT 11-14; PinC Parish 
of Zillmere 15-16; Mission Chaplain - Ecumenical Co-ord Chaplain QUT from 2016.  10 
Margaret Close, Brighton 4017 email: fmquest@hotmail.com;  S: Michael:                Active  
 
QUESTED, The Rev'd Michael Charles b.66; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Soc Sc (Bible 
Coll of Qld) 93; B Th (BCT) 95; B.A. Hons. (UQ) 08; D.94; P.96; Hon A.C. St Mary's, 
Kangaroo Point 95-96; A.C. St Paul's, Cleveland 96-99; P-in-C Balaclava/Elwood, Dio of 
Melb 99-02; Missionary Taiwan 02; Parish Priest (Locum Tenens) Nanango 03-04; P-in-
C 04-10; Chpln 2nd Cavalry Reg, Diocese NT 2010-1012; Chpln 5th Royal Aust Regmnt 
2013-2014; Hon Priest, Palmerston NT 2010-2014; Chpln 2nd Gen. Health Batt. Brisbane 
from 2015; Mission Chpln Dio Brisbane from 2015.  10 Margaret Close, Brighton 4017 
(PO Box 225, Zillmere 4034) Tel: 3269 5703 Mbl: 0438 761 327 email: 
michael.quested@defence.gov.au;  S: Fang Ling:                   Active  
 
RANGIWAI, The Rev'd Morris Bruce b.60; BTh (Uni Auckland) 07; D. 02; P. 04; Te Karati 
Te Pou Herenga Waka; Pihopatanga O Te Tai Tokerau, Missioner 06-2010; Hon Asst P. 
Algester from 2016.  37 Vergulde Road, Regents Park 4118 Tel: 3800 1614 Mbl: 0449 
557 351 email: rangiwai@gmail.com;  S: :                   Active  
 
RAYMOND, The Rev'd Laurel Anne b.49; St Francis' Coll; BTh (SFC) 09; D.08; P.08; 
Hon A.C., Holy Trinity, Goondiwindi 08-10; PinC Texas-Inglewood 2010-16;, Area Dean 
(Southern Downs Deanery) from 2015; PinC Allora-Clifton from 2016; Abp Examining 
Chpln from 2017  "Glen-East" Station, Goondiwindi  4390 (1 Church Street, Allora 4362) 
Tel: 4666 3343(BH) 4666 3343(AH) Mbl: 0429 671 949 email: 
LaurelbillRaymond@bigpond.com;  S: Bill:                   Active  
 
REDHEAD, The Rev'd Stephen Harry b.49; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 71; D.72; P.73; 
A.C. St Luke's, Ekibin 72-73; A.C. St Paul's, Maryborough 73-75; A.C. St Andrew's, 
Lutwyche 75-76; V. St Luke's, Miles 76-80; R. Hervey Bay 80-82; Dio of Bris; R. St Luke's, 
Emerald 82-86; Dio of Rockptn; R. King Charles the Martyr 86-90; Dio of NQ; R. St Luke's, 
Wandal 90-96; Area Dean of Central Highlands 88-90; Area Dean of Rockptn 92-96; Dio 
of Rockptn; P-in-C St Mark's, Slacks Creek 96-2000 and also P-in-C Prov Par Park Ridge-
Browns Plains 98-2000; Area Dean of the Hinterland 97-01; P-in-C Parish of Logan 2000-
03; R. St Mary's, ; Archd of Moreton 03-06; Kangaroo Point 03- 11; PinC Coolangatta-
Palm Beach (Gold Coast South) 2011-2014; PTO Parish of Greenhills 2014.-2015; PTO 
Parish of Caloundra 15-18. PTO Parish of Fortitude Valley from 18.  29 Coronation 
Avenue, Golden Beach, Caloundra 4551 Tel: 5492 4720 Mbl: 0415 911 492 email: 
fr.stephenred@bigpond.com;  S: Wendy:       PTO  
 
REDMAN, The Rev'd William Arthur b.52; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 78; D.80; 
P.81; A.C. St Peter's, Wynnum 80-83; V. All Saints', Mitchell 83-86; R. St David's, Allora 
86-90; Assoc P. St Luke's, Toowoomba 90-99; P-in-C St Thomas', Ipswich North from 99 
- 18; Chapl to the Ipswich Hospital from 05-08. Chapl to The Park - Centre for Mental 
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Health at Wolston Park 08-2018; Area Dean West Moreton Deanery 10-12. PTO 
Centenary Suburbs from 18.  2 Clune Street, Brassall 4305 Tel: 3813 0604 Mbl: 0412 
665 097 email: redmanw@optusnet.com.au;  S: Lindy:       PTO  
 
REEDER, The Rev'd Geoffrey Edward b.43; St Francis' Coll; Dip Ag (Dookie Ag Coll) 63; 
Dip Th (MCD) 71; B Th (Univ of Sth Africa) 73; B Div (Reformed Th Coll, Geelong) 75; B 
Th (Hons) (Univ of Sth Africa) 78; CFP 95; D.88; P.89; Hon A.C. St Matthew's, Sherwood 
88-95; PTO Dio of Bris 95-2000; Hon Asst P. Parish of Logan 2000-08; Hon Assist Priest 
Parish of Kenmore-Brookfield 08-18; Retiried PTO Parish of Kenmore-Brookfield from 18. 
Missioner to Communities, Parish of Quilpie from 18.  85 Martindale Street, Corinda  4075 
Tel: 3379 1821 Fax: 3379 4769 Mbl: 0416 241 409 email: reeds@bigpond.net.au;  S: 
Betty:              Retired PTO  
 
REUSS, OStJ, The Rev'd Harold Leslie b. 45; St Barnabas' Coll, Adel; Dip Ag 
(Longerenong Coll) 64; ThL (ACT) 72; D.69, P.70 Dio of Ballarat; A.C. St John's, 
Horsham, Ballarat 69-73; A.C. St Mary Magdalene, Leamington Spa 73-75; Dio of 
Coventry; R. St George's, Nhill 75-79; R. St Stephen's, Portland 79-94; Dio of Ballarat; 
R. All Saints', Murwillumbah 94-05; 1994-2005 RMC (Regional Ministry Co- Ordinator) 
Tweed Byron Rural Deanery; Dio of Grafton; P-in-C St Peter's, Southport 05-07; R. 07-
15; Area Dean of the Gold Coast 08- 2015; Hon Chpln St John Ambulance Qld from 09; 
Assistant Chaplain Order of St Lazarus 15. PinC Parish of Maleny from 15 - 17. PTO 
Parish of Burleigh Heads from 17. L/T Yeronga July-Dec 17. PinC Yeronga from 17.  19 
Mulgrave Crescent Varsity Lakes 4227  Mbl: 0428 187 625 email: 
hngreuss@bigpond.net.au;  S: Gillian:                    Active  
 
ROBERTS, The Rev'd Colin Frederick John b.35; St Michael's House, Crafers, S.A.; ThL 
(ACT); D.60; P.61; C. Holy Trinity, Ingham 61-63; C. St John's, Cairns 63-68; Sec SPCK 
in NQ 67-72; R. Good Shepherd, Edge Hill, Cairns 68-80; Dio of NQ; R. St Jude's, Everton 
Park 80-05; PinC 05-08; Chapl RANR Cadets 81; Commissary to Bp of Carpentaria 84; 
Area Dean of Bris Nth West 94-97; Chapl SSA 97-03. PTO (Rtd) Grovely 09-2014; 
PTO(Rtd) Parish of Inala 2014-July 2015; PinC Morningside P/T 2015-2016.  Unit 94, Mt 
Gravatt Retirement Community, 1748 Logan Road, Mt Gravatt 4122  Mbl: 0499 600 437 
email: crbethel@bigpond.com:               Archbishop's Cert  
 
ROBERTS, The Rev'd George Edward b.41; QTC 60; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 71; 
Grad Dip TL 81; B Ed 82; D.72; P.73; Hon A.C. St Paul's, Cleveland 72-75; Hon A.C. St 
Paul's, Manly 75-78; Chapl St Margaret's School 78-80; Hon A.C. St Paul's, Manly 80-
85; Hon Chapl T/S "Norfolk" 84-09; Hon A.C. St Paul's, Cleveland from 85; Hon Chapl 
Cleveland Yacht Club from 99; Hon Chapl Redland Shire Bands Incorp 01-06; PTO (Rtd) 
Cleveland from 11.  18 Dart Street, Redland Bay  4165 S: Margaret:            Retired PTO  
 
ROBERTS, The Rev'd Mary Nelse b.33; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 55; D & P 01; 
Hon A.C. Charleville 01-03; PTO 03-08; PTO (Retired) St John's Cathedral from July 
2008.  B302/469 Sandgate Road, Albion 4010 (B302/469 Sandgate Road, Albion  4010) 
Tel: 3262 8061 Mbl: 0448 548 109 email: maryroberts2@bigpond.com;       Retired PTO  
 
ROBINS, The Rev'd Ronald Peter b.36; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThL 62; D.62; P.63; Dio 
of Melb; A.C. St John's, Camberwell 62; A.C. St Peter's, West Heidelberg 63-64; C. St 
John's, Croydon 65; V. St Mary's, East Preston 65-71; V. St M & AA, Bennettswood 71-
75; Dio of Melb; R. (BCA) St Luke's, Zeehan, Dio of Tas 75-76; R. (BCA) Derby-Broome, 
Dio of NW Aust 77-79; R. Lower Macleay, Dio of Grafton 80-85; R.D. The South 85; Assoc 
P. St Andrew's, Lismore 85-91; Ecum Offcr, Dio of Grafton 89-91; R. St Alban's, Gatton 
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92-98; Asst P. St James', Toowoomba 98-01; PTO Dio of Bris from 02; Hon Chapl Symes 
Thorpe 02-04; PTO Nambour 08-10; PTO Kawana Waters from 10..  Unit 88, 242 
Parklands Boulevard Currimundi 4551 Tel: 5491 9154 Mbl: 0413 844 140 email: 
rprobins@westnet.com.au;  S: Ann:           Retired PTO  
 
ROBINSON, The Rev'd Philip Charles b.35; D & P 73, Carp; P-in-C Kowanyama 73-74; 
Dio of Carp; A.C. St Andrew's, Caloundra 75-76; A.C. St Andrew's, Lutwyche 76-77; R. 
St Anne's, Nanango 78-81; R. ChCh, Childers 81-84; Area Dean Burnett 83-84; R. St 
John's, Nambour 84-02; Area Dean Sunshine Coast 90-94; PTO 02; P-in-C Palmwoods 
02-08. Retired 09. PTO Maroochydore from 09.  9 Eagleview Court, Woombye  4559 Tel: 
5442 3686(BH) 5442 3686(AH)  S: Ida:           Retired PTO  
 
ROGERS, The Rev'd Sidney Roy b.46; Lincoln Th Coll, Lincolnshire 78-80; B Sc (Natal 
Univ, Durban, Sth Africa) 69; DipTch (Univ of Sth Africa) 75; DipTh (Nottingham Univ, 
Eng) 79; GOE (Lincoln Th Coll) 80; D.80, P.81 Dio of Matabeleland, Zimbabwe; A.C. All 
Saints', Dio of Matabeleland 80-81; R. St Luke's, Zvishavane, Dio of Lundi 82-84; Asst P. 
St Mary's, New Plymouth 85; V. St Luke's, Te Kuiti 85-89; Dio of Waikato; Chapl, 
Cathedral Schl, Townsville, Dio of NQ 90; Chapl Wellington Dio Schl for Girls 91-93; 
Chapl Auckland Dio Schl for Girls 94-96; Chapl, St Hilda's School 97-04; Chpln to the 
Gold Coast Hospitals 04-13; Diocesan Hospital Chaplaincy Team Leader 07-13; 
PTO(Rtd) Parish of Biggera Waters-Coomera Valley from 2014.  49 Allinga Street, 
Coombabah   4216 (PO Box 669, Southport   4215) Tel: 5577 5446 Mbl: 0419 175 960 
email: hond@bigpond.com;  S: Shelagh:          Retired PTO  
 
ROGERS, The Rev'd Timothy John b.59; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 81; B Soc Wk 
(Univ of Qld) 85; M Couns (QUT) 05; D.85; P.86; A.C. St Matthew's, Grovely 85-87; P-in-
C Noosa 87-91; PTO from 91.  31 Mirnoo Street Currimundi 4551 (BH) Mbl: 0409 748 
584 email: timrogers@optusnet.com.au;  S: Tracy:       PTO  
 
ROGERS-SMITH, The Rev'd David Barry b.61; Dip.Div&Miss (Syd Miss & Bib Coll) 90; 
BTh (Hons) (ACT) 96; MTh (ACT); D.96; (Armid), P.96 (Armid). V Emmaville 96-98; Lect 
(SMBC) 200-03; R Dorset 04-06; Dio Tas: Enabler Riverlinks 07-14 Min Dev Off - 
Christian Formation Tas 07-14; Mission Chpln BCA - Regional Officer from 2015.  9 
Fenimore Street, Wishart 4122 Tel: 3349 9081(BH) Fax: 3849 7927 Mbl: 0448 019 081 
email: d.rogerssmith@bushchurchaid.com.au:                Mission Chaplain  
 
ROSS, The Rev'd Graham Robert b.38; St Francis' Coll; ThL (1st Cl Hons) (ACT) 63; BA 
(Hons Hist) (McGill) 70; MA (Rutgers) 72; Dip Ed (Qld) 77; D.64; P.65; A.C. St Andrew's, 
Indooroopilly 64; A.C. Parish of Stafford 65-66;  A.C. St Thomas', NDG Montreal 67-70; 
Primate's List 70-76; Asstg Chapl Rutgers Univ 70-72; P-in-C St Andrew's, Plainfield, Dio 
of New Jersey, USA 71-72; Lec in Med Hist, Univ of Syd 73-76; PTO Dio of Bris 77; Asst 
Chapl CEGS 78; Chapl St Paul's School 78-81; V. Pine Rivers North 81-88; Dio of Bris; 
R. St Paul's, Port Adelaide 88-93; PTO Dio of Bris 93-96; Hon Asst P. Everton Park 96-
01; PTO Dio of Bris 01-02; Asst P. Sandgate Northpoint 02-06; PTO Sandgate Northpoint 
06-07; PTO North Pine 08-15; Arch Cert from 15.  Peninsula Palms Residential Care 
Facility 77 Morris Road Rothwell 4022 S: Marguerite:             Archbishop's Cert  
 
ROSS, The Rev'd William David b.49; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 75; Grad Dip RE 
(BCAE) 81; B Th (BCT) 93; D.75; P.76; A.C. ChCh Bundaberg 75-78; A.C. St Matthew's, 
Grovely 78; V. St Mary's, Wondai 78-82; R. St David's, Allora 82-86; Miss Chapl Dio of 
Bris (Ind Chapl ITIM; pt Assoc P. Lutwyche 86-87; pt Assoc P. Sherwood 87-93); R. St 
Oswald's, Banyo 93-2000; R. St Matthew's, Drayton 2000-08; R. St Matthias', Zillmere 
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08-2014; PTO Parish of Laidley from 14. 43 Mountain Road, Laidley 4341 (PO Box 211, 
Laidley 4341)  Mbl: 0490 113 621 email: bill.yvonne.ross@gmail.com;  S: Yvonne:   PTO  
 
ROTH, The Rev'd Carol Lorna b.49; St Francis' Coll; B Bus (Accounting and 
Finance)(USQ) 92; Grad Dip Min (BCT) 98; B Ed (Adult and Workplace)(QUT) 2000; 
D.2000; Diocesan Children's Ministry Officer 2000-06; Hon Dcn, Aspley-Albany Creek 
from 2000 - 08. Hon Dcn, Coolum from 08.  1 Learg Street, Coolum Beach 4573 Tel: 
5446 5334 Fax: 3881 3618 Mbl: 0411 690 058 email: carolroth@commander360.com;  
S: John:                       Active  
 
ROUHEAD, The Rev'd Dr Daniel Vincent B.74. MB.BS(Hons) (UQ) 1997; B.A. (Monash) 
2004; Grad Dip Thl (CSU) 2007; Grad. Cert Forensic Med.(GradCertForMed (Monash) 
2010; JP (Qual)  D.09. P. 09; Hon A.C. St Bartholomew's, Toowoomba from 09.  1 Nielsen 
Court, Middle Ridge 4350 Tel: 4632 2331(BH) 4635 8681(AH) Fax: 4632 2029 Mbl: 0408 
637 178 email: doctoryoda@yahoo.com;  S: Brooke:                  Active  
 
RULE, The Rev'd Leisha Estella b.40; St Francis' Coll; D.01; Hon Dcn St Clement's-on-
the-Hill, Stafford from 01-2010; PTO (Ret) Stafford from 2010.  34/131 Quinlan Street, 
Bracken Ridge  4017 Tel: 3269 6780 Mbl: 0404 134 823 email: candlerule@bigpond.com;  
S: Cec:              Retired PTO  
 
RULFS, The Rev'd Mary-Annestis 61; B.App.Sc (Physioth)(Cumberland College of 
Health Sciences) 82; BTh (CSU) 2014; D.2014;Physiotherapist 1983 - 2005 Pastoral 
Assist (Newlife Uniting Church) Robina; 07-10; P/T Chaplain Coomera Ang Coll 2012-14; 
Hon A.C. Parish of Gold Coast North & Chpln Coomera Ang Coll. 2014-2014; Hon Assist 
Priest Gold Coast North & Chpln Coomera Ang Coll from 2015.  22 Wave Street, Mermaid 
Beach 4218 (PO Box 168, Nobby Beach 4218)  Mbl: 0403 049 124 email: 
marulfs@gmail.com; mrulfs@cac.qld.edu.au;  S: Brad:                  Active  
 
SAMINATHAN, The Rev'd Michael b. 86; (Theol. College of Lanka) , Dip Theol. And Min. 
2011; (Theol. College of Lanka), BTh. 2011; D.10;  P.11 Kurunagala. Ass.Curate Christ 
the Peace Giver, Dio Kurunagala 11-12; Ass.Curate Trinity College Chapel Kurunagala 
12-13; Ass.Curate St Andrew's Church Kurunagala 13-14; Res. Priest Holy Trinity 
Kurunagala 14-16; Hon. Ass. Priest Annerley 17.  C/- St Philip's Anglican Church 115 
Cornwall Street, Annerley 4102  Mbl: 0477 829 301 email: 
michaelsaminathan@gmail.com:                    Active  
 
SAMPSON, The Rev'd Geoffory Gerard b.42; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip; D.83; P.84; A.C. 
St Peter's, Coolangatta 84; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 85-86; P-in-C Mitchell 87-91; R. 
St Anne's, Nanango 91-99; Area Dean of Sth Burnett 92-94; Area Dean of Bunya 94-97; 
P-in- C All Saints, Charleville 99-03; PTO Rosewood 03-14; (LT Chap at The Park - 
Centre for Mental Health 04-07). PTO (Rtd) Parish of Booval from 2015.  13 Earlwood 
Court, Raceview 4305 Tel: 3288 0903 Mbl: 0438 742 051 email: 
gandjsampson@bigpond.com;  S: Joy:          Retired PTO  
 
SANDAVER, The Rev'd Alan Richard b.42; St Francis' Coll; B Soc Wk (Univ of Qld) 72; 
BA (Univ of Qld) 82; Th.Dip (ACT) 12; D.83; P.84; A.C. St John's, Nambour 84-86; P-in-
C Mundubbera-Eidsvold 86-87; R. St Luke's, Ekibin 87-93; Miss Chapl (Ecum Tert Chapl 
QUT) 94- 97; P-in-C Ithaca-Red Hill 97; P. Assoc, The Brookfield Centre 98-04; 
Archbishop's Certificate to Officiate on Special Occasions from 2012.  62/169 Seventeen 
Mile Rocks Road, OXLEY 4075 Tel: 3161 1699 email: sandavera@optusnet.com.au S: 
Bev: Archbishop's Cert-- --- Savage, The Rev'd Arthur Mellish b.39; ThL (Morpeth) 64; 
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D.65 (Adel), P.66 (Adel). AC Toorak Gdns 65-66 Adel; AC WhyallaW Will 66- 69; AC 
W'bool 69-70; R Skipton 70-75; V. Creswick/Clunes 76-81; AC E'bourne, UK 80; AC 
Upholland UK 80; R. Colac 81-89; A/g RD Camperdown 72-83; RD 86-89; A/t Gegstr 80-
91; Admin 93; VGen 89; R St Peter Ball 93-99; Adn Ball 89, p/t 2000-04; Admin 04. Dio 
Graft Ret 04; Can Em Ball 05-14; Dio Brisbane PTO Gold Coast South from 2014.  24 
Snowgum Drive, Bilambil Heights 2486 Tel: 07 5590 9573 email: 
asavage22@bigpond.com;  S: Robyn:          Retired PTO  
 
SCHMIDT, The Rev'd Andrew Norman b.78; St Francis' Coll; BA (Relg) (Univ of Qld) 
2000; M Th (BCT) 05; GDLT (UQ) 09. D.03; P.04; A.C. Robina-Mermaid Beach 03-05; 
A.C. St Paul's, Maryborough 05-07; Chapl, St Luke's Anglican School, Bundaberg 07-10; 
Chaplain St Hilda's School 2011-2015; PinC Parish of Bundaberg West 15-18; Area Dean 
Burnett Deanery from 2017. Rector Parish of Bundaberg West from Dec 18. 201 George 
Street, Bundaberg West 4670 (PO Box 5120, Bundaberg West 4670) Tel: 4152 8810(BH) 
Mbl: 0429 520 317 email: revschmidt@gmail.com;  S: Louise:                 Active  
 
SCHWARZROCK, The Rev'd Steven Paul b.71;DipTh (St Mark's, ACT) 2000; BTh 
(CSU)02; AdvDipMinTh (St Mark's, ACT) 14; D.02(Rockh), P.03(Rockh). Hon Asst 
Wandal 02-04; AsstP Nth Rockh. 05-06; Chpln Rockh Base Hosp 06; Mgr MssnSea 
Gladstone 07-09; P MLT Gladstone 07-09; PinC Boyne River 09-16; AD Southern 09-16; 
(Dio Brisb) PinC Parish of Bribie Island 2016-2017; Rector Bribie Island from 2017..  45 
Jasmin Drive, Bongaree 4507 (PO Box 1087, Bongaree 4507) Tel: 3408 3191(BH) Mbl: 
0427 227 322 email: revsteven@icloud.com;  S: Freya:                  Active  
 
SEARLE, The Rev'd John Alexander b.56; St Francis' Coll; BA(Theol) (Univ of Qld) 82; 
B Couns (UNE) 98; Cdec (Q) 94; D & P 82; A.C. St Peter's, Wynnum 82-83; A.C. St 
Andrew's, Lutwyche 83-84; A.C. St Paul's, Maryborough 84-86; P-in-C Centenary 
Suburbs 87-88; R. 88- 92; Actg Chapl, John Oxley Yth Remand Centre 88; Relief Chapl, 
Moreton Corr Centre 89-91; PTO Dio of Bris (ITIM Chapl) 92-97; Miss Chapl (ITIM - 
Trading As Converge International) from 97; Chapl, Brisbane Private Hospital from 07; 
L/t Stradbroke 09; L/T Auchenflower 09; L/T Carindale 10; L/T Alexandra Hills 10-11; L/T 
Hendra-Clayfield from 11; L/T Carindale 2012, 2013; Rector Parish of Carindale 13- 18. 
PTO Annerley from Oct 18 PO Box 2252 Mansfield  4122 Mbl: 0406 182 748 email: 
jsearle@ecn.net.au; stgabrielscarindale@gmail.com;  S: Annette:     PTO  
 
SELVAGE, The Rev'd Canon Cheryl Ann b.60. Dip. Sec Teaching (QUT) 80; G.Dip. 
Sp.Ed. (Griffith Uni) 89; G.Dip Ex. Children (Uni Sthern Qld) 91; M.Ed. (Uni Sthern Qld) 
96; Grad Cert Mental Health (Monash) 2005; B.Th (BCT) 08; D.09; P.09; CPE 08; A/g L1 
Super CPE Nov. 2011-2014;;Assist Curate Mt Gravatt 09-11; Hon Assist Priest from 
2011; Pastoral Care Co-Ord, PA Hospital & Brisbane Regn. 2011-2014; Diocesan 
Hospital Ministry Co-ordinator from 2014; L 1 Supervisor CPE Sept 2014; A/g Level 2 
CPE 2016; Residentiary Canon St John's Cathedral from 2016.  Lot 13, Rocheadon 
Drive, Eatons Hill 4037 Tel: 0407 585 270(BH) Mbl: 0413 585 179 email: 
cselvage@anglicanchurchsq.org.au; olytrans2@hotmail.com;  S: Ross:              Active  
 
SHAW, The Rev'd Dr George Peter b.34; St Michael's Th Coll, Crafers, SA; ThL (ACT) 
58; BA (1st Cl Hons, Hist) (Univ of Qld) 66; PhD (ANU) 70; D.57; P.59 Bris for Rockptn; 
A.C. St Luke's, Wandal 59-60; A.C. Longreach 60; Dio of Rockptn; V. St Hugh's, Inala 
60-65; PTO Dio of Bris 65-66; PTO Dio Canb-Goulb 67-70; Lect in Hist, Univ of Qld 70; 
PTO Dio of Bris 71-82; Miss Chapl, Fellowship of St John 82- 04; Abp's Cert for Officiating 
on Special Occasions from 04.  Suite 2901, Sebel Suites, Brisbane  4000 (PO Box 15218, 
City East B C,  Brisbane   4002) Tel: 3211 7715 email: georgepshaw@optusnet.com.au;  
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S: Jan:                   Archbishop's Cert  
 
SHAW, The Rev'd Garth Thomas b.51; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 97; Grad Dip Min 
(BCT) 98; D.97; P.98; A.C. St Matthew's, Drayton 97-99; A.C. St Paul's, Cleveland 99-
2000; P-in-C St Martin's, Tara 2000-04; P-in-C Christ Church, St George with Dirranbandi 
04-11. Area Dean Maranoa 08-11; R. Pittsworth from 11-18; Exam Chpln from 2012. Area 
Dean Toowoomba 16-17. PTO Parish of St James' Toowoomba.  4 Cedar Street East 
Toowoomba 4350 Tel: 07 46387117 Mbl: 0447 745 997 email: garthshaw@bigpond.com 
S: Jan: PTO-- --- Shayler-Webb, The Rev'd Peter b.57; Ripon Coll, Cuddesdon, UK; B 
Sc 81; B Arch 83 (Bath Univ); Dip Min (Cuddesdon) 95; D.95, P.96 Dio of St Alban's, UK; 
A.C. St Paul's, Bedford, Dio of St Alban 95-99; Assoc V. St Martin's, Dorking, Dio of 
Guildford UK 99-04; R. St Matthew's, Sherwood from 04.  41 Kathleen Street, Corinda  
4075 (PO Box 107, Sherwood  4075) Tel: 3379 3437(BH) Mbl: 0439 770 487 email: 
psw5957@gmail.com;  S: Claire:                    Active  
 
SHEEHAN, The Rev'd Patrick Edward Anthony(Tony) b.37; Campion House Middx UK 
58-62; English Coll Lisbon 62-68; D.67 Lisbon, Portugal, P.69 Surrey UK(RC); C. 
Ballspond Rd London 69-73; C. Clapham 73-75; P-in-C Wimbledon 75-77; R. Balga WA 
77-80; R. Melville WA 80-85; Chapl RNH 85-90; ARes 83-94; Chapl Jo Hunter Hosp 91-
97; R.Terrigal 97-01; PTO Dio of Bris from 02.  22 Abby Crescent, Ashmore  4214 Tel: 
5564 7064  S: Ann:             Retired PTO  
 
SHEPHARD, The Rev'd Allan George b.38; St John's Coll, Morpeth 61; ThL (Hons 2nd 
Cl) (ACT) 61; D.61; P.62 Grafton; A.C. St John's, Coffs Harbour 61-63; Asst P. St 
Andrew's, Lismore 63-66; R. St Stephen's, Dorrigo 66-70; Dio of Grafton; Asst Chapl 
Missions to Seamen, Dio of Syd 70-71; R. St James', Kyogle 71-77; R. St Andrew's, 
Lismore 77-84; Dio of Grafton; R. St Andrew's, Lutwyche 84-92; Rural Dean Bris Nth East 
87-92; R. St James' Toowoomba 92-2000; Area Dean of Toowoomba 92-97; Dio Chapl 
Cursillo Movement 90-91; Dio Chapl Mothers' Union 94-2000; Archdeacon of the Downs 
97-2000; R. St David's, Chelmer 2000-02; PTO (Retired) St Mark's Clayfield from 02; 
Archbishops Examining Chapln 08-18. Locum Tenens Stradbroke Island 09-2016. Locum 
Tenens St James' Cathedral Townsville June-July 17.  Saville Row North, 2/108 Chalk 
Street, Lutwyche  4030 (PO Box 995, Lutwyche  4030) Tel: 3357 5518 Mbl: 0419 712 
260 email: agshephard@bigpond.com;  S: Dawn:          Retired PTO  
 
SHEPHERD, The Rev'd Judith Lesley b.54; GradCert HRM (CQU) 02; BTh (CSU) 13; 
D.13. (Rockh) Hon.Dcn. Nth Rockh 13-16; (Dio Bris) PTO Grovely from 16; Pastoral Carer 
RBWH (P/T) from 16.   (21 Glen Holm Street, Mitchelton 4053) Tel: 3855 9298 Mbl: 0499 
432 090 email: fitzgerald_shepherd@yahoo.com.au:       PTO  
 
SHEPPERSON, The Rev'd Ann b.49; St Francis' Coll; Cert Tchg (KGTC) 68; BTh (BCT) 
08; Dip Chaplaincy (MACCM) 13; D.07; P.08; A.C. St Mark's, Buderim from 07; Half Time 
A.C. St Mark's Buderim (with special resp for Parish of Palmwoods) 08- 10; PinC 2010-
13; Pastoral Care Co-Ord. Nambour Hospital from 11; PTO Parish of Gympie 2013; Hon 
Assist Priest Parish of Gympie 13 -18. Pastoral Care Co-ordinator Sunshine Coast Uni 
Hospital from 17. Hon. Ass. Priest Maleny from 18.  35 Landershute Road, Palmwoods 
4555 (PO Box 547 Palmwoods 4555) Tel: 5202 8961(BH) 5445 9026(AH) Personal Mbl: 
0408 983 193 Mbl: 0408 983 193 email: annshepperson@gmail.com;:                 Active  
 
SHIELD, The Rev'd Dr Barry Graham b.39; St Francis' Coll; BA (Univ of Qld) 79; Dip Th 
(ACT) 81; Grad Dip Ed (Univ of New Eng) 84; Grad Dip Rel Ed (McAuley Coll) 84; Master 
of Letters (Church History) (Univ of New Eng) 86; MA (Appl Th) (Univ of Kent at Cantab 
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UK) 95; PhD (WIU) 02; D.83, P.84 Dio of NQ; A.C. St Paul's, Charters Towers 83-85; 
Asst Priest and Asst Chapl All Souls' and St Gabriel's School, Charters Towers 85-89; 
Dio of NQ; PTO Dio of Bris 90-96; L/t Parish of St John, Swalecliffe, Dio of Cantab UK 
94-95; P-in-C, Holy Trinity, Taroom 96-04; L/T Parish of North Perrett with Haselbury
Plucknett and Misterton, Dio of Somerset UK 2000-01; PTO Dio of Bris 04-17. Archbishop
Certificate to Officiate on Special Occasions from 17.  2/1 Sixth Avenue, Woorim 4507
Tel: 3408 2212 email: barryshield2@bigpond.com;  S: Janice:            Archbishop's Cert

SIMPSON, The Rev'd John Barrie b.34; Ridley Coll, Melb; Th Dip 70; D.58; P.60; A.C. St 
Mark's, East Brighton 58-61; A.C. All Saints', Greensborough 61-62; V. St Faith's, 
Montmorency 62-70; Dio of Melb; Chapl ARA 69-89; HQ 6 TF/SQ Area 69-70; On Active 
Service Sth Vietnam 70-71 (Sen Chapl 71); Chapl HQ 6 TF (SQ Area 9 RAR and 6 RAR) 
71-73; Sen Chapl HQ 1 Div 73-74; Area Chapl DSG, Puckapunyal 74-79; Chapl 1 Mil
Hosp 79-80; Chapl HQ 6 TF (6 RAR) 80-82; Chapl 1 RTB Kapooka 82-84; Chapl HQ 3
MD (DSU Watsonia) 84-85; DSU Liverpool 85-86; Chapl HQ 1 MD (1 Mil Hosp Yeronga)
86-89; PTO Dio of Bris 70-74; Wangaratta 75-79; Bris 79- 82; Riverina 82-84; Canb-
Goulb 82-84; Melb 84-86; Syd 86-87; Bris 87-89; Assoc P. St Matthew's, Grovely 89-90;
P-in-C St Paul's, Samford 90-92; Chapl ITIM 90-92; Snr Police Chapl, Qld Police Service
92-97; PTO Dio of Bris from 97-18. Arch Cert from 18.  North Lakes Retirement Resort,
249/60 Endeavour Boulevard, North Lakes 4509 Tel: 3482 5249 Mbl: 0418 754 377
email: simpsonjb01@gmail.com;  S: Brenda:              Archbishop's Cert

SIMPSON, The Rev'd Julie Margaret Anne b.39; St Francis' Coll; D.03; Hon Deacon, St 
Mark's, Warwick 03-12; PTO (Rtd) St Mark's, Warwick from 2012.  112/5 Regency Drive, 
Warwick  4370 Tel: 4661 1771 Mbl: 0419 679 142 email: juliesimpson6@bigpond.com:  

 Retired PTO 

SIMSON, The Rev'd Jennifer Gay b.50; St Francis' Coll; Assoc Dip Min (BCT) 97; B.Th. 
(BCT) 09; Accredited Spiritual Director (MEC Brookfield) 2011; MA (Theol) (ACU) 2012; 
D.97; P.10; Hon Deacon, St Mark's, Clayfield 97-99; Hon Deacon, St Andrew's, Lutwyche
07- 10; Hon AC Lutwyche from 10; L/T Grovely 2011;; PinC Grovely 2012-2015; Rector
Parish of Grovely from 15.  35 Church Rd, Mitchelton  4053 Tel: 3855 1314(BH) 3855
1314.(AH) Mbl: 0434 917 221 email: priestatgrovely@bigpond.com;  S: Paul:          Active

SITARAM, The Rev'd Daniel b.63; Grad.Dip.Ed (Univ South Pacific) 98; B.Arts (Univ SP) 
95; BThl (Uni Auckland) 07; D.91; P.92; (Dio Polynesia) Dcn St Thomas; 89-92; Asst P. 
St Matthews 92-95; Tchr St Thomas Cath. Sch. 1996; Chpln All Saints Sec. Schl. 97-98; 
St Christopher's 99-01; (Dio Christchurch) Asst P. St Martin's 01-02; Asst P. St John's 
03-05; St John's Coll. 05-07; Hon P. St Thomas 08- 09; Hon P. St Paul's 09-13; Chpln
Port of Auckland 03-14; (Dio Waikato & Taranki) Chpln Hamilton Hosp. 14-17; (Dio
Brisbane) PinC Parish of Stanthorpe from 2017.   (2 Corundum Street, Stanthorpe 4380)
Tel: 4681 3030(BH) Mbl: 0447 743 781 email: sitaramdaniel@yahoo.com;  S: Gita:

 Active 

SKETCHER, The Rev'd Trevor b.60; GradDipTch. (Mt Gravatt CAE) 82; BA (Griffith Uni) 
82; BTh (ACT) 90; MEd (Uni S.A.) 98; D.2015; Assist Curate Parish of Surfer's Paradise 
2015.-2016. Assist Priest Surfer's Paradise from 2016.   (18 Loweana Street, Southport 
4215) Tel: 5591 4480 Mbl: 0410 364 392 email: tsketcher60@gmail.com;  S: Deborah:  

 Active 

SLIGO, The Rev'd Bruce James b.49; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 74; D.75; P.76; A.C. 
St Clement's, Stafford 75-76; A.C. St Matthew's, Drayton 76-77; A.C. St Mark's, Warwick 
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77; P-in-C St Peter's, Millmerran 77-81; Dio of Bris; Asst P. St John's, Darlinghurst, Dio 
of Syd 81-83; Assoc P. St Andrew's, Caloundra 83-85; P-in-C 85-86; P-in-C Kawana 
Waters 87-93; R. St Matthew's, Sherwood 93-04; Area Dean of Brisbane South West 
02-04; PTO issued by Abp of Canterbury under measure 1967 and affirmed by the Dio
of Salisbury (UK) as Vicar of Bearwood in the team ministry of Canford Magna Parish
(Feb-April 2003); R. St Luke's, Toowoomba 04-09. AsstP St Cuthbert's, Tweed
Heads (Grafton) 10-11; R. All Saints Murwillumbah (Grafton) 12-15; PTO Gold Coast
North from 18. 6 Clifford Crescent Banora Point  2486 Tel: 07 5524 9619 Mbl: 0481
069 497 email: brucesligo@gmail.com; S: Pamela:      PTO

SMITH, The Rev'd Canon Gary Leonard Douglas b.41; St Francis' Coll; AAUQ (Univ of 
Qld) 70; B Com (Univ of Qld) 72; CA 85; FCPA 87; B Th (BCT) 92; Research Fellow 
(Griffith Uni) 93-97;D.90; P.91; A.C. St Paul's, Cleveland 90-93; P-in-C Prov Par of St 
Anne's, Albany Creek 93-97 (renamed Prov Par of South Pine 94); P-in-C Biggera 
Waters 97-06 (renamed Parish of Biggera Waters-Coomera Valley 2000); Hon Canon, 
St John's Cathl from 04; Mission Chaplain (Executive Director, Parishes and 
Other Mission Agencies Commission) 06-09. Retired 31 January 09; PTO Biggera 
Waters from 09; Canon Emeritus St John's Cathedral from 2013; L/T Robina 2015; 
L/T Logan, Inala & Sunnybank 2015; L/T Gold Coast North 17. Member Coomera Ang 
Coll. Council; Member FDSC from 11. Assoc Priest Gold Coast North October - January 
2017; Assoc. Priest GC North 21 May 17- 30 April 18.  Halcyon Greens Site 46 / 7 
Halcyon Dve Pimpama  4209 Mbl: 0407 141 468 email: garymarg1@bigpond.com;  S: 
Margaret:                                                                                                  Retired PTO

SMITH, The Rev'd Howard Greig b.63.BTh (St Francis' BCT) 93; D.93 (Rockh); P.94 
(Rokh). JP(Cdec) Rel Chpln Rockh CC 93-97; AsstC Frenchville 93-98; PinC Clermont 
98; R. 00-01; CEBS Chpln 94-01; R. St Charles' West Mackay 01-06; PTO Mackay
09-12. (Dio NQ) R.Bowen 13-16; (Bris) PinC Parish Bramble Bay 16-17. Rector Parish
Bramble Bay 17. 38 Baringa St, Clontarf 4019 PO Box 94, Margate 4019
Mbl: 0419 977 852 email: bramblebayparish@bigpond.com;
smithhk@mackay.matilda.net.au; S: Karen:      Active

SMITH, The Rev'd James Cameron b.42; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 86; D.87; P.88; 
A.C. St James', Toowoomba 87-90; Chapl RAAF from 90; RAAF Base, Richmond
90-94; ATO Sydney 1990-1994; RAAF Base, Amberley 95-97; PTO Dio of Bris 95-97;
Assoc P. St Peter's, Coolangatta 97-98; P-in-C from 98. Seconded to Defence Force
(RAAF Base, Amberley) Sep 99-May 2000; R. St Mary's, Bardon 2000- 02;
Chaplain RAAF Williamtown 02; PTO Newcastle 02; Tindal 03; PTO Northern Territory
03; PTO (Ret) Dio of Bris 03-12; L/T Tennant Creek 06; L/T Tennant Creek 2007; PTO
(Rtd) Coolangatta-Palm Beach 12-14; ATO Grafton 2014; PTO Parish of Bardon 2014.
2/438 Coolangatta Road, Tugun  4224 Tel: 5630 4389 Mbl: 0419 653 549 
candlesmiths@bigpond.com;  S: Prue:                                                                       PTO

SMITH, The Rev'd Mary Jane b.41; St Francis' Coll; BD (Hons) (Univ of Lond) 63; Grad 
Dip Lib Sc (QIT) 84; MA St Th (Univ of Qld) 96; D.93; P.95; A.C. St Andrew's, 
Indooroopilly 93-94; Hon A.C. Kingston-Woodridge 94-95; Assoc P. 95-2000; Asst Chapl 
Canterbury Coll from 97; Hon Asst P. Parish of Logan 2000-02; P-in-C Stradbroke Island 
02-07; Chapl at Canterbury College 08- 30 November 2012; PTO Logan from 2012.  85
Wagensveldt Street, Slacks Creek 4127 Tel: 3299 4649 Mbl: 0400 716 864 email:
revmaryjane59@gmail.com:            Retired PTO

SMITH, The Rev'd Thomas b.29; St Francis' Coll; Dip Th 85; D.82; P.84; Hon A.C. 
Bramble Bay 82-87; P-in-C All Saints', Monto 87-91; P- in-C Cooroora 91-95; PTO Dio of 
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Bris 9-08; Abp's Cert for Officiating on Special Occasions from 09.  Unit 81, 183 
Karawatha Drive,  Buderim Meadows  4556 Tel: 5444 6396  S: Rose: Archbishop's Cert 

SNAPE, The Rev'd David Roy b.53; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip; Grad Dip Min (BCT) 2009 
D.85; P.86; A.C. St Barnabas', Sunnybank 85-87; A.C. St Thomas', Beaudesert 87-88;
P-in-C St Luke's, Miles 88-91; Army Res Chapl from 89; HQ 6BDE(49 RQR); P-in-C St
Alban's, Cunnamulla 91-95; R. St David's, Allora 95-99; P-in-C Brisbane Valley 99-01;
Chapl ARA from 02; Mission Chapl (Defence Force - 7 Sigs Regt, Cabarlah) 02-03;
Chapl, 1 Armoured Regt, Palmerston, Dio of NT, 04; Chapl, 5 Aviation Regt, Townsville
from 05; PTO Dio of Bris 05-06; Deployed HQ633 Chaplain HQ Jan - Aug 06 Op Catalyst
Iraq; Co-ord Chapl Darling Downs, Army Aviation Training Centre 06-07; Mission Chapl
(Defence Force) 07; LTS Masters of Ministry Study 2007-08; Locum Millmerran/Leyburn
from 2009; Co-Ord Chapl Darling Downs, Army Aviation Training Centre Oakey 09-2014;
Chap 6ESR Regiment Amberley : Weekly address Unit 5/3 Pine Street, North Ipswich
4305 from 2014. Co-ord Chaplain Darling Downs HQ Aviation Training Centre Swartz
Barracks Oakey Qld from 17. .  34 Elizabeth Street, Toowoomba 4350 Tel: 0419 683
936(BH) 46359086(AH) Mbl: 0475125471 email: padresnape@bigpond.com;  S: Denise:

 Mission Chaplain 

SOLARI, The Rev'd Dr Ann b.58. MBChB Bristol Univ UK 86; Grad Dip GP (Monash Uni) 
2000; Grad Dip Th (CSU) 05; D.04; Hon D Christ Church Cathedral Dio Grafton; Hon. D 
Dio Brisbane, St John's Cathedral Brisbane from 08.  373 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000 
(GPO Box 421 Brisbane 4001)  Mbl: 0424 423 972 email: annsolari@westnet.com.au:  

 Active 

SPARKS, The Rev'd Tiffany Fleur Maree b.81. B.Soc.Sc (ACU 2007); B.Th (Hons) (ACU 
09); D.11; P.11; AC The Gap 2011; Assist Priest The Gap 2011-12; PinC Parish of Ithaca-
Ashgrove 12-17; R Parish of Ithaca-Ashgrove from 17.  POBox 31, Ashgrove 4060 (PO 
Box 31, Ashgrove 4060) Tel: 3366 2320(BH) Mbl: 0405 224 616 email: tiffany@sparks.to;  
S: Grant:                       Active  

SPREADBOROUGH, The Rev'd Kenneth John b.43; St Francis' Coll; Cert Tchg (BCAE) 
62; B Ed (BCAE) 82; Grad Dip Comp Ed (BCAE) 85; B Th (BCT) 98; D.92; P.97; Hon 
A.C. St Thomas', Beaudesert 92-93; Hon A.C. Prov Par of Jimboomba 94-97; A.C. St
Peter's, Wynnum 98- 2000; P-in-C, Coolangatta 2000-2011; Area Dean of the Gold Coast
01-07; Abp's Exam Chapl from 06;Chair Diocesan ABM Cttee from 2011; PTO
Jimboomba from 2011; L/Tenans Beaudesert April-Jul 2013; L/T, St George 2013-5.  220
Dennis Road, Cedar Vale 4285 Tel: 5543 2189 Mbl: 0418 838 013 email: 
kspread@bigpond.net.au;  S: Betty:  Retired PTO 

STALLEY, The Rev'd Michael David b.69; St Francis' Coll; Dip App Sc - Pod (QUT) 89; 
B Th (BCT) 99; Grad Dip Min Distinction (CSU) 2016. D.99; P.2000; A.C. Holy Trinity, 
Goondiwindi 2000-01; A.C. St James', Toowoomba 02; A.C. St Peter's, Southport 03-04; 
Assoc P. Biggera Waters-Coomera Valley 05-12; PinC Parish of Chelmer-Graceville 
2013-2015; Rector, Parish of Chelmer-Graceville from 2015. Area Dean of Bris. Sth Wst 
from 17.  22 Moolanda Street Jindalee 4074 (62 Chelmer Street East, Chelmer 4068) Tel: 
3379 8894(BH) 3379 8894(AH) Mbl: 0407 466 108 email: 
michael@stdavidschelmer.com.au;  S: Catherine:  Active 

STEELE, The Rev'd Gordon Danby b.37; St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 61; D.60; P.61; A.C. 
St Barnabas', Sunnybank 61-62; A.C. St Paul's Cathl, Dio of Rockptn 62-63; A.C. Beech 
Forest, 63-65; V. St Luke's, St Stephen's and St Mark's, Ballarat 65-69; R. Rupanyup 69-
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72; Dio of Ballarat; PTO Dio of Bris 84-07; PTO Nambour 07-09; PTO (Retired) Grovely 
09-2017; Archbishop's Certificate to Officiate on Special Occasions from 2017.  25
Balvenie Street Keperra 4054 Tel: 3851 4284 Mbl: 0419 749 546 email: 
gdsgsteele@gmail.com;  S: Sue:  Retired PTO 

STEPHENS, The Rev'd Graham Frederick b.35; Ridley Coll, Melb; D.68; P.69 Melb; A.C. 
Greensborough 68-70; C-in-C Winchelsea 70-71; I. 71-73; I. Springvale 73-76; Dio of 
Melb; A.C. St John's, Dalby 76-79; R. St John's, Upper Mt Gravatt 79-2000 (parish divided 
and renamed Wishart Nov 95); PTO Dio of Bris from 2000.  30 Vanderbilt Street, Eight 
Mile Plains  4113 Tel: 3841 0959 Mbl: 0438 553 141 S: Sally:        Retired PTO 

STEPHENSON, The Rev'd Michael Paul b.45; St Francis' Coll; BD (Univ of Qld) 69; ADA 
(Griffith Univ) 95; Univ of Leeds 70-71; RE Tchr, Swinton Comp Schl 71-72; D.72; P.73; 
A.C. All Saints', Chermside 72-75; Chapl Prince Charles Hosp 75-83; Chapl Princess
Alexandra Hosp and P-in-C St Philip's, Thompson Estate 83-91; A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich
91-92; PTO Dio of Bris from 92.  12 Toombul Terrace,  Nundah  4012 Tel: 3266 9462
Mbl: 0403 276 050 email: michael_stephenson286945@hotmail.com;          Retired PTO

† STEVENS, The Right Rev'd Dr Douglas Robert b.52; BA (Newc) 78; BTh(Hons) 
(Morpeth) 78; MPhil (Ecum) (Trinity Coll Dublin) 85; Grad Cert CLM (CSU) 96; 
DMinsStuds (MCD) 06; D.79 (Newc.); P.79 (Newc.); C 05 (Riv).Asst C Toronto 79-80; R. 
Merriwa 81-84; Pastoral Asst St Francis Xavier Gardiner St Dublin (Roman Catholic) & 
PTO Dublin/Glendalough (Church of Ireland) 84-85; Assoc. P. Christ Church Cathedral 
(Newc.) 85; PinC Bolton Point/Teralba 86-90; Chpln CA Brown Anglican Village 86-90; 
Visiting Lecturer Morpeth 89- 90; Chair Hunter Churches Assoc 89-90; R Wingham 90-
94; R Nambucca Heads 94-98; Nambucca/Bellinger Reg Min Co-Ord. 95-98;  Dio 
Education Officer 94-05; Canon Christ Church Cathl 97-05; R Tweed Heads 99-05; Dio 
Riverina: Bp Riv 05-12; Anglican Co-Chair AUSTARC 08; Chair NSW Provincial 
Commission on Christian Education 08; Co-Chair AUSTARC 08 - 17; Dio Brisbane: R Mt 
Gravatt from 2012; Anglican Member NCCA from 2014; Area Dean Moreton from 2015. 
Chair Bne Diocesan Ecumenical Affairs Committee from 17   PO Box 334, Mansfield 4122 
Tel: 3849 4411(BH) 3343 3479(AH) Mbl: 0413 805 010 email: bishdoug1@yahoo.com; 
S: Denise:                      Active  

STEWART, The Rev'd Dr Donald Edward AM 1991 b.36; Dip M & E Engr (Qld Ed Dept) 
65; Kenmore Christian Coll Dip (Hons) 69; BA (Univ of Qld) 69; BD (MCD) 74; D Min 
(Fuller Theol Sem USA) 87; FAIM 87; (Churches of Christ: Ordained Minister 68; Minister, 
Traralgon Vic 69-72, Snr Min Hobart Tas 73-78; Exec Dir, Churches of Christ Care Qld 
79-01, National President 89-90; National V Pres Qld 90-97; National Senior V Pres 97-
2000; Retired 01).  Received into the Anglican Church 2004, St Francis' Coll 04; D. 04;
P.05; Hon Dcn, St Paul's, Ipswich 04-05; Hon A.C. 05-06; PTO Ipswich from 06.  51
Sunshine Crescent, Brassall  4305 (PO Box 5341, Brassall  4305) Tel: 3813 0320 Mbl:
0419 705 479 email: biber51@optusnet.com.au;  S: Gillian:         Retired PTO

STEWART, The Rev'd Philip Nixon b.36; B Sc App (Univ of Qld) 59; Post Grad Dip Sugar 
Tech (Univ of Qld) 60; D.82 P.85 Dio of NQ; Dcn St Margaret's, West Cairns 82-85; P. St 
John's, Cairns 85-86; C. St Matthew's, Mundingburra 86-87; C. St Luke's, Sarina 87-88; 
R. 88-90; R. St Margaret's, West Cairns 91-01; PTO Dio of Bris from 02.  47 Kalimna
Drive, Clontarf  4019 Tel: 3885 4647(BH) email: philhelenstewart@hotmail.com;  S:
Helen:             Retired PTO

STONIER, The Rev'd Alfred James Arthur b.34; Cert.Ed. (QUT) 1953; Ridley Coll, Melb; 
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ThL (2nd Cl Hons) (ACT) 62; B Ed (Univ of Qld) 70;Grad Dip RE (Melb Coll of Div) 73; 
BD (Univ of Qld) 76; M Ed St (Univ of Qld) 82; D & P 63; A.C. All Saints', Booval 63-66; 
P-in-C All Saints', Monto 66-68; R. 68-72; Asst Chapl The Southport School 72-73; Chapl
The Southport School 73-01; Area Dean of the Gold Coast 94-97; Hon Asst P. Surfers
Paradise 02-04; PTO 04-2016; PTO (Rtd) Coorparoo from 2016. L/T Coorparoo 17-18.
23 Ontario Street, Holland Park West 4121 Mbl: 0422 958 019 email: 
jimanddianastonier@gmail.com;  S: Diana:  Retired PTO 

STOWER, The Rev'd Rosanne May b.50; St Francis' Coll; D. 05; Hon Dcn, Biggera 
Waters-Coomera Valley from 05 (C/- Gold Coast North Anglican Church, 142 Billinghurst 
Crescent, Upper Coomera 4209) Tel: 5580 7800 (Mon/Tues)(BH) Mbl: 0421 725 275 
email: chros4@optusnet.com.au;  S: Chris:                   Active  

STRONG, The Rev'd Owen Trevor b.47; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 76; BA (CQU) 93; 
D & P 77; A.C. ChCh Bundaberg 77-78; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 78-80; P-in-C St 
John's, Mundubbera-Eidsvold 80-81; R. 81-83; Dio of Bris; R. St Barnabas, Nth Rockptn 
83-90; Hosp Chapl, Rockptn 91-93; Area Dean, Central Deanery, Rockptn 91-93; Dio of
Rockptn; Dio of Bris; Chapl, Wolston Park Hospital from 93- 2000; Hospital Chaplaincy
Co-ordinator, Dio of Bris 97-07; P-in-C, Christ Church, Milton 2000-06. PTO Toowong 07-
2014; L/T Ipswich 15-16. PTO Chelmer-Graceville from 17.  24 Queenscroft Street,
Chelmer 4068 Tel: 3162 1125 Mbl: 0421 257 503 email: owenstrong@optusnet.com.au;
S: Pat:              Retired PTO

STRUGNELL, The Rev'd Dr John Richard b.30; Wells Th Coll 54; BA Lon 52; MA Leeds 
61; PhD Qld 77; D.56; P.57; C. St Wilfrid, Halton, 56- 59; P-in-C Alwoodley 59-62; Dio of 
Ripon; Lect in Eng, Univ Coll, Townsville 62; Lect in Eng, Univ of Qld 65; Snr Lect in Eng 
75; PTO Dio of Bris 65-82; Miss Chapl, Fellowship of St John 82-2000; PTO (Ret) 2000-
04; Abp's Cert for Officiating on Special Occasions from 04.  231 Grandview Road, 
Pullenvale  4069 Tel: 3374 1776  S: Maureen:              Archbishop's Cert  

STUART, The Rev'd George Steven b.51; Moore Coll, Syd; ThL (ACT); D & P 83; A.C. 
St Matthew's, Sherwood 83-86; P-in-C Holy Trinity, Taroom 86-91; Assoc Minister St 
John's Upper Mt Gravatt 91-95; P-in-C St Philip's, Rochedale from 96.  27 Lenore 
Crescent,  Springwood  4127 Tel: 3290 2300 email: geosstuart@gmail.com;  S: Ruth:  

 Active 

SUDDICK, The Rev'd James Kenneth b.51; St Francis' Coll; Dip App Sc (Nursing Ed) 
(QIT) 80; BA (Univ of Qld) 82; M Ed St (Univ of Qld) 89; B Th (BCT) 93; D.92; P.93; A.C. 
St Barnabas, Sunnybank 92-94; P-in-C Prov Par of Nerang 94-98; R. St Catherine's, 
Centenary Suburbs 98-2000; PTO Dio of Bris 2000-03; R. St Bartholomew's, Mt Gravatt 
03-Dec 2010; Archdeacon Moreton 07-2010; PTO Logan 2010. On leave from the
Diocese 2010-2012; Rector, Aspley Albany Creek 2012-2013; Archdeacon Lilley 2012-
2014; PinC (P/T) Freshwater Bay 2014-2016; PTO North Pine from 17.  4 North Quay,
Scarborough 4020 Tel: 3203 2440(BH) 3885 8420(AH) Mbl: 0409 276 336 email:
ksudick@gmail.com;  S: Janice:         PTO

SULLIVAN, The Rev'd Thomas Edward b.55; St Francis' Coll; BA Theol (UofQld) 83; 
Grad Dip Bus (QUT) 89; Cert IV Workplace Assess & Training (Yeronga TAFE) 2000; 
Cert in Sports Chaplaincy (SCA) 11; SCP Society of Catholic Priests; JP; D & P 83; A.C. 
St Luke's, Ekibin 83-85; Miss Chapl (Fld Offcr for Youth) 85-88; PTO 89-96; Hon Assoc 
P. St Barnabas', Ithaca-Red Hill 97-98; PTO 98-02; Chapl at Cannon Hill Anglican College
02-09; Army Reserve Chaplain from 08, R St Thomas' Toowong from 09; Assist Chapl
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Order of St Lazarus 13; Chapl Order of St Lazarus from 14-18; Area Dean, Brisbane West 
Deanery 2014-2017. ((Parish Office) 3/96 Jephson Street, Toowong 4066) Tel: 3870 
1655(BH) Mbl: 0422 641 657 email: toowonganglican@gmail.com;  S: Sandra:      Active 

SVENSEN, The Rev'd Theodor Winston William b.43; BA (UQ) 63; ThA. (ACT) 63; Dip.Ed 
(UQ) 64; Dip Youth Ldrship (Nat YMCA Coll. Ldrship trning) 68; MA (UQ) 66; Bed. (UQ) 
70; MA Lit. Studies (UQ) 77; Cert IV TESOL (Language Trning Institute) 02; Hon Deacon 
Parish of Nambour from 2012.  Laural Springs Retirement Centre 24/18 Doolan Street 
Nambour 4560 Tel: 5476 3292 email: winsven@hotmail.com:        Retired PTO 

SWANSSON, The Rev'd Anthony Paul b.52; St Barnabas Th Coll; B Th, Dip PS (Flinders 
Univ) 91; D & P Dio of Adel 91; A.C. Modbury 91-93; A.C. Warradale 93-94; A.C. Glen 
Osmond 94-95; P-in-C Hillcrest 96-99; Locum Para Hills 99; Dio of Adel; PTO Dio of Bris 
2000; PTO Drayton 05-08; Visiting Locum for Millmerran 06-09; Locum Tenens Alora 
Clifton 09; PinC Kingaroy from 09-13; Area Dean Twmba and Bunya Deaneries 2013-
2014; Rector, Kingaroy 14; Rector, Parish of Beaudesert from 2014.  9 Albert Street, 
Beaudesert 4285 (PO Box 74, Beaudesert 4285) Tel: 55413427(BH) Mbl: 0439 876 110 
email: swonkers@bigpond.com;  S: Kate:                   Active  

TAIT, The Rev'd James Laurence Jamieson b.47; St John's Coll, Durham, UK; D.80, P.81 
Dio of Manchester, UK; A.C., St Marks, Heyside 80-81 Dio Manchester, UK; A.C. St 
Bartholomew's, Westhoughton 81-84; , Dio of Manchester UK; R. United Benefice of 
Aldingham, Dendron and Rampside, Dio of Carlisle UK 84-88; V. St John the Baptist, Dio 
of Carlisle UK 88-92; V St John the Baptist, Hunterville, Dio of Wellington NZ 92-95; V. 
St Peter's,Palmerston North, Dio of Wellington 95-06; Police Chaplain, Police Central 
District NZ 96-06. Dio of Wellington NZ liaison to Dio of Brisbane Aust 02-06. PTO Bribie 
Island 07-17; Archbishop’s Cert from 17  1 York Court Sandstone Point 4511 Tel: 3408 
2773 email: bledisloe100@bigpond.com.au;              Archbishop's Cert  

TALBOT, Gavin Ian b.50; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 97; D.97; P.98; A.C. St Barnabas' 
Sunnybank 97-99; P-in-C Goonaneman (amalgamation of Childers with Biggenden and 
Gin Gin) 99-03; R. St Matthias', Zillmere 03-08; (Dio Newcastle) Rector, St Paul's 
Stockton 08-2013; P/T PinC Parish of Mudgeeraba 2014-2017.  12 Mount Bilinga Circuit, 
Bilambil Heights 2486 Tel: (07) 5590 8270 Mbl: 0407 576 345 email: 
gavintalbot50@gmail.com;  S: Louise:  Active 

TALBOT, The Rev'd Daniel John b.78; St Francis' Coll; B.Bus (ACU) 99; Grad Dip Th 
(BCT) 04; MA (Theol)(ACU) 06; D.04; P.05; A.C. Holy Spirit, Surfers Paradise 04-08; P-
in-C, St James the Great, Jimboomba 08-18; Hon Police Chaplain 2011-2014; P/T Stip 
Police Chpln from 2014; Rector, St James the Great, Jimboomba from 18.  47-57 East 
Street, Jimboomba  4280 (PO Box 279 Jimboomba  4280) Tel: 5546 0644(BH) 5548 
7356(AH) Mbl: 0409 898 507 email: dantalbot@bigpond.com;  S: Kylie:                Active  

TEDMAN, The Rev'd Dr Debra Kay b.57; BSc (Griffith Univ) 78; DipTeach(Sec) (Griffith 
Univ) 78; MSc (Griffith Univ) 85; PhD (Flinders Univ) 98; Cert 1 Min (Adel. CD) 01;BTh 
with Distinction (CSU); Chpln All Saints Anglican School (P/T) 2015-17; AC Gold Coast 
South and Assist Chpln TSS 17-18. Hon. Ass. Curate Parish of Surfers Paradise from 19. 
(80 Townson Avenue, Palm Beach 4221) Tel: 5520 1965 Mbl: 0468 406 020 email: 
dktedman@gmail.com; S: Ray:                    Active  

THOMAS, The Rev'd Dr Mervyn Rees b.53; St Francis' Coll; BA (Hons) (Univ of York UK) 
74; D Phil (Univ of York UK) 81;Grad Dip Thl (BCT) 08; D.04; P.10. Hon A.C. St Andrew's, 
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Indooroopilly from 04.  6 Geewan Place, Chapel Hill  4069 Tel: 3503 1765(BH) 3378 
3071(AH) Fax: 3318 7677 Mbl: 0422 405 110 email: mervyn.thomas@emphron.com;  S: 
Susan:                       Active  
 
THOMAS, The Rev'd Edward Bernard Meredith b.21; Coll of Resurr, Mirfield 47; GOE 
49; BA (Univ of Leeds) 44; B Ed (Univ of Qld) 67; BD 71; D.49; P.50 Southwark; C. St 
Mary-the-Less, Lambeth 49-54; St Mark, Portsea, Dio of Portsmouth 54-56; (P-in-C St 
Nicholas 55-56); V. All Saints', Portsea, Dio of Portsmouth 56-64; R. Holy Trinity, 
Woolloongabba, Dio of Bris, 64-72; PTO Dio of Bris 72-78; Miss Chapl 78- 92; PTO Dio 
of Bris from 92.  33 Highfield Street, Durack  4077 Tel: 3372 3517 Mbl: 0416 227 121 
email: bernard_thomas@iinet.net.au:           Retired PTO  
 
THOMAS, The Very Rev'd David Glynne b.41; Westcott House, Cambridge; B Sc 
(Durham Univ) 63; D.67, P.68 London; A.C. St John's Wood Church, Dio of Lond 67-70; 
Minor Canon St Alban's Cathl, Dio of St Albans 70-72; Chapl Wadham Coll and Curate 
Univ Ch of St Mary the Virgin, Oxford 72-75; Dom Chapl to Bp of Oxford 75-78; Team 
Rector Burnham w Dropmore, Hitcham and Taplow 78-83; Dio of Oxford; R. St Peter's, 
Coolangatta 83-86; R. St Luke's Toowoomba 86-87; Dio of Bris; Res Canon and Vice 
Dean, Worcester Cathl 87-99; Dean of St John's Cathedral, Brisbane 99-03; Abp's Chapl 
03-06; Dean Emeritus from 06; PTO Buderim from 06.  173/171 David Low Way Bli Bli  
4560 Tel: 5450 8224 Mbl: 0412 311 603 email: davidthomas@westnet.com.au;  S: 
Jeanette:              Retired PTO  
 
THOMPSON, The Rev'd Lucille Jennifer b.45; Assoc Dip Community Welfare (James 
Cook Univ) 93; B Community Welfare (James Cook Univ) 95; B Health Science (Mental 
Health) (Charles Sturt Univ) 2000; D.95; Deacon, Parish of Cherbourg 95-03; Hon 
Deacon, St Phillip's, Annerley 03-2015; PTO (Rtd) Parish of Annerley from 2015.  C/- 115 
Cornwall Street, Annerley 4102 (C/- Church of Annerley Parish PO Box 6134 
Woolloongabba 4102)  Mbl: 0409 343 414 email: jenwakka8@bigpond.com:  
              Retired PTO  
 
THOMPSON, The Venerable John Carver b.39; St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 64; D & P 
65; A.C. All Saints', Chermside 65-67; A.C. St Matthew's, Grovely 67-68; V. Holy Trinity, 
Taroom 68-71; Dio of Bris; R. Willaura 71-74; R. Ararat , Chpln Aradale Mental Hosp & J 
Ward for the criminally insane; Chpln HM Prison, Ararat; 74-77 Dio of Ballarat; R. St 
Mary's, Redcliffe 77-83; R. St Catherine's, Centenary Suburbs 83-86; R. St Matthew's, 
Drayton 87-91; R.D. of Toowoomba 87-91; R. St Paul's, Roma 91-96; Archd of the West 
91-96; R. St Alban's, Wilston 96-03; Archd of Bris 96-03; Dio Chapl Mothers' Union 2000-
06; PTO (Ret) Drayton from 03-17; Archdeacon Emeritus from 03. Arch Cert from 17.  6 
Rosewood Street Toowoomba 4350 Tel: 4638 9045 email: 
j.thompson10@optusnet.com.au;  S: Jennifer:               Archbishop's Cert  
 
THOROGOOD, The Rev'd Beverley Anne b.53; BA (Univ of Qld) 97; D.98; P.99; Hon 
A.C. St David's, Chelmer-Graceville 98-99; A.C. ChCh Bundaberg 99-03; P-in-C, St 
George's, Crows Nest 03-06; P-in-C, Gatton with Ma Ma Creek 06-11; Assist Priest 
Toowoomba St James from 2011.  U46/6 O'Brien Street, Toowoomba 4350  Mbl: 0418 
189 378 email: beverley.thorogood@bigpond.com:                  Active  
 
TOON, The Venerable Heather St Francis' Coll; Ed Min Cert (GBRE); Assoc Dip Min 
(SFC) 98; D.88; Hon A.C. St Clement's, Stafford 88- 98; Hon Dcn 98-07; Archdeacon of 
the Household of Deacons 96-02; Archdeacon Emeritus from 03; PTO St Clement's, 
Stafford 07-08; PTO St Peter's, Bribie Island 08-2014; PTO Stafford from 2014.  Bluecare 

111

mailto:mervyn.thomas@emphron.com
mailto:bernard_thomas@iinet.net.au
mailto:davidthomas@westnet.com.au
mailto:jenwakka8@bigpond.com
mailto:j.thompson10@optusnet.com.au
mailto:beverley.thorogood@bigpond.com


 

Iona 129 Brookfield Road Kenmore Hills 4069  Mbl: 0412 032 626 email: 
ccollier2@bigpond.com;  S: Bernie:          Retired PTO  
 
TRAILL, The Rev'd Geoffrey Conway b.58. BA 1981; BTh (Ridley ACT) 1987; D.85; 
(Melb) P.85 (Melb). Asst C Frankston 85-86; Asst C Shrub End Colchester (Chelmsford) 
UK 87-88; PinC Corio/Balliang/Anakie 89-92; l Corio & Nth Geelong 92-99; Chap Barwon 
Prison 90- 92; l St James' Point, Lonsdale 99-05; PinC St George's, Queenscliff 02-05. 
RAAChD ARes Chap from 04 SCMA. Western Reg Officer 05-07; Northern & Western 
Regional Officer 07-09. Archdeacon Essendon 07-09; Community Dev Officer, Geelong 
W. Anglicare Victoria 09-10; RAAChD ARA Chaplain 1 RAR 11-12; 10 FSB 13-15; 8/7 
RVR 15-16; 8/9 RAR 17-18; (Dio Brisb) 2 GHB, Gallipoli Barracks, Enoggera from 2019.   
(2nd General Health Battalion BHQ G04 Nimmo Road, Gallipoli Barracks Enoggera 4051) 
Tel: 3332 4921(BH) 0444 520 045(AH) Mbl: 0438 761 327 email: 
geoffrey.traill@defence.gov.au;  S: Heather:                Mission Chaplain  
 
TRIGG, The Rev'd Jane Elizabeth b. 67. CPE ASPEA 06; BTh 2011 MCD; Ad.Dip.Min 
2011 MCD; D. 11. P. 11. Dio of Melb. Parish of St Stephen's & St Mary's Melb, Ass. 
Curate 11-12; Royal Melbourne Hospital, Locum Chaplain 12; Parish of Holy Apostles 
Sunshine, Melb, Ass Curate 13; Parish of St Mary's Ballina & Parish of St John's Lennox 
Head, Grafton, Ass Priest 13-14; Bishop Tyrrell Anglican College, Newcastle, Chaplain 
15; Parish of St John the Divine Branxton & Parish of Holy Trinity Lochinvar, Newcastle, 
P-in-C 16-18. PTO Parish of Gympie from Sept 18.  51 Station Road Gympie 4570  Mbl: 
0430 531 951 email: janetriggforever@gmail.com;:       PTO  
 
TURNBULL, The Rev'd Ian Reginald b.41; St Francis' Coll; D.78; P.79; Th Dip (ACT) 94; 
Grad Dip Min (MCD) 06; A.C. ChCh, Bundaberg 78-80; P-in-C St Matthew's, Gayndah 
80-81; R. St Matthew's, Gayndah 81-83; R. St John's, Enoggera 83-89; A Res Chapl 84-
96; Dio of Bris; R. Longreach 89-96; Archd of the West 89-96; Police Chapl 89-96; Dio of 
Rockptn; R. St Thomas', Beaudesert 96-05; Duty Chapl, Palen Creek Correctional Centre 
98-05; Area Dean of the Hinterland (renamed Logan 24/7/03) 01-04; PTO Dio of 
Leicester, England 02; Priest in the Parish of Texas-Inglewood (L/T) 05; PTO Jimboomba 
06; L/T 07/08;(L/T) Bundaberg 09; PTO Logan from 2012; L/T Algester 2013 -2014.  6 
Sales Street, Jimboomba   4280 (PO Box 604, Jimboomba   4280) Tel: 5547 7705 Mbl: 
0419 673 873 email: Ian.kayt13@bigpond.com;  S: Kathleen:       Retired PTO  
 
TUTIN, The Rev'd Canon Richard Brendon b.53; St Francis' Coll; BD (Univ of Qld) 76; M 
Prof Comm (USQ) 03; MTh (CSU) 2013; D.77; P.78; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 77-78; 
A.C. ChCh, Bundaberg 78-79; V. St Mary's, Gin Gin 79-82; Asst Sec ABM 82-84; Miss 
Chapl Dio of Bris 84-86; Qld Reg Rep ABM Qld 84-86; R. Devonport 86-90; Dio of 
Tasmania; Lect Biblical Studies Morpeth 90-91; Actg Principal 92; Vice Principal St John's 
Coll Ministry Centre 92-97; Dio of Newcastle; R. St Luke's, Toowoomba 98-03; Chapl to 
Twba Prep 98-02; Abp's Exam Chapl 2000-2004; R. Ch Ch Bundaberg 03-08; Actg 
Chapl, St Luke's Ang Schl 05-06; Res Canon, St John's Cathl from 06.Arcbhishop's Chpln 
08-2011; Gen Sec Qld Churches Together from 2011.  Unit 1, 14 Mitchell Street, West 
End 4101 (General Secretary,Queensland Churches Together, PO Box 2096, Toowong 
4006) Tel: 3369 6792(BH) 3844 4206(AH) Mbl: 0418 335 088 email: gensec@qct.org.au; 
S: Jennifer:                      Active  
 
TWINE, The Rev'd Malcolm George b.46; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip; D.84; P.85; A.C. St 
Mark's, Warwick 84-86; A.C. Surfers Paradise 87- 88; P-in-C Cooroora 88-91; R. Christ 
Church St George 91-97; R. St Andrew's, Pittsworth 97-10; Area Dean of Toowoomba 
99-03; pt Police Chapl Toowoomba District 01-10; Full Time Qld Police Chpln 
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Toowoomba District 10-29 Feb 2015.; PTO Toowoomba West from 2011.  17 Hillview 
Crescent Gowrie Junction 4352 Tel: 4630 7386 Mbl: 0412 247 879 email: 
mmtwine@bigpond.com;  S: Megan:          Retired PTO  
 
TYACK, The Rev'd Christopher Rhys b.80; BA (UQ 04); LLB (UQ 06); Grad Dip LP (Coll 
Law NSW 10); MDiv (Melb,Coll.) 14; D.12.; P.16 Curate St John's Cathedral from 2012; 
Assistant to the Primate 2012-14; Curate (P/T) Toowong 16; Assistant Priest Parish of 
Southport 17. Priest in Charge Parish of Eastern Hills from 18.  9/19 Kennington Rd Camp 
Hill 4152 (PO Box 3493 Norman Park 4170) Tel: 3398 5944(BH) Mbl: 0404 518 011 email: 
crtyack@gmail.com:                     Active  
 
TYLER, The Rev'd John Samuel b.39; St Francis' Coll; D.08; Hon Deacon, St Alban's, 
Gatton 08-12; PTO (Rtd) St Alban's, Gatton from 2012.  9 Sandy Creek Road, Grantham  
4347 Tel: 5466 1137 Mbl: 0437 020 673 email: jty92555@bigpond.net.au;  S: Palina:  
              Retired PTO  
 
UPTIN, The Rev'd Michael Charles b.62; Moore Th Coll; B Fin Admin (UNE Armidale) 
82; M Ec (UNE Armidale) 92; B Th (Moore Coll) 97; Dip Min (Moore Coll) 97; D.2000; 
P.01; Hon A.C., St Bartholomew's, Mt Gravatt 2000-01; A.C. St Luke's, Toowoomba 02-
03; P-in-C, St John's, Dalby 03-04; R. 04-08; R. Surfer's Paradise from 08, Area Dean 
Gold Coast from 2014.  73-75 Salerno Street Bundall 4217 (PO Box 5384 Gold Coast 
Mail Centre 9726) Tel: 5592 1543(BH) 5592 1654(AH) Mbl: 0410 606 411 email: 
michael@surfersanglican.org.au; ;  S: Sandra:                   Active  
 
UTHER, The Rev'd Peter Francis b.55; St Francis' Coll; Cert Bus Stud (QIT) 72; B Th 
(BCT) 05; D.95; P.2000; Deacon, St Barnabas', Sunnybank 95-99; Hon Dcn, St 
Matthew's, Holland Park 2000; Hon A.C. 2000-04; P-in-C 04 - 2014; PTO Parish of Gold 
Coast South 14-18.  PTO Parish of Burleigh Heads from 18.  Unit 4, 66 Marine Parade 
Coolangatta 4225 Tel: 5536 4385 Mbl: 0421 565 413 email: cooly55@bigpond.com;  S: 
Elizabeth:           PTO  
 
VAN DEN BOS, The Rev'd Julia Rosalind Harrison b.86. BA (UQ 09), BTh (BCT 09); 
D.10 P.10; Assist Curate Surfers Paradise 2010-2011; UQ Chap, Assist Priest St Lucia 
2012-14; PinC Parish of Wilston from Nov. 2014.  Unit 6/ 117 Indooroopilly Road Taringa 
4068 Tel: 3356 0030(BH) Mbl: 0439 827 934 email: julia.harrison1@uqconnect.edu.au;  
S: Thomas :                      Active  
 
VAN MUNSTER, The Rev'd Steffan Jon b.69; Adv.Dip. (Counselling & Family Therapy) 
(AIFC) 11; BTh (CSU) 14. D.14; P.15. A.C. Maranaoa- Warrego Anglican Mission Aea 
(MWAMA 2014; Assist Priest Parish of MWAMA 2015-2016; PinC Parish of MWAMA 
from 2016.  30 Oxford Street, Mitchell 4465 (PO Box 9, Mitchell 4465) Tel: 4623 1126(BH) 
Mbl: 0428 231 126 email: MWAD11@bigpond.com;  S: Eliane:                Active  
 
VERCOE, The Rev'd Michael John b43. ThL, DipRE MCD; D1973 (C&G), P.1974 (C&G), 
C St Jn Canb 1973-76; PiC Adaminaby 1976-77; R Braidwood 1977-81; PiC 
Ashmont/Glenfield 1981-86; R Callide Valley 1986-2000; R Gladstone 2000-05; Chapl 
Police Gladstone Dist 2000-07; And/Commissary 2001-08 Dio Rockhampton: P Memb 
Min Ldrshp Team Gladstone 06-09; PTO Bundaberg West (Locum Oct- Dec) 2009; L/T 
St Paul's Cathl 2010; A/g R St Andrews, Kyabram 2011; A/g R. Swan Hill 2012; Dio 
Rockh: Ret 2009 - PTO; L/T Emerald 2012-13; Dio Brsbne PTO Bundaberg West from 
2013; L/T Maryborough 2014; L/T Maryborough 2014-15; L/T Goonaneman 2015-09-05.    
(26 Scotton Street, Bundaberg 4670) Tel: 4154 4120 Mbl: 0475 569 666 email: 
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mikevercoe@gmail.com;  S: Pam:          Retired PTO  
 
VIEROW, The Rev'd Shan b.54; DipTchg MCAE 75; DipTheol Morpeth 94; D.93; P.94; 
Dio of Newcastle: Asst Singleton/Jerry's Plains 94- 95; Asst P. Gosford 96; R. Southlakes 
97-2000; Dio of Newcastle; Chapl Emmanuel Coll/Assoc P. Ballina 01-02; Dio of Grafton; 
P-in-C St George's, Tamborine Mountain 02-05; PTO Nerang from 05-07; Assoc P. 
Robina-Mermaid Beach 07-10; L/T Parish of Manly 6 July - August 2010; PinC Manly 
2010-2013; Rector Manly 2013-2018. PTO East Redlands from 18. Area Dean, Moreton 
Deanery from 18.  12 Noah Court, Redland Bay 4165  Mbl: 0418 136 502 email: 
shan@thevierows.com;  S: Maurie:        PTO  
 
VINCENT, The Rev'd Mark Frederick b.54. B.Com. (Univ Auckland) 75; Dip.Ed. (ASTC) 
76; B.Ed.St., (UQ) 1980; MBA (UQ) 1986; Grad Dip Thl. (BCT) 2008; D.09; P.09; Hon 
A.C. East Brisbane 09-12; Hon. Chpln Easts Leagues Club from 2011; Hon Assist Priest 
East Brisbane from 2012..  28 Hanworth Street, East Brisbane 4169 (PO Box 7302 East 
Brisbane 4169) Tel: 3391 3699(BH) 3393 1363(AH) Fax: 3391 3995 Mbl: 0409 544 297 
email: markvincent@insightplus.com.au;  S: Julie:                   Active  
 
WAGSTAFF, The Rev'd Norman William b.38; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT); D.75, P.76 
Dio of Rockptn; A.C. St Matthew's, Park Avenue, Rockptn 75-77; P-in-C St Peter's, 
Barcaldine 77-78; R. 77-80; P-in-C St Paul's, Moranbah 80-81; Chapl to Geriatric 
Institutions 81-87; Chapl (pt) to Rockptn hospitals 82-87; P-in-C St Mary's, Mt Morgan 86-
87; R. Holy Trinity, The Barcoo 87-93; Dio of Rockptn; R. St Peter's, Millmerran 93-97; 
Miss Chapl 97; P-in-C Kilkivan and LT Wondai 97; P-in-C Prov Par Barambah 98-02; 
PTO Bundaberg from 02.  167/3 Carlyle Court, Bargara  4670 Tel: 4159 1349 email: 
ngwaggy@gmail.com;  S: Gwenn:          Retired PTO  
 
WALSH, The Rev'd Robert George b.39; St Francis' Coll; ThL (2nd Cl Hons) (ACT) 66; 
BA (UNE Armid) 85; B Ed (UNE Armid) 88; MA (St Th) (Univ of Qld) 95; D.66; P.67; A.C. 
St Paul's, Maryborough 66-69; A.C. St Paul's, Ipswich 69-70; V. St John's, Pialba 70-72; 
R. St John's, Hervey Bay 72-75; R. St Michael & All Angels, Kingaroy 75-86; R.D. Wide 
Bay 84-86; R. St Matthew's, Holland Park 86-95; PTO Dio of Bris 95-97; Assoc P. St 
Hugh's, Inala 97-04; PTO Inala 04-17. Arch. Cert. from 18.  70 Hansen Street, Moorooka  
4105 (PO Box 452, Moorooka  4105) Tel: 3848 1546 email: bobjoywalsh@gmail.com;  S: 
Joy:                   Archbishop's Cert  
 
WARE, The Rev'd Diana Joan b.42; Dip.Min (SFC) 99; EfM., CPE.; D.99; Hon Dcn St 
Matthias', Zillmere 99-02, St Martin's Nursing Home 99-01; Duty Chapl, Brisbane 
Women's Correctional Centre 2000-03; PTO (Itinerant Deacon) from 03.  PO Box 435, 
Moffatt Beach, 4551  Mbl: 0417 784 384:          Retired PTO  
 
WARREN, The Rev'd Dr Graham John b.50; MB BS (UQ) 73; FRANZCR (Royal Aust 
Coll. Radiology) 83; M.Med Sc (Newcastle Uni) 97; BTh(Hons) (CSU) 2015; D.2014; 
P.15. Hon A.C. Partish of Toowoomba St Luke's 2014; Hon Assist Priest Toowoomba, St 
Luke's 2015- 2106; PinC St Paul's Roma from 16-18. Part time from Aug 18.  13 Taylor 
Street East, Roma 4455 (PO Box 37 Roma 4455)  Mbl: 0409 665 301 email: 
revgrahamwarren@gmail.com;  S: Imelda :                   Active  
 
† WARREN, The Rt Rev'd Cecil Allan b.24; BA (Syd Univ) 50; ThL (ACT) 52; MA (Oxford) 
59; D.50; P.51 Dio of Canb-Goulb; P-in-C St John's, Adaminaby, Dio of Canb-Goulb 50-
53; A.C. St Mary the Virgin, Oxford, UK 54-57; Asst P. St John's, Canberra 57-60; P-in-
C St Philip's, O'Connor 60-63; Org Sec Church Soc & Hon Canon St Saviour's Cathl 63-
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65; Consecrated Bishop 65; Asst Bishop of Canb-Goulb 65-71; Bishop of Canb-Goulb 
71-83; I. Old Brampton & Loundsley Green, Chesterfield, Derby, England and Asst 
Bishop of Derby 83-88; PTO Dio of Bris 89-02; Abp's Cert for Officiating on Special 
Occasions from 02.  Symes Thorpe 69 Stenner Street Toowoomba  4350 Tel: 4613 5178  
S: Doreen:          Bishops Ret Arch Cert  
 
WATSON, The Rev'd Herbert William (Bill) b.47; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 93; D & P 
Rockptn 92; A.C. Gladstone 92-96; Chapl Missions to Seamen 94-96; Asst Cathl 96-97; 
P-in-C Park Avenue/Gracemere 97-01; Dio of Rockptn; A.D. Rockhampton 01; P-in-C 
Kilcoy 01-06; Chapl Toowoomba Hospital 06-12; Hosp Chaplcy Admin Asst 07-2012; 
PTO St Luke, Toowoomba from 2012. Locum Tenens Drayton from 17.  17 Chifley Court, 
Toowoomba  4350 Tel: 4613 6376 Mbl: 0400 094 438 email: wattoone@kcs.net.au;  S: 
Jill:             Retired PTO  
 
WEATHERLEY, The Rev'd Stuart Matthew (Matthew) b.36; St Francis' Coll 62-65; ThL 
(Private Study)(ACT) 71; D.73; P.74 Dio of Wangaratta; A.C. Shepparton 73-75; A.C. 
Wodonga 75-76; Dio of Wangaratta; A.C. Maryborough 76-78; V. Pine Rivers North 78-
81; R. St Alban's, Gatton 81-87; A.C. St James', Toowoomba 87-92; Hosp Chapl 92-99; 
P to Dio of Bris 99-2017; Hon Chpln Twmba Nat Servicemen's Branch 02; Highfields RSL 
03; Twmba United RSL 04; Twmba RAAF-A 09; Twmba Milne Bay Military. Museum 12; 
PTO (Rtd) St James, Toowoomba from 2017.  18 Blue Gum Drive, Highfields  4352 Tel: 
4698 7775 email: mcweather@bigpond.com;  S: Carole:         Retired PTO  
 
WHEREAT, The Rev'd Jonathan Leslie b.59; St Francis' Coll; Th Dip (ACT) 84; D.84; 
P.85; A.C. St Andrew's, Indooroopilly 84-87; A.C. St Paul's, Maryborough 87; P-in-C St 
John's, Mundubbera 87-91; P-in-C Noosa 91-96; Chapl, Matthew Flinders Ang Coll 97-
02; R. Fred's Pass and Chapl Kormilda Coll Dio of NT 02-05; R Atherton 06-10; Chpln 
The Southport School from 11.  The Southport School, Winchester Street, Southport 4215 
Tel: 55319956(BH) 55319969(AH) Mbl: 0414 671 486 email: 
jonathanw10@bigpond.com;  jonathan.whereat@tss.qld.edu.au;  S: Heather  Chaplains  
 
WHEREAT, The Rev'd Nicholas Jeremy Keith b.60; St Francis' Coll; B Th (BCT) 87; D.86; 
P.87; Hon A.C. St Oswald's, Banyo 86-87; A.C. St Peter's, Wynnum 87-88; A.C. St 
John's, Nambour 88-89; A.C. St John's, Dalby 90; P-in-C St John's, Biggenden 90-95. 
Hon Miss Chapl 95-02 (On Missionary Service in South America); R. St George's, 
Birkdale (re-named Waterloo Bay 05) 02-15; TSSF 03; Area Dean of Moreton 04-2015 
Examining Chapln from 2010; Spiritual Direction Formation 2012; Rector Parish of 
Aspley-Albany Creek from 2015  15 Nansen Street, Northgate 4013 (30 Ridley Road, 
Bridgeman Downs 4035) Tel: 3263 3518(BH) Mbl: 0423 030 326 email: rector@aspley- 
albanycreek.org.au;  S: Gwenn:                    Active  
 
WHITE, The Rev'd Clarence John b.38; St Francis' Coll; ThL (ACT) 60; BA (Univ of Qld) 
71; MA (Qual) 82; MA (Univ of Qld) 86; D.60; P.62; A.C. St Andrew's, Lutwyche 60-61; 
A.C Holy Trinity, Fortitude Valley 61-62; A.C. St Matthew's, Grovely 62-64; V. St Martin's, 
Tara 65- 68; R. St Luke's, Rosewood 68-70; PTO Dio of Bris 70-71; Asst Chapl CEGS 
East Bris 71-80; Senior Chapl CEGS 80-82; Chapl Canberra Grammar School 83; PTO 
Dio of Bris 84-94; Miss Chapl 94-98; PTO 98-01; Assoc P. St George's, Windsor 01-03; 
Chapl Anglicare, SA 04; Chapl, St Mark's College, Adelaide 04; Locum Tenens Priest in 
the Parish of Coolum 05; PTO Ithaca-Red Hill 05-07; Assoc Chapl, ACGS 08-09; 
Registrar and Chaplain to St Francis Theological College from 2010; Assoc Chapln St 
Aidan's Anglican Girls' School 2012; PTO Caloundra from 2013.  17 Undambi Place, 
Pelican Waters 4551 Tel: 5439 7922 Mbl: 0459 845 083 email: 
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clarrywhite38@gmail.com;  S: Sue:          Retired PTO  
 
WHITE, The Rev'd Joy Alice b.36; St Francis' Coll; D.01;AC Numinbah Correctional 
Centre 2000-01; AC St Luke's Nursing Service 02-03; Hon Dcn, St Margaret's, Nerang 
01-07; PTO Nerang from 06..  1 Edelweiss Way, Gaven  4211 Tel: 5596 3083 Mbl: 0413 
303 163 email: whitefrogs@gmail.com;  S: Keith:          Retired PTO  
 
WHITTALL, OAM, The Very Rev'd Christopher Gordon b.50. OAM 07; KSJ 17; BA 
(Macquarie) 77; BD (MCD) 80; MA (Sydney) 87; Master of Sacred Theology (STM) in 
Spiritual Direction (GTS New York) 98; GradDipRE (SACAE 82); SJC (Morpeth) 77-78; 
D.79; (Bath) P.80 (Bath). AsstP Orange 79-80; AsstP Blayney 80-83; LT 82; RNSH CPE 
82; R. Bourke Bath 83-87; Lect in Bib Studies/Dir Field Ed/Librarian St John’s Theological 
College Morpeth Newc 87-90; Dean/R St Paul's Cathdl Rockh 90-09; Truro Cathdl (Truro) 
02; AD Rockh City 00- 03; AD Rockh City 04-07; Diocesan Theologian 90-09; Bourke 
District Hospital Board 86-87; CQU Ethics Research Review Cttee 92-95; CQU Human 
Ethics Research Review Cttee 00-04; Qld Health Regional Ethics Cttee 93-95; Rockh 
Youth Suicide Prevention Strategy Chair 97-99; Mbr Capricornia District Health Council 
96-00 Chair 00-04; Mbr Capricornia Electricity Authority 08-10; Trustee Rockh Art Gallery 
03-10; Nat Chair CEBS 93-05; Actg Dean of Chapel & Chapln Queens' Coll Cam. (Ely) 
07; Chapln Mater Hosp Rockh 99-09; Chapln Rockh Grammar School 90-09; Dean Em 
Rockh 09; Chapln & Researcher to Abp & Primate of Church in Wales (Province Wales) 
09-11; General Synod 04, 07, 10; PTO Maleny, Dio Bris from 12; LT Maleny 12-14, LT 
Buderim 2017.  139 McCarthy Road, Maleny 4552 Tel: 5435 2173 Mbl: 0477 279 442 
email: christopherjwhittall@gmail.com;  S: Gillian:        PTO  
 
WILLIAMS, The Rev'd Erika Louise b. 74. Ass Dip Bus CQ, TAFE CQ 97; B.Ed (Primary) 
CQU 05; Dip Early Childhood Ed & Care, TAFE QLD 15; D. 18. The Springfield Anglican 
College (part time) from 18.  Parish of Springfield (Provisional) Stipendiary Lay Minister 
18.  Ass Curate (Part Time) Parish of Springfield from 19. Chaplain (Part Time), 
Springfield Anglican College from 19.  U77- 21 Springfield Parkway Creekside Views 
Springfield 4300 (U77 - 21 Springfield Parkway Creekside Views Springfield 4300)  Mbl: 
0438 116 702 email: erika@tpg.com.au;  S: Adam:                  Active  
 
† WILLIAMS, The Rt Rev'd Ronald John Chantler b.38; St John's Coll, Morpeth; ThL 
(ACT) 59; BA (Univ of Adel) 63; M Sc (Univ of Bristol) 74; D.63, P.64 Dio of Adel; C. 
Toorak Gardens 63-64; L to O, Dio of Syd 65; Dom Chapl to Bp in Polynesia 66-67; Asst 
P. Labasa, Fiji 67- 69; V. Labasa 69-71; PTO Dio of Bristol 72-74; V. Holy Trinity Cathl 
Parish and Dean of Suva 74-79; Exam Chapl to Bp in Polynesia 67-69 and 75-79; Dep 
Vicar General 75-77, Dio of Polynesia; R. Campbelltown, Dio of Adel, 79-84; Priest to the 
City of Adelaide and Director of St Paul's Centre 84-93; Hon Canon St Peter's Cathl, 
Adelaide 86-93; Consecrated Bishop, Diocese of Brisbane on St Peter's Day, 29th June 
1993, in St John's Cathedral by the Archbishop of Brisbane (Hollingworth) assisted by 
the Archbishop of Melbourne and Primate (Rayner), the Archbishop of Adelaide (George), 
the Bishops of Canberra/Goulburn (Browning), Carpentaria (Hall-Matthews), 
Rockhampton (Hearn), Grafton (Schultz), Willochra (McCall), the Assistant Bishops of 
Brisbane (Wood) and North Queensland (Stuart), and Bishops Grindrod, Mason, 
Shearman and Charles. Assistant Bishop (Bishop of the Southern Region), Diocese of 
Brisbane 93-07; PTO South East Deanery from 07; L/T Bishop for the Northern Region 
July-November 2013.  Tel: 3399 9818 Home Fax:: 3399 9818 Mbl: 0408 884 006 email: 
rk.will@bigpond.com;  S: Katie:                  Bishops Ret PTO  
 
WILSON, The Rev'd Susan Penelope b.61. Dip.Tch (Bris Coll Advanced Ed) 1982; BA 
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(UQ) 1990, BTh (BCT) 2008; MTh (CSU) 2015; D.09. P.09; A.C Killarney Parish of 
Warwick 09-11; AP Cleveland 11-13; Assoc Priest Parish of Cleveland 2013-2015; PinC 
Parish of Maryborough 15-18. Rector Parish of Maryborough from 18.  10 Sheldon Drive, 
Maryborough 4650 Tel: 0419 873 457(BH) 4121 3385(AH) Mbl: 0408 332 114 email: 
rector@anglicanmaryborough.org.au;  S: Jeff:                                 Active  
 
WILTON, The Rev'd Suzanne Louise b.69; Dip.Tchg (QUT 88; BA (History) (Murdoch) 
01; Clin. Pastrl.Ed. (QICPE) 05; Grad.Cert. Ed. (ALC) 08; BTh (CSU) 15; D.15; P.16; P/T 
Youth Admin Aspley-Albany Creek 2011; Stip Lay Min P/T St Aidan's Ang. Girls School 
2013- 2014; Assoc. Lay Chpln Ang. Church Grammar School 2015.; Assistant Curate, St 
John's Cathedral 2015-2016; Assist Priest St John's Cathedral 16-18. Chaplain Brisbane 
Women's Correctional Centre. PinC Indooroopilly Parish from Oct 18.  89 Fairley Street 
Indooroopilly  4068 Tel: 3835 2219(BH) Mbl: 0413 108 584 email: 
swilton@stjohnscathedral.com.au;                   Active  
 
WINDRED, The Rev'd Scott Robert b.86; Dip.Ed., (Shaftson Coll) 2007; Dip.Bib.Studies 
(Inst. Of Nations) 2012; BTh (CSU) 2017; D. 18. P/T Stip Min Parish Kawana Waters 
from 2013 - 1/11/14; Stip Lay Min (with special responsibility as Youth, Children's & 
Families Minister Parish of Kawana Waters from Nov 17 - Mar 18. Ass Curate, Parish of 
Mt Gravatt from 19.  7/10 Grand Parade Parraerra 4575  Mbl: 0431 411 137 email: 
scott_windred@hotmail.com;  S: Sarah:                    Active  
 
WINTERTON, The Ven Rodney Douglas b.53; St Francis' Coll; B Vet Sc (Univ of Qld) 
74; Grad Dip Nat Res (UNE) 90; Grad Dip Th (BCT) 01; M.Theol (BCT) 09; D.01; P.02; 
Hon A.C., St Paul's, Samford 01-03; Hon A.C. Ithaca-Ashgrove 03-04; Asst P. Ithaca-
Ashgrove and Kelvin Grove 04; P-in-C St James', Kelvin Grove 05; P-in-C, Kelvin Grove 
and Enoggera from 06; Area Dean of Brisbane North West from 08; Parishes merged to 
form Green Hills Anglicans 30 April 2009-2011; Rector Warwick from 11-18; Area Dean 
Southern Downs Deanery 2011-2014; Archdeacon of Cunningham 16-18. PTO Parish of 
Allora-Clifton from Oct 18. Archdeacon Emeritus from Oct 18.  125 Moonlight Avenue 
Highvale 4520 Tel: 4661 7223(BH) 4661 7532(AH) Fax: 4661 5238 Mbl: 0412 762 164 
email: rdwinterton@gmail.com; ;  S: Dianne:        PTO  
 
WISKEN, The Rev'd Robert Daniel b.30; Church Army Training College 48-51. C.A 
Evangelist 51-60. ThL (ACT); D & P 60 Rockptn; A.C. St Barnabas', Nth Rockptn 60; V. 
St Matthew's, Nth Rockptn & Chap St John’s Chaplain GFS. Rockhampton Diocese 1960 
-1965 Hospital Rockptn 60-63; R. Winton 63-65; Dio of Rockptn; R. Luddington w 
Hemington and Thurning 65-69 and P-in-C Clopton 66-69; V. All Saints', Ipswich 69- 75; 
V. Sompting, Sussex 75-80; Clerical Deputation Sec for C of E Soc for Sth West 80-82; 
Public Preacher for Dio of Winchester 81; R. Edmundbyers and Muggleswick and Chapl 
of Shotley Bridge General Hosp, County Durham 82-84; R. Wexham 84-86; Assoc P. St 
Andrew's, Caloundra 86; P-in-C Maleny 86-88; R. St M & AA, Kingaroy 88-90; R.D. of 
South Burnett 89-90; Dio of Bris; R. Huon Valley 90-92; R. Moonah, Hobart, Chaplian 
AMS 91-95; Dio of Tas; PTO Dio of Bris 95-96 PTO Dio Exeter UK 2003; PTO Southport 
2011-2013; PTO Robina-Mermaid Beach from 2013.  Unit 33, 60 Ridgeway Avenue, 
Southport 4215 Tel: 5532 1308 email: randjwisken@bigpond.com;  S: Jean: Retired PTO  
 
WOCKNER, The Rev'd Steven b. 58. B.Th, Australian Lutheran College 89.  P. 09 
Diocese of Nelson NZ. Pastor Zion Lutheran Church, Gawler SA 89-94; Pastor Ipswich 
East Lutheran Church 94 - 2000; Pastor Sth Est Downs Lutheran Church 01-03; Pastor 
Upper Moutere Lutheran Parish NZ 03-07; L/T Pastor Biloela Lutheran Parish 07; 
L/TGracehaven Lutheran Rest Home Chaplain 08; Interregnum Minister Buller Anglican 
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Parish Westport NZ 08-09; Interregnum Minister St Christopher's Anglican Church, 
Blenheim NZ 09; Vicar Buller Anglican Parish, Westport NZ 09; Regional Dean of 
Mawhera Deanery, Nelson Anglican Diocese NZ 13; SOMA Team to South Africa 17; 
Priest in Charge, Parish of Kawana Waters from 18.   (6 Royal Close Wurtulla 4575) Tel: 
5493 4774(BH) Mbl: 0487 102 916 email: quickervicar28@gmail.com;  S: Clenda: Active  
 
WOLFF, The Rev'd Professor Rodney Carl b.66; BSc(Hons)(Math) (UQ) 87; DPhil (Univ 
Oxford) 94; CStat(Profess. Accred) (RSS) 07; FQA 15; D.13; P.14; P/T AC Parish of 
Hamilton 2013-2014; Assist Priest (P/T) Parish of Hamilton 2014-2016; Acting Warden, 
St John’s College UQ 2016-2017; Warden St John's College from 2017; Area Dean 
Brisbane West Deanery from 2017.  The Wardens Lodge, St John's College, College 
Road, St Lucia 4067 Tel: 3842 6600(BH) Mbl: 0426 287 283 email: 
warden@stjohns.uq.edu.au:                     Active  
 
WOOD, The Rev'd Allan Thomas Joseph b.41; Ridley Coll, Melb 65; ThL (ACT) 68; Dip 
RE (Melb Coll of Div) 70; Cert Transpersonal Psych (AITP) 85; D.69; P.70 Melb; A.C. 
Holy Trinity, Surrey Hills 69-71; A.C. St John's, Blackburn 71-72; P-in-C St Mark's, 
Reservoir 72- 73; Dio of Melb; A.C. All Saints', Booval 73-75; R. St Andrew's, South 
Brisbane 75-85; PTO Dio of Bris 85-93; PTO Dio of Bris from 96.  10 Highland Place, 
Forest Lake Qld  4078 (PO Box 4316, Forest Lake  4078) Tel: 3879 8886 Mbl: 0438 752 
878 email: tomnheather64@gmail.com;  S: Heather:         Retired PTO  
 
WOOD, The Rev'd Rodney Kenneth b.50; D.85; P.87 Dio of Rockptn; Hon A.C. Callide 
Valley 85-87; C. Boyne River 87-91; Assoc P. Cathl 91-95; PTO 95; ITIM Co-ord Chapl 
95-01; QPS Chapl 95-01; Dio of Rockptn; PTO Dio of Rockptn 01-04; Chapl, Qld Police 
Service, Dio of Bris 01-04; Snr Anglican Chapl (Co-ordinating Senior Chaplain), Qld 
Police Service 06 - 15; National Coordinating Senior Police Chaplain 2007 Deputy 
National Co-ord Chaplain 2008; Police Chaplain South Brisbane Police District 2015- Hon 
Asst P. Alexandra Hills from 08.  21 Sycamore Street Redland Bay 4165 Tel: 3364 
4778(BH) Fax: 3364 4478 Mbl: 0417 739 768 email: stude28@bigpond.com; : Chaplains  
 
† WOOD, The Rt Rev'd Clyde Maurice b.36; Trinity Coll, Melb; ThL 64; BA (Monash 
Univ) 73; D & P Dio of Melb 65; A.C. St John's, Bentleigh 65-66; A.C. St Paul's, Ringwood 
66-67; P-in-C St Philip's, Waverley 67-70; P-in-C St Alban's/St Martin's Armadale-
Hawksburn 70-74; Dio of Melb; R. and Res Canon ChCh Cathl, Darwin 74-78; Dean 78-
83; Dio of NT; On Leave, R. St Timothy's Episcopal Church, Indianapolis, USA, 81; 
Consecrated Bishop on 18th October 1983 in Christ Church Cathedral, Darwin, by the 
Archbishop of Brisbane and Primate (Grindrod) assisted by the Bishops of Rockhampton 
(Hearn) and North West Australia (Muston) and Bishop Mason (Chairman of ABM) and 
Archbishop Sir Frank Woods; Bishop of Northern Territory 83-91; Assistant Bishop 
(Bishop of the Western Region), Diocese of Brisbane 92-96. Bishop of Nth Qld 96-02; 
PTO (Ret) Dio of Bris from 03-18. PTO (Ret) Parish of St Luke's Toowoomba from 18.  
Mbl: 0439 877 240 email: clymargwood@bigpond.com;  S: Margaret:    Bishops Ret PTO  
 
WOODS, The Rev'd Theodore Frank Spreull b.37; BA (Nat Science) Cambridge UK 58; 
GOE (Dip Th) Wells Theol Coll 62; Dip Ed (Univ of Qld) 80; D.62, P.63 Leic UK; Miss 
Tchr Martyrs Sch Dio of PNG 59-60; C. St Luke's Conv Dist Stocking Farm, Leic 62-67; 
Prin St Aidan's Tchrs Coll; Dogura, PNG 67-69; Ang Chapl Balob Luth Tchrs Coll, Lae, 
PNG 70-71; PNG Educ Dept 71-77; Prin In-service Trng 71-73; Sp Projects 74-77; L to 
O, Dio PNG 71-77; V. St John the Baptist Church, Leic 77-80; Asst Chapl ACGS 80-88; 
Chapl Hillbrook Anglican School 89-06; PTO Camp Hill with Norman Park (known as 
Eastern Hills Anglicans) 07-09; PTO St Andrew's, South Brisbane 09-18. Ret PTO 
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Buderim from 18.  17 Attunga Street Buderim 4557 Tel: 3398 4437 Mbl: 0409 616 150 
email: tandlwoods@bigpond.com;  S: Lorelei:         Retired PTO  
 
WOOLNER, The Rev'd Christine Clare b.46; St Francis' Coll; B Ed (Primary)(KCAE) 85; 
Grad Dip App Sc (WACAE) 90; Grad Dip Th (BCT) 05; D.& P. 07; Hon A.C., Algester 07-
08; L-T Blackall (Rockhampton 5-09/08/09,) Kyabram & Tongala (Bendigo 08/09-05/10); 
PTO Maroochydore from 09; Hon Assoc P. Maroochydore 2011-2014; L/T Eaglehawk 
(Dio Bendigo) 2015; PTO Kawana Waters from 2015.  Riverbreeze Apartments, 3/10 
Broadmeadows Road Maroochydore 4558  Mbl: 0407 033 257 email: 
bcwoolner@gmail.com;  S: Bob:           Retired PTO  
 
WOOLNER, The Rev'd Robert Frank b.46; St Francis' Coll; Cert Tchg (Wagga Wagga 
TC) 65; B Th (SFC) 93; D.93; P.95; A.C. Holy Spirit, Surfers Paradise 94-96; A.C. St 
Matthew's, Drayton 96-97; P-in-C Holy Spirit, Algester 98-02; R. 02-09; Area Dean of 
Logan 04-07; Retired 16 April 09; PtoO Maroochydore 09-11; L-T Blackall (Rockhampton 
5-09/ 08-09,) Kyabram & Tongala (Bendigo 08/09-05/10); Priest in Charge Maroochydore 
2011- 2014, PTO Parish of Kawana Waters from February 2015. L-T Kawana Waters 
11/2016 -06/2018.  Unit 208, Edgewater Apartments 21 Innovation Parkway Birtinya 4575  
Web: Mbl: 0448 995 575 email: Woolner.rfw@gmail.com;  S: Christine:       Retired PTO  
 
WORRALL, The Ven Julie Clare b.72; St Francis' Coll, B Th (BCT) 04; Grad Dip Min 
(MCD) 05; MMin (CSU) 09. D.04; P.05; A.C., Christ Church, St Lucia 04-07; P-in-C 
Cooroora 07-2011; Rector Chermside 11 - 17 Area Dean Brisbane North West from 14-
17. (Married April 2017) Rector Caloundra from 17. Archdeacon Sunshine Coast from 18 
PO Box 52 CALOUNDRA 4551 Tel: 5491 1866(BH) Mbl: 0419 779 968 email: 
rector@cgca.com.au;  S: Peter:                   Active  
 
WORTHINGTON, The Rev'd Bruce William b.44; St Francis' Coll; ThL (2nd Cl Hons); 
D.68; P.69 Rockptn; Hon A.C St Alban's, Auchenflower 69; C. Wandal 70-71; C. Park 
Ave, Rockptn 72-73; C. Gladstone 73-74; V. Barcaldine 74; R. 74-77; R. Clermont 77-82; 
Dio of Rockptn; R. St Mark's, The Gap 83-92; P-in-C Church of the Good Shepherd, Prov 
Par of Mudgeeraba 92-93; Miss Chapl 93; P-in-C, Holy Trinity, Kawana Waters 93-94; R. 
94-05; Area Dean of the Sunshine Coast 96-99; PTO North Pine from 05.  Unit 33, 10-44 
Tomlinson Road, Caboolture 4510 Tel: 5428 3748 email: brubarw62@gmail.com;  S: 
Barbara:              Retired PTO  
 
WYNNE, The Rev'd Dr Ceridwen Jane b.63. BSc. (UQ)84; BSc(Hons.) 1st Class (UQ) 
85; PhD (Biochemistry) (UQ) 93; BTh (BCT) 08; MTh (CSU) 2011; D.10; P.10; Assist 
Chaplain St Aidan's School 09-10; Hon AC Bulimba 09-10, A.C. (P/T) Bulimba 10-12; 
PinC P/T East Brisbane 2012.-2016; PTO Parish of Bulimba 2016-2017; Senior 
Tutor/Chpln St John's College from 2017.  19 Balcha Street, Holland Park 4121  Mbl: 
0412 397 475 email: seniortutor@stjohns.uq.edu.au;  S: Ewen:      PTO  
 
YARHAM, The Rev'd Josephine Lesley b.81; B.Mus(Hons); (UQ) 02; BTh (CSU) 2012; 
D.12; P13; .AC Parish of Aspley-Albany Creek (P/T) 2012.-13; Assist Priest (P/T) Parish 
of Aspley-Albany Creek 2013.-2014; Chpln The Springfield Anglican College (P/T) from 
2015.  46 Claremont Pde Forest Lake 4078 Tel: 3814 8100(BH) Mbl: 0421 507 566 email: 
revjosiey@gmail.com;  S: Jason:                    Active  
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Lay Ministers Biographical Information 

 
 
ADAMS, Mr David, b. 81. B.Ed 05; BTh 15.  Chap. Hillbrook Anglican School from 18.   
3/22 Hows Road Nundah  4012 (3/22 Hows Road, Nundah  4012)   Mbl: 0403 666 941 
email: davida@hillbrook.qld.edu.au:             Lay Minister 
 
BATE, Ms Juliana, b. 85.  Stip. Lay Minister, St John's Anglican College from 18.   15 
Katrina Way, Raceview  4305 Tel: 3294 3170  Mbl: 0411 365 220 email: 
juliana.bate@outlook.com;   S: Christopher :          Lay Minister 
 
BELL, Mr Kevin John, Hon. Lay Chpln (Prison Min) Brisbane Correctional Centre from 
2016.                     Lay Minister 
 
BRINER, Mrs Juliet, b79. BA (ACU) 03; Stip Lay Min Parish of Coorparoo from 2013.   
118 Lade street, Coorparoo  4151   Mbl: 0427 071 860 email: 
juliet@ststephenscoorparoo.org.au;   S: Naman:          Lay Minister 
 
BRYDEN, Mr Paul Richard, Hon. Lay Chaplain (Prison Ministry) Woodford Correctional 
Centre from 2016                Lay Minister 
 
BUCHANAN, Ms Alexandra Ellen, b.90. BMin (Tabor BC NSW) 2012;  Padstow Ang Ch 
(Dio Sydney) 10-13; Wollongbar Christian Ch. Child Leader 14-15; Youth Min Co-Ord 
(P/T) Parish of Wishart from 2015.      (29 Pankina Street, Sunnybank  4109) Tel: 3849 
5444(BH)  Mbl: 0401 409 401 (nfp) email: alex@stjohnswishart.com.au:      Lay Minister 
 
BUCHANAN, Mrs Susan Kay, b.49; Lay Minister (Pastoral Carer, Ipswich Hospital) from 
1997.   Mbl: 0402 398 636  S: Neville:           Lay Minister 
 
CALDER, Mr Michael, b. 95. Stip. Lay Min. Parish of St Bartholomews Toowoomba from 
18.   19 Spring Garden Court Middle Ridge  4350   Mbl: 0414 392 231 email: 
mwcalder@gmail.com:            Lay Minister 
 
CARLTON-JONES, Mr Liam, b. 97  Stip. Lay Minister, Parish of Mount Gravatt from 18.   
57 Moorbell Street Tarragindi  4121   Mbl: 0413 805 010 email: liam_cj@hotmail.com: 
                Lay Minister 
 
CHAPMAN, Mr Raymond Arthur, OAM. JP(Qual), b45. Assoc Dip Min (SFC) 97; JP 
(Qual) 98; Diocesan Lay Minister with particular ministry to Veteran's Support and 
Advocacy Service Australia Inc (Veterans Ministry) from 97; Hon Padre Veterans Ministry 
- Goodna RSL from 97.   20 Bates Drive,  Everton Hills  4053 Tel: 3855 1290  Mbl: 0428 
151 748 email: chapman20@bigpond.com;   S: Shirley:         Lay Minister 
 
COLLINS, Mr Ken George, b. 40. Hon Lay Chpln (Prison Ministry), Wolston Correctional 
Centre from 2017.             Lay Minister 
 
DUTTON, Mr Peter Andrew, b.85. B.Ed (USQ) 07; Stip Lay Minister, Parish of 
Toowoomba, St Bartholomew from 2015.   34 Carinya Drive, Hodgson Vale  4352 Tel: 
4641 7733  Mbl: 0400 118 829 email: peterd45@hotmail.com:        Lay Minister 
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EAGLES, Mr Christopher Alan Lewis, 19 Trundle Street Coorparoo  4151  Mbl: 0425 323 
649 email: chris.eagles@hotmail.com;   S: Kate:                         Lay Minister 
 
GRAY, Mr Thomas Poe, Lay Chpln (Prison Ministry) Arthur Gorrie Correctional Centre 
from 2014.                  Lay Minister 
 
GREEN, Mrs Desley Helen, b.63.B.Bus (Account) (USQ) 83; GradDipDiv ACT-QTC (16). 
Certificate in Foundations of Biblical Counselling from CCEF 18. Stip Lay Min (with 
special responsibility for Women's Ministry) Parish of The Gap from 2016. (15 Glenferrie 
Place, The Gap  4061) Tel: 3300 3407  Mbl: 0402 225 717 email: 
desley.green@tgac.org.au;             Lay Minister 
 
HALE, Mr David Douglas, b. 83. Stip. Lay Minister (part time) Youth Parish of 
Indooroopilly from 18. (11/144 River Terrace Kangaroo Point  4169)  Mbl: 0433 010 425 
email: rideas.fg@gmail.com:            Lay Minister 
 
HAMPSON, Dr Margaret Elizabeth Hon. Lay Chpln (Prison Ministry) Numinbah 
Correctional Centre from 16.                 Lay Minister 
 
HARRISON, Dr Stephen James, b.73; St Francis' Coll; BCT; BAppSc (QUT) 94; BTh 
(BCT) 97; BCW (JCU) 05; Grad Dip L&T (USQ) 07; MMin(CSU) 11; DMin(CSU) 18; 
Student Youth Min, St Mark's, The Gap 96-97; Lay Min (Youth and Families), St Peter's, 
Southport 98-01; p/t Lay Chapl Griffith Univ 98-2000; Lay Minister (Youth and Families), 
Biggera Waters-Coomera Valley 02-03; Lay Minister (Chaplaincy duties) Coomera 
Anglican College 02-08; MEC Youth, Children & Families Ministry Officer 08-11; Director 
Of Mission A.S.C. 11-18; Executive Director PMC from 2018. 12 Stonecurlew Street, 
Upper Coomera 4209 (Parishes and other Mission Agencies Commission, GPO Box 421. 
Brisbane 4001) Tel: 3835 2233(BH) Mbl: 0418 763 742 email: 
sharrison@anglicanchurchsq.org.au;  S: Catherine:         Lay Minister 
 
HARTH, Mrs Annabel Maree b.75; B.A.Mus.(QUT) 97; Cert.Inst.Mus.Tch., (QCM) 02; 
Musician Chinchilla 75-2002; Parish of Dalby 02-16; Stip Lay Min (with special 
responsibilities Young Families Min Leader from 2016. (187 Blaxland Road, Dalby  4405) 
Tel: 4662 3748  Mbl: 0447 736 474 email: mickannie007@gmail.com:       Lay Minister 
 
KEMP, Mr Jonathan David, b.71. BA Hons. (UQ) 92; PGDipEd., (UQ) 93; GCertTheol. 
(BCT) 06; M.Ed. (USQ) 07; Director – Youth, Children’s and Families Ministry from 2011; 
Stip Lay Min MEC from 2011.      (Ministry Education Commission, PO Box 1261 Milton  
4064) Tel: 3514 7432(BH)  Mbl: 0409 744 507 email: jdkemp@ministryeducation.org.au;   
S: Alison:             Lay Minister 
 
LAW, Mr Grant Joffre, b. 41.  Lay Chaplain (non-stip) Woodford Correctional Centre from 
18.                   Lay Minister 
 
LENNON, Mr Dale William, b. 84  B.Min CHC 09; B.Ed CHC 12; MTh CSU 17.  Stip. Lay 
Minister Robina-Mermaid Beach Parish from 17.   PO Box 3065 Robina Town Centre 
4230  Ph: 5618 8234  email: dale@robinaanglican.com;          Lay Minister 
 
LOWE, Mrs Bettrys, b. 82.  B.Ed (Prim) Griffith University 04, Grad Dip RE A.C.U 09, MA 
Ed (Lead) CSU 10. Lay Min (Children and Families Coordinator) St Bartholomew's 
Toowoomba from 17.   103 Stenner Street, Middle Ridge  4350 (PO Box 11390, 
Centenary Heights  4350) Tel: 4636 2922 (BH)  Fax: 4636 2972 email: 
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bettrys@stbarts.com;   S: Adam:         Lay Minister 
 
LYNCH, Mrs Lorraine Ann, b.64; Cert.IV Life Coaching 09; Grad.Dip.Min (Christian 
Heritage Coll) 2012; BA Hons Phil (Sheffield Uni) 1993; Stip Lay Min. Carindale from 17.  
138 Cooper Crs, Rochedale  4123  Mbl: 0449 564 930 email: lynchlf@bigpond.com: 
            Lay Minister 
 
MARSHALL, Mrs Melissa Irene, Hon. Lay Chpln (Prison Min.) Maryborough Correctional 
Centre from 2016.                Lay Minister 
 
MILLER, Mr Bowen James, b.85; Dip Youth & Community Work (Fusion Training) 08; 
Dip.Couns (Christian) AIFC 2014; AdvDip.Couns (Christian) AIFC 2015; Stip Min (P/T) 
Parish of Robina-Mermaid Beach from 2013.   5 Morven Court, Mudgeeraba  4213   Mbl: 
0419 887 193 email: bowen@robinaanglican.com:         Lay Minister 
 
MISSO, Mrs Deanna Rowena, b.39; Cert Marriage Counsellor (Ang Family Care) 89; Cert 
Ecum Hosp Chapl (Trinity Theol Coll) 89; Grad Cert Pastoral Care (ACU) 06; Lay Minister 
(Pastoral Carer - Prince Charles Hospital) from 07; Anglican Pastoral Visitor, Holy Spirit 
Northside Private Hosp from 07.   17 Lilly Pilly Crescent,  Fitzgibbon    4018 (PO Box 250,  
Zillmere    4034) Tel: 3216 2980  email: drmisso@bigpond.com; S: Karol:   Lay Minister 
 
NELSON, Ms Wendy Olivia, b. 89  BSSc CHC 2014, Cert IV Bib Stud. Institute of the 
Nations, Dip Yth Work Scripture Union 2010. Stip. Lay Minister Bribie Island Parish (part 
time) from Nov 17.   76 Bimimulya Street Bellara  4507 Tel: 3408 9753  Mbl: 0421 781 
885 email: wendy.nelson@live.com:          Lay Minister 
 
NORMAN, Miss Amy Jane Elizabeth, b. 94. B.Eng (Civil Hons) Stip Lay Min St Bart's 
Toowoomba from 18;      (103 Stenner Street Rangeville  4350)   Mbl: 0427 356 301 
email: amy@stbarts.com.au;:            Lay Minister 
 
PENNELL, Mr Neil, b. 39. Non-Stip. Lay Minister, Prison Chaplain Arthur Gorrie 
Correctional Centre and the Brisbane Correctional Centre from 17;          Lay Minister 
 
SARGEANT, Mr Jonathan Keith, b.66; Dip Teach (Prim) (BCAE) 87; Dip YEA (BCT) 90; 
B Th (BCT) 06; MMin (CSU) 12; Chapl, The Gap State High School 91-97; Stip. Lay 
Minister (Diocesan Religious Education Officer)  96-14; Director Lay Education from 14.   
28 Foch Street, Ashgrove  4060 (PO Box 1261 Milton  4064) Tel: 3514 7442(BH) 3366 
7454(AH)  Fax: 3369 4691 Mbl: 0438 768 676 email: 
jonathans@ministryeducation.org.au;   S: Lisa:          Lay Minister 
 
SCOTLAND, Mr Brett James, b. 82, Lay Minister Caboolture from 18.  28 Lynanda Court, 
Caboolture 4510 Mbl: 0419 742 904. email: bscotlandf1@gmail.com       Lay Minister 
 
SIMON, Ms Jessica Courtney, b.98; Stip. Lay Minister Waterloo Bay from 2016   12 
Cormorant Close Cashmere  4500 12 Cormorant Close Cashmere Tel: 3882 2157(BH) 
0474 080 303(AH)  Mbl: 0474 080 303 email: jessica.c8298@gmail.com:    Lay Minister 
 
SKYNER, Mr William Edward, b. 45  Lay Minister - Prison Ministry from 18.  Lay Minister 
 
SKYNER, Mrs Rimaati, b. 62 Lay Minister - Prison Ministry from 18.           Lay Minister 
 
SOLTES, Miss Rhonda Lorraine Erna, b.86; Cert.III Tertiary Prep (Wollongbar TAFE) 04; 
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StipLayMin Parish of Gold Coast North (Children’s Minister) 16. Stip Lay Min Parish of 
Sunnybank (Youth, Children’s and Family Minister) from 17. 6 Rivermeadows Drive, 
Upper Coomera  4209 Tel: 3345 1535(BH)  email: rhonda.soltes@gmail.com:  
              Lay Minister 
 
VAN DEN BOS, Mr Thomas Aaron Harrison, b.86; Lay Minister (Youth and Families), 
Kawana Waters from 08-10; Camps Coordinator MEC 2011- 2012; Lay Minister 
(University Pastoral Worker) UQ 2014; Lay Minister (Youth, Children and Families) Parish 
of St Lucia from 2014. S. Julia   Unit 6/117 Indooroopilly Road Taringa  4068   Mbl: 0406 
775 794 email: tom.vandenbos@gmail.com; S: Julia :        Lay Minister 
 
VANDERSEE, Ms Joanna Christine, b. 73. BNSc JCU 93;  Dip Intercultural Studies WEC 
MTC Tas 1997; French Language Profidiency, Catholic Uni Paris 2002.  Stip Lay Min St 
Andrew's South Brisbane from 17.      (C/- St Francis College 233 Milton Road MILTON  
4064)   Mbl: 0408 735 878 email: jovandersee@gmail.com:        Lay Minister 
 
WILLIAMS, Mrs Erika Louise, b. 74. Ass Dip Bus CQ, TAFE CQ 97; B.Ed (Primary) CQU 
05;  Dip Early Childhood Ed & Care, TAFE QLD 15;   The Springfield Anglican College 
(part time) from 18.   Parish of Springfield (Provisional) Stipendiary Lay Minister 18.   Unit 
77/21 Springfield Parkway Creekside Views Springfield  4300   Mbl: 0438 116 702 email: 
erika@tpg.com.au:          Lay Minister 
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Lay Ministers Licensed In The Diocese Of Brisbane 

ADAMS, Mr David   Hillbrook Anglican School 
BATE, Ms Juliana   St John’s Anglican College 
BELL, Mr Kevin   (Prison Ministry) Brisbane Correctional Centre 
BRINER, Mrs Juliet   Parish of Coorparoo 
BRYDEN, Mr Paul   (Prison Ministry) Woodford Correctional Centre 
BUCHANAN, Ms Alexandra  Parish of Wishart 
BUCHANAN, Mrs Susan  (Pastoral Carer) Ipswich Hospital 
CALDER, Mr Michael  Parish of St Bartholomew’s Toowoomba 
CARLTON-JONES, Mr Liam  Parish of Mt Gravatt 
CHAPMAN, OAM., Mr Raymond Parish of Grovely, (Veterans’ Ministry) 
COLLINS, Ken    (Prison Ministry) Wolston Correctional Centre 
DUTTON, Mr Peter   Parish of St Bartholomew’s Toowoomba 
EAGLES, Mr Christopher  Parish of Coorparoo 
GRAY, Mr Thomas (Prison Ministry) Arthur Gorrie Correctional 

Centre 
GREEN, Mrs Desley  Parish of The Gap 
HALE, Mr David   Parish of Indooroopilly 
HAMPSON, Dr Margaret (Prison Ministry) Numinbah Correctional 

Centre 
HARRISON, Dr Stephen Parishes & Other Mission Agencies 

Commission 
HARTH, Mrs Annabel  Parish of Dalby 
KEMP, Mr Jonathan  Ministry Education Commission 
LAW, Mr Grant   (Prison Ministry) Woodford Correctional Centre 
LENNON, Mr Dale   Parish of Robina-Mermaid Beach 
LOWE, Mrs Bettrys   Parish of St Bartholomew’s Toowoomba 
LYNCH, Mrs Lorraine  Parish of Carindale 
MARSHALL, Mrs Melissa (Prison Ministry) Maryborough Correctional 

Centre 
MILLER, Mr Bowen   Parish of Robina-Mermaid Beach 
MISSO, Mrs Deanna  (Pastoral Carer) Prince Charles Hospital 
NELSON, Ms Wendy  Parish of Bribie Island 
NORMAN, Ms Amy   Parish of St Bartholomew’s Toowoomba 
PENNELL, Mr Neil (Prison Ministry) Arthur Gorrie and Brisbane 

Correctional Centre 
SARGEANT, Mr Jonathan  Ministry Education Commission 
SCOTLAND, Mr Brett  Parish of Caboolture 
SIMON, Ms Jessica   Parish of Waterloo Bay 
SKYNER, Mrs Rimaati (Prison Ministry) Maryborough Correctional 

Centre 
SKYNER, Mr William (Prison Ministry) Maryborough Correctional 

Centre 
SOLTES, Ms Rhonda  Parish of Sunnybank 
VAN DEN BOS, Mr Thomas  Parish of St Lucia 
VANDERSEE, Ms Joanna  Parish of South Brisbane 
WILLIAMS, Mrs Erika  Parish of Springfield  
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Archdeaconries & Area Deaneries 
of the Three Regions 

NORTHERN REGION 
The Right Reverend J D Greaves 

ARCHDEACONRY OF BRISBANE 
The Venerable Olaf Anderson 

Deanery of Brisbane North East 
The Rev’d Sandra Kjellgren 

Banyo 
Clayfield, St Mark’s 
Hamilton 
Hendra-Clayfield 
Lutwyche 
Nundah 
Zillmere 

Cathedral 
All Saints’ 
Fortitude Valley 
New Farm 

ARCHDEACONRY OF LILLEY 
The Venerable Chris Johnson 

Deanery of Redcliffe 
The Rev’d Avriel Green 

Deanery of Brisbane NW 
The Rev'd Kevin Bourke 

Bramble Bay 
Bribie Island 
Caboolture 
Freshwater (Burpengary/  
Deception Bay/Narangba) 
Kilcoy 
The Lakes Anglican Church 
North Pine 
Redcliffe 
Sandgate Northpoint 
Strathpine 

Aspley-Albany Creek 
Chermside 
Everton Park 
Greenhills Anglicans 
Grovely 
Ithaca-Ashgrove 
Ithaca-Red Hill 
Samford 
Stafford 
The Gap 
Wilston 

ARCHDEACONRY BURNETT 
The Venerable Keith Dean-Jones 

ARCHDEACONRY SUNSHINE 
COAST The Venerable Julie Worrall 

Deanery Of Burnett 
The Rev'd Andrew Schmidt 

Deanery Of Sunshine Coast 
The Rev'd Jeanette Jamieson 

Bundaberg 
Bundaberg West 
Gayndah 
Goonaneman (Childers/ 
Biggenden/Gin Gin) 
Hervey Bay 
Maryborough 
Mundubbera Eidsvold Monto 

Buderim 
Caloundra – Glass 
House Country 
Coolum 
Cooroora 
Gympie 

Kawana Waters 
Maleny 
Maroochydore 
Nambour 
Noosa 
Palmwoods 
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SOUTHERN REGION 
The Right Reverend A John Roundhill 

ARCHDEACONRY OF OXLEY 
The Venerable Michael Faragher 

Deanery of Brisbane West 
The Rev’d Prof. Rodney Wolff 

Deanery of Brisbane South West 
The Rev’d Michael Stalley 

Auchenflower-Milton 
Bardon 
Indooroopilly 
Kenmore-Brookfield 
Moggill-Mt Crosby 
St Lucia 
Toowong 

Centenary Suburbs 
Chelmer-Graceville 
Ekibin 
Goodna 
Inala 
Moorooka-Salisbury 
Sherwood 
Springfield (Provisional) 
Yeronga 

ARCHDEACONRY OF MORETON 
The Venerable Denise Ferguson 

Deanery of Moreton 
The Rt Rev'd Shan Vierow 

Deanery of Brisbane South East 
The Rev’d Alan Moore 

Alexandra Hills 
Carindale 
East Redland Anglicans (formerly 
Cleveland and Stradbroke Island) 
Holland Park 
Manly 
Mt Gravatt 
Waterloo Bay (formerly Birkdale) 
Wishart 
Wynnum 

Annerley, St Philip’s 
Bulimba 
Eastern Hills Anglicans (formerly 
Camp Hill-Norman Park) 
Coorparoo 
East Brisbane 
Kangaroo Point 
Morningside 
South Brisbane 
Woolloongabba 

ARCHDEACONRY OF THE GOLD COAST 
The Venerable Valerie Hoare 

Deanery of the Gold Coast 
The Rev’d Michael Uptin 

Deanery of Logan 
The Rev’d Geoff Hoyte 

Burleigh Heads 
Gold Coast North 
Gold Coast South 
Mudgeeraba  
Nerang 
Robina-Mermaid Beach 
Southport 
Surfers Paradise 

Algester 
Beaudesert 
Beenleigh 
Jimboomba 
Logan 
Rochedale 
Sunnybank 
Tamborine Mountain 
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THE WESTERN REGION 
The Rt Reverend Cameron Venables 

ARCHDEACONRY OF THE WEST 
Vacant 

Deanery of Maranoa 
Vacant 

Maranoa/Warrego 
Anglican Mission Area 

Leichhardt Chinchilla 
Anglican Mission Area 

Charleville 
Cunnamulla 
Mitchell 

Roma-Surat  
St George-Dirranbandi 
Tara 

Chinchilla 
Leichhardt 

ARCHDEACONRY OF CUNNINGHAM 
Vacant 

Deanery of Southern Downs 
The Rev’d Laurel Raymond 

Deanery of West Moreton 
The Rev’d Helen Paget 

Allora-Clifton 
Goondiwindi 
Stanthorpe 
Texas-Inglewood 
Warwick 

Boonah-Harrisville 
Booval 
Brisbane Valley 
Gatton-Ma Ma Creek 
Ipswich 
Ipswich North 
Laidley 
Rosewood 

ARCHDEACONRY OF THE DOWNS 
The Venerable Mark Carlyon 

Deanery of Toowoomba 
The Rev’d Paul Mitchell 

Deanery of Bunya 
Vacant 

Crows Nest 
Drayton 
Millmerran 
Oakey 
Pittsworth 
Toowoomba, St Bartholomew’s 
Toowoomba, St James’ 
Toowoomba, St Luke’s 
Toowoomba West 

Barambah 
Cherbourg 
Dalby 
Jandowae 
Kingaroy 
Nanango 
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Regional Bishops, Archdeacons 
& Area Deans 

Gifts are given … to equip the saints, for the work of ministry, for building up 

the Body of Christ. 
Ephesians 4.12 

The role descriptions below outline some of the expectations of Area Deans, 
Archdeacons and Regional Bishops. These expectations are not exhaustive, and each 
person is able to shape further the role they hold.   

Area Deans, Archdeacons and Regional Bishops work with the Archbishop in 
encouraging, serving and building up the People of God. They extend pastoral care to 
the clergy of the Diocese and work with all to realise our vision of ‘Going for Growth in 
Christ’.  

The Role of Area Deans 

Area Deans draw the clergy and laity in the Deanery together for mutual consultation, 
support and action to encourage effective ministry in the Church and in the wider 
community.  

In particular, Area Deans: 

 convene meetings of clergy in the Area Deanery for peer support, mutual
encouragement and further education. Area Deaneries should meet at least
four times a year.

 offer counsel and pastoral support to all clergy in the Area Deanery and foster
fellowship for them and their families, taking care to include retired clergy,
chaplains, locums, clergy widows, etc.

 oversee arrangements for commissioning services of new parish priests and
chaplains in collaboration with parish lay leaders and submit the draft order of
service for the Regional Bishop’s approval in good time.

Area Deans are usually priests of busy parishes, so expectations of the time they have 
available need to be realistic.  
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The Role of Archdeacons 

Archdeacons work with their Regional Bishop to support the Area Deans, clergy, 
parishes and other ministry agencies to enable the diocesan vision of ‘Going for Growth 
in Christ’ to be fulfilled.  

Archdeaconries are usually defined geographically, although from time to time the 
Archbishop might create an Archdeacon with a particular ministry portfolio.   

In particular, Archdeacons: 

 are part of the ordained leadership team in the diocese and within the region.
The Archdeacon is a channel of communication between diocesan officials, the
Regional Bishop, Area Deans and clergy.

 are responsible for the Parish Review, at least every five years as prescribed
by the relevant regulation, or when a parish becomes vacant.

 inspect church property, including rectories (by negotiation with the parish
priest) every five years, and consult with church wardens about required repairs
and refurbishments.

 consult with parishes about plans for new buildings or alterations to existing
buildings, and indicate agreement or otherwise report on the prescribed form
seeking building approval.

 receive from clergy, on the prescribed form, notification regarding leave or
other absences and arrangements for the continuance of pastoral and liturgical
ministries; and convey such arrangements to their Regional Bishop.

 welcome locum clergy during a parish interregnum and keep in touch with them
during the length of their locum.

 consult with the Regional Bishop in finding pathways for the resolution of any
parish conflict.

 work with the Regional Bishop and others in the development of strategies for
church growth in the Archdeaconry, and in the implementation of good
management procedures in parishes and other ministry agencies, such as
record keeping, accounts, policies, etc.

 participate in the Archbishop’s regular meeting with the Bishops, Archdeacons
and Dean of the Cathedral.

Archdeacons are also usually priests of busy parishes, so (as with Area Deans) 
expectations of the time they have available need to be realistic. Recognising the 
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additional workload and responsibilities of Archdeacons, an annual allowance equal to 
10% of the Minimum Rate of Stipend (MRS) will be paid by the diocese to the Archdeacon 
at the end of the year, (or for those who have not served a full year in the role a pro rata 
amount).  

Provision is also made for a contribution to an Archdeacon’s parish for expenses incurred 
by the parish because of the Archdeacon’s ministry. Payments will be made annually to 
the parish as follows: 

The Role of Regional Bishops 

The Regional Bishops form, with the Archbishop, an episcopal team serving the 
Diocese. Assistant Bishops undertake functions or roles requested or authorised by the 
Archbishop. This might include serving on one or more commissions from time to time.  

Except for the responsibilities of decision and appointment that are specifically the 
Archbishop’s, they carry out the role of a Bishop to the clergy and people in the episcopal 
region they serve. This is often a pastoral responsibility and will involve them closely in 
consultation with the clergy and people of the parishes. As “shepherds of the shepherds” 
they seek to encourage the development of ministry and the witness of clergy and laity in 
their region. They teach and defend the faith, encourage all Christians and foster hope 
for the future as we ‘Go for Growth in Christ’.  

The Bishops realise it is fundamental that they pray and plan together. For this purpose 
they meet together with the Archbishop each week.  

Other roles and responsibilities of the Regional Bishops include: 

 visiting parishes and other mission agencies regularly and spending time with
clergy and people, for it is in the parishes and other mission agencies that the
fundamental and continuing life and witness of the Church takes place.

 chairing, at the Archbishop’s request, meetings of the Presentation Board.

 regular consultation with the Region’s Archdeacons and Area Deans,
especially in relation to new appointments, to strategies that might grow the

Archdeaconry Percentage of MRS 

West 8% 

Cunningham, The Downs, Sunshine Coast, 
Burnett 

6% 

Brisbane, Lilley, Oxley, Moreton, Gold Coast 4% 
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church in faith, service, generosity and numbers, and to pastoral care 
especially of the clergy. 

 keeping in touch with clergy who have recently accepted an appointment to a
parish within the region and particularly with clergy in their first charge.

 responsibility for ecumenical relationships at the regional level, and the
exploration, where appropriate, of possible co-operative ventures.

 responsibility for the making of locum tenens arrangements in the case of
vacancies.

 being available to clergy and laity who seek an appointment and attentive to
their needs and issues.

Therefore … let us run with perseverance the race that is before us, looking to 

Jesus the pioneer and perfector of our faith.   
Hebrews 12 
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Parish Information 

Image: Holy Trinity Anglican Church, Goondiwindi
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D = Dedication      C = Consecration     O = Opened   B = Benefice

ABORIGINAL ANGLICAN FELLOWSHIP Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

Diocesan Office
Tel:  3835 2222

Aboriginal Anglican Fellowship Brisbane 
GPO Box 421 Brisbane 4001

Church WardensSynod Reps Parish Nominators

ALEXANDRA HILLS Deanery: MORETON

ALEXANDRA HILLS
The Church of the Resurrection
(seats 180) D1991 C 2010

The Rev'd Jonathan I Bright 2001

(Church & Parish Office)
Cnr Windemere & Newhaven Streets ,
(PO Box 5413), Alexandra Hills 4161 
Mbl:  0409 277 521 

Church Wardens

Mr John Angus  
Mrs Karen Carter 
Dr Diane Payton

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr John Angus  
Mrs Karen Carter 
Dr Diane Payton

Mrs Charmaine Dyer 
Dr Diane Payton

ALGESTER Deanery: LOGAN

ALGESTER
The Church of the Holy Spirit
(Seats 180) D.1981 C.1993    B

The Rev'd Jane L Mitchell 2014 (R)

(Church & Parish Office)
362 Algester Road, 
Algester 4115
(O):   3273 7169  Mbl:   0438 184 148 
(Fax): 3273 7189
office@algesteranglican.org.au  

Church Wardens

Mrs Joan Harvey  
Mrs Rhonda Nelson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Dianne Bocquee 
Ms Ruth Bullock 
Mr Ian Nelson

Mr Ian Nelson  
Mrs Rhonda Nelson

ALL SAINTS, BRISBANE Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

The Rev'd Canon Richard G Martin 2005 (R) ALL SAINTS'
Wickham Terrace, Brisbane
(Seats 300) O.1862;  
Rebuilt D.1869  C.1885     B

Res: 101/301 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000
Parish Office: Wickham Terrace,
Brisbane 4000 (PO Box 574)
Spring Hill 4004 
(O) 3236 3692  (H)   3211 9143
admin@allsaintsbrisbane.com

Church Wardens

Mr Peter Kent  
Mrs Belen Needham

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Leigh Duffin 
Mr Peter Kent

Mr Gerri Jordan  
Mrs Annabelle McDonald
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D = Dedication      C = Consecration     O = Opened   B = Benefice

ALLORA-CLIFTON Deanery: SOUTHERN DOWNS

ALLORA-CLIFTON
St David's, Allora (Seats 150)
O 1888 C.1890
All Saints', Clifton (Seats 110)
D. 1889 Rebuilt D. 1905     B

The Rev'd Laurel A Raymond 2016 (PinC)

1 Church Street Allora 4362  1 Church Street Allora 4362 
Tel  (O)4666 3343   Mbl: 0429 671 949
anglican_acg@bigpond.com 

Church Wardens

Mr Ashley Gillam  
Mr Darryl Keys  
Mrs Linda Sharman-Bowman

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Ashley Gillam  
Mr Darryl Keys  
Mrs Linda Sharman-Bowman

Mrs Gail Fulton

ANNERLEY Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH EAST

ANNERLEY
St Philip's (Seats 250) D.1955

The Rev'd Donald G Campbell 
(Brother Donald Campbell SSF)  (2003)

(Church & Parish Office):
115 Cornwall Street, 
Annerley 4102
(O) 3391 3915   Mbl:   0410 444 502 
Fax:  3391 3916
saintphilipsannerley@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mr David Hale  
Mrs Jean Nicholson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr David Hale 
Mr Mark Young

ASPLEY - ALBANY CREEK Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

The Rev'd Nicholas J K Whereat 2015 (R) ASPLEY-ALBANY CREEK
The Church of the Resurrection,
Bridgeman Downs (Seats 140)
D. & C. 1981 B

(Church & Parish Office)
30 Ridley Road,
Bridgeman Downs 4035  
(O)  3263 3518    Mbl:   0423 030 326
office@aspley-albanycreek.org.au

Church Wardens

Ms Debbie Kemish  
Mr Michael Richardson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Christine Rooney 
Mr Gordon Strickland

Ms Debbie Kemish 
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D = Dedication      C = Consecration     O = Opened   B = Benefice

AUCHENFLOWER-MILTON Deanery: BRISBANE WEST

AUCHENFLOWER-MILTON

Milton, Christ Church (Seats 200)
D.1876  Rebuilt D.1891 B
Sunday Worship - Chapel of the Holy 
Spirit, St Francis' College

The Rev'd Penny H Jones 2017 (PinC)

(Parish Office): 
Room 22, Main Wing, St Francis' College
233 Milton Road, Milton 4064
All Mail: PO Box 1506, Milton 4064

(O) 3369 2797     Mbl:  0477 444 095 
info@cccpm.org.au 

www.miltonanglican.org

Church Wardens

Dr Hilda Maclean  
Ms Amerson Stephenson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Kerry Holland  
Dr Hilda Maclean  
Ms Amerson Stephenson

Miss Petrina  Gardiner 
Ms Jeni Nix

BANYO Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

BANYO
St Oswald's (Seats 135)
D. 1929      B

The Rev'd Stephen P Briggs 2016 (PinC) 

9 Froude Street, 
(PO Box 36), Banyo 4014

Tel  (O)3267 5329  Mbl: 0428 136 116 
parish.stoswalds@gmail.com;

Church Wardens

Mrs Denise Barber  Mrs Lyn 
Northfield

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Robert Armstrong 
Mrs Beryl Cowley  
Mrs Lyn Northfield

Mrs Barbara  Briggs 
Ms Marie Fuller

BARAMBAH Deanery: BUNYA

BARAMBAH
Christ Church, Murgon (Seats 60)
D. 1920
The Church of the Epiphany,
Goomeri (Seats 60) D.1916
St David's, Boonara (Seats 80) D.1914
St Mary's, Wondai (Seats 70) C.1938
St Faith's, Mondure (Seats 100)
D.1917

Vacant:

Parish of Barambah 
29 Taylor Street East,
(PO Box 70), Murgon 4605 
Tel 4168 1450
ang.barambah@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Patricia Hansen  
Mrs Barbara Hockey 
Mrs Julie Lobwein

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Julie Lobwein
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D = Dedication      C = Consecration     O = Opened   B = Benefice

BARDON Deanery: BRISBANE WEST

The Rev'd Dr Colin L Nicholson 2011 (R) BARDON
St Mary's (Seats 150) 
D 1962 C. 1975     BRes. & All mail: 

1 Hardwick Terrace, 
Bardon 4065
Parish Officeand all mail:  
290 Simpsons 
(cnr Burnham Road),
Bardon 4065
(O)  3369 3301
office@bardonanglican.org.au 
www.bardonanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Dr Paul Ashley  
Ms Jenna Haywood 
Ms Kaye Oakley

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Dr Paul Ashley  
Ms Jenna Haywood 
Ms Kaye Oakley

Ms Jenna Haywood

BEAUDESERT Deanery: LOGAN

The Rev'd Anthony (Tony) P Swansson 2014 (R) BEAUDESERT
St Thomas' (Seats 300)
D.1888 Rebuilt D.1957 C.1965
St David's, Rathdowney (Seats 120)
D.1929
All Saints', Tamrookum (Seats 120)
D.1915   B

Church & Parish Office: 
7 Albert Street 
(PO Box 74) 
Beaudesert  4285 
(O) 5541 1015   Mbl:   0439 876 110
angbeaudesert@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Melissa Troncoso
Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Melissa Troncoso 
Mrs Jenny Walker

Mrs Irene May  
Mrs Kathryn Swansson

BEENLEIGH Deanery: LOGAN

BEENLEIGH
St George's (Seats 200)
O.1876 Rebuilt D.1965     B

The Rev'd Peter W Palmer 16 -17
(PinC) R from 17

(Church & Parish Office):
10 Tansey Street, 
Beenleigh 4207 
(O) 3287 2326    Mbl: 0402 062 842

stgeorgesbeenleigh@westnet.com.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Yvonne Bobermien 
Mr Michael McDonnell

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Michael McDonnell 
Mrs Carol Smith

Mrs Julie James  
Mr Michael McDonnell
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BOONAH-HARRISVILLE Deanery: WEST MORETON

BOONAH-HARRISVILLE
Christ Church, Boonah (Seats 150)
D.1890, Rebuilt D.1960 C.1961
St Andrew's, Maroon 
(Seats 50) D.1907
St John's Harrisville (Seats 90) D.1878 
Rebuilt D.1986
St Stephen the Martyr, Aratula
(Seats 50) D.1954     B

The Rev'd Helen M Paget 2014 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
10 Church Street,
(PO Box 55), Boonah 4301
(O) 5463 1041   Mbl:   0409 474 276

office@bhanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Wayne Bird  
Mrs Janita Moore  
Mr Thomas Pressler

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Frances Faulkner 
Mr James Grayson  
Mr David Roderick

Mr Wayne Bird  
Mr Thomas Pressler

BOOVAL Deanery: WEST MORETON

BOOVAL
All Saints' (Seats 170) D. 1983

The Rev'd Christopher J Bate 2017 (PinC) 

(Church & Parish Office): 
144 Brisbane Road, 
(PO Box 40) Booval 4304 
(O) 3282 1471   Mbl: 0429 112 127

asangbooval@bigpond.com 
www.allsaintsbooval.com  

Church Wardens

Ms Sue Ellis  
Mrs Carol Trotter

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Sue Ellis  Mrs 
Joy Sampson

BRAMBLE BAY Deanery: REDCLIFFE

BRAMBLE BAY
St Peter the Fisherman, Clontarf
(Seats 260) D. 1993 C.1996    B

The Rev'd Howard G Smith 2016 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
13 Lucinda Street, 
Clontarf  4019 
PO Box 94, Margate 4019 
(O) 3883 2378  Mbl:    0419 977 852 
bramblebayparish@bigpond.com 
www.bramblebayanglican.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Elizabeth Peters 
Mrs Gail Symons  
Mr Ian Wimberley

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Grant Peters  
Mrs Gail Symons  
Mr Peter Van Twist

Mrs Dale Jarman 
Mr Grant Peters
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D = Dedication      C = Consecration     O = Opened   B = Benefice

BRIBIE ISLAND Deanery: REDCLIFFE

BRIBIE ISLAND
St Peter the Apostle & Martyr
(Seats 165) D.1928 
Rebuilt D.1974 Closed 2008.
New Church of St Peter's
the Apostle & Martyr 
D. 2008;     C. 2016.   B

The Rev'd Steven P Schwarzrock 2017 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
Cnr Banya & Foster Streets,
(PO Box 1087) Bongaree, 
Bribie Island  4507 
(O) 3408 3191   Mbl:   0427 227 322

office@stpetersbribie.org.au
www.stpetersbribie.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Kay Benson  
Mr Jeffrey Eustace  
Mrs Karen Llewellyn

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Kay Benson  
Mrs Vivienne Bourne 
Ms Lynette Macbeth

Mr Jeffrey Eustace  
Mrs Karen Llewellyn

BRISBANE VALLEY Deanery: WEST MORETON

BRISBANE VALLEY
St Andrew's, Toogoolawah 
(Seats 100) D. 1912
St Agnes', Esk (Seats 80) D.1889
St George's, Linville (Seats 40) 
D.1915

The Revd Ian Bailey (PinC)

(Rectory):
13 Keeley Place,   
(PO Box 168) Esk 4312   
Mbl:    0417 540 008 
bvanglican@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Win Oxenford  
Mr Lawrence Witham 
Mrs Ruth Wyatt

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Win Oxenford  
Mr Lawrence Witham 
Mrs Ruth Wyatt

Mrs Joycelyn Cameron 
Mrs Leah Hayward

BUDERIM Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

BUDERIM
St Mark's (Seats 220)
D.1917 Rebuilt D. 1988     B

The Rev'd Moira Patricia Evers 2018 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
7-17 Main Street,
(PO Box 43) Buderim 4556 
(O) 5445 2060 
stmarksbuderim@gmail.com
www.stmarksbuderim.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Sandra Bartley  
Mr Andrew Butterworth 
Mrs Anna McKinlay

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Sandra Bartley  
Mrs Jane Butterworth  
Mrs Janette Mychajlyk

Mrs Jane Butterworth  
Mrs Janette Mychajlyk
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BULIMBA Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH EAST

BULIMBA
St John the Baptist (Seats 150)
D & C 1889                        B

The Rev'd John F Milburn 2004 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
171 Oxford Street, 
(PO Box 217)  Bulimba 4171 
(O) 3399 1508  Mbl:   0415 838 239 
office@stjohnsbulimba.org

Church Wardens

Mrs Jacqueline Chapman 
Mrs Dianne Coffey  
Mr Allan Thomson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Dianne Coffey 
Mrs Sarah Davies  
Mr Allan Thomson

Mr Donald Smith  
Mr Allan Thomson

BUNDABERG Deanery: BURNETT

BUNDABERG
Christ Church (Seats 500)
D.1880, Rebuilt D.1927 C.1936
St Mark, Gooburrum
(Seats 50) O.1880
St John the Divine, Burnett Heads
(Seats 60) D 1940
St Peter, Bargara (Seats 80) D.1951
St Benedict Chapel, Meilene      B

The Ven Keith M Dean-Jones, OGS 2015 (R) 

Parish Office:
Cnr Woongarra & 
Maryborough Streets, 
(PO Box 275) Bundaberg 4670 
Residence:   2 Meilene Street, 
Kalkie 4670
(O) 4151 3128   Mbl:   0407 693 897
(H) 4151 2467  Fax:   4152 5408 

admin@bundaberganglican.org

Church Wardens

Mrs Suzanne Galvin  
Mrs Jennifer Moreny 
Mr Gordon Taylor

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Russell Cobb  
Mrs Suzanne Davis

Mrs Suzanne Davis

BUNDABERG WEST Deanery: BURNETT

BUNDABERG WEST
The Church of the Good Shepherd
(Seats 200) D.1962 C.1971        B

The Rev'd Andrew N Schmidt 2015 (R) 

(Parish Office):
201  George Street, 
(PO Box 5120),
Bundaberg 4670  
(O) 4152 8810  Mbl:    0429 520 317 
goodshepherdwest@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr Gregory Blundell 
Mr Russ Ford  
Mrs Carolyn Wood

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Gregory Blundell 
Mr Reg Dean  
Mrs Carolyn Wood

Mr Reg Dean  
Mrs Jenny Wedemeyer
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BURLEIGH HEADS Deanery: GOLD COAST

BURLEIGH HEADS
St John's (Seats 210)
D.1962, C.1971

The Rev'd Eron Perry 2017 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
14 Park Avenue, 
(PO Box 375) 
Burleigh Heads 4220
(O) 5535 6066    Mbl:   0411 417 779 
pezzmondo@gmail.com 
stjohnsbh@winshop.com.au
www.stjohnsburleigh.org.au

www.facebook.com/anglicanchurchburleigh/

Church Wardens

Ms Marian Gilbert  
Mrs Rosemary Hogan 
Mrs June Stephenson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Rosemary Hogan  
Deaconess Margaret Thornton

CABOOLTURE Deanery: REDCLIFFE

CABOOLTURE
St Laurence's (Seats 350)
D.1889. Rebuilt D.1982 C.1959   B

The Rev'd Avriel R Green 2015 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
165 King St,
(PO Box 81), Caboolture 4510  
(O)   5419 0835       Mbl:   0421 951 696

churchcaboolture@gmail.com 

Church Wardens

Mrs Catherine Cofield 
Mrs Susan Sanker  
Mr Trevor Vieritz

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Catherine Cofield 
Mrs Dorian Holloway  
Mr Trevor Vieritz

Mr Garry Franks 
Mr Tony Green

CALOUNDRA WITH GLASSHOUSE COUNTRY
Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

CALOUNDRA with
GLASSHOUSE COUNTRY
St Andrew's, Caloundra (Seats 350)
D.1939 Rebuilt D.1967 C.1974
St Thomas', Mooloolah (Seats 30)

D.1927   B

The Ven Julie C Worrall 2017 ( R)

(Church & Parish Office)
46 Upper Gay Terrace, 
(PO Box 52) Caloundra 4551  
(O) 5491 1866   Mbl: 0419 779 968 
admin@cgca.com.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Lorraine Connolly  
Mrs Miriam Hargreave 
Miss Judith Sperling

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Helene Baker-Daines 
Mrs Lorraine Connolly  
Mrs Heather Setch

Mr John Turner 
Mrs Kay Turner
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CARINDALE Deanery: MORETON

CARINDALE
St Gabriel the Archangel (Seats 240)
D.1958 New Church D.1991
C.2010     B

Vacant

(Church & Parish Office):
11 Bridgnorth Street,
Carindale 4152 
(O) 3398 8069   Mbl:   0406 182 748 
stgabrielscarindale@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Gail Abbott  
Mr Ian Alexander  
Mr Russell Clutterbuck

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Ian Alexander  
Mr Russell Clutterbuck 
Mrs Deb Stanley

Mrs Gail Abbott  
Mrs Joanne Rose

CATHEDRAL Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

CATHEDRAL  
St John's, 1910 (seats 1200)
First St John's Church
cnr. Queen & George Streets, Brisbane 
1844-1850
Second St John's Church, William Street 
1850-1860
St John's Pro-Cathedra,
William Street, 1860-1904;
St Luke's Pro-Cathedral 1904-Oct 1910. 
D.1904;
St Johns Cathedral first stage C.28 Oct 
1910
Second stage C 22 Nov 1968; Final Stage 
C 29 Oct 2009

The Archbishop
The Very Rev'd Dr Peter C Catt 
(The Dean)

373 Ann Street,(GPO Box 421) 
Brisbane 4001
(O) 3835 2222  (O)   3835 2239 
cathedral@stjohnscathedral.com.a
u www.stjohnscathedral.com.au

Church Wardens

Dr Christopher Gourlay 
Dr Helen Lancaster  
Mrs Helen Wootton

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Alan Gallimore  
Dr Christopher Gourlay

CENTENARY SUBURBS Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH WEST

CENTENARY SUBURBS
St Catherine's, Middle Park
(Seats 300) D.1980          B

The Revd John Coleman 2019 (PinC)

Parish Office:
43 MacFarlane Street, 
Middle Park 4074 
(O) 3076 5335 
stcaths@powerup.com.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Melanie Johnson 
Mr Luke Paatan

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Richard Swan  
Ms Amy Trumata-Paatan 
Mr Paul Waterhouse

Mr Denis Freeman
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CHARLEVILLE Deanery: MARANOA

CHARLEVILLE  (Maranoa-Warrego 
Anglican Area - also comprising 
Cunnamulla and Mitchell)
All Saints' (Seats 200) 
O.1897 Rebuilt  D.1958 C.1967
St Luke's, Augathella (Seats 150)
O.1892 Rebuilt D.1957
All Souls', Morven (Seats 50)
O.1906  D.1926

Refer Maranoa-Warrego Anglican Area 
The Rev'd Steffan van Munster  2016 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
41 Alfred Street, 
(PO Box 153),Charleville 4470  
(O) 4654 1043   Mbl:   0428 231 126 
canegrass@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Jenny Crichton
Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs June  Taylor

CHELMER-GRACEVILLE Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH WEST

The Rev'd Michael D Stalley 2015 (R) CHELMER-GRACEVILLE
St David's, Chelmer (Seats 250)
D.1939 C.1971     B

(Church & Parish Office):
69 Chelmer Street East, 
Chelmer 4068  
(O) 3379 8894   Mbl:   0407 466 108
office@stdavidschelmer.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Merv Brown  
Mrs Karen Green 
Mr Ross Miles

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Diane Jones 
Mr Gavin Scott

Mr Phillip Bate  
Mrs Karen Green

CHERMSIDE Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

The Rev'd Daniel Paulraj Jayaraj (PinC) All Saints' (Seats 250)
D.1914 Rebuilt D.1961 C.1996
C.2014   B(Chuch & Parish Office):

501 Hamilton Road,
Chermside 4032  
(O)  3359 2062    Mbl:    0419 779 968
office@allsaintschermside.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Fiona Bennett  
Mr Stephen Clarke 
Mr Ian Somerville

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Stephen Clarke  
Mrs Prudence Haldane 
Mrs Karen Winters

Mrs Sandra Beck  
Dr Sylvia Haworth

143



D = Dedication      C = Consecration     O = Opened   B = Benefice

CHINCHILLA Deanery: MARANOA

CHINCHILLA (Leichhardt-
            Chinchilla Anglican 

Mission Area)
St Cecilia's (Seats 300)
D.1904 Rebuilt D.1960 C.1965      B

Refer  Leichhardt-Chinchilla Anglican Mission Area 
The Rev'd Terry G Frewin 2018 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
Cnr Middle & 
Colamba Streets, 
(PO Box 202) Chinchilla 4413
Res: 24 Mann Street, Chinchilla 4413
(O) 4668 9001   Mbl:   0438 689 662
angchin8@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Ms Kay Balnaves 
Mr Errol Turnbull

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Sally Turnbull

CLAYFIELD, ST MARK'S Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

Vacant CLAYFIELD
St Mark's (Seats 250) D.1888 moved
1899 Rebuilt D.1964 C.1970        B

(Parish Office)
56 Bellevue Terrace,
Clayfield 4011  
(O) 3862 2221 (H) 3862 1411 
admin@stmarksclayfield.org

Church Wardens

Mr David Adams  
Mrs Margaret Black  
Mr Robert Standish-White

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Jan Jardine
Shane Monks
Ross Watkins

Mr David Adams 
Ms Alison Reid

COOLUM Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

COOLUM
The Church of the Holy Spirit
(Seats 100)  D.1970 C.1977

The Rev'd Dr Cathy E Laufer 2010 (PinC)

Rectory: 18 Edith Place,
Church: 25 Beach Road, 
(PO Box 5)  Coolum Beach 4573  
(O) 0447 002 573     (H)    5351 1215 
ang.coolum@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Janice Christian 
Mr David Lupton  
Mrs Carol Smeeton

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Rebecca Crockett 
Mr David Lupton
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COOROORA Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

COOROORA
The Church of the Good Shepherd,
Pomona (Seats 90) D.1974 C.1980
The Church of the Holy Nativity,
Cooroy (Seats 100)
D.1913 Rebuilt D.1954
St Luke's, Kin Kin (Seats 60) D.1926

The Rev'd Mark N Calder 2016  (PinC) 

(Parish Office):
1 Rectory Street, Pomona 4568 
(O) 5485 1218   Mbl 0412 585 686 
coorooraanglican@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mr Neville Anderson  
Mr John Butterworth  
Mr Timothy Lipscomb

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Stephen  Hilditch

COORPAROO Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH EAST

COORPAROO
St Stephen's (Seats 400)
D.1922, Rebuilt D.1958 C.1962      B

The Rev'd Jeremy Gehrmann 2018 (PinC) 

(Church & Parish Office):
343 Cavendish Road,
Coorparoo 4151   
(O) 3397 0555   Mbl 0412 528 758 
office@ststephenscoorparoo.org.au
www.ststephenscoorparoo.com

Church Wardens

Ms Kate Crouch 
Mr John Kotzur 
Mr Dan Wilson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Kate Crouch  
Mr Tony Levick  
Mr Warren Young

Mr Tony Levick  
Ms Trish Osgood

CROWS NEST Deanery: TOOWOOMBA

CROWS NEST

St George the Martyr (Seats 140)
D.1951 C.1952 Reded 2001

St Mark's, Goombungee (Seats 80)
D.1908

The Rev'd Marjorie L Charrington (L/T)

(Church & Parish Office):
Cnr Sharp & Thallon Streets,
(PO Box 14), Crow's Nest 4355 
(O) 4698 1403  or  3355 3256 
anglicanchurch1@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Denise Iseppi 
Mr Barry Miller

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Barry Miller

CUNNAMULLA Deanery: MARANOA

CUNNAMULLA
Maranoa-Warrego Anglican Mission 
Area 
-also comprising Charleville and Mitchell
St Alban's, (Seats 150) O.1896
Rebuilt D.1963 C.1974
St Aidan's, Wyandra (Seats 60)
D.1960

Refer Maranoa-Warrego Anglican Mission Area 
The Rev'd Steffan van Munster 2016 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office)
Cnr 56-62 Jane Street, 
(PO Box 150) Cunnamulla 4490 
(O) 4655 1210   Mbl:    0428 231 126 
tcjensen@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr Glen Bradford
Synod Reps Parish Nominators
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DALBY Deanery: BUNYA

Vacant DALBY

St John's Dalby (Seats 250) O.1866
Rebuilt D.1876  C.1878
Rebuilt D.1923 C.1935
St Margaret's, Cecil Plains 
(Seats 100) D.1927

(Church & Parish Office):
153 Cunningham Street,
(PO Box 37) Dalby   4405 
(O) 4662 2071    Mbl  0428 776 451

admin@anglicandalby.org.au

www.anglicandalby.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Michael Harth 
Mr Neil Holmes  
Mrs Kim Kelly

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Michael Harth 
Mr Arthur Martin  
Mr Colin Watters

Mr Roger Henderson 
Mrs Susan Waddell

DRAYTON Deanery: TOOWOOMBA

The Rev'd Bill Watson (Locum) from 2017 DRAYTON
St Matthew's (Seats 125) O.1859
Rebuilt D.1887 C.1933
St Mary the Virgin, Harristown
(Seats 125) D.1941 Rebuilt D.1980
C.1982
All Saints', Cambooya (Seats 100)
D.1904 Rebuilt D.1915
St Paul's, Umbiram (Seats 40) D.1906

(Church): 
1 Beatrice Street, 
(PO Box 317), Drayton North 4350 
Rectory: 41 Lynch Street, Drayton 4350   
(O)  4630 2999   Mbl:   0429 465 564
Fax: 4637 2875
drayton.parish@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr James Boucher 
Mr Paul Watkins

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Grahame Johnson 
Mrs Helen Moloney  
Mr Paul Watkins

Mrs Sylvia Free  
Mrs Tina Woodall

EAST BRISBANE Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH EAST

EAST BRISBANE
St Paul's (Seats 150) D.1924 C.1937

The Rev'd Donald Campbell 2017 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Centre):
554 Vulture Street,      
East Brisbane 4169  
All Mail to:
PO Box 7713, East Brisbane 4169 
(O) 0418 876 912   Mbl 0419 653 123 
stpaulseastbrisbane@gmail.com 
www.saintpauls.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Lloyd Barron  
Mr Bart Seaton-Said

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Cheryl Kadinsky 
Mr Doug Russell
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EAST REDLAND Deanery: MORETON

EAST REDLAND 
(Cleveland and Stradbroke Island)
St Paul's (Seats 250)
D.1874 C.1876 Extension C.1924
Rebuilt D.1980
St Andrew's, Ormiston (Seats 50)
D.1874 C.2003
All Saints', Redland Bay (Seats 100)
D.1890, Rebuilt D.1989
St Peter's, Russell Island (Seats 50)
O1927
St Mark's Dunwich (Seats 30)
D. 1908
Congreations -
Holy Advent, Macleay Island
St Peter Chanel Church, Point Lookout 
(owned by RC Church)

B

The Ven Denise R Ferguson 2015 (R)

(Parish Office)
41 North Street
(PO Box 2), Cleveland 4163 
(O) 3821 2443    Mbl    0458 589 739 
office@eastredlandanglican.com.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Barbara  Michael 
Mr Paul Sime  
Mrs Gayle Tuckwood

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Kylie Hobbs  
Mr Paul Sime  
Mrs Gayle Tuckwood

Mr Paul Sime  
Mrs Gayle Tuckwood

EASTERN HILLS ANGLICANS Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH EAST

EASTERN HILLS ANGLICANS
The Church of the Annunciation,
Camp Hill (Seats 110)
D.1926 Rebuilt D.1940 C.1976

The Rev'd Christopher Tyack 2018 (PinC)

(Church): 
101 Watson Street,
Camp Hill 4152 
All Mail to: PO Box 3493, 
Norman Park 4170 
(O) 3398 5944
parish@annunciation.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Alistair Read

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Robyn Casey 
Ms Julie Lewis
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EKIBIN Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH WEST

EKIBIN

St Luke the Evangelist
(Seats 200) D.1925
Rebuilt D.1956 C.1962
St Aidan's, Clifton Hill (Seats 80)
C.1929       B

Vacant

(Parish Office):   
193 Ekibin Road East,
Tarragindi 4121 (PO Box 79), 
Wellers Hill 4121
Rectory: 115 Beverley Hill Street, 
Moorooka  4105
(O) 3848 2123    Mbl    0409 108 554 
admin@stlukesekibin.org.au
www.stlukesekibin.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Christine Bromwich 
Mr Brian Wood

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Honor Lawler  
Mr Timothy Vassella 
Mr Brian Wood

Mr Jeff Drysdale  
Mrs Judith Jones

EVERTON PARK Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

St Jude the Apostle Anglican Church 
(Seats 200) D.2013
(Church of St Jude, Buller St, Everton 
Park closed 26 Feb 2012)   B

The Rev'd Dr Andrew E Peters 2014 (R)

Church: St Jude the Apostle Anglican 
Church, 203 Flockton Street, 
(PO Box 231) Everton Park  4053 
(Cnr Old Northern Road & Flockton Street) 
Parish Office: 
"Cornerstone Ministry Centre" 
203 Flockton Street, 
Everton Park  4053
(O) 3353 2020  (H) 3420 5309
Mbl:  0418 500 148
stjudes@tpg.com.au
www.stjudesep.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Neil Griffiths  
Mrs Vicki Herman 
Mr Victor Smith

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Neil Griffiths  
Mrs Vicki Herman 
Mr Victor Smith

Mr Donald Cock 
Mr Victor Smith

FORTITUDE VALLEY Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

Vacant FORTITUDE VALLEY
Holy Trinity (Seats 240) C.1877    B

(Church & Parish Office):
141 Brookes Street,
(PO Box 1220),
Fortitude Valley 4006  
(O) 3852 1635
admin@trinityvalley.org.au

Church Wardens

Ms Katharine Philp 
Mr Phillip Rule  
Ms Helen Tranter

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Leigh Buchanan  
Ms Donna Normoyle 
Ms Katharine Philp

Mr Leigh Buchanan  
Ms Donna Normoyle
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FRESHWATER Deanery: REDCLIFFE

FRESHWATER
(Burpengary, Deception Bay & Narangba)
The Church of the Risen Christ C.2005
Deception Bay (Seats 175) D.1993
Church of the Holy Spirit C.2012 
Burpengary

The Rev'd Claye E Middleton 2016 (PinC) 

(Church & Parish Office):
43 Pitt Road, 
Rectory: 43 Park Road,
(PO Box 522) Deception Bay 4508 
(O) 3203 2440   Mbl  0429 628 213 
freshang@bigpond.net.au

Church Wardens

Mr Robert Forrester  
Mrs Pauline Walker  
Mr Gregory Windsor

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Danielle  Clark  
Mr Gregory Windsor

GATTON-MA MA CREEK Deanery: WEST MORETON

GATTON with MA MA CREEK
St Alban the Martyr (Seats 250) O.1886 
Additions D.1910
Rebuilt D.1967  C.1975
St Stephen's Ma Ma Creek (Seats 90)
O1887 Rebuilt C.1912
St Gabriel's, Grantham (Seats 80)
D.1932

The Rev'd Jennifer A Colbrahams 2012 (PinC)

The Rev'd W F Colbrahams (Assoc Priest) 
Mbl:  0409 071 215
(Church Office) 68 Railway Street, 
PO Box 373 Gatton 4343 
(Rectory)    5462 1006      (O)  5462 4081 Fax   
5462 1795 
angpargatton@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Miss Theresa Hearne 
Mr Lawrie Johansen  
Mr Colin Taylor

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Lawrie Johansen  
Mrs Marjorie Johansen

GAYNDAH Deanery: BURNETT

Vacant GAYNDAH
St Matthew's (Seats 120) D.1882
Rebuilt D.1976 C.1978
St Anne's, Mt Perry (Seats 80) 
D.1903       B

(Parish Office)
97 Capper Street,  
(PO Box 69), 
Gayndah 4625 
(O) 4161 1214 

gayndahanglican@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Cheryl Cumming 
Mr Raymond Harris  
Mrs Angela Slack

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Cheryl Cumming 
Mrs Angela Slack  
Mrs Robbyn Slack

Mrs Cheryl Cumming 
Mrs Angela Slack
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GOLD COAST NORTH Deanery: GOLD COAST

GOLD COAST NORTH
St James', Biggera Waters
(Seats 140) D. & C.1984
The Holy Rood, Oxenford 
(Seats 90) O.1889
St Matthews', Coomera
(Seats 250) O.2014        B

The Rev'd John A Dougherty 2017 (PinC)  

Gold Coast North Anglican Church, 
142 Billinghurst Crescent, 
Upper Coomera 4209 

PO Box 810, Oxenford, QLD 4210

(O) 5580 5814  Mbl  0417 190 817 
Fax   5580 5876
anglicangcn@bigpond.com 
www.goldcoastnorth.org.au

Church Wardens

Ms Karen Jones  
Mrs Patricia Schmidt

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Ian Boniface  
Ms Renee Hall  
Mr Peter La Porta

Mr Grantley Kemble  
Mrs Patricia Schmidt

GOLD COAST SOUTH Deanery: GOLD COAST

The Rev'd Phillip S Hardie 2015 (PinC) GOLD COAST SOUTH
Church of St Peter & St Paul,
Palm Beach, Gold Coast South
(Seats 170) D. & C. 1976

(Parish Church & Office):
69 Palm Beach Avenue,
Palm Beach 4221 
(O) 5534 2115   Mbl   0414 761 804

coolpalmang@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Patricia Bailey  
Ms Susan Coppack  
Mr Robert Paterson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Claire Dean  
Mrs Lesleigh Jackson
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GOODNA Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH WEST

GOODNA
St Alban's, (Seats 60) D.1897
St Luke's, Collingwood Park
(Seats 150) D.1915  C.1982

Vacant 

St Alban's Church: 
69 Alice Street, Goodna 4300; 
Goodna Welfare House:
73 Alice Street, Goodna 4300

Rectory: 
33 Reerdon Street, Collingwood 
Park St Luke's Church & Office:
40 Reerden Street, Collingwood Park 
(O) 3818 4077  Mbl  0400 381 840 
Welfare House   3818 0945 
admin@goodna-anglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Gillian Lynn 
Mrs Janine Tubb

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Helyn Brockman 
Mrs Janine Tubb

GOONANEMAN Deanery: BURNETT

Vacant GOONANEMAN
St John's, Biggenden (Seats 75)
D.1936
St Mary's, Brooweena (Seats 45)
D.1919
Christ Church, Childers (Seats 150)
O.1888 Rebuilt D. 1901
St Thomas', Coalstoun Lakes
(Seats 45) D.1934
St Mary's, Gin Gin (Seats 100)
D.1905

Rectory/Office:
24 Macrossan Street, 
(PO Box 65), Childers 4660 
(O) 4126 1758 
anglicanchilders@bigpond.com.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Margaret Cooper-Smith
Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Beryl Carroll  
Mrs Margaret Cooper-Smith

GOONDIWINDI Deanery: SOUTHERN DOWNS

GOONDIWINDI
Holy Trinity (Seats 120) D.1882
Rebuilt D.1939 C.1944
St Paul's, Talwood (Seats 80)
D. 1956 C.1960
The Church of the Annunciation,
Yelarbon (Seats 80) D.1925

B

The Rev'd Kay G Hart 2017 (R)

Parish Office:  
Holy Trinity Church, 
43 Bowen Street,
(PO Box 37)  Goondiwindi 4390 
(O) 4671 4151    Mbl   0491 228 672 
htcgundy@bigpond.net.au

Church Wardens

Mr Neville Quinlan 
Mrs Gail Toohey  
Mrs Jo Warden

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Jacquie MacDonald 
Mrs Alicia Stewart  
Mrs Gail Toohey

Mrs Kay Rhodes
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GREEN HILLS Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

GREEN HILLS ANGLICAN COMMUNITY
Enoggera
St John the Evangelist, D.1962
(Seats 220)
Kelvin Grove
St James (Seats 150) D.1901
Rebuilt D.1944 C.1983

The Rev'd Canon Bruce W Boase 2012 (PinC)

(Church): 
181 Wardell Street,
Enoggera 4051
Rectory: 
42 Harding Street, 
Enoggera 4051 
(O) 3355 1431   Mbl 0448 206 312 
greenang@tpg.com.au

Church Wardens

Ms Carmen Kleindienst 
Dr Dianne Le Clercq  
Ms Jayne Murdoch

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Carmen Kleindienst 
Ms Suzanne Walker

GROVELY Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

GROVELY
St Matthews (Seats 80) O.1867
D.1997
All Saints', Arana Hills (Seats 300)
C.2000     B

The Rev'd Jennifer G Simson 2015 (R)

(Parish Office & All Saints Church):
68-86 Cobbity Crescent,
Arana Hills 4054
PO Box 452, Ferny Hills 4055 
(O) 3851 0526   Mbl  0434 917 221 
office@grovelyanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Clayton Baker  
Mrs Narelle Betts  
Mrs Beverley Reading

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Clayton Baker  
Mr Blair Given  
Mrs Beverley Reading

Mr Daniel Axelson  
Mrs Rebecca Axelson

GYMPIE Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

GYMPIE
St Peter's (Seats 350) D.1869 Rebuilt
D.1888 Rebuilt D.1954 C.1959
St John's, Pine Street (Seats 200)
D.1969
The Church of the Good Shepherd,
Rainbow Beach, (Seats 100) D.1993
Christ Church, Gunalda (Seats 100) 
O.1956
All Saints', Kandanga (Seats 50)
D.1953      B

The Rev'd Shaji Joseph 2018 (PinC)

(Parish Office):
15 Amy Street Gympie 4570 
(O) 5482 2629     Mbl 0429 995 323

anglican.gympie@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr David Crampton 
Mrs May Nash  
Mr Graham Ward

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Anne Brown  
Mr David Crampton 
Mr Neil Goodall

Ms Catherine David 
Dr Jack Wright
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HAMILTON Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

HAMILTON
St Augustine's (Seats 250) O.1896
Rebuilt D.1920 C.1944                  B

The Rev'd Canon Dr Marian Free, 2008 (R)

Parish Office:
Racecourse Road,
(PO Box 202), 
Hamilton Central 4007 
Res: 9 Charlton Street, Hamilton 4007 
(O) 3268 3935    Mbl 0402 985 593 

staugust@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr Daniel Aspinall 
Ms Lisa Bateson  
Mrs Frances Wellington-
Hacker

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Darryl Barber  
Mr Roger Burrell  
Miss Zara Wellington-Hacker

Mr Daniel Aspinall 
Mr Darryl Barber

HENDRA-CLAYFIELD Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

HENDRA-CLAYFIELD
St John's, Hendra (Seats 80) D.1953
St Colomb's, Clayfield (seats 250)
D.1899 Extensions D.1964 
C.1974   B

The Rev'd Iain A Moore 2015,  (R)

St John's Church: 
66 Manson Road, Hendra 4011 
Rectory/Office:
12 Burilda Street, Hendra 4011
PO Box 2298 Ascot 4007 
St Colomb's Church & Ministry Centre:
23 Victoria Street, Clayfield Q 4011 
(O) 3268 3092     Mbl  0407 382 647

anglican.hendraclayfield@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr Anthony Court  
Mr Peter Tranter  
Mrs Ann-marie Ware

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Sandra Bateman-Ellison 
Mr William Gebers  
Mr Leo Giddens

Mr Hugh Luck-Hurst Smith 
Mr Peter Tranter
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HERVEY BAY Deanery: BURNETT

The Rev'd Gregory M J Loumeau (PinC) 2017 HERVEY BAY
St John's, Wondunna (Seats 300)
D.1990
All Saints' Chapel, Pialba (Seats 30)

B

Parish Office:
5 Peters Lane, Pialba Q 4655 
(PO Box 35),  Hervey Bay 4655 
Residence:
205 Doolong Road,
Wondunna 4655 
(O) 4124 1499     Mbl  0431 065 118

admin@anglicanherveybay.org.au 
www.anglicanherveybay.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr John  Calder  
Mrs Jill Crane  
Mr Maxwell McClelland

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Dianne SmithMrs Merilyn Greensill 
Mr Darren  Nicholls

HOLLAND PARK Deanery: MORETON

HOLLAND PARK
St Matthew's (Seats 250)
D. 1958 C.1963

The Rev'd Allan J Paulsen 2017 (PinC) 

Church Office:
889 Logan Road, Holland Park 4121 
(PO Box 248),  Holland Park 4121  
(O) 3397 0390    Mbl:  0401 570 534 
stmattshp@iprimus.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Graham Young
Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Heather Walker 
Mr Graham Young

INALA Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH WEST

INALA
St Hugh's (Seats 90) D.1956

The Rev'd Carol L Palmer 2016 (PinC)

Church & Parish Office:
105 Poinsettia Street,
(PO Box 32) Inala 4077
(O) 3372 1216     Mbl  0477 447 264 
Fax  3278 8738
Careforce 3372 1216
sthughs@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Margaret Lang  
Mrs Pauline Moran  
Ms Myrna Wakeling

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Geoff Clarke  
Mrs Vivien Taylor
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INDOOROOPILLY Deanery: BRISBANE WEST

INDOOROOPILLY
St Andrew's (Seats 450)
D.1889 Rebuilt D.1965 C.1976     B

The Rev'd Suzanne Wilton 2018 (PinC) 

Rectory/St Andrew's Church
89 Fairley Street,
Indooroopilly 4068 
(O) 3870 7263    Mbl  0417 738 035 
Fax   3870 8581 
secretary@anglicanipilly.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Timothy Coates 
Ms Christina James-Overheu 
Mrs Barbara Potger

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Helen Harrison 
Mr Gregory Marsh  
Ms Deian Ping

Mr Timothy Coates 
Ms Lynn Haughey

IPSWICH Deanery: WEST MORETON

The Rev'd Stephen McMahon 2016 (R) IPSWICH
St Paul's (Seats 400) D.&C. 1859
Extensions C.1945           B

St Paul's Church/Parish Office:
124 Brisbane Street,
(PO Box 168),  Ipswich 4305 

(O) 3812 0377  Mbl 0415 771 345

Fax  3281 6098
admin@stpaulsips.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Malcolm Ferguson 
Mr Des Hunt  
Mr Gregory Thomson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Des Hunt 
Mrs Ruth Mullan 
Mr Peter Taylor

Mrs Susan Buchanan 
Mr Des Hunt

IPSWICH NORTH Deanery: WEST MORETON

IPSWICH NORTH
St Thomas' (Seats 120) D.1889     B

Vacant

Church & Parish Office:
15 Lawrence Street,  
(PO Box 2060), Ipswich North 4305  
(O) 3281 3271
ipsnthanglican@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mr Peter Grice 
Mrs Dorothy Prasser

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Lesley Briggs  
Mrs Cynthia Forbes  
Mr Christopher Raymont

Mrs Lesley Briggs  
Mrs Dorothy Prasser
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ITHACA - ASHGROVE Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

ITHACA-ASHGROVE
St Paul's (Seats 200) 
D.1952 & 1962  C.1991      B

The Rev'd Tiffany F M Sparks 2017 (R)

(St Paul's Church) 
290 Waterworks Road, 
Ashgrove 4060
Parish Office:
10 Jubilee Terrace, 
(PO Box 31), Ashgrove 4060  
(O) 3366 2320   Mbl   0405 224 616

info@stpaulsashgrove.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Sarah Combe  
Mr George McCallan

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Sarah Combe 
Mr Richard Lane  
Mrs Gillian Outen

Mr David Sneesby 
Mr Grant Sparks

ITHACA - RED HILL Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

ITHACA-RED HILL
St Barnabas'  (Seats 70)
D.1889  Rededicated 1997

Vacant 

(St Barnabas' Church & Office)
28 St Barnabas Place, Red Hill 4059 
( PO Box 183), Red Hill 4059 
(O) 3369 3826

redhillanglican@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mr Scott Malcolmson 
Mr Ken Rouse

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Scott Malcolmson 
Mrs Dianne Phillips

JANDOWAE Deanery: BUNYA

JANDOWAE
St Paul's (Seats 120) D.1917
Rebuilt D.1957  C.1960
St Matthew's Bell (Seats 60) D.1910
All Saints', Warra (Seats 60) D.1907
Holy Trinity, Durong (Seats 40)
O.1940

Vacant

(Church & Parish Office)
33 Market Street
(PO Box 30)
Jandowae 4410  
(O) 4668 5383 
janglican@dodo.com

Church Wardens

Dr Olivia Rose-Slater
Synod Reps Parish Nominators

No Synod Reps
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JIMBOOMBA Deanery: LOGAN

JIMBOOMBA
St James the Great (Seats 120)
D.1988 C.1993
St John the Evangelist, Mundoolun
(Seats 90) D.1901 C.1905      B

The Rev'd Daniel J Talbot 2008 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
47-57  East Street,
(PO Box 279),
Jimboomba 4280
(O) 5546 0644   Mbl   0409 898 507 
askus@jimboombaanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Ross Dinnar 
Mrs Penelope Leimeister 
Mr David Robinson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Penelope Leimeister 
Ms Ash-Lee Lund

KANGAROO POINT Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH EAST

KANGAROO POINT
St Mary the Virgin (Seats 200) 
O.1849  Rebuilt C.1873 
Rededicated 1893

The Rev'd Canon Gary F Harch 2014 

Church & Parish Office:
455 Main Street, 
Kangaroo Point 4169  
(PO Box 7050),
East Brisbane 4169 
(O) 3391 4071  Mbl 0487 414 068 
office@saintmarys.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Jan Black 
Ms Marcia Cox 
Mrs Kay Self

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr David Keyt  
Mr Greg Maiden  
Mrs Susan Reade

Mr David Keyt  
Mr Derrick Newton

KAWANA WATERS Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

KAWANA WATERS
Holy Trinity (Seats 200) D.1989   B

The Rev'd Steven Wockner 2018 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
11 Meridian Street, 
Bokarina  Q  4575
All Mail to: (PO Box 6219)
Meridan Plains 4551)
Residence: 6 Royal Close,
Wurtulla 4575
(O) 5493 4774
Revd Wockner  0487 102 916

admin@htkchurch.com

Church Wardens

Mr Nigel Baron  
Mrs Janet Dyke 
Mr Donald Henderson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Janet Dyke  
Mr Gregory Henderson
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Deanery: BRISBANE WESTKENMORE-BROOKFIELD

The Rev'd Jan Crombie 2018 (R) KENMORE-BROOKFIELD
The Church of the Holy Spirit
(Seats 350) D.1966 
Rebuilt D.1980 C.1990
The Church of the Good Shepherd,
Brookfield (Seats 80) D.1893     B

(Church & Parish Office): 
1036 Moggill Road, 
PO Box 1090), Kenmore  4069  
(O) 3378 9189 (Tues-Fri)
Mbl 0439 222 112

www.kenbrookang.org.au 
office@kenbrookang.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Peter Brady  
Mrs Margaret De Witt

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Gaye Johnson 
Mr John Vickers

Dr Neville Eckersley  
Mrs Ann MacRonald

KILCOY Deanery: REDCLIFFE

KILCOY
St Mary's (Seats 120) D.1898
St Mathias', Woodford (Seats 100)
D.1892
Mt Mee Community Church

The Rev'd Jilleen Chambers  (2018) PinC

(Church & Parish Office):
67 William Street,
(PO Box 86), Kilcoy 4515 
(O) 5497 1015   Mbl 0419 676 180 
kilcoyanglican@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Carole Dobson  
Mrs Jennifer Edwards 
Mrs Glenys Willocks

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Hamish Lamb  
Mrs Glenys Willocks

KINGAROY Deanery: BUNYA

KINGAROY
St Michael and All Angels 
(Seats 160) Rebuilt D.1904 C.1993
St Andrew's, Wooroolin (Seats 50)
D.1921
Ironpot Hall     B

Vacant

Church & Parish Office:
2 Alford Street,
(PO Box 76) Kingaroy 4610  
(O) 4162 1231 Mbl 0438 176 828

kingang@westnet.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Lewis Jenkinson 
Mr Gregory Marr  
Mr Stephen Upton

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Stephen Carige  
Mr Lewis Jenkinson

Mrs Jann Bishop  
Ms Rona Sandilands
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LAIDLEY Deanery: WEST MORETON

LAIDLEY
St Saviour's (Seats 140)
D. & C. 1910

Vacant:

(L/T)  The Rev'd R L F Blackburn 
Mbl  0403 376 589

Church & Parish Office:
28 Ambrose Street,
(PO Box 64), Laidley 4341 
(O) 5465 1453      Fax  5465 2871 
laidleyang@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr David Green  
Ms Carolyn Perry

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Suzanne Lazarevski 
Mr Milton Walit

LEICHHARDT Deanery: MARANOA

LEICHHARDT (Leichhardt-
            Chinchilla Anglican 

Mission Area)
St Luke's, Miles (Seats 100) D.1906
St Mary's, Condamine (Seats 100)
D.1961
Holy Trinity, Taroom (Seats 120)
D.1936
St Margaret's, Wandoan (Seats 140)
D.1956     B

Refer  Leichhardt-Chinchilla Anglican Mission Area

Rev'd Terry Frewin 18 (P-in-C)

(Church & Office):
42 Constance Street, 
(PO Box 80),  Miles 4415 
(O) 4627 1190      Fax  4627 1190 
anglicanleichhardt@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Cecily Brockhurst 
Mr Alan Postle

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Cecily Brockhurst 
Mrs Heather Hansen  
Mr Alan Postle

Mr Alan Postle 
Mrs Gillian Rees

LOGAN Deanery: LOGAN

LOGAN
St Mark's, Daisy Hill (Seats 160)
D.1901 Rebuilt D.1983 C.2005
The Church of the Good Shepherd,
Park Ridge, Browns Plains 
(Seats 80)  D.1990     B

The Rev'd Geoff M Hoyte 2010 (R)

Parish Office:
41A Winnetts Road, 
(PO Box 5085) Daisy Hill 4127  
(O) 3290 3718   Mbl  0409 669 904

St Mark's Social Services: 
Mon-Fri 9-12    3808 2696
office@logananglican.com.au 

Church Wardens

Ms Patricia Ferguson 
Mr Brett Kerrison

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Frances Burns  
Ms Patricia Ferguson 
Mr Brett Kerrison

Mrs Frances Burns 
Mr Ian Mitchell
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LUTWYCHE Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

LUTWYCHE
St Andrew's (Seats 200) D.1866
Rebuilt D.1926 C.1960        B

The Rev'd Sandra E Kjellgren, 2002 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
673 Lutwyche Road, 
Lutwyche 4030 
(O) 3857 5734   Mbl  0404 623 423 
Fax  3357 1797 
lutwycheang@bigpond.com
www.lutwycheanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Ms Pixie Annat  
Mr Michael Ruska  
Mrs Louise Thompson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Michael Ruska 
Ms Fleur Scriven  
Mrs Joy Wilson

Ms Pixie Annat  
Ms Anna-Britt Kjellgren

MALENY Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

MALENY
St George's, Maleny (Seats 130)
D.1931 Rebuilt D.1993
St Mary's, Montville (Seats 80)
D.1914
St Luke's, Kenilworth D.1914
St Matthew's, Gheerulla D.1926
Rebuilt D.1955 (Closed 17 May 2015)

The Rev'd Jeanette A Jamieson 2017 (PinC)

(Parish Office & Residence):
2 Walkers Drive, (PO Box 265)
Maleny 4552  
(O) 5499 9130  Mbl  0429 073 262 
angmaleny@westnet.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Jim Atkinson  
Mrs Shirley Moreland 
Mrs Carole Phillips

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Peter Blackburn  
Mrs Maureen Cooper 
Mrs Judy Payne

Mrs Susan Myring 
Mr Garry Richter

MANLY-TINGALPA Deanery: MORETON

MANLY
St Paul's (Seats 200) 1912
Rebuilt D.1964 C.1974        B

The Rev'd Daniel Hobbs 2019 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office): 99 Ernest 
Street,
Manly 4179  
(O) 3396 2746
office@stpaulsmanly.org

Church Wardens

Mr Mark Austin  
Mr Robert Wilson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Jennifer Crisp  
Mr Nicholas Crisp  
Mrs Melinda Lawrence

Mr Christopher Rohde 
Mrs Isobel Rohde
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MARANOA-WARREGO ANG MISSION AREA Deanery: MARANOA

The Rev'd Steffan van Munster 2016 (PinC) MARANOA-WARREGO ANGLICAN 
MISSION AREA
Comprising Parish of Charleville, Parish of 
Cunnamulla and Parish of Mitchell

(Parish Office):
30 Oxford Street,
(PO Box 9), 
Mitchell 4465 
(O) 4623 1126    Mbl 0428 231 126 
mwad11@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Merilyn Taylor
Synod Reps Parish Nominators

MAROOCHYDORE Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

MAROOCHYDORE
St Peter's (Seats 250) D.1925
Rebuilt D.1970 C.1975         B

The Rev'd Tania A Eichler 2017 ( R )

(Church & Parish Office): 
Cnr Church Street and Beach Road
(PO Bo 243), Maroochydore 4558  
Rectory: 210 Wises Road,
Buderim  4556

(O) 5443 2133    Mbl   0401 690 127
office@anglicanmaroochydore.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Marie Flegler  
Mrs Daphne McAdam

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Marie Flegler  
Mrs Daphne McAdam 
Mr Lance Tremlett

Ms Anne Braithwaite 
Mrs Marie Flegler

MARYBOROUGH Deanery: BURNETT

MARYBOROUGH
St Paul's 1879 (Seats 450)
D.1866 Rebuilt D.&.C 1879
Christ Church, Granville (Seats 50)
D.1883    B

The Rev'd Susan P Wilson 2015  (R)

(Church & Parish Office:) 
Cnr Lennox & Ellena Streets,
(PO Box 329), Maryborough 4650  
(O) 4121 4745   Mbl   0419 873 457 

admin@anglicanmaryborough.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Alan McHardy 
Mr Ian Miles

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Greg Hammond 
Mr Alan McHardy  
Mr Ian Miles

Mrs Pamela McHardy
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MILLMERRAN Deanery: SOUTHERN DOWNS

MILLMERRAN
St Peter's (Seats 150) D.1901
Rebuilt D.1956 C.1962
All Saints', Yandilla (Seats 90)
D.&C. 1897
St Augustine of Canterbury, Leyburn 
(Seats 80) D.1871
St Paul's, Tummaville (Seats 40)
D.1891 (closed 1985)

The Rev'd David Snape (L/T)

Church & Rectory:
43 Walpole Street, 
(PO Box 457), 
Millmerran 4357  
(Bishop's Office - Toowoomba)

(O) 4614 7050

rr_millar@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr John Brand 
Mrs Cheryl King 
Mr Ross Millar

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

  No Synod Reps

MITCHELL Deanery: MARANOA

MITCHELL
(Maranoa-Warrego Anglican Mission 
Area - also comprising Charleville and 
Cunnamulla)
All Saints (Seats 110) D.1890
Rebuilt C.1987
St Barnabas', Amby (Seats 70)
D.1955

Refer Maranoa-Warrego Anglican Mission Area 
The Rev'd Steffan J van Munster 2016 (PinC)

(Church & Parish): 
Cnr 110 Alice & 24 Oxford 
Streets,  
(PO Box 9)  Mitchell 4465  
Rectory:30 Oxford Street, Mitchell
(O) 4623 1126   Mbl  0428 231 126 
allsaintsmitchell@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Jennifer Crocker  
Mrs Christine Mclean

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Christine Mclean

MOGGILL-MT CROSBY Deanery: BRISBANE WEST

MOGGIL-MT CROSBY
St Michael & All Angels, Moggill
(Seats 80) D.1968 Extensions
D.1991
Mt Crosby State School

The Rt Rev'd Rob W Nolan 2015 (PinC)

Church: 
3407 Moggill Road,
Moggill 4070  
Postal Address:
PO Box 168,
Bellbowrie 4070
(O) 3432 9260  Mbl  0439 784 457 
church@mmcanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Dr John Gavranich  
Mr Stephen Greenwood 
Mrs Wendy Hilder

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Dr Philip Towers 
Dr Samantha Towers
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MORNINGSIDE Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH EAST

MORNINGSIDE
The Church of the Ascension
(Seats 150) D1911 Rebuilt D 1925
C. 2013

The Rev'd Martyn C Hope 2017 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
706 Wynnum Road, (PO Box 27) Morningside 4170  
(O) 3399 4129    Mbl  0418 177 785 
admin@morningsideanglican.org.au 
www.morningsideanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Grace Goss  
Mr Rodney Powell

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Joshua  Beausang 
Mr Rodney Powell

MT GRAVATT Deanery: MORETON

The Rt Rev'd Dr Doug R Stevens 2012 (R) MT GRAVATT
St Bartholomew's (Seats 200) O 1897
Rebuilt D.1974 C.1978                  B

1357  Logan Road Mt Gravatt 4122  PO Box 275 Mt Gravatt 4122  
(O) 3849 4411 

secretary@stbarts.net.au

Church Wardens

Mr Steve James  
Mrs Judith John  
Mrs Jillian Patrick

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Steve James  
Mrs Judith John  
Miss Vaishi Rajanayagam

Mrs Judith John  
Miss Vaishi Rajanayagam

MUDGEERABA Deanery: GOLD COAST

MUDGEERABA
The Church of the Good Shepherd
(Seats 50) Reded 1988
C.1915

The Rev'd Harold Reuss 2019 (Hon PinC) 

(Church & Parish Office):
4 Tarrant Drive, Mudgeeraba 4213
All Mail to: 
(PO Box 332) Mudgeeraba 4213  
(O) 5525 1018
mudgeeraba@anglicangoldcoast.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr John Hosking  
Mr Mark Stevens

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Aileen Sinclair

163



D = Dedication      C = Consecration     O = Opened   B = Benefice

MUNDUBBERA-EIDSVOLD-MONTO Deanery: BURNETT

MUNDUBBERA-EIDSVOLD-MONTO
St John the Baptist, Mundubbera (Seats 
80) D.1923
St Mark's, Eidsvold (Seats 80)
D.1892 Rebuilt D.1960
St Paul's, Abercorn (Seats 30)
D. 1939
All Saints', Monto (Seats 100)
D.1928 Rebuilt D. 1964 C.1975     B

The Rev'd Jeffery B Balnaves 2016 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
78-80 Lyons Street,
(PO Box 68) Mundubbera 4626
(O) 4165 4665  Mbl  0407 150 889 
memanglicanchurch@gmail.com
www.anglicanmundubbera@wordpress.com

Church Wardens

Mr Fred Heidrich  
Mrs Julie Roger  
Mrs Jean Wedemeyer

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Fred Heidrich  
Mrs Theresa Pattie 
Mrs Julie Roger

Mrs Cheryl Heidrich 
Mr Fred Heidrich

NAMBOUR Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

NAMBOUR
St John the Baptist (Seats 300)
D.1903 Rebuilt D.1959 C.1966
All Saints', Yandina (Seats 60) 
O.1926
St Margaret's, Woombye (Seats 75)
D.1898   B

Vacant

(Church & Parish Office):
174-176 Currie Street,
(PO Box 5327), Nambour 4560
(O) 5441 1018     Mbl  0427 101 070 
sj.anglican@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr Paul DeKruyf  
Mrs Lynette Hall  
Mrs Jesma O'Hara

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Lynne Doneley 
Mrs Jesma O'Hara

Mrs Lynne Doneley 
Mrs Coral McVean

NANANGO Deanery: BUNYA

NANANGO
St Anne's (Seats 130) D.1881
Rebuilt D.1910
St John the Divine, Blackbutt
(Seats 150) D.1912 Rebuilt D.1967
St Philip's Yarraman (Seats 60)
D.1913 

Vacant

(Church & Parish Office):
110 Burnett Street, Nanango 4615  
(O) 4163 1393    Mbl 0412 002 116 
co07808@bigpond.net.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Susan Allen  
Mrs Tania Fitzsimons 
Mr Ian Mowat

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Susan Allen 
Mr Ian Mowat
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NERANG Deanery: GOLD COAST

NERANG
St Margaret's (Seats 110) O.1878
D.1900

The Rev'd Harold Reuss 2019 (PinC) 

(Church & Parish Office):
167-169 Beaudesert-Nerang Road,
Nerang 4211
(O) 5596 6596   Mbl  0439 550 773 
stmargaretsnerang@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr John Davies  
Mrs Sue Seccombe

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Narrelle Allen 
Mr Grant  Vorhauer

NEW FARM Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

The Ven. Olaf E Anderson 2011 (R) NEW FARM
St Michael and All Angels 
(Seats 225)
D.1891 Rebuilt D.1959 C.1974     B

(Church & Office):
655 Brunswick Street,
New Farm 4005  

(O)  3358 1555
stm.newfarm@bigpond.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Howard Haddrell  
Ms Jacqueline Hunter

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Howard Haddrell  
Ms Jacqueline Hunter 
Mr Gary Ypinazar

Mrs Gail Frankcom  
Ms Margaret Harrington

NOOSA Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

NOOSA
St Mary the Virgin, Tewantin
(Seats 200) D.1932
Rebuilt D & C 1995
St Andrew's, Sunshine Beach
D.1990  (Seats 150)       B

The Rev'd Mark N Calder 2009 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
17 William Street, Tewantin 4565 
All Mail to: 
(PO Box 342) Tewantin 4565  
(O) 5449 8009
office@anglicanchurchnoosa.org

Church Wardens

Mr John Butterworth  
Mrs Rebecca  Hutton 
Dr Don Turkington

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr John Butterworth  
The Rev'd Chris Ivey 
Mr David Vos

Ms Mary Couche 
Mr Kevin Hutton
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NORTH PINE Deanery: REDCLIFFE

St John the Baptist, Petrie 
(Seats 250) D1953 C.1978 
Rebuilt D.1995. C. 2000
St Aidan's, Dayboro (Seats 50)
D.1930                                    B

The Ven. Chris D Johnson 1996 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
2 Wyllie Street Petrie 4502  
(O) 3285 6333    Mbl  0427 586 568 
admin@northpineanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Don Amos  
Mrs Nicole Cunneen 
Mr Garth Hollindale

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Graeme  Aldom  
Mr Garth Hollindale 
Mr Iain Simonds

Mr Frank Harrison  
Mr Stuart MacKenzie

NUNDAH Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

NUNDAH
St Francis' (Seats 300) D.1886
Removed 1913, Rebuilt D.1959
C.1974
The Church of the Holy Spirit
Wavell Heights (Seats 120) D.1937   B

The Rev'd Canon T J (James) G Oulds 2000 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
62-66 Cavendish Street,
(PO Box 165)  Nundah 4012
(O) 3266 2174 + Fax   Mbl 0408 876 301 
pew@assisinundah.org

Church Wardens

Mrs Jennifer Eagles  
Mrs Carolyn Siemsen

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Annette Barnes 
Mr Neil Crisp  
Mrs Jennifer Eagles

Mrs Annette Barnes  
Mrs Carolyn Siemsen

OAKEY
Deanery: TOOWOOMBA

OAKEY
St Augustine of Canterbury, Oakey
(Seats 130) D.1898
Rebuilt D.1981 C,1989
St Anne's, Jondaryan (Seats 60)
D.1893 Reded. 1993
St Thomas', Biddeston (Seats 60)
D.1925

The Rev'd David Snape (L/T)

(Church & Parish Office)
2 Creek Street, (PO Box 29),
Oakey 4401  
(O) 4691 1193
oakeyanglicanparishqld@gmail.com 

Church Wardens

Mrs Margaret Clarke 
Mr Graham Cooke

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Fredrick Hurman 
Mrs Janet Hurman
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PALMWOODS Deanery: SUNSHINE COAST

PALMWOODS
St Augustine of Canterbury 
(Seats 100)  D.125

The Ven Richard N Gowty 2013 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
13 Hill Street, (PO Box 301), 
Palmwoods 4555  
(O) 5478 9300    Mbl 0411 236 650 
(AH)   5442 1283
anglipalm@yahoo.com.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Beverley Scholz 
Mr David Vickary

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

PITTSWORTH Deanery: TOOWOOMBA

PITTSWORTH
St Andrew's (Seats 250) C.1899
Rebuilt C.1913     B

The Rev'd Frances Andrews 2018 (PinC) 

(Rectory & Parish Office):
18 Murray Street,
(PO Box 44) Pittsworth 4356  
(O) 4693 1029    Mbl 0409 671 152

stanpitt44@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mr Geoffrey Baker  
Mr Ian Kronk  
Mrs Brenda Prentice

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Ian Kronk  
Mrs Annette Stallman 
Mr Gregory Wilkes

Mrs Lorraine West

QUILPIE
Deanery: MARANOA

QUILPIE
St Matthew's (Seats 100) D.1936
St Clare's, Windorah (Seats 25)
D.1896
Eromanga
Cheepie

Contact the Office of 
Bishop Cameron Venables 

(O) 4614 7050

Church & Rectory:
13 Buln Buln Streets,
Quilpie 4480  

All Mail to:
Bishop for the Western Region
PO Box 2600 Toowoomba 4350 

(O) 4614 7050    Mbl   0419 784 456

167



D = Dedication      C = Consecration     O = Opened   B = Benefice

REDCLIFFE Deanery: REDCLIFFE

REDCLIFFE
St Mary's (Seats 200) D.1898
Rebuilt D.1959 C.1967
St Anne's Scarborough (Seats 80)
D.1970 C. 1976                           B

The Rev'd Graheme P Baldock 1996 (R)

(Parish Office)
97 Sutton Street, Redcliffe
(Church)
93 Sutton Street, 
(PO Box 439),  Redcliffe 4020  

(O) 3284 2393   Mbl 0407 328 423 
Fax   3284 4380 
redang@westnet.com.au

Church Wardens

Ms Allison Gray  
Mr Donald Kirkwood 
Mr Raymond White

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Allison Gray  
Mr Donald Kirkwood 
Mr Raymond White

Ms Allison Gray  
Mr Raymond White

ROBINA-MERMAID BEACH Deanery: GOLD COAST

ROBINA-MERMAID BEACH
Trinity Anglican Mission (Seats 200)
D.1997        B

The Rev'd Stewart R Perry 2015 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
186 Robina Town Centre Drive,
(PO Box 3065), 
Robina Town Centre 4230 
(O) 5618 8238    Mbl   0421 421 521 
Fax   5578 7445
office@robinaanglican.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Dawn Courage 
Mrs Lynne Farrar  
Mr Stephen Wruck

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Frank Estevao 
Mrs Lynne Farrar  
Mr Stephen Wruck

Mr Frank Estevao  
Ms Hope Nakagawa-Morrison

ROCHEDALE Deanery: LOGAN

ROCHEDALE
St Philip's (Seats 90) D.1957    
Community Hall New St Philip's
(Seats 250) D. 2017                   B

The Rev'd George S Stuart 1996 (PinC)

Church and Parish Office
270 Rochedale Road
Rochedale 4123  

(R) 3290 2300
(O) 3736 2181
stphils@bigpond.net.au

Church Wardens

Mr Rob Cox  
Mr Martin Hawkins 
Mr Bryan Kenny

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Martin Hawkins 
Mr Bryan Kenny  
Mr Shane Reddell

Mr Dave Allen  
Mr Martin Hawkins
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ROMA Deanery: MARANOA

ROMA
St Paul's (Seats 400) C.1876
Rebuilt D.1915 C.1947
St John the Divine, Surat (Seats 100)
O.1879 Rebuilt D.1938
St John the Baptist, Wallumbilla
(Seats 100) D.1912 Rebuilt D.1955
St Andrew's, Yuleba (Seats 75) D.1891
St Peter's, Injune (Seats 50) D.1926
Dunkeld                                      B

The Rev'd Dr Graham Warren 2016 (PinC)

The Rev'd Imelda O'Loughlin 
Mbl 0409 665 300
Church:
Cnr Bungil & Arthur Streets,
Roma 4455 
Rectory: 13 Taylor Street,  
(PO Box 37), Roma  4455
(O) 4622 4623 Mbl: 0409 665 301 
stpaulsroma@bigpond.com 

Church Wardens

Mrs Sheryl Arnold  
Mr Craig Miller  
Mrs Leslee Sabine

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Jean Benham  
Mr David Knowles  
Mrs Leslee Sabine

Mr Patrick Hanly  
Mrs Susan Sharpe

ROSEWOOD Deanery: WEST MORETON

ROSEWOOD
St Luke's (Seats 150) D.1930
All Saints, Marburg (Seats 100)
D.1891
St James', Lowood (Seats 100)
D.1894
St Anne's, Hiddenvale (Seats 35)
D.1937

The Rev'd Louise Orpe 2019 (PinC) 

(Church & Parish Office):
74 John Street,
(PO Box 176),
Rosewood 4340  
(O) 5464 2797 
anglicanrosewood@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Catherine  Nicol 
Mr Rob Parker  
Mrs Sue Thomas

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Sue Dunne  
Mr Mark Robinson

SAMFORD Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

SAMFORD
St Paul's, 1924 (Seats 140) D.1924
Removed from Alderley and 
Rededicated 1988

Vacant 

(St Paul's Church): 
12 Mt Samson Road, Samford 4520 
Rectory: 2 Serendipity Drive, 
(PO Box 213), Samford  4520 

3289 1715
samfordanglican@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mr Robert Kersnovske 
Mrs Christine Pass  
Mrs Bronwyn Rees

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Robert Kersnovske 
Ms Linda Wallis
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SANDGATE NORTHPOINT Deanery: REDCLIFFE

SANDGATE-NORTHPOINT
St Margaret's (Seats 130) O.1887
Rebuilt 1891 Rebuilt D.1927 C.1948
St Peter's, Brighton (Seats 100)
D.1960
Bracken Ridge (Seats 150) 
D.1989    B

The Rev'd Michael Donaldson 2019 (PinC) 

Church/Rectory
103 Denham Street, 
Brackenridge 4017
Parish Office:
58 Rainbow Street 
(PO Box 135) Sandgate 4017
(O) 3269 1148   Mbl  0406 492 912 
Mbl 0481 533 123 
sandgatenorthpoint@outlook.com

Church Wardens

Mr Rodney Kennedy  
Mr Christopher Mancini

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Christobel Clark 
Mrs Judy Kennedy  
Ms Angela Manley

Mr David Lewis  
Mr Christopher Mancini

SHERWOOD Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH WEST

SHERWOOD
St Matthew's (Seats 300)
D.1870 C.1847 Rebuilt D.1923
St John the Divine, Oxley (Seats 120)
O.1865 Rebuilt 1891 Rebuilt
D.1928   B

The Rev'd Peter Shayler-Webb 2004 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
Cnr Sherwood & Oxley Roads
(PO Box 107), Sherwood 4075 
Residence: 
41 Kathleen Street,
Corinda 4075
(O) 3379 3437   Mbl  0439 770 487

angprswd@tpg.com.au

Church Wardens

Ms Cheryl Dymock 
Mr Michael Hortz  
Mr Glen Taylor

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Marilyn Moore 
Mr Bruce Moy 
Ms Cheryl Scholtz

Ms Cheryl Dymock 
Ms Marilyn Moore
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SOUTH BRISBANE Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH EAST

SOUTH BRISBANE
St Andrew's (Seats 300) O.1878
D.1883 Extension D.1932       B

The Rev'd Alan K Moore 1992 (R)

Church & Parish Office:
160 Vulture Street, 
South Brisbane 4101

(O) 3844 3808   Mbl 0409 062 156
st-andrews@st-andrews.org.au

The Rev'd Ian McGrath  Mbl 0475 941 280

Church Wardens

Mr Ed Behrbohm  
Dr Mark Hickman 
Mr Bruce Wilson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Ed Behrbohm  
Dr Judith Salecich  
Mr Stephen Woodward

Mrs Angela Rae 
Mr Bruce Wilson

SOUTHPORT Deanery: GOLD COAST

St Peter's (Seats 450) D.1887
Rebuilt 1960 C 1971      B

The Rev'd Donald L Parker 2015  (R)

(Church & Parish Office
83 Nerang Street,
(PO Box 1950), Southport 4215 
Res: 26 Water Street, Southport 4215 
(O) 5532 8978  Mbl 0434 040 138

parish@stpetersgc.com.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Christine Corroy 
Dr Russell Manfield  
Mr Allen Peters

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Judith Dempsey 
Mr Ian Hollindale  
Dr Russell Manfield

Dr Russell Manfield 
Mr Jason Zagami
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SPRINGFIELD, ST ANDREW'S PARISH Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH WEST

Meeting at:
The Multipurpose Centre
The Springfield Anglican College
Secondary Campus
Springfield Greenbank Arterial Road
Springfield QLD 4300

The Rev'd Charles R Lacey 2016 (PinC)

St Andrew's Parish of Springfield
All Mail: C/- 94 James Josey Ave, Springfield 4300 
Mbl 0476 818 763
charlie@standrewsspringfield.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Mark Dungey  
Miss Juanita Fialua

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Mark Dungey  
Miss Juanita Fialua 
Mr Scott Stephens

Mr Mark Dungey 
Mrs Helen Irwin

ST GEORGE Deanery: MARANOA

ST GEORGE with DIRRANBANDI
Christ Church, St George 
(Seats 200) D.1893 Rebuilt D&C 1960
St Anne's, Thallon (Seats 50) D.1959
C.1960
St Mark's, Dirranbandi (Seats 50) D.1936
St Mary the Virgin, Bollon (Seats 50)

Vacant

(Church & Parish Office):
133-135 Victoria Streets,
(PO Box 267),  St George 4487 
(O) 4625 3044   Mbl  0409 263 817

stgeorgeanglican@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Dr Desley Buchan  
Mrs Diane Massurit

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Dr Desley Buchan  
Mrs Diane Massurit

ST LUCIA Deanery: BRISBANE WEST

The Ven Michael A J Faragher 2014  (R) ST LUCIA
Christ Church (Seats 300) O.1936
Rebuilt D.1962 C.1973     B

(Church & Parish Office):
Cnr. Central & Ninth 
Avenues, St Lucia 4067  
All mail to:  9 Ninth Avenue, St Lucia 4067 
(O) 3870 8887  Mbl   0424 344 273 

ccstluci@tpg.com.au 
www.anglican-stlucia.org

Church Wardens

Dr Chris Andrews 
Mrs Kym Reid

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Dr Chris Andrews 
Mrs Ann Fitzpatrick 
Dr Rosalind Mason

Dr Ruth Kerr OAM 
Mr Richard Mason
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STAFFORD Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

STAFFORD
St Clement's on the Hill (Seats 350) 
D.1963 Rebuilt D.1979 C.1987      B

The Rev'd Kevin G Bourke 2015 (R)

(Church & Parish Office): 
2 Eudunda Street 
Stafford 4053  
(O) 3356 4300   Mbl 0419 693 552

office@stclements.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Susanne Krause 
Mr Robert Mowat  
Mr David Murray

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Carol Defries 
Mr James Haig  
Mr David Murray

Ms Alexandra Amankwah 
Mr David Murray

STANTHORPE Deanery: SOUTHERN DOWNS

STANTHORPE
St Paul's (Seats 250) D.1874
Rebuilt D & C 1878 Rebuilt D.1905
Rebuilt D.1959 C.1971
St John's The Summit, D.1926 
(Seats 50)
St Barnabas', Dalveen (Seats 50)
D.1910
St James', Glen Aplin (Seats 50) O.1935
St Denys, Amiens D.1923 (Seats 50)      B

The Rev'd Daniel Sitaram 2017 (PinC) 

(St Paul's Church & Office):
Cnr Corundum & High 
Streets, (PO Box 98)
Stanthorpe 4380  
(O) 4681 3030    Mbl 0447 743 781

stanthorpeanglican@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Marj Furness 
Mr Rod Haase  
Mr Peter Moll

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Gillian Boucher 
Mr Robert Horn  
Mr Peter Moll

Mr Brough Warren  
Mrs Margaret Warren

STRATHPINE Deanery: REDCLIFFE

STRATHPINE
St Faith's (Seats 200)
D.1980 C.1987      B

The Rev'd Desmond Potter 2017

Parish Office: 
1 Sutherland Drive,
Strathpine 4500 
(O) 3881 2090

office@stfaiths-strathpine.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Michael Bolton  
Mr Peter Doolan  
Mrs Laura van Kressibucher

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Michael Bolton  
Ms Pam Lynam  
Mrs Laura van Kressibucher

Ms Amanda McCarrick  
Mrs Laura van Kressibucher
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SUNNYBANK Deanery: LOGAN

SUNNYBANK
St Barnabas' (Seats 300) D.1977 
C.2012          B

The Rev'd Stephen M Hooper 2016 (PinC)

Cnr Lister & Young Streets 
(PO Box 12) Sunnybank 4109  

(O) 3345 1535  Mbl  0411 579 954

sunnybankanglican@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Narelle Blunt 
Mr Adrian Chee  
Mr Dallas Elvery

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Robyn Armstrong 
Mrs Narelle Blunt  
Mr Ian Olsson

Mrs Narelle Blunt 
Mr Peter Buttery

SURFERS PARADISE Deanery: GOLD COAST

SURFER'S PARADISE
The Church of the Holy Spirit
(Seats 400)  D.1979 C.1988
St John's (Seats 60) 
D.1951  C.1957      B

The Rev'd Michael C Uptin 2008 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
73-75 Salerno Street,
Surfers Paradise 4217
Mail to:
PO Box 5384 
Gold Coast Mail Centre 9726 
(O) 5592 1543   Mbl 0410 606 411 
office@surfersanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Sherri Bailey  
Mr Robert Kelly  
Mrs Pauline Millican

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Sherri Bailey  
Ms Lynn Gallagher 
Mr Robert Kelly

Mrs Judy Bennett 
Ms Kay Lauchland

TAMBORINE MOUNTAIN Deanery: LOGAN

TAMBORINE MOUNTAIN
St George's (Seats 200) D.1938
Rebuilt C.1992
St Luke's, Canungra (Seats 60)
D.1936

The Ven Valerie A Hoare 2013 

(Church & Parish Office):
2 Dapsang Drive, 
Tamborine Mountain 4272  
(O) 5545 2919      Mbl 0487 117 662 
anglicantamborine@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mr John King  
Mrs Jennifer Peat

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Judy Jaeger  
Mrs Gisela Meehl
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TARA Deanery: BUNYA

TARA
St Martin of Tours (Seats 100) D.1936
St Augustine's, Meandarra 
(Seats 70) D.1955
Inglestone
Moonie

Vacant

(Church):
51 Day Street, (PO Box 27)
Tara 4421  
Mbl  0467 735 969 
stmartinstara@gmail.com 

Church Wardens

Mrs Michelle Heuston
Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Michelle Heuston

TEXAS-INGLEWOOD Deanery: SOUTHERN DOWNS

TEXAS-INGLEWOOD
All Saints', Texas (Seats 100)
D.1905 Rebuilt D.1980
St John the Evangelist, Inglewood
(Seats 150) D.1894 Rebuilt D.1962
C.1979

Vacant

(Church & Parish Office):
27 George Street, 
(PO Box 160)
Inglewood 4387
(O) 4652 2999 
angtexingl4@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Margaret Cranston
Parish NominatorsSynod Reps

THE GAP Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

THE GAP
St Mark's (Seats 200) D.1978
C.1988      B

The Rev'd Ken D Hopper 2008 (R)

(Parish Office):
1073 Waterworks Road 
(PO Box 22), The Gap 4061 
Residence: 
1091 Waterworks Road, The Gap 4061
(O)3300 1502     Mbl 0439 722 210
Fax    3300 9597 
info@tgac.org.au 
www.tgac.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr Pierre De Wet 
Geldenhuys  
Mr Daniel Green

Parish Nominators

Mr Daniel Green  
Mr Mark Illingworth  
Mr Adam Robinson

Synod Reps

Ms Denise Cruickshank 
Mrs Desley Green
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THE LAKES ANGLICAN CHURCH Deanery: REDCLIFFE

THE LAKE ANGLICAN CHURCH
(Incorporating Griffin, Mango Hill & 
North Lakes)

The Rev'd Daniel J Berris 2012  (PinC)

Parish Office/Rectory:
4 Walowa Street, North Lakes 4509 
Place of Worship:
The Space,
Cnr Lakefield Drive and Endeavour Blvd, North Lakes  4509

(O) 3482 4493   Mbl  0403 977 512
office@thelakesanglican.org.au
www.thelakesanglican.org.au

Church Wardens

Ms Shannon Buttriss
Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Ian Russell  
Miss Eleanor Whereat

TOOWONG Deanery: BRISBANE WEST

TOOWONG
St Thomas' (Seats 200) C.1877     B

The Rev'd Tom E Sullivan 2009 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):

3/96 Jephson Street, Toowong 4066 

(O) 3870 1655   Mbl   0422 641 657

office@stthomastoowong.org.au 
www.stthomastoowong.org.au

Church Wardens

Miss Leanne Cronk 
Mr Peter Luxton

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Miss Leanne Cronk 
Mr Peter Luxton  
Mr Joseph Samson

Miss Leanne Cronk 
Mr Joseph Samson

TOOWOOMBA WEST Deanery: TOOWOOMBA

TOOWOOMBA WEST
St Alban's, Newtown (seats 200) 
D. 1908
St Augustine's, Rockville (seats 200) 
D.1967 C.1971     B

The Rev'd Pauline Harley 2019 (PinC)

Parish Office: 
69a Anzac Avenue, 
(entry via Hill Street) Newtown 4350
PO Box 6413 Clifford Gardens 4350 
(O) 4638 5521 & Fax  Mbl  0407 676 917 
admin@toowoombawest.org
www.toowoombawest.org

Church Wardens

Mrs Sharyn Gray  
Mrs Geoffrey Lingard 
Mrs Carolyn Smith

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Sandra Gierke 
Mr Gary Rozynski  
Mrs Carolyn Smith

Mr Alan Gray  
Mrs Sharyn Gray
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TOOWOOMBA, ST BARTHOLOMEW'S Deanery: TOOWOOMBA

ST BARTHOLOMEW'S
St Bartholomew's, Rangeville
(Seats 500) D.1938 Rebuilt C.1982
Relocated 2012

The Rev'd Adam M Lowe 2013  (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
103 Stenner Street, Rangeville,
Toowoomba 4350 
PO Box 11390 Centenary Heights, Toowoomba 4350 

(O) 4636 2922  Mbl 0410 512 782
office@stbarts.com.au
www.stbarts.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Jeremy Freyburg  
Mr Dennis Gamble  
Ms Wendy Swanson

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Warren Dutton  
Mr Jeremy Freyburg 
Mrs Trish Rathie

Mr Michael Dennison 
Mr Jeremy Freyburg

TOOWOOMBA, ST JAMES' Deanery: TOOWOOMBA

TOOWOOMBA, ST JAMES
St James (Seats 320) D.1869 C.1877
St Anne's, Highfield (Seats 100)
O.1886     B

The Ven Mark D Carlyon 2017 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
145 Mort Street, (PO Box 2004), Toowoomba City 4350 
(O) 4639 1858 Mbl   0419 729 233
Fax  4639 2455

office@stjames.org.au

Church Wardens

Mr James  Adol 
Mr Rodney Brightman 
Mrs Sandra Whybird

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Prof Reid Mortensen  
Mrs Pamela Wedgwood 
Mrs Sandra Whybird

Mrs Allison Leech  
Prof Reid Mortensen

TOOWOOMBA, ST LUKE'S Deanery: TOOWOOMBA

TOOWOOMBA,
St Luke's, (Seats 600) O.1857
Rebuilt 1897 C.1972
All Saints' (Seats 120) O.1888
D.1921
St Mark's, Rangeville (Seats 150)
D.1970 C.1976    B

The Rev'd Paul Mitchell 2017 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
152 Herries Street, 
(PO Box 2434)
Toowoomba 4350  
(O) 4639 1910   Mbl 0437 391 910

stluke.tmba@bigpond.com.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Judith Bond 
Mrs Sandra Lee 
Mr Steve Rigney

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Judith Bond  
Mr John Compton  
Dr Ann Dashwood

Ms Margaret Compton 
Dr Ann Dashwood

177



D = Dedication      C = Consecration     O = Opened   B = Benefice

TORRES STRAIT ISLANDER Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

TORRES STRAIT ISLANDERC/- of the Parish of Fortitude Valley

PO Box 1220 
Fortitude Valley 4006  
Tel:  3852 1635

Church Wardens

Ms Rosaline Dai 
Ms Rose Elu

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Rose Elu     
Ms Bethel O'Keefe

WARWICK Deanery: SOUTHERN DOWNS

WARWICK
St Mark's (Seats 300) D.1869
Rebuilt D.1870 D.1872 C1896
Additions C.1940
St John's, West Warwick (Seats 75) 
O.1972
St Alban's, Maryvale (Seats 75) D.1925
St James', Pratten (Seats 75) C.1882
Christ Church, Killarney (Seats 90) C.1879
Rebuilt D&C 1891 Rebuilt D.1970
C.1971   B

Vacant

(Church & Parish Office):
55 Albion Street (cnr Grafton Street)
Warwick 4370  
(O) 4661 7223    Mbl  0417 609 745 
admin@warwickanglican.org.au

www.anglicanwarwick.org.au 

Church Wardens

Mr Gregory Carey  
Mrs Sharon Johnson  
Mr Lewis Von Stieglitz

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Alison Appleby 
Mr Ian Lennard  
Mr Douglas Wilson

Mr Jeffery Rogers  
Mr Lewis von Stieglitz

WATERLOO BAY Deanery: MORETON

WATERLOO BAY
St George's, Birkdale (Seats 100)
D.1935 C.1945
St James', Wellington Point
(Seats 50)  D&C 1913     B

The Rev'd Scott W J Gunthorpe 2015 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
33 Thorne Road,
(PO Box 3203), Birkdale 4159  
(O) 3822 1110     Mbl    0431 494 012 
office@apwb.net

Church Wardens

Mr Ian Carr  
Mr Robert  Clark  
Mr Scott Leisemann

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Ian Carr  
Mr Robert  Clark  
Mr Scott Leisemann

Mrs Aline Stinton  
Mr Robert Sweeney
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WILSTON Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH WEST

WILSTON
St Alban the Martyr, 1929 (Seats 220)
D.1914 Rebuilt D&C 1943

The Rev'd Julia R Van Den Bos 2014 (PinC) 

(Church& Parish Office)
Cnr Lovedale Street, 
(PO Box 219) Wilston 4051 
Rectory: 60 Inglis Street, Wilston
 (O) 3356 0030 
parishoffice@stalbanswilston.org.au

Church Wardens

Mrs Susan Bryant 
Mr David McHugh

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr David McHughMr Julian Glassock 
Mrs Pamela Ray

WISHART Deanery: MORETON

WISHART
St John the Evangelist (Seats 160)
C.1990      B

The Rev'd Peter R Judge-Mears, 2013  (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
10 Greenwood Street,
Wishart 4122  
(O) 3849 5444   Mbl 0403 413 478 
office@stjohnswishart.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Anthony Harper 
Mr Earl Marken  
Mr Ross Miles

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Anthony Harper 
Mr Earl Marken  
Mrs Anne Milton

Mr Earl Marken  
Mr John Saunders

WOOLLOONGABBA Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH EAST

WOOLLOONGABBA
Holy Trinity (Seats 240) O.1870
Rebuilt D.1875 Rebuilt D.1930
C.1950

 The Rev'd Ron Paschke (PinC) 

(Church & Office):
68 Hawthorne Street, 
Woolloongabba 4102 
(O) 3891 9401    Mbl   0409 346 836 
Fax  3891 9402 
holytrin@optusnet.com.au

Church Wardens

Mr Ian Lacey  
Mr Don Rennie  
Mrs Sally-Lou Schmidt

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Prudence Klaer 
Mrs Ann Lacey
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WYNNUM Deanery: MORETON

WYNNUM
St Peter's (Seats 250) D.1899
Rebuilt D.1978 C.1981    B

The Rev'd Donna Petersen 2015 (R)

(Church & Parish Office):
77 Charlotte Street, 
(PO Box 1097)
Wynnum 4178 
(O) 3893 2492  Mbl   0415 439 311 
stpeterswynnum@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Miss Cryssi Glynn  
Mrs Margaret Henzell 
Mrs Marilyne Jacob

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mr Ross Hodson  
Mrs Marilyne Jacob 
Mrs Wendy Ross

Mr Neil Henzell 
Mr Ross Hodson

YERONGA Deanery: BRISBANE SOUTH WEST

YERONGA
Christ Church (Seats 120) D.1923
C.1951

The Rev'd Rebecca King  2019 (PinC)

(Church & Parish Office):
4-6 Cork Street,
(PO Box 3217),
Yeronga 4104 
Rectory: 10 Cork Street, Yeronga 4104 
(O) 3848 1638   Mbl  0428 187 625 
yerongaanglican@gmail.com

Church Wardens

Mr Mamour Anyieth 
Ms Mary Neeve  
Mr James Stephen

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Mrs Barbara Brice 
Ms Mary Neeve  
Ms Helen Poggioli

Mr Christopher Gehrmann 
Mr Bushra Hamid

ZILLMERE Deanery: BRISBANE NORTH EAST

ZILLMERE
St Matthias' (Seats 200) O.1959
Rebuilt D.1968
Symes Grove Community Hall      

The Rev'd Helen L Button  2017 (PinC)

(Church & Office)
74 Murphy Road,
(PO Box 225),  Zillmere 4034 
(O) 3862 8953    Mbl 0431 766 941 
st.matthias@bigpond.com

Church Wardens

Mrs Pamela Clemments 
Mrs Patricia Dwyer  
Mrs Verna  Halsey

Synod Reps Parish Nominators

Ms Wendy Brown  
Mrs Pamela Clemments
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Chart of Australian Dioceses

Tasmania, 1842
F. R. Nixon, 1842
C. H. Bromby, 1864
D. F. Sandford, 1883
H. H. Montgomery, 1889
J. E. Mercer, 1902
R. Stephen, 1914
R. S. Hay, 1919
G. F. Cranswick, 1944
R. E. Davies, 1963
P. K. Newell, 1982
J. D. Harrower, 2000

Perth, 1857
M. B. Hale, 1857
H. H. Parry, 1876
C. O. L. Riley, 1894
(des. Archbishop, 1914)
H. F. LeFanu, 1929
R. W. H. Moline, 1947
G. Appleton, 1963
G. T. Sambell, 1969
P. F. Carnley, 1981
R. A. Herft, 2005

Bunbury, 1904
S. Goldsmith, 1904
C. Wilson, 1917
L. A. Knight, 1938
D. L. Redding, 1951
R. G. Hawkins, 1957
A. S. Goldsworthy, 1977
H. T. U. Jamieson, 1984
W. D. McCall, 2000
A. B. Ewing, 2010

Adelaide, 1847
A. Short, 1847
G. W. Kennion, 1882
J. R. Harmer, 1895
A. N. Thomas, 1906
B. P. Robin, 1941
T. T. Reed, 1957
(des. Archbishop, 1970)
K. Rayner, 1975
I. G. George, 1991
J. W. Driver, 2005

Willochra, 1915
G. White, 1915
R. Thomas, 1926
T. E. Jones, 1958
S. B. Rosier, 1970
W. D. McCall, 1987
G. S. Weatherill, 2001
J. Stead, 2012

NWA, 1910
G. Trower, 1910
J. Frewer, 1929
H. J. Witt, 1965
G. B. Muston, 1982
A. H. Nichols, 1992
D. G. Mulready, 2004
G. N. Nelson, 2012

Murray, 1970
R. G. Porter, 1970
G. H. Walden, 1989
R. O. Davies, 2002
vacant, 2010
J. F. Ford, 2014

Kalgoorlie, 1914
C. H. Golding-Bird,
1914

W. E. Elsey, 1919
C. E. B. Muschamp,
1950

D. W. Bryant, 1967
(now Perth, 1972)

Melbourne, 1847
C. Perry, 1847
J. Moorhouse, 1876
F. F. Goe, 1887
H. L. Clarke, 1902
(des. Archbishop, 1905)
H. C. Lees, 1921
F. W. Head, 1929
J. J. Booth, 1942
F. Woods, 1957
R. Dann, 1977
D. Penman, 1984
K. Rayner, 1991
P. R. Watson, 2000
P. L. Freier, 2006

Ballarat, 1875
S. Thornton, 1875
A. V. Green, 1900
M. H. M. Gumbleton,
1916

P. C. T. Crick, 1927
W. H. Johnson, 1936
W. A. Hardie, 1960
J. Hazelwood, 1975
R. D. Silk, 1994
M. G. Hough, 2004
vacant, 2010
G. Weatherill, 2012

St Arnaud, 1926
M. C. James, 1926
A. E. Winter, 1951
H. W. Shand, 1973
(now Bendigo, 1978)

Bendigo, 1902
H. G. A. Langley, 1902
J. D. Langley, 1907
D. Baker, 1920
C. L. Riley, 1938
R. E. Richards, 1957
O. Heyward, 1975
B. Wright, 1991
R. D. Bowden, 1995
A. W. Curnow, 2003
Gippsland, 1902
A. W. Pain, 1902
G. H. Cranswick, 1917
D. B. Blackwood, 1942
E. J. Davidson, 1955
D. A. Garnsey, 1958
G. R. Delbridge, 1975
N. J. Chynoweth, 1980
C. Sheumack, 1987
A. L. V. Jones, 1994
J. W. Driver, 2001
J. C. McIntyre, 2006
vacant, 2014
Wangaratta, 1902
T. H. Armstrong, 1902
J. S. Hart, 1927
T. M. Armour, 1942
T. B. McCall, 1963
K. Rayner, 1969
M. M. Thomas, 1975
R. Beal, 1985
P. Richardson, 1995
R. D. Farrer, 1998
A. J. Parkes, 2008

ILLUSTRATING THEIR DESCENT WITH A LIST OF DIOCESANS

Australia — W. G. Broughton, 1836
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Brisbane, 1859
E. W. Tufnell, 1859
M. B. Hale, 1875
W. T. T. Webber, 1885
St. C. G. A. Donaldson,
1904

(des. Archbishop, 1905)
G. Sharp, 1921
J. W. C. Wand, 1934
R. C. Halse, 1943
P. N. W. Strong, 1963
F. R. Arnott, 1970
J. B. R. Grindrod, 1980
P. J. Hollingworth, 1990
P. J. Aspinall, 2002

Rockhampton, 1892
N. Dawes, 1892
G. D. Halford, 1908
P. C. T. Crick, 1921
F. L. Ash, 1928
J. A. G. Housden, 1947
T. B. McCall, 1959
D. N. Shearman, 1964
J. B. R. Grindrod, 1971
G. A. Hearn, 1981
R. F. Stone, 1996
G. C. Fryar, 2003
D. A. Robinson, 2014

Grafton &
Armidale, 1867
W. C. Sawyer, 1867
J. F. Turner, 1869
A. V. Green, 1894
H. E. Cooper, 1901

Armidale, 1914
H. E. Cooper, 1914
W. F. Wentworth-
Shields, 1916

J. S. Moyes, 1929
R. C. Kerle, 1965
P. Chiswell, 1976
P. R. Brain, 2000
R. Lewers, 2012

Grafton, 1914
C. H. Druitt, 1914
J. W. Ashton, 1921
W. H. W. Stevenson,
1938

C. E. Storrs, 1946
K. J. Clements, 1956
R. G. Arthur, 1961
D. N. Shearman, 1973
B. A. Shultz, 1985
P. Huggins, 1998
K. F. Slater, 2003
S. A. Macneil, 2014

Goulburn, 1863
M. Thomas, 1863
W. Chalmers, 1893
C. G. Barlow, 1902
L. B. Radford, 1915
E. H. Burgmann, 1934

Canberra & Goulburn,
1949
K. J. Clements, 1961
C. A. Warren, 1971
O. Dowling, 1983
G. V. Browning, 1993
S. P. Robinson, 2009

Riverina, 1884
S. Linton, 1884
E. A. Anderson, 1895
R. C. Halse, 1925
C. H. Murray, 1943
H. G. Robinson, 1951
J. B. R. Grindrod, 1966
B. R. Hunter, 1971
B. Q. Clark, 1993
D. R. Stevens, 2005
vacant, 2013
A. R. Gillion, 2014

Bathurst, 1870
S. E. Marsden, 1870
C. E. Camidge, 1887
G. M. Long, 1911
H. Crotty, 1928
A. L. Wylde, 1936
E. K. Leslie, 1959
H. A. J. Witt, 1981
B. W. Wilson, 1989
R. W. Hurford, 2001
I. S. Palmer, 2013

Nth Queensland, 1878
G. H. Stanton, 1878
C. G. Barlow, 1891
G. H. Frodsham, 1902
J. O. Feetham, 1913
W. B. Belcher, 1948
I. W. A.Shevill, 1953
H. J. Lewis, 1971
C.M. Wood, 1996
J. A. Noble, 2002
W. J. Ray, 2007

Carpentaria, 1900
G. White, 1900
H. Newton, 1915
S. H. Davies, 1922
W. J. Hudson, 1950
S. J. Matthews, 1960
E. E. Hawkey, 1968
H. T. U. Jamieson, 1974
A. F. B. Hall-Matthews,
1984-96

(Nth Queensland, 1996)

Nthn Territory, 1968
K. B. Mason, 1968
C. M. Wood, 1983
R. F. Appleby, 1992
P. L. Freier, 1999
G. E. Thompson, 2007
G. D. Anderson, 2014

Newcastle, 1847
W. Tyrrell, 1847
J. B. Pearson, 1880
G. H. Stanton, 1890
J. F. Stretch, 1906
R. Stephen, 1919
G. M. Long, 1928
F. de W. Batty, 1931
J. A. G. Housden, 1958
I. W. A. Shevill, 1973
A. C. Holland, 1978
R. A. Herft, 1993
B. G. Farran, 2005
vacant, 2013
G. E. Thompson 2014

Sydney, 1847
W. G. Broughton, 1847
F. Barker, 1854
A. Barry, 1884 
W. S. Smith, 1890
(des. Archbishop, 1897)

J. C. Wright, 1909
H. W. K. Mowll, 1933
H. R. Gough, 1958
M. L. Loane, 1966
D. W. B. Robinson, 1982
R. H. Goodhew, 1993
P. F. Jensen, 2001
G. N. Davies, 2014

Tasmania became a diocese in 1842 and mainland
Australia was divided into four dioceses in 1847. Letters
patent for Adelaide, Melbourne and Newcastle dioceses
were issued on 25 June 1847. Bishop Broughton’s
Letters Patent was redrafted making him Metropolitan of
Australia and Bishop of Sydney.
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Tasmania, 1842
F. R. Nixon, 1842
C. H. Bromby, 1864
D. F. Sandford, 1883
H. H. Montgomery, 1889
J. E. Mercer, 1902
R. Stephen, 1914
R. S. Hay, 1919
G. F. Cranswick, 1944
R. E. Davies, 1963
P. K. Newell, 1982
J. D. Harrower, 2000

Perth, 1857
M. B. Hale, 1857
H. H. Parry, 1876
C. O. L. Riley, 1894
(des. Archbishop, 1914)
H. F. LeFanu, 1929
R. W. H. Moline, 1947
G. Appleton, 1963
G. T. Sambell, 1969
P. F. Carnley, 1981
R. A. Herft, 2005

Bunbury, 1904
S. Goldsmith, 1904
C. Wilson, 1917
L. A. Knight, 1938
D. L. Redding, 1951
R. G. Hawkins, 1957
A. S. Goldsworthy, 1977
H. T. U. Jamieson, 1984
W. D. McCall, 2000
A. B. Ewing, 2010

Adelaide, 1847
A. Short, 1847
G. W. Kennion, 1882
J. R. Harmer, 1895
A. N. Thomas, 1906
B. P. Robin, 1941
T. T. Reed, 1957
(des. Archbishop, 1970)
K. Rayner, 1975
I. G. George, 1991
J. W. Driver, 2005

Willochra, 1915
G. White, 1915
R. Thomas, 1926
T. E. Jones, 1958
S. B. Rosier, 1970
W. D. McCall, 1987
G. S. Weatherill, 2001
J. Stead, 2012

NWA, 1910
G. Trower, 1910
J. Frewer, 1929
H. J. Witt, 1965
G. B. Muston, 1982
A. H. Nichols, 1992
D. G. Mulready, 2004
G. N. Nelson, 2012

Murray, 1970
R. G. Porter, 1970
G. H. Walden, 1989
R. O. Davies, 2002
vacant, 2010
J. F. Ford, 2014

Kalgoorlie, 1914
C. H. Golding-Bird,
1914

W. E. Elsey, 1919
C. E. B. Muschamp,
1950

D. W. Bryant, 1967
(now Perth, 1972)

Melbourne, 1847
C. Perry, 1847
J. Moorhouse, 1876
F. F. Goe, 1887
H. L. Clarke, 1902
(des. Archbishop, 1905)
H. C. Lees, 1921
F. W. Head, 1929
J. J. Booth, 1942
F. Woods, 1957
R. Dann, 1977
D. Penman, 1984
K. Rayner, 1991
P. R. Watson, 2000
P. L. Freier, 2006

Ballarat, 1875
S. Thornton, 1875
A. V. Green, 1900
M. H. M. Gumbleton,
1916

P. C. T. Crick, 1927
W. H. Johnson, 1936
W. A. Hardie, 1960
J. Hazelwood, 1975
R. D. Silk, 1994
M. G. Hough, 2004
vacant, 2010
G. Weatherill, 2012

St Arnaud, 1926
M. C. James, 1926
A. E. Winter, 1951
H. W. Shand, 1973
(now Bendigo, 1978)

Bendigo, 1902
H. G. A. Langley, 1902
J. D. Langley, 1907
D. Baker, 1920
C. L. Riley, 1938
R. E. Richards, 1957
O. Heyward, 1975
B. Wright, 1991
R. D. Bowden, 1995
A. W. Curnow, 2003
Gippsland, 1902
A. W. Pain, 1902
G. H. Cranswick, 1917
D. B. Blackwood, 1942
E. J. Davidson, 1955
D. A. Garnsey, 1958
G. R. Delbridge, 1975
N. J. Chynoweth, 1980
C. Sheumack, 1987
A. L. V. Jones, 1994
J. W. Driver, 2001
J. C. McIntyre, 2006
vacant, 2014
Wangaratta, 1902
T. H. Armstrong, 1902
J. S. Hart, 1927
T. M. Armour, 1942
T. B. McCall, 1963
K. Rayner, 1969
M. M. Thomas, 1975
R. Beal, 1985
P. Richardson, 1995
R. D. Farrer, 1998
A. J. Parkes, 2008
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Synod Sermon 

by Archbishop Phillip J Aspinall 

Preached at the Eucharist of the 2018 Synod 
Friday 5 October 2018 

Job 38:1, 12-21; 40:3-5 
Ps 139:6-11  
Luke 10:13-16 

Once again this evening we thank God for the lectionary. 

‘Woe to you Chorazin! Woe to you, Bethsaida!’  

The Revised Common Lectionary sets the first part of Luke 10 for the 14th Ordinary 
Sunday in Year C: but it omits verses 13-16, precisely the text of tonight’s gospel reading. 
So if you go to church only on Sundays you have probably never heard this passage read 
in public worship. And even if you have been to the eucharist on Friday in the 19th week 
after Pentecost, I doubt that many of you have heard a sermon on this text. But tonight’s 
the night. What you’re sensing is the thrill of rising anticipation.  

‘Woe to you Chorazin! Woe to you, Bethsaida!’  

In this central part of the gospel Luke is well and truly in mission mode. 

The previous chapter, 9, begins with Jesus sending out the 12. He gives them authority 
over evil; and power to cure diseases. He tells them to proclaim the kingdom of God and 
to heal.  

The number is significant, of course. The Ancient people of God, Israel, consisted of 12 
tribes. Jesus calling and sending the 12 is a dramatic gesture signifying the renewal of 
the 12 tribes, the re-creation of the Ancient people of God, the transformation of Israel, 
as the kingdom of God breaks in.  

The current chapter, 10, similarly begins with Jesus sending. This time he sends 70 (or 
72 in some manuscripts). This sending of the 70 is the gospel reading for St Luke’s Day 
coming up in a fortnight. Again the number is significant.  

I once read Genesis 10 to an unsuspecting congregation. It’s an absolutely scintillating 
genealogy of the descendants of Noah through his sons, Shem, Ham and Japheth. And 
I had the congregation count the number of descendants named for each son. It took a 
few tries, and most of a Sunday morning, because the text isn’t entirely clear and wanders 
off on various excursions. But finally we arrived at totals: Japheth 14; Ham 30; and Shem 
26. A grand total of … 70. And the account concludes: ‘These are the families of Noah’s
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sons, … and from these the nations spread abroad on the earth after the flood (Genesis 
10.32).  

So in Luke 10, when Jesus sends the 70 ‘on ahead of him … to every town and place 
where he himself intended to go’, it’s a way of referring to the whole inhabited earth, to 
all people, everywhere. 

This sending anticipates the programme Luke will unveil in his second volume, the Acts 
of the Apostles, where the announcement of the kingdom will move outwards from 
Jerusalem, beyond the people of Israel, into all Judea and Samaria, and to the ends of 
the earth’ (Acts 1.8). 

Holding chapters 9 and 10 together, the two sendings, Luke tells us that the Messiah of 
Israel is also the saviour of the world.  

But what exactly are these 70 sent to do? Well, they are to travel light and to accept 
hospitality; to bring peace, a rich, deep notion that includes wholeness, reconciliation, 
healing, wellbeing for individuals and communities. They are to cure the sick; and they 
are to announce that ‘the kingdom of God has come near to you.’  

Jesus warns them that they will be vulnerable, like lambs among wolves, and that they 
will experience rejection and hostility as well as welcome.  

And rejection of the kingdom has significant consequences.  

‘Woe to you, Chorazin! Woe to you, Bethsaida! … And you, Capernaum’ 

These are all towns around the north of the Sea of Galilee where Jesus performed 
miracles. But even seeing and experiencing the presence and action of God first hand 
didn’t necessarily lead to changed hearts and minds; encountering God doesn’t always 
give birth to faith.  

And so these towns of Israel are compared with the foreigners in Tyre and Sidon. The 
whole of Israel knew and understood that the residents of Tyre and Sidon had to repent, 
had to change. What they failed to see was that similar transformation was expected of 
them too.  

So welcomed or rejected, the 70 are to announce and to embody the kingdom of God in 
all the towns and villages they will visit, just as Jesus did. The 70 are sent ‘not to be 
people pleasers but God bearers’ agents of individual and social transformation 
(Dechamplain, 2014, 287).  

Whoever listens to them, listens to Jesus; whoever rejects them, rejects Jesus; and 
whoever rejects Jesus, rejects the one who sent him: God and opts out of the new 
creation.  

Here then is a New Testament snapshot of mission: sent to embody and to announce the 
kingdom of God.  
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We don’t always think of mission like that. 

The well-known English theologian Martyn Percy was once asked what he would do to 
get more bums on pews. He said ‘I’m more interested in getting bums off pews. Seriously, 
we are not trying to grow the membership of a club; we are trying to send out people to 
further the work of the Kingdom of God’ (Graham, 2017).  

In similar vein, Carol Merritt (2014, 286), an American scholar wrote: 

Too often Christians are shut up in … [churches], concerned about leaky roofs and … 
counting the attendance, and wringing their hands because people do not seem to be 
worshiping God as they did in the past. Congregations spend so much time caring for 
their own and feeling anxious about their demise that they sometimes forget that they, 
like the 70, have been sent out with the Gospel of God’s love and justice and mercy. The 
good news has been given to them for the world. … get out of the pews and join in the 
mission of God to the world…  

Jesus did precisely that. He was forever getting into trouble for eating and drinking with 
sinners. Back in Luke chapter 5 even the despised and ostracised tax collector, Matthew, 
Jesus seems to see as a beloved child of God, in need of healing, restoration, 
transformation, re-creation. So Jesus says to him ‘Come’. Hated by all, no one had said 
that to Matthew for a very long time. ‘Come.’  

Come with me. Enter into relationship with me. Join me in my relationships with others. 
Help me create a community that embodies and fosters God’s rule on earth (McManus, 
2013, 226).  

It must have blown Matthew’s mind to be seen like that and spoken to like that. To have 
been on the receiving end of nothing but hate, derision, repulsion, condemnation – and 
then to feel that divine love had come to rest on him – on him of all people – must have 
been a profound shock. The embodiment of divine love says to him ‘Come’.  

And the text records simply that ‘He got up and followed.’ But instantly he’s at dinner with 
Jesus and his disciples ‘breaking bread, sharing in conversation, trusting one another, 
coming alive, dissolving [old] boundaries of every kind – and entering into genuine 
communion’ (McManus, 2013, 228).  

Matthew’s transformation, and the transformation of the rag-tag community Jesus mixed 
with, stems from the mysterious power of genuine communion. It’s nothing less than the 
dawning of the actual reign of God through Jesus’ word and action.  

Everyone around the table is ‘embraced by the unconditional, transforming love of God 
in Jesus’ (ibid). All are invited to ‘come’ and ‘follow’. All are empowered by being ‘seen’ 
as children of God.  

‘Why does your teacher eat with tax collectors and sinners? [The Pharisees want to 
know.] Because he is the enfleshed Word of God who is known in mercy, not sacrifice, in 
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communion, not separation, in healing acceptance, not judgement. Because he is the 
embodiment of the new creation …’ (McManus, 2013, 228).  

Jesus sent the 70 to be the means of healing, wholeness and transformation in a world 
broken and in the grip of evil, but loved by God. We are now summoned and sent to 
embody and announce God’s reign so that others might know they too are loved by God 
and be transformed.  

God, grant us grace and courage so to live. 
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President’s Address 

By The Most Reverend Dr Phillip J Aspinall 
Archbishop of Brisbane 

To the second session of the 79th Synod of the Diocese of Brisbane 
Saturday 6 October 2018

Welcome to this Second Session of the 79th Synod of the Diocese of Brisbane. 

Royal Commission 

Since we last met the Royal Commission into Institutional Responses to Child Sexual 
Abuse has delivered its final report. Announced in late 2012, the Commission began its 
work in early 2013 and ran for five years until December 2017. 

The Royal Commission exposed significant failures of institutions to protect children in 
their care, bringing great shame on those institutions, including the churches. The pain of 
facing those failures and that shame is great; so great that the temptation is great to 
regard them as a tragic chapter that’s now behind us, and to move on to other important 
matters. We must resist that temptation. It would be a further betrayal of the survivors 
who, at great cost to themselves, courageously came forward and told their stories. On 
the basis of that courage and the comprehensive work of the Royal Commission, 
Australia has crossed a threshold into a future in which our children will be much safer, 
and institutions will be much more accountable for protecting them. But that future will 
eventuate only if we, now, have the courage to face squarely the truth the Royal 
Commission uncovered and implement its comprehensive recommendations. That will 
involve considerable further work and, I believe, is a sacred responsibility of our church 
and this Synod. 

The Royal Commission worked in three main areas. 

Overview 
• 2013–2017

– 16,953 people made contact
– 7,981 survivors
– 1,344 written accounts
– 2,562 matters referred to police

• Private sessions
– Over 8,000 personal stories

• Public hearings
– Carefully chosen case studies
– 57 public hearings

• Policy and research
– Roundtables, consultation papers, funded research
– 59 research reports
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First it held private sessions and listened to nearly 8,000 stories, spanning many 
decades. Those sessions helped Commissioners learn about how institutions had 
responded to survivors and to decide which case studies would be instructive. 

Public hearings were the second main activity. Fifty seven case studies examined how 
particular institutions responded to reports of abuse. 

The third plank was its policy and research program. Research into child sexual abuse, 
its causes and impacts involved experts, academics, governments, service providers and 
others. Fifty nine research reports were published. 

Survivors’ reports have taught us a great deal. Each person’s story is unique but there 
are patterns we can learn from. 

Many survivors experienced physical, emotional and psychological abuse as well as 
sexual abuse. In church institutions spiritual abuse also occurred. 

Survivors usually found it very difficult to tell parents, partners, families, friends and 
institutions about their abuse. Disclosure took place over time and at different stages in 
survivors’ lives. On average it took survivors 24 years to tell someone. 

Almost always representatives of institutions reacted negatively when they were told and 
didn’t support survivors. 

Some survivors experienced immediate impacts. For others it was triggered years later. 
Almost all survivors said they had poor mental health as a result of the abuse. Many 
reported impacts on their physical health. Abuse also affected education results, 
employment prospects and economic security. 

The impacts have rippled out to affect victims’ parents, siblings, partners, children and, in 
some cases, entire communities. Many survivors found it hard to maintain healthy 
personal relationships. Sometimes people are estranged from their own parents as a 

What we’ve learned from survivors 

 Each person’s story is unique
 There are patterns
 Physical, emotional, psychological and spiritual abuse as well
 Difficult to tell others

- on average it took 24 years to tell someone else
 Support

- sometimes offered by parents, partners, friends
- almost never from institutions

 Impacts
- sometimes immediate, sometimes years later
- mental and physical health
- personal relationships
- education, employment, financial security
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result of abuse; or from their own children. Marriages break down. Some grandparents 
never see their grandchildren. Some who were abused have taken their own lives. 

Over 4,000 survivors told the Commission they were sexually abused as children in 
religious institutions. This table shows the proportion of survivors who reported abuse in 
religious institutions. 14.8% were abused in Anglican institutions. 

Most were aged between 10 and 14 years when the abuse first started. The perpetrators 
were priests, religious brothers and sisters, ministers, church elders, teachers in religious 
schools, workers in residential settings, volunteers, youth group leaders and others. 

More than 200 survivors had experienced child sexual abuse in a religious institution 
since 1990. So it is not all historical. Some is quite recent. 

Thirty case studies focused on religious institutions. Seven of them concerned Anglican 
institutions. 

Some aspects of abuse in churches and religious institutions are unique. 

Abuse in religious institutions 
 Trust and respect used to gain access to children
 Grooming of child and child’s family
 Manipulation of religious beliefs
 Spiritual abuse
 Unique impacts in religious institutions

- spiritual confusion and loss of faith
- children not believed because of status of perpetrator
- alienation from families and religious communities
- communities feel betrayed by perpertrators
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People in religious ministry are often trusted. That trust allows perpetrators to gain access 
to children, to groom and abuse them. Seeing ministers as God’s representatives, often 
parents couldn’t believe they could be capable of sexually abusing a child. So ministers 
often had unfettered access to children. This trust also led adults not to listen to children 
who tried to disclose sexual abuse. It made religious leaders reluctant to take action and 
willing to believe perpetrators’ denials. 
 
Not believing that ministers could be capable of such abuse, also meant family members 
reacted negatively when told. That caused alienation between survivors and their families 
for years, in some cases for a lifetime. 
 
Perpetrators often groomed the child’s family, becoming closely involved in family life, 
regular visitors to the home, ingratiating themselves. Sometimes perpetrators targeted 
vulnerable families, stepping into the role of an absent father or manipulating those 
experiencing marriage breakdown or mourning a death. 
 
Some children were threatened or blamed for the sexual abuse, in ways that manipulated 
their religious beliefs: told they’d go to hell if they resisted or told anyone about it. 
Threatening or blaming in the name of God powerfully affected children. 
 
Some children were spiritually as well as sexually abused through religious rituals, 
symbols or language, producing spiritual confusion and loss of faith. Some children 
thought they’d been abused by God or that God must have wanted the abuse to happen. 
 
Communities of faith also disbelieved disclosures of abuse and ostracised the reporters. 
A religious community itself can be shattered when child sexual abuse and inadequate 
responses come to light. When the abuse is revealed to be extensive or when leaders fail 
to take decisive action against perpetrators and to support survivors, or when they try to 
cover up abuse, church members can feel betrayed by leaders and institutions they had 
trusted. 

How religious institutions failed 
 

 Leaders  
– Knew of abuse and didn’t act 
– Treated perpetrators leniently 
– Concealed abuse and protected perpetrators 
– Protected church’s reputation over children’s wellbeing 
– Disbelieved and blamed the victim 
– Minimised the misconduct 
– Failed to report criminal conduct to police 
– Allowed alleged perpetrators to continue in ministry 
– Failed to honour commitments to victims 
– Allowed known offenders to continue in ministry 
– Failed to discipline known perpetrators 
– Allowed offenders to disappear ‘quietly’ 
– Failed to care for survivors 
– Responded defensively, legalistically, without understanding or 

compassion 
 Governance structures failed to hold leaders accountable 
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The failures of religious institutions are particularly troubling because they have played, 
and continue to play, an integral and unique role in many children’s lives. They have been 
key providers of education, health and social welfare services to children. Among the 
most respected institutions in our society, their leaders were trusted the most and 
suspected the least by children and parents. 
 
The case studies revealed that many religious leaders knew about allegations of child 
sexual abuse yet failed to take effective action. 
 
Some ignored allegations and did not respond at all. Some treated alleged perpetrators 
leniently and failed to address the obvious risks they posed to children. Even when some 
perpetrators made admissions, some leaders inappropriately saw it as an ‘aberration’ or 
a ‘one-off incident’ and not as part of a pattern of behaviour. So perpetrators were forgiven 
and victims were encouraged to forgive those who abused them. 
 
Some leaders concealed abuse and shielded perpetrators from accountability. 
Institutional reputations and individual perpetrators were prioritised over victims and their 
families. Senior Anglican Church personnel at times asked complainants to remain silent 
‘to protect the good name of the church’. Trying to prevent or repair public scandal, 
leaders concealed information that could tarnish the institution’s image or diminish its 
standing in the community. 
 
Leaders often dismissed, did not believe, or minimised allegations. Sometimes they 
attempted to blame or discredit the victim. Some children who disclosed abuse were 
punished or suffered further abuse. Some leaders told victims that there was nothing they 
could do, suggested that victims had misinterpreted abusive behaviour, or told victims 
that they should be ‘forgiving’ or ‘let sleeping dogs lie’. Survivors spoke of being 
devastated by such responses. 
 
In some cases, leaders knew that allegations may have involved criminal actions, but 
treated them as a forgivable sin or a moral failing rather than a crime. Other leaders 
wrongly concluded that there was no criminality involved. Some religious leaders claimed 
to have had a general lack of understanding about paedophilia and conduct amounting 
to child sexual abuse. 
 
Before the early 2000s, Anglican Church personnel rarely reported complaints of child 
sexual abuse to police or other civil authorities. Alleged perpetrators were not reported to 
police despite them having made admissions of child sexual abuse to a bishop. In other 
cases, alleged perpetrators were not reported to police despite multiple allegations being 
made over years or decades. Where policies requiring reporting to police existed, they 
were sometimes not followed. One Anglican bishop acknowledged that had he gone to 
the police, much suffering would have been avoided. 
 
Some who complained to the Anglican Church were actively discouraged from taking 
further action. Senior Anglican personnel threatened legal action against survivors and 
others who made complaints, dissuading them from reporting to police. 
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Church leaders allowed alleged perpetrators to continue to remain in ministry after 
suspicions or allegations were raised, with little or no risk management or monitoring of 
their interactions with children. Supervision was often either not arranged, not complied 
with or not effective, and further allegations followed. Some perpetrators allowed to 
continue in ministry or employment continued to abuse. 
 
Even multiple complaints about the same individual at times did not lead to action. Some 
alleged perpetrators remained in the same positions with access to children for years, 
some for decades, after initial and successive allegations. 
 
People who reported child sexual abuse were at times promised that action would be 
taken and none was. 
 
Alleged perpetrators were given a ‘second chance’ with continued or successive 
appointments. This included moving alleged perpetrators to new positions in different 
locations where they were offered a ‘fresh start’, untarnished by their history of sexual 
offending or previous allegations. In some instances, these new appointments were 
geographically removed from the locations where the original complaints arose with 
movements across Australia and between different religious institutions. The 
communities that alleged perpetrators were moved into were often not made aware of the 
risks these individuals posed. 
 
At times, clergy and lay people were promoted and progressed through the ranks of 
Anglican institutions even after allegations of child sexual abuse had been made against 
them. 
 
Disciplinary systems were poor and leaders were reluctant to use them. So some 
perpetrators were not disciplined at all; some were, but in a minimal way; and others were 
disciplined, but only many years after allegations were raised or they were convicted. This 
often meant that perpetrators retained their religious titles, and lay perpetrators remained 
attached to religious institutions posing further danger. 
 
Instead of reporting allegations to police or disciplining perpetrators they were sometimes 
encouraged to retire or resign as a way of dealing with these matters ‘quietly’ and to avoid 
scandal for the Church. Sometimes the real reasons why people were removed were 
concealed. This included allowing perpetrators to retire or resign on false grounds, such 
as for health reasons. 
 
Where disciplinary proceedings occurred, the processes often caused additional trauma 
to survivors. Some survivors said that church complaint and redress processes were 
difficult, frightening or confusing, often overly legalistic, lacked transparency, involved 
generic apologies or no apologies at all, and failed to recognise the long-term and 
devastating impacts of child sexual abuse on survivors and their families. Religious 
institutions frequently failed to care for and support survivors during redress processes, 
civil litigation and criminal proceedings. This exacerbated the trauma they experienced. 
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The structure and governance of religious institutions may have inhibited effective 
responses. Independent, autonomous or decentralised governance structures often 
served to protect leaders from being scrutinised or held accountable. 
 
In two of the case studies, alleged perpetrators remained in positions where they had 
access to children after a bishop had received a complaint of child sexual abuse about 
them, and further allegations followed. There was a lack of oversight and accountability 
of bishops, and no uniform process for complaints about bishops’ handling of allegations. 

 
The Royal Commission identified numerous ways that schools failed. Certain features of 
schools magnify the risks and the impact of failures. 
 
Failure to act on disclosures and complaints can lead to further abuse, place other 
children at risk of harm, and leave perpetrators not being held accountable for their 
criminal behaviour. 
 
Poor leadership, governance and culture prioritised protecting the school over the safety 
of children. 
 
School leaders and staff failed to report matters to external authorities, because of 
inadequate processes for complaint handling, investigation and disciplinary action. 
 
Inadequate recordkeeping and sharing of information increased the risk to children. 
School culture can be a strong factor in creating risk of child sexual abuse. Some cultures 
can allow opportunities for abuse and make it difficult to detect. In such cultures physical 
and emotional abuse often accompanied sexual abuse. 
 
Some boys’ schools have cultures in which males are encouraged to exert power over 
others and behave in a sexually aggressive ways. Wrongly seen as healthy expressions 
of masculinity, such hyper-masculine cultures lead to harmful sexual behaviours. 
Homophobia is characteristic of such cultures and could be a barrier to boys disclosing 
sexual abuse by a male. 
 

How schools failed 
 

• Failure to act on reports of abuse 
• Protecting the school rather than children 
• Not reporting to external authorities 
• Record-keeping and sharing information 
• Harmful culture 

– Physical and emotional abuse permitted 
– Encouraging male power 
– Homophobia 
– Blind obedience to authority 
– Lack of children’s empowerment  
– ‘Dobbing’ 

• Not holding leaders accountable 
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Some schools have strong cultures of unquestioning obedience to authority. This can 
create conditions conducive to child sexual abuse. 
 
A lack of children’s participation and empowerment can discourage children from 
complaining and feeling unable to speak up. Fear of not being believed was common 
because of the perceived authority and high-standing of the perpetrator. In some cases, 
disclosing sexual abuse led to further abuse. 
 
Survivors feared the impact of disclosure on their family and community. Both as children 
and as adults, survivors choose not to disclose, or to delay disclosure, out of concern for 
their relationships with others. A culture of retribution against ‘dobbers’ exists in some 
schools. 
 
School council members and leaders need to understand their obligations to keep 
children safe, and to be held accountable if they do not. Schools failed by having complex 
and opaque governance, leadership that didn’t notify school boards of abuse, that didn’t 
keep good records and didn’t share information about perpetrators or complaints. 
 
All these failings of churches, schools and other religious institutions are laid bare for all 
to see in the three substantial books that comprise Volume 16 of the Final Report, as well 
as in the detailed case studies, seven of which deal with Anglican organisations. 

 
Looking to the Future 
 
But the Commission was concerned not only to unveil the truth about the past and past 
failings. It was also fiercely resolved to make institutions safer for children in the future.  

It said that keeping children safe was a shared responsibility of governments, institutions, 
the broader community and individuals. 
 
The Royal Commission made hundreds of recommendations, but they focus on three 
main areas: 
 

 Preventing abuse or, at the very least identifying it as early as possible; 
 Improving the way perpetrators are investigated, prosecuted and sentenced; 

and 
 Improving survivors’ access to justice and ongoing support. 

Looking to the future 
 

 Shared responsibility 
– Governments, communities, institutions, individuals 

 Recommendations focus on  
– Prevention 
– Investigating, prosecuting and sentencing offenders 
– Justice and support for survivors 
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The Royal Commission recommended: 

 Improving knowledge about child sexual abuse in the community at large and
steps that assist prevention;

 Ten Child-Safe Standards that all institutions should implement to make them
safer and focused on children’s best interests;

 Strengthening children’s safety online and improving institutions’ responses to
online abuse;

 Improving institutions’ responses to and reporting of abuse;
 Strengthening recordkeeping and information sharing; and
 Thorough screening, training and supervising workers and volunteers.

There are also recommendations about what governments should do to regulate and 
oversee institutions. 

The Commission made a number of recommendations specifically for the Anglican 
Church. 
Survivors have been treated inconsistently because the Anglican Church has no 
consistent national approach to responding to child sexual abuse. The Commission 
recognised the barriers to such an approach, such as dispersed and decentralised 
authority, diocesan autonomy, and theological and cultural differences between dioceses. 
But the Commission insisted that a way be found to develop a consistent approach to 
child safety and monitor it in the 23 dioceses and their organisations (Recommendations 
16.32 and 16.33). 

Making institutions safer for children 

• Community-wide understanding and prevention
• 10 Child-Safe standards
• Online safety
• Better responses and reporting
• Better record-keeping and information sharing
• Screening, training and supervising workers and volunteers
• Regulation and oversight by governments

Recommendations for Anglican Church 

• Consistent approach to child safety across the national church and its institutions 
(16.32 and 16.33)

• Uniform episcopal standards framework (16.1)
• Managing conflicts of interest (16.2)
• Consistent national approach to selection, screening and training people for ordination

(16.4)
• Mandatory national standards for professional/pastoral supervision and regular 

performance appraisals (16.5)
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A start was made last year when the General Synod passed the Safe Ministry with 
Children Canon setting in place national standards for this Church. This Synod adopted 
that Canon in 2017 just weeks after the General Synod and an implementation group has 
been working carefully since then to implement them. 

The Royal Commission also said there needs to be a uniform episcopal standards 
framework to ensure that bishops and former bishops are accountable to an appropriate 
authority for their responses to complaints of child sexual abuse (Recommendation 16.1). 

Again a start has been made with the General Synod extending the jurisdiction of the 
national Special Tribunal to include former bishops as well as current bishops, but more 
work needs to be done to have a uniform episcopal standards framework for the whole 
Church. 

Sometimes bishops and senior diocesan officials had conflicts of interest in their 
responses to people accused of child sexual abuse. Bishops’ close relationships with 
clergy sometimes clearly affected their responses to allegations. The Commission 
recommended the Anglican Church adopt a clear policy to manage those conflicts 
(Recommendation 16.2). 

The Commission recommended that the Anglican Church develop a national approach 
to the selection, screening and training of candidates for ordination (Recommendation 
16.4); and that we develop and implement mandatory national standards to ensure that 
all people in religious or pastoral ministry undertake regular professional development, 
undertake professional/pastoral supervision and undergo regular performance appraisals 
(Recommendation 16.5). The Commission recommended that all this be mandatory. 

Clearly there are further big and complex tasks. Work has begun on them but it will take  
some time. These are major cultural changes. Things are going to be different and we 
are all responsible to see that those changes are made as quickly and effectively as 
possible. 

Redress 

• Three elements
– Monetary payment (recognising seriousness of abuse)
– Lifelong episodic counselling and psychological care
– Direct personal response from institution

• Commonwealth has not accepted all RC recommendations
– Reduced max monetary payment from $200k to $150k
– Max $5,000 for counselling

• Anglican Church working to participate in national scheme
– May also be an adjunct (national or diocesan) scheme for those not eligible for

national scheme
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Some years ago the Commission released its final report on Redress and Civil Litigation. 
It identified three elements of redress: 

 a monetary payment to acknowledge the seriousness of the sexual abuse and
the harm caused;

 counselling and psychological care to assist recovery; and
 a personal response from the institution, including an apology, if wanted by the

survivor.

All these things we have been doing for many years, but the way in which we do them is 
changing because of the Commission’s work. 

The Commission identified two basic principles of utmost importance to survivors in 
relation to redress. First that there be consistency of treatment. Second that decisions 
about monetary payments be made independently of the institution in which the abuse 
occurred. 

The federal government accepted the thrust of the Commission’s recommendations 
(though not all the details) and has established a national redress scheme. That scheme 
commenced operation on 1 July this year and will run for 10 years in the first instance. 

The Anglican Church nationally has established a company, through which Anglican 
dioceses, schools and other organisations can participate in the scheme. Diocesan 
Council has committed this diocese to join. Last month the Queensland Parliament 
passed the necessary legislation to allow institutions in Queensland to opt in. We are 
moving to do so as soon as possible. 

We will still need to respond to some people outside the national scheme because not 
everyone is eligible to participate in it. We have put in place policies to ensure as far as 
possible that all survivors will be treated consistently. 

You will have seen and heard media reports of some dioceses selling property to fund 
redress payments. Our finance people have advised Diocesan Council that we expect to 
meet our financial commitments to survivors in a timely and ordered way. Provisions for 
redress monetary payments have been and will continue to be made. Decisions about 
property assets unfold after thorough consultation and careful examination of what best 
serves the mission going forward. We don’t anticipate needing to sell off property 
hurriedly to meet our redress commitments. 
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Clearly we still have considerable work to do to ensure children are protected. I also 
recognise that we have already come a long way and I pay tribute to all those who have 
contributed to the transformation of the church over nearly two decades. I acknowledge 
those who have served on our Professional Standards Committee and Board and their 
predecessors. I acknowledge our professional standards staff and those who manage 
abuse claims. The Anglican Schools Office has brought to bear enormous energy and 
expertise to ensure our schools are safe and up to speed. Anglicare provides counselling 
and support services to survivors of abuse and ensures its own services to children and 
families are at the highest standards. All these dedicated people do costly and difficult 
work on behalf of us all. I thank them for it. Those who have worked on groups developing 
polices and processes and reviewing them in the light of feedback from survivors and 
church members, also deserve our thanks as do members of the Diocesan Council who 
have been overseeing all this work for many years. Thank you all. 

 
Pilgrimage of Justice, Peace & Healing 
 
Nearly 20 years of dealing with the horror of child sexual abuse has had enormous 
impacts on the church and the wider community. The extent of abuse and response 
failures over many decades has shocked and appalled people both within and outside 
the church. That reality has also fundamentally shaken the wider community’s trust in the 
church. It has accelerated the decline in church participation which was already under 
way and profoundly damaged our efforts in God’s mission. 
 
It has also damaged us spiritually. We’ve been slow to recognise and acknowledge the 
depth and long-lasting nature of the harm abuse has wreaked in the lives of survivors and 
their families. Facing the truth of what has happened and the reality of our failures has 
shaken us to the core. Many in our church have felt ashamed and betrayed and, yes, 
angry. Spiritually many have felt bereft, abandoned, numbed, immobilised, at a loss to 
understand how this could have happened? And so there have been defensive reactions, 
minimising, denial, avoidance. 
 
It has been, and is, a very difficult and disturbing pilgrimage we have been on and are 
still travelling. But if the gospel is about justice, if the gospel is about healing, if the gospel 
is about reconciliation and restoring community, then this is a journey which is at the heart 
of the gospel, not a distraction from it. 
 
The Lenten discussion groups this year helped many enter into this reality and move 
forward. In March this year we held a service in the Cathedral to reach out to the families 
and friends of those who had committed suicide because of sexual abuse. It was timed 
to follow the release of the Royal Commission’s final report. On that occasion I again 
acknowledged the church’s failures and the harm and suffering that had flowed from 
them. 
 
A few weeks ago, during Child Protection Week, a further service was held in the 
Cathedral. ‘Never Again’ provided an opportunity for Anglicans to come together with 
survivors, their families and supporters during which church members expressed 
repentance for past failures and commitment to a new and radically different future. 
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We have come a long way on this journey we are on. And we have further to go. It is not 
a distraction from our core mission it is the essence of it. It is truly a pilgrimage of justice, 
peace and healing. 

 

A Wider Context 
 
Let me briefly say a word about the wider context in which we will continue this pilgrimage. 
The abuse scandals are not the only reason Anglicans are on the back foot. 
 
In her 2015 book, A New Exile, Muriel Porter said that the Anglican Church of Australia 
is barely recognisable anymore as the Church that adopted its national constitution in 
1960. Reflecting on the 2014 General Synod she painted a gloomy picture of six dioceses 
teetering on the edge of bankruptcy, three more in serious trouble, of steep decline in 
rural areas and of falling attendances across the board. 
 
Porter also lamented the decline of the moderate and Anglo-catholic parts of the church, 
which have historically characterised Brisbane diocese and Queensland generally. In 
Porter’s assessment, moderate and Anglo-catholic Anglicanism, in Australia and in other 
parts of the world, have capitulated to conservative evangelicalism which is now clearly 
in the ascendancy. 
 
In some places Common Prayer, a central element in classical Anglican DNA, has been 
radically eroded. Until the 1960s virtually all Anglicans would have used the same words 
in worship, the same rites, drawn from the 1662 Book of Common Prayer. Mostly the 
same words were used in worship across the nation and differences were about which 
vestments were worn, about ceremonial and symbols such as candles and so on. 
 
In 1978 the General Synod adopted An Australian Prayer Book, remarkably with only a 
single dissenting voice in the final vote. AAPB became standard fare across the whole 
church, with continued use of 1662 for some so long accustomed to it. Porter describes 
that as the high water mark of Anglican unity in Australia. But it was not to last. 
 
By 1995 things had changed radically. The debates in the General Synod over the current 
prayer book, APBA, were strident and divisive. Though it passed the General Synod it 
was never uniformly authorised throughout the church even with its status reduced from 
‘Prayer Book’ to ‘Liturgical Resources’. 
 
In 1996, the then Archbishop of Sydney, Harry Goodhew, had become so concerned 
about the erosion of Common Prayer and departures from what we might call classical 
Prayer Book Anglicanism that he told the 1996 Sydney Diocesan Synod: 
 

The time has come when we must honestly face the question of the status of 
common prayer and liturgical worship in our diocese. We have always been a 
liturgical church … For us, liturgy has meant a specific, authorised form that 
those set aside to minister in the church undertake to follow. As a result, 
Christ’s people know what to expect when they gather for worship … We are 
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in danger of losing something which has been a principle feature of our life … 
our rules provide our shape and our character… 

Our [liturgical] forms have put into people’s minds words with which to confess 
sin, to praise God, and to pray for issues which we are exhorted to bring before 
God. They have taught people the moral and spiritual precepts revealed by 
God, the value of both Old and New Testaments, the active place of the Psalms 
in Christian spirituality, as well as giving a concise and catholic expression of 
the faith, and a balanced and biblical approach to the sacraments. To abandon 
all this for the creations and passing predilections of an individual clergy 
person, or the inclinations of those whose main interest is music, may, in the 
long run, prove to be a poor trade off. 

Yet Archbishop Goodhew’s warning did not check the drift from classical Anglicanism 
which spread into other parts of Australia, not least because it’s seen to be successful. 
Even some moderates and more catholic-minded Anglicans may have turned to it out of 
fear and anxiety about church decline, says Porter. 

Preferring one style of worship over another is not the whole story, though. Peter Corney, 
a noted Melbourne evangelical leader, wrote a perceptive article in 2009, ‘The future of 
the Anglican Church in Australia in the light of the decline of the Anglo-Catholic 
Movement.’ 

Corney is very positive about the beginnings of the Anglo-Catholic movement. In his 
assessment, its strengths arose because the founders: 

 ‘made a careful study of the early Fathers’;
 Were ‘concerned about personal holiness, committed discipleship and ...

recovery of the spiritual disciplines’;
 restored ‘a sense of awe and beauty and holiness to worship [which] led them

to recover a more elaborate and symbol-rich liturgy’;
 ‘wrote many beautiful hymns’;
 ‘had a very high view of Scripture and the creeds and were deeply orthodox

and theologically conservative on creedal fundamentals’;
 ‘emphasised a more central and catholic notion of the role of the Bishop and

the diocese’; and
 set forward a vision of Christian service and commitment that challenged a

whole generation of young men and women to start new religious orders to
serve others in evangelism, welfare and education.’

But by the 1960s the compelling, originating ‘vision was running out of energy. Today it 
is almost exhausted.’ Many of the organisations and movements have collapsed or been 
absorbed into secular institutions. Corney judges that: 

 The movement ‘lost touch with its theological ... core – the very things that had
produced its energy and passion’;
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 ‘It drifted away from ... creedal and biblical orthodoxy ... and gradually 
embraced a reductionist liberal theology’; so that 

 eventually it became ‘form without substance’ where you have ‘the appearance 
of Christianity ... but the essence ... lost’. 

 The movement allowed ‘a recovered incarnational theology to become 
unbalanced ... the importance of presence ... eventually overpowered the 
importance of proclamation ... confidence in preaching was eroded and the link 
between word and deed fatally weakened ... preaching, evangelism and 
proclamation were devalued and diminished.’ 

 ‘Because Biblical teaching and preaching was [sic] diminished, this produced 
a poorly taught laity’ and led to ‘an incipient “Pelagianism” – salvation by good 
works. Being good and kind to others came to be seen as the essence of the 
Gospel.’ 

 It ‘focused on a pastoral maintenance mode of ministry and so did not grow 
churches.’ 

 It became associated with high culture and rather snobbish, ‘out of step with 
ordinary Australians’. 

 It tended to look backwards to its 19th Century roots and failed to ground 
Anglicanism in Australian culture appearing as a kind of ‘Vicar of Dibley’ church 
‘eccentric, odd and quaint’ but not needing to be taken seriously. 

 It was divided and weakened over the ordination of women and ‘The issues 
surrounding gender and sexual politics have been a major preoccupation’ 
leaving ‘little energy for other fundamental issues’. 

 
The upshot of all this, in Corney’s judgement, is that moderate and Anglo-Catholic 
Anglicanism has been left hollowed out, lacking energy, motivation and passion and 
without a compelling vision or message for the wider community. 
 
Meanwhile ascendant conservative evangelicalism continues to grow in influence 
domestically and internationally. Porter sees that reflected in Australia in Sydney’s vastly 
increased numbers in the General Synod, in unofficial church-planting strategies 
establishing ‘non-Anglican’ but Sydney-style churches in other dioceses, in exporting 
Sydney-trained clergy to alter the balance in other places and in other strategies. The 
Anglican Church of Australia is on its way to becoming a large Sydney diocese, says 
Porter. 
 
Now, I think we should take care not to deride, still less to demonise, one or another 
emphasis within Anglicanism as if the various elements were in irreconcilable opposition: 
at war, as it were. Admittedly, over the years, as the church has faced various ‘hot-button’ 
issues it has sometimes felt like war: remarriage of divorced persons in church, the 
ordination of women as deacons, priests and bishops, lay people and deacons presiding 
at the eucharist as well as current differences over issues of human sexuality all readily 
spring to mind. 
 
Can we take seriously the biblical affirmation that we are members of each other with 
differing gifts and functions intended to build up the whole body (Rom 12.3-7)? 
Conservative evangelical Anglicans enrich the whole body through the clarity and 
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confidence with which they articulate the gospel; by their engagement with and 
knowledge of the scriptures; by their carefully planned approaches to pastoral care and 
following up of new people; and by their resolute teaching of the faith. The whole church 
in this diocese and beyond can learn from these strengths and be enriched by them. 
 
At the same time, if Peter Corney’s analysis is largely correct, as I think it is, this diocese 
and the wider church faces significant losses should the perspective of moderate and 
Anglo-Catholic Anglicanism further weaken. 
 
Some of the potential losses were identified by Archbishop Harry Goodhew. The loss of 
the ministry of women as priests and bishops would be keenly felt by many, as would a 
reduced emphasis on the sacraments. 
 
But perhaps the most profound loss would be what has traditionally been known as 
Anglicanism’s comprehensiveness. Today it would probably be called inclusiveness. I 
mean ‘the generous inclusivity that has been the hallmark of the best historic Anglicanism’ 
(Porter, 2015, 68). 
 
William Temple, is widely regarded as a quintessential Anglican. He became Archbishop 
of Canterbury in 1942 at the height of the Second World War. He summed up Anglicanism 
by saying: 
 

Our special character and ... our peculiar contribution to the Universal Church, 
arises from the fact that ... we have been enabled to combine in our one 
fellowship the traditional Faith and Order of the Catholic Church with that 
immediacy of approach to God through Christ to which the Evangelical 
Churches bear witness, and freedom of intellectual inquiry, whereby correlation 
of the Christian revelation and advancing knowledge is constantly effected 
(Temple, nd, 113-14). 

 
This generous Anglican comprehensiveness is one of our greatest treasures and one of 
our most prized gifts to the church universal. We should cherish and guard it. 
 
But for this precious gift to be retained, the moderate and Anglo-Catholic expressions of 
Anglicanism need to be vital, imaginative, energetic contributors to the overall life of the 
church. This may well be a most significant responsibility that falls to a diocese like 
Brisbane in the current times and seasons and a critically important contribution we can 
make to the life of the national church. 
 
I repeat, this is not to diminish either the evangelical or what is sometimes called liberal 
expressions of Anglicanism. They too have a vital and valuable role to play in this diocese 
as elsewhere. It is to recognise, however, that the diminished vitality of moderate and 
Anglo-catholic expressions actually threatens this church’s historic, generous 
comprehensiveness. Brisbane, in my view, has an important contribution to make to 
ensure that loss does not eventuate. 
What is most needed is for moderates and Anglo-Catholics once again to grasp and 
articulate a compelling vision and message. That means not so much borrowing methods 
and techniques from the apparently successful, though of course we can learn from 
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others. Nor does it mean abandoning our heritage in panicked attempts to become 
superficially relevant. No, the heart of a compelling vision and message will come from 
theological renewal. 
 
The roots of that renewal are in our fundamental convictions that God, in Christ, effected 
reconciliation between human beings and God. That reconciliation flows from the cross 
and resurrection and also from Christ’s saving life. Christ makes available an eternal 
quality of life here and now, nothing less than a share in the divine life in the gift of the 
Holy Spirit, available to us through the scriptures and the sacraments in the life of the 
church. 
 
This eternal quality of life is a first taste of what God will eventually complete in remaking 
all things and bringing heaven and earth together. 
 
We are called to work with God in anticipation of that re-creation, to make real here and 
now the life of grace Christ reveals, and to invite all to the banquet. 
 
In this work, the scriptures and sacraments attended to through sacred space, symbols, 
meditation, prayerfulness, stillness – are not old fashioned irrelevancies but the very 
means by which we encounter and worship the incarnate God with us (Porter, 2015, 42). 
 
This diversity of ways in which we encounter God reflects the conviction that God cannot 
be contained or exhausted in texts, doctrines or dogma. As Martin Percy (2017, 21) has 
written: 
 

Anglicans are broad because, simply, they think God is much broader than the 
measure of our minds. ... Anglicans ... often revert to broad and deep words 
like ‘Communion”, ‘catholic” and “comprehensive” because, deep in the 
ecclesial DNA of Anglicanism, is a breadth and inclusiveness that is 
fundamentally resistant to tribalism and sharp, high borders that only serve 
exclusivists. 

 
Our task is to live in communion with God. When we do, God then brings together in the 
community of the church those who so live. People will come to faith in Christ ‘when they 
discover inclusive churches committed to working for peace with justice; showing mercy, 
and engaging in the community with grace and integrity’ (McIntyre, 2014 cited in Porter 
(2015, 43)) This is what makes the pilgrimage of justice, peace and healing in relation to 
sexual abuse central to mission. It’s one expression of acting in the community with grace 
and integrity, showing mercy and working for justice and peace. 
 
That’s our share in God’s mission. It’s very different from a shallow ‘supporting good 
causes approach’ that Peter Corney criticises as hollowed out. Its foundation is following 
God in every aspect of life with a ‘singular allegiance to Jesus’ (ibid). 
 
May this deep communion with God and a singular allegiance to Jesus mark our 
deliberations in this Synod. May we live out that comprehensive, inclusive character of 
classical Anglicanism with humility and integrity. And may the good news of God’s love 
in Christ be evident in all we are and all we do in the life of the church and in the 
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communities we serve. Then we will be true partners with God in God’s mission to the 
world God loves, and partners in God’s new creation begun in Christ. 
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Synod of the Diocese of Brisbane Friday 5 October 2018 

ANGLICAN CHURCH OF AUSTRALIA 

DIOCESE OF BRISBANE 

The Second Session of the Seventy-Ninth Synod of the Diocese of Brisbane met in St John's 
Cathedral, Ann Street, Brisbane, on Friday 5 October 2018, following the Synod Eucharist at which 
the Synod Sermon was preached by the Most Rev'd Dr Phillip Aspinall, Archbishop of Brisbane. 

1. Opening

The President, the Most Rev'd Dr Phillip Aspinall, took the Chair at 8.30pm and his Chaplain
read prayers.

2. Welcome

The Archbishop welcomed members of Synod, both Lay and Clerical.

3. Reports

The Reports of Diocesan Council and other Reports are noted as tabled.

4. Petitions

No petitions were presented.

5. Procedural Motions

On behalf of the Diocesan Council, the General Manager moved, Mr Alan Gallimore seconding,

"That consideration of the following business be made an Order of the Day in accordance with
the following table:

Business being considered Order of the Day for: 

Finance & Diocesan Services 
Commission Report 

Motion No. I Auditors Report and Saturday at 11 am 
Statement of Accounts 

Business to be considered 
Motion No. 2 Budget 2018 consecutively 

Motion No. 3 Appointment of Auditors 

Motion No. 4 Collection and Analysis of Immediately following the Parishes & 
Parish Date Other Mission Agencies Commission 

Report 

Motion No. 5 ABM- Archbishop's November Saturday at 5.00 pm 
Appeal 
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"That Synod give leave to the following persons to address Synod or the Committee if called 
upon by the President or Chairman of Committees. 

Ms Stephanie Munday-Lake, Deputy Principal, Hillbrook Anglican School 

Mr Brady Downes Deputy Chairman, Anglican Church Grammar 
School Council 

The Rev'd Annette Woods Missioner and Priest in Charge, Parish ofYarrabah 

Mr Lindsay Murgha Parish ofYarrabah 

"That Synod give leave for the distribution of the following literature:-

Anglican Board of Mission mouse pads, pens, post-it notes and Parish resources for the 
2018 November appeal. 

6. Notices of Questions and Motions

The President called for notices of questions and motions.

The Rev'd Gillian Moses moving, the Rev'd Sue Wilton seconding,

Carried 

That the motion concerning Communication and Reporting on Mission Activities (Motion 19 in
the business papers) be an Order of the Day immediately after the motion concerning Collection
and Analysis of Data (Motion 4)

Carried 

The Rev'd Michael Uptin moving, Ms Kay Lauchland seconding, 
That debate on Motion 15 be an Order of the Day for 4pm on Saturday 6 October. 

Carried 

The Rev'd Peter Palmer was granted leave to give notice of a motion regarding Bush Church Aid 
Society. The motion was seconded by Mr Michael McDonall. 

7. Notices of Motions on Supplementary Business Paper

The following motion on the Supplementary Business Paper was added to the Business Paper.

Motion 22 
The Ven Gary Barch moving, the Rev'd Bill Colbrahams seconding, 

That this Synod, 
a) remembers that 2018 is the 100th anniversary of the signing of the Armistice of the

WWI.
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b) welcomes the arrival in Brisbane, of the "pectoral" cross of Canon David John Garland,
after 79 years of being in England.

c) asks that Peter Collins, Secretary of the Canon Garland Memorial Society, and
temporary Custodian of the Cross while it is in Brisbane, first show the cross to the
Archbishop on Sunday morning at Synod, and then make it available for viewing by 
members of Synod in a place to be determined by the General Manager.

8. Call of Business paper and taking of formal motions

Motion 11 Refugees & Asylum Seekers 
The Very Rev'd Dr Peter Catt to move; the Rev'd Tiffany Sparkes seconding 

That Synod, 
1. Notes with deep concern:

a. The plight of asylum seekers held indefinitely on Nauru and Manus Island by the
Federal Government of Australia.

b. That many people seeking asylum in Australia have lost access to core services and
financial support due to Government changes in the Status Resolution Support Services
(SRSS), and that up to 12,000 people seeking asylum in Australia are at risk of losing
access.

c. That charities are already struggling to support destitute asylum seekers.

2. Calls on the Federal Government to:
a. Remove from Nauru to Australia, as a matter of urgency, all asylum-seeker children

and their families.
b. Remove to Australia all other asylum-seekers held on Nauru and Manus Island
c. Reverse the changes made to SRSS so that those seeking asylum are not forced into

destitution.

3. Commends to members of the Diocese for attention and action:
• The Kids Off Nauru Campaign www.kid offnauru.corn and the Dignity not Destitution

Campaign http://www.acrt.com.au/dignity-not-destitution-change -to- upport-service -
f r-people-s eking-asylum-Tss/

Carried 

Motion 13 Clergy Summer School 
The Rev'd Geoff Hoyte to move; the Rev'd Helen Paget seconding: 

That this Synod 
• affirms the role of the Clergy Summer School in maintaining collegiality and in the

ongoing professional development of the clergy of Brisbane Diocese,
• encourages the clergy to attend the January 2019 Summer School
• encourages Parishes to meet the financial cost for their clergy of registration at the

Summer School.

Motion 17 Statement of our Mission 
The Rev'd Bronwyn Pagram to move; the Rev'd Dr Timothy Nicholson seconding: 

"That this Synod: 
1. commends the statement of mission on the ACSQ Diocesan website; and
2. notes the statement:

Carried 

a. is congruent with the Anglican Communion marks of mission numbers one,
two, three and five, with the fourth mark of mission being present ina
truncated form, and
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b. contains supplemental mission statements on worship an living as the
Church.

3. supports the extension of the ACSQ mission statement on justice to read, "To seek to
transform unjust structures of society, to challenge violence of every kind and pursue
peace and reconciliation." This will enable the Diocesan mission statement to both
strengthen its commitment to non-violent living, peace and reconciliation, and fully
incorporate the fourth mark of mission of the Anglican Communion into the
Diocesan statement of mission."

9. Reports

By leave of Synod, the President moved from the chair, 

"That the Report of the Cathedral Chapter be considered this evening." 

10. Report of the Cathedral Chapter

The Very Rev'd Dr Peter Catt presented the report of the Cathedral Chapter.

The Very Rev'd Dr Peter Catt moved, Mr Alan Gallimore seconding,

"That the Report of the Cathedral Chapter be received."

11. Motions of which previous Notice has been given

Motion 6 mover of motion was not present and the motion lapsed. 

Motion 7 Religious Freedom 
The Rev'd Dr Josephine Inkpin to move; the Rev'd Peter Mayen seconding: 

"That this Synod: 

Carried 

Carried 

Carried 

1. Affirms the view of the National Council of Churches in Australia that 'the human right
to freedom is in reasonable state' in Australia, but that much more needs to be done by
Australian authorities to aid the victims of religious persecution overseas, not least the
needs of asylum seekers, irrespective of religious affiliation.

2. Considers that further attention should be given to the clarification of religious rights to
ensure religious freedom is safeguarded for all Australians and that ideas of religious
freedom should not be used to support religious privilege, bullying and discrimination.

3. Calls on the Federal Government to strengthen Australian efforts to help end religious
persecution overseas and to receive more compassionately those seeking refuge and
asylum.

4. Encourages members of the Anglican Church Southern Queensland to deepen their
prayer and practical support for all victims of religious persecution, and, with the
National Council of Churches in Australia, to encourage all Australian leaders, from
whatever outlook, 'to model courteous and respectful discourse in public life'."

Debate was adjourned. 

12. Adjournment

Ct-J. 
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The President adjourned the Synod at 9.30 pm and pronounced the Blessing. 

13. Attendance

Clergy 
Lay 

��·,wc.J 

108 
163 

+f� tn">bGl'A-
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ANGLICAN CHURCH OF AUSTRALIA 

DIOCESE OF BRISBANE 

The Second Session of the Seventy-Ninth Synod of the Diocese of Brisbane resumed in Morris Hall, 
Anglican Church Grammar School, East Brisbane, on Saturday 6 October 2018. 

1. Opening

The President, the Most Rev'd Dr Phillip Aspinall, took the Chair at 9.00 am, and his
Chaplain read prayers.

2. President's Inaugural Address

The President, the Most Rev'd Dr Phillip Aspinall, welcomed Members of Synod and
delivered his inaugural address, which was received with applause.

The Right Rev'd Cameron Venables moved; the Right Rev'd Jeremy Greaves seconded:

"That Synod express its thanks to the President for his charge, and asks
that it be made available to Synod members for further reflection and discussion."

3. Minutes
Carried 

The Rev'd Sharon Baird reported to Synod that the Minutes Committee had read the minutes
of the previous day's sitting [Friday 5 October 2018] and had certified that they were a true
record.

The Rev'd Sharon Baird moved; Mr David Sneesby seconded:

"That the minutes of the previous day's sitting be confirmed."

4. Petitions

No petitions were presented.

5. Notices of Questions and Motions

The President called for Notices of Questions and Motions.

There were 3 questions.

Miss Petrina Gardiner asked about waste generated at Synod.

Ms Leanne Cronk asked a question about the old Neilson Home site.

Carried 

The Rev'd Ann Shepperson asked whether the Anglican Church had considered the area of
financial compensation from perpetrators of sexual abuse.

6. Formal Motions

The President called over the list of motions of which notice had been given.
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Motion 14. Church Missionary Society- Appointment General Secretary 

Mr Martin Hawkins moved; The Rev' d Michael Uptin seconded: 

"That this Synod welcomes the appointment of the Rev'd Mark Fairhurst as the new General 
Secretary of the Church Missionary Society (Queensland and Northern NSW) and prays that 
the Lord will continue to bless the efforts of CMS as it works to extend God's kingdom 
throughout the world." 

Carried 

Motion 22. Canon Garland Memorial Society 

The Rev'd Canon Gary Harch moved; The Rev'd Bill Colbrahams seconded: 

"That this Synod 
a. Remembers that 2018 is the 100th anniversary of the signing of the Armistice of the

WWl.
b. Welcomes the arrival in Brisbane, of the "pectoral" cross of Canon David John Garland,

after 79 years of being in England.
c. Asks that Peter Collins, Secretary of the Canon Garland Memorial Society, and temporary

Custodian of the Cross while it is in Brisbane, first show the cross to the Archbishop on
Sunday morning at Synod, and then make it available for viewing by members of Synod
in a place to be determined by the General Manager."

7. Adjournment

The President adjourned the Synod at 10.28 am.

8. Resumption

Synod resumed at 11am.

9. Finance and Diocesan Services Commission

Carried 

Mr Douglas Porter presented the report of the Finance and Diocesan Services Commission.

The General Manager moved; Mr David Sneesby seconded:

"That the report of the Finance and Diocesan Services Commission be received."

10. Motion 1. Auditor's Report and Statement of Accounts
The General Manager moved; Mr David Sneesby seconded:

Carried 

"That the Auditor's Report and Statement of Accounts of The Corporation of the Synod of the
Diocese of Brisbane and related entities and The Corporation of the Lesser Chapter of the
Cathedral Church of Brisbane for the year ended 31 December 2017 as incorporated in the
Report Book be adopted."

Carried 
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11. Motion 2. Budget 2019

Saturday 6 October 2018 

The General Manager moved; Mr David Sneesby seconded:

"That this Synod approves the Budget for the 12 months ending 31 December 2019 as detailed
in the attached summary and in so doing notes that

• this Budget has been prepared six months in advance of the year of operation;
• the Budget will need revision and approval by Diocesan Council in the light of any

unforeseen external economic factors and more up-to-date estimates of revenue and
costs which may emerge in the intervening period; and

• whilst Synod acknowledges that the budget may require a refresh in light of changed
circumstances, the intent of operational initiatives included in the budget as submitted
will be honoured where possible."

12. Motion 3. Appointment of Auditors for 2019

The General Manager moved; Mr David Sneesby seconded:

Carried 

"That this Synod appoints Ernst & Young as Auditors to the Diocese of Brisbane for all
Diocesan audits for three years ending 31 December 2019, 2020 and 2021 ".

13. Report of the Diocesan Council

Dr Gemma Dashwood presented the Report of Diocesan Council.

The Hon Justice Debra Mullins moved; Mr Alan Gallimore seconded:

Carried 

"That the President now leave the Chair and the Synod resolve itself into a Committee of the
whole to consider a question regarding the Appellate Tribunal."

Carried 

The Archbishop left for the duration of the Committee. 

The Chair of the Committee moved; 

"That the Chairman do now leave the chair and report that the question regarding the 
Appellate Tribunal has been considered in Committee." 

Dr Gemma Dashwood moved; the Canon Garry Harch seconded: 

"That the report of the Diocesan Council be received." 

14. Report of the Community Services Commission

Mrs Cathy Grant presented the report of the Community Services Commission.

Mrs Cathy Grant moved; the Right Rev'd Cameron Venables seconded:

"That the report of the Community Services Commission be received."

15. Report of the Ministry Education Commission

The Right Rev'd Dr Jonathan Holland presented the report of the Ministry Education
Commission.
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The Right Rev'd Dr Jonathan Holland moved; the Rev'd Penny Jones seconded: 

"That the report of the Ministry Education Commission be received." 

16. Parishes and Other Mission Agencies Commission

Carried 

The Right Rev'd John Roundhill presented the report of the Parishes and Other Mission
Agencies Commission.

The Right Rev'd John Roundhill moved; the Ven Julie Worrall seconded:

"That the report of the Parishes and Other Mission Agencies Commission be received."

17. Motion 4. Collection & Analysis of Parish Data

The Rev'd Adam Lowe moved; the Right Rev'd John Roundhill seconded:

Carried 

"That this Synod notes the continuing work of collection and analysis of parish data and
commends the outcomes to the Diocese for use in strategic planning."

Debate was adjourned.

18. Adjournment

The President adjourned the Synod at 1.00 pm with grace.

19. Resumption

Synod resumed at 2pm.

20. Motion 4. Collection & Analysis of Parish Data

Debate was resumed.

The Rev'd Adam Lowe moved; the Right Rev'd John Roundhill seconded:

"That this Synod notes the continuing work of collection and analysis of parish data and
commends the outcomes to the Diocese for use in strategic planning."

21. Motion 19. Communicating & Reporting on Mission Activities
The Rev'd Gillian Moses moved; the Rev'd Sue Wilton seconded:

"That this Synod:

Carried 

1. celebrates the many and diverse expressions of the mission of God through the
Anglican Church Southern Queensland, which nurture relationships and faith
formation within our own communities and with the communities in which we are
situated;

2. encourages the development and effective use of Diocesan media platforms where
Anglican faith communities can share their stories of engagement and evangelism;

3. asks parishes, schools and agencies to reflect on how they are participating in the
mission of God outside formal worship services."

Carried 
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22. Report of the Anglican Schools Commission

The Right Rev'd Jeremy Greaves presented the report of the Anglican Schools Commission.

The Right Rev'd Jeremy Greaves moved; the Rev'd Canon Dr Marian Free seconded:

"That the report of the Anglican Schools Commission be received."

23. Diocesan Governance Canon Amendment (FDSC) Canon 2018
The Rev'd Stewart Perry moved; the General Manager seconded:

"That this Synod agrees to the general principles of the Diocesan Governance Canon
Amendment (FDSC) Canon 2018."

The Rev'd Stewart Perry moved; the General Manager seconded:

Carried 

Carried 

"That the Diocesan Governance Canon Amendment (FDSC) Canon 2018 do now pass."

24. General Synod Legislation Canon Amendment Canon 2018
The Hon Justice Debra Mullins moved; the Rev'd Gillian Moses seconded:

Carried 

"That this Synod agrees to the general principles of the General Synod Legislation Canon
Amendment Canon 2018."

Carried 

The Hon Justice Debra Mullins moved; the Rev'd Gillian Moses seconded:

"That the General Synod Legislation Canon Amendment Canon 20 I 8 do now pass."

25. Diocesan Governance Canon Amendment (FDSC) Canon 2018

Carried 

The President announced that he had assented to the Diocesan Governance Canon Amendment
(FDSC) Canon 2018.

26. Professional Standards Canon Amendment Canon 2018
Ms Vaishi Rajanayagan moved; the General Manager seconded:

"That this Synod agrees to the general principles of the Professional Standards Canon
Amendment Canon 2018."

Ms Vaishi Rajanayagan moved; the General Manager seconded:

"That the Professional Standards Canon Amendment Canon 2018 do now pass."

27. General Synod Legislation Canon Amendment Canon 2018

Carried 

Carried 

The President announced that he had assented to the General Synod Legislation Canon
Amendment Canon 2018.

28. Answer to Question.
Miss Petrina Gardiner asked:

a) How much waste is generated through the catering for Synod, and of this, how much is

recyclable?
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b) Have any efforts been made, with the caterers or the school facility, to reduce the amount of

waste produced, increase the proportion of waste that is recyclable, and provide ways to

recycle waste that is recyclable?

Answer-
The Synod is using the facilities of Churchie and the event is subject to the waste and
recycling procedures used at Churchie.

The Event Director for Churchie has advised that Churchie does recycle documents/paper/etc
and has commercial recycle bins. However, 'green' recycling is not yet in place at Churchie.
The caterer endeavours to have as little left-over foods as possible in catering for the numbers
provided. Any foods left over are not able to be recycled or used for human consumption.
However, historically there has virtually been no wastage from food lines particularly from
Synod as catering numbers provided are usually accurate. The caterer has moved to
recyclable sandwich wedges and other recyclable products where possible and will use such
products if practicable.

Churchie has introduced recycling bins in the past, however, it is difficult to monitor students
always doing the right thing and to-date all types of recycling initiatives have not been
successful due to contamination. The School is currently in dialogue with contractors
looking for a viable solution and, when resolved, bins for recycling of all products will be re­
introduced across the campus.

Recycle bins for confidential documentation and paper products are in use in all buildings for
staff and students.

The General Manager's Office did engage with Churchie on the issue of waste and recycling
for the event but special arrangements outside existing systems proved to be impracticable for
2018.

29. Adjournment

The President adjourned the Synod at 3.30 pm.

30. Resumption

Synod resumed at 4.00pm.

31. Professional Standards Canon Amendment Canon 2018
The President announced that he had assented to the Professional Standards Canon
Amendment Canon 2018.

32. Motion 15. Civil Marriage & Blessings
The Very Rev'd Dr Peter Catt was given leave to move the motion in an amended form.

The Very Rev'd Dr Peter Catt moved; the Rev'd Canon Garry Harch seconded:

"That this Synod:
1) notes that it has previously supported and enco11rnged the Social Re.sponsibilities Committee

in the use of talking circles to enable members of the Diocese to discuss and explore the shape
and character of marriage

2) notes that the talking circle processes demonstrated:
a) that members of the Diocese hold a variety of views about the character of Christian

marriage

er�. 
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b) that there is a high level of support for the church to have the capacity to celebrate
marriage for and with all who seek it

3) therefore:
a) notes that there is pastoral value in providing a blessing to those whose marriages are not

between a man and a woman, and have been solemnised by a civil celebrant
b) requests the Archbishop to explore ways for those communities that wish to offer it to

offer a blessing for all couples who seek a blessing of their marriage."

The Rev'd Kay Hart moved; Mrs Janine Tubb seconded: 

"That 3a) be amended to read: 
notes that there is pastoral value in providing a blessing to those whose marriages have be 
solemnised by a civil celebrant, including those marriages not between a man and a woman." 

Carried 

The Very Rev'd Dr Peter Catt moved; the Rev'd Canon Garry Harch seconded: 

"That this Synod: 
1) notes that it has previously supported and encouraged the Social Responsibilities

Committee in the use of talking circles to enable members of the Diocese to discuss and
explore the shape and character of marriage

2) notes that the talking circle processes demonstrated:
a) that members of the Diocese hold a variety of views about the character of Christian

marriage
b) that there is a high level of support for the church to have the capacity to celebrate

marriage for and with all who seek it

3) therefore:
a) notes that there is pastoral value in providing a blessing to those whose marriages

have be solemnised by a civil celebrant, including those marriages not between a man
and a woman

b) requests the Archbishop to explore ways for those communities that wish to offer it to
offer a blessing for all couples who seek a blessing of their marriage."

Debate adjourned. 

33. Motion 5. Australian Board of Missions

The Rev'd Andrew Schmidt moved; the Rev'd Rebecca King seconded:

"That this synod:
1. commends the people of the Diocese for their support of ABM in 2017 and in particular

the 2017 Archbishop's November Appeal through which over $28,000 was raised to
help support the Province of Myanmar

2. commends the people of the Diocese for their support of ABM, generally, with over
$180,000 being raised for ABM again in 2017, amounting to 15% of the total donations
from all of the Australian Dioceses

3. encourages the people of the Diocese to support the 2018 Archbishop's November
Appeal - an urgent need for resources at Yarrabah in North Queensland including to:
• provide Faithfulness in Service Training
• provide training in how to lead liturgy and use the prayer book, more prayer books

and Bibles and access to e-pray
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• continue repairs to the hall which is a neutral location for Christian Education and
other ministry activities

• provide Resources such as the Bethel Bible Studies
• provide Funds to send leaders to retreats and diocesan conferences.
• assist in the provision of other Indigenous Grants

4. commends the Anglican Schools as they support ABM Projects

5. encourages the people of the Diocese to collect used stamps, the sale of which
benefits ABM by over $5,000 each year

6. gives thanks for the contribution of Bishop Bill Ray to the work of ABM in the life of
the Church in the Province of Queensland."

34. Answers to questions

The Rev' d Ann Shepperson asked:

Carried with acclamation 

Is this Diocese currently receiving any financial compensation from perpetrators of sexual
abuse of children in their care?
If not, is it possible to establish a process where those responsible for such criminal actions
provide financial contribution to the Diocese as part of the penalty for their actions for any
convictions?

Answer:

Monetary payments to people who have suffered child sexual abuse within the Church in this
Diocese are funded from a combination of contributions from schools, Anglicare (in the case
of Tufnell Home and Enoggera Boys Home), insurance and other Diocesan resources.

The Diocese considers the opportunity for contribution or recovery from alleged perpetrators
of child sexual abuse on a case by case basis.

The principal opportunity for the Diocese to obtain contribution from an alleged perpetrator
of child sexual abuse is to join the person as a contributor in civil proceedings. The Diocese
was successful in such circumstances in obtaining contribution from an alleged perpetrator to
the settlement of one claim of around 10% of the settlement sum.

The Redress and Claims team aims to deal with claims as expeditiously as possible and in a
way informed by the risk of re-traumatising the claimant. In that context, the Redress and
Claims team carefully considers and balances a number of matters when deciding whether to
join an alleged perpetrator as a contributor in civil proceedings, including:
1. Whether the alleged perpetrator has been identified or is still alive;
2. Whether the allegations have been proved in another forum, e.g. by a criminal conviction;
3. The assets available to the alleged perpetrator to meet any judgement or contribution to a

settlement;
4. The likelihood of being able to reach an early settlement of the claim if the alleged

perpetrator is involved;
5. The impact on the person who was abused of having the alleged perpetrator involved in

the proceedings, e.g. the alleged perpetrator having access to the claimant's discovered
documents such as medical records and expert medical reports on the claimant, or being
present during mandatory settlement conferences.

Our experience has been that in many cases, the alleged perpetrator: 
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1. is either not identified or is deceased; or

2. is not likely to have sufficient assets to make contribution or recovery steps

worthwhile.

While it may be legally possible to commence a separate recovery action against an alleged 
perpetrator, there are difficulties including that all redress and settlement payments made by 
the Diocese are voluntary and are not a payment the Diocese has been legally obliged to pay. 
Also, such an action may require evidence from the person who was abused and therefore 
present an unreasonable risk of re-traumatisation. 

Ms Leanne Cronk asked: 

Would you provide an update of the current status and plans for the property at 2 Roseberry 
Terrace, Chelmer, the old Neilson Home site? The site has remained 'open' ground for close 
to 20 years. 

Has there been any progress in the last 12 months concerning a preferred option for future use 
or development of this site? 

Answer: 

Anglicare and the Diocesan Property team have been looking into potential opportunities for 
the Roseberry Terrace, Chelmer site, and have carried out detailed investigations into the 
property, particularly from a town planning viewpoint. 

The most recent advice from the Brisbane City Council is that there is potential for a 
resumption of around one third of the site for a future road/bridge. Together with flooding 
issues, this increases the constraints on the site in terms of future use and in particular 
substantially hampers its suitability for Aged Care. 

Anglicare has no current intention to divest the land but is continuing to explore opportunities 
for the use of the land to support ongoing mission. 

35. Adjournment

The President adjourned the Synod at 5.26 pm for evening prayer.

36. Resumption

Synod resumed at 7.30pm.

37. Motion 15. Civil Marriage & Blessings
Debate was resumed.

The Very Rev'd Dr Peter Catt moved; the Rev'd Canon Garry Harch seconded:

"That this Synod:
1) notes that it has previously supported and encouraged the Social Responsibilities

Committee in the use of talking circles to enable members of the Diocese to discuss and
explore the shape and character of marriage

2) notes that the talking circle processes demonstrated:
a. that members of the Diocese hold a variety of views about the character of Christian

marriage
b. that there is a high level of support for the church to have the capacity to celebrate

marriage for and with all who seek it
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3) therefore:
a. notes that there is pastoral value in providing a blessing to those whose marriages

have be solemnised by a civil celebrant, including those marriages not between a man
and a woman

b. requests the Archbishop to explore ways for those communities that wish to offer it to
offer a blessing for all couples who seek a blessing of their marriage."

Ms Anne Braithwaite moved; the Rev'd David Browne seconded: 

"That the question be not now put." 

38. Tribunal Canon Amendment Canon 2018
The Hon Justice Debra Mullins moved; Ms Vaishi Rajanayagan seconded:

Carried 

"That this Synod agrees to the general principles of the Tribunal Canon Amendment Canon
2018."

Carried 

The Hon Justice Debra Mullins moved; Ms Vaishi Rajanayagan seconded: 

"That the Tribunal Canon Amendment Canon 2018 do now pass." 

39. Motion 7. Religious Freedom

Debate was resumed.

The Rev'd Dr Josephine lnkpin moved; the Rev'd Peter Mayen seconded:

"That this Synod:

Carried 

1. affirms the view of the National Council of Churches in Australia that 'the human right to
freedom is in reasonable state' in Australia, but that much more needs to be done by
Australian authorities to aid the victims of religious persecution overseas, not least the
needs of asylum seekers, irrespective of religious affiliation

2. considers that further attention should be given to the clarification of religious rights to
ensure religious freedom is safeguarded for all Australians and that ideas of religious
freedom should not be used to support religious privilege, bullying and discrimination

3. calls on the Federal Government to strengthen Australian efforts to help end religious
persecution overseas and to receive more compassionately those seeking refuge and asylum

4. encourages members of the Anglican Church Southern Queensland to deepen their prayer
and practical support for all victims ofreligious persecution, and, with the National Council
of Churches in Australia, to encourage all Australian leaders, from whatever outlook, 'to
model courteous and respectful discourse in public life."

40. Motion 8. Disability Access & Action

The Rev'd Penny Jones moved; the Rev'd Allan'Paulsen seconded:

"That thi·s Synod:-

Carried 

1. affirms the equality and gifts of the members of the Anglican Church Southern Queensland
with disability and recognises that there are significant attitudinal and environmental barriers
in church and society to their full participation.
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2. encourages use of the growing resources supplied by disability support practitioners and
theologians of disability.

3. requests Diocesan Council to set up a Diocesan working group to progress a Disability
Access and Action Plan, in partnership with people with disability and their families, and in
consultation with Anglicare and other expert non-governmental organisations."

41. Motion 9. Reconciliation Action Plan

The Rev'd Canon Bruce Boase moved; the Rev'd Dr Josephine Inkpin seconded:

"That this Synod:

Carried 

1. gives thanks to God for the fruits of the ACSQ Reconciliation Plan (RAP) 2016-2018, and
for the ministry of all involved, especially that of Christine Ellis, RAP Co-ordinator

2. requests the Diocesan RAP Working Group to develop a new Innovate RAP in consultation
with Reconciliation Australia, with details to be agreed by Diocesan Council

3. encourages all members of the Diocese to contribute their own input to the development
of the new RAP and to share fully in the continuing journey of Reconciliation."

42. Motion 10. Acknowledgment of Mr BM Lovett

Mr Doug Russell moved; Mrs Janet Dyke seconded:

Carried 

"That this Synod acknowledges the tremendous contribution oflate (deceased) teacher Mr
BM 'Peter' Lovett over four decades (excludes military service in WWII) of both TSS and
Anglican Church Grammar School, until December 1977. To that end, recommends to the
Churchie headmaster and School Council the commissioning of a bronze bust or statue in the
precinct of Centenary Library or Brenan Pavilion."

43. Tribunal Canon Amendment Canon 2018

Not carried 

The President announced that he had assented to the Tribunal Canon Amendment Canon 2018.

44. Adjournment

The President adjourned the Synod at 9.32 pm and after reading prayers, pronounced the
Blessing.

45. Attendance

Clergy: 160 
Lay: 256 

Le"�v� 
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ANGLICAN ClillRCH OF AUSTRALIA 

DIOCESE OF BRISBANE 

The Second Session of the Seventy-Ninth Synod of the Diocese of Brisbane resumed in Morris Hall, 
Anglican Church Grammar School, East Brisbane, on Sunday 7 October 2018. 

1. Opening

The President, the Most Rev' d Dr Phillip Aspinall, took the Chair at 11.30am.

The President's Chaplain read the prayers.

2. Minutes

Mr David Sneesby reported to Synod that the Minutes Committee had read the minutes of the
previous day's sitting [Saturday 6 October 2018] and had certified that they were a true record.

Mr David Sneesby moved, Dr Ann Dashwood seconded,
"That the minutes of the previous day's sitting be confirmed."

3. Standing Orders - Confirmation of Minutes
Mr Alan Gallimore moved; Mrs Joanne Rose seconded:

"That:

Carried 

In accordance with Standing Order B.2(5), the confirmation of the minutes for Sunday 7 October
be delegated to the Diocesan Council."

4. Petitions

The President called for petitions. There were no petitions.

5. Notices of Motion on Supplementary Business Paper

There was no Supplementary Business Paper.

6. Formal Motions
The President called over the list of motions of which notice had been given.

Motion 21. Australian Broadcasting Corporation
Dr Chris Gourlay moved; Mrs Suzanne Bain seconded:

Carried 

"That this Synod respectfully requests the Archbishop to write to the Australian Broadcasting
Corporation to encourage the ABC to continue to support programs with a religious element as
being an important part of the national identity and cultural life of Australians of all generations

and backgrounds and to make provision for those who for whatever reason are not able to use
digital technology."

Carried 

Motion 23. Bush Church Aid Centenary 
The Rev' d Peter Palmer moved; the Rev' d Michael Uptin seconded: 
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"That this Synod, 

Sunday 7 October 2018 

a. thanks God for 100 years of Mission by the Bush Church Aid Society,

b. gives thanks to God for the ministry of Bush Church Aid in seeking to reach Australia
for Christ in remote, rural, and regional Australia, and in particular with Indigenous

Australians, over the past 100 years

c. encourages parishes to use resources made available by Bush Church Aid to mark this
Centenary celebration on Sunday May 26th 2019

d. urges parishes and Synod representatives to support the work of Bush Church Aid in the
future by:
praying that God would raise up men and women to respond to the call of ministry in
remote, rural and regional Australia

city parishes to develop links with country parishes here in Queensland
using the monthly prayer points in their weekly services."

7. Motion 12. Ecumenical Ministry
The Right Rev'd Doug Stevens moved; the Rev'd Helen Paget seconded:

Carried 

"That this Synod encourage continued Diocesan participation in the following ecumenical
ministries:

a) Diocesan Ecumenical Affairs Committee

b) Queensland Churches Together
c) Ecumenical Tertiary Chaplaincy Committee

d) Queensland Faith Communities Council."

Deaconess Margaret Thornton moved; the Rev'd Bronwyn Pagram seconded: 

"That we add the words 'and multi-faith' after 'ecumenical' in the first sentence." 

The Right Rev' d Doug Stevens moved; the Rev' d Helen Paget seconded: 

Carried 

"That this Synod encourage continued Diocesan participation in the following ecumenical and 

multi-faith ministries: 
a) Diocesan Ecumenical Affairs Committee
b) Queensland Churches Together

c) Ecumenical Tertiary Chaplaincy Committee
d) Queensland Faith Communities Council."

8. Motion 16. St Francis College
The Rev'd Professor Rodney Wolff moved; the Rev'd Canon Sarah Leisemann seconded:

"That this Synod:

Carried 

1. acknowledges theological education offers a valuable way to know Jesus and to deepen
one's discipleship of him;

2. commits to prayer for, and encouragement of, all undertaking formal theological
education, especially for those in formation for ordained ministry in this diocese;

3. commends the Principal, lecturers, and professional staff of St Francis' Theological
College for
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a. providing Bible-based study programs which uphold academic excellence and
faithful theological integrity, and

b. curating a spiritual and physical environment at the Milton site which is highly
conducive to faith seeking understanding; and

4. calls on incumbents and leaders in parishes, other mission agencies, and schools to
a. encourage members of their respective communities to engage with learning

opportunities at St Francis' College, and

b. visit the College to meet with the Principal and staff to discover more about
learning opportunities and the potential use of the College for parish fellowship
and faith formation activities."

9. Motion 18. Community of the Way

The Rev'd Jasmine Dow moved; Ms Wynona Newby-Clark seconded:

"That this Synod:

Carried 

1. celebrates and gives thanks for the vision and implementation of an intentional Christian
community for young adults (Community of The Way), at St Francis Theological
College in 2019

2. encourages the people of the Diocese to support the life of the Community through
prayer, publicity, and financial giving."

Carried 

10. Motion 20. Statements on 'Climate and the Environment'

The Rev' d Bronwyn Pagram moved; Ms Rebecca Crockett seconded:

"That this Synod:

Recalling the 2009 adoption by this Synod of the General Synod Protection of the Environment
Canon 2007 (Canon No. 11, 2007),

1. acknowledges:

a. that this Diocese has been slow in meeting the undertakings it made in adopting the
Canon,and

b. that actual programs and targets have not been co-ordinated nor collated by the
Diocese for reporting to General Synod;

2. thanks those individual members, parishes, schools, commissions and agencies of the
diocese who are active in reducing their environmental footprint;

3. requests:

a. individual parishioners, every Diocesan organisation, and the Diocese as a whole, to
commit to putting in the necessary time and energy to take seriously our care for the
environment, including the commitments agreed to in the above-mentioned Canon,

b. Diocesan Council, in consultation with the Social Responsibilities Committee and
Angligreen, to develop a process whereby we are able to examine our successes, our
failures and ways in which we can better respond to the undertakings we made in
2009,and

c. requests that progress on this task be the subject of a 2019 Report to this Synod. This
report would mark the tenth anniversary of the commitment made in 2009."

Carried 
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11. Thanks of Synod

Sunday 7 October 2018 

By leave of Synod, the Right Rev'd Jeremy Greaves moved; the Right Rev'd Cameron Venables
seconded:
"That the thanks of Synod be accorded to -

• His Grace the Archbishop as President of Synod,
• the Chair of Committees,
• the Deputy Chair of Committees,
• the Chancellor,
• the Deputy Chancellor,
• the Chaplain to Synod,
• the Clerical and Lay Secretaries of Synod,
• the Minutes Committee,
• the Committee of Elections and Qualifications,
• the Timekeeper,
• the Deputy Timekeeper,
• the General Manager,
• those assisting, particularly with the secretarial work

for their care and attention to the conduct of Synod and the preparation thereof. 

Carried with acclamation 

12. Thanks of Synod

By leave of Synod, the Right Rev'd Jeremy Greaves moved; the Right Rev'd Cameron Venables
seconded:
"That the thanks of Synod be accorded to -

• the Headmaster Dr Alan Campbell, and staff of the Anglican Church Grammar School,
in particular Ms Diane Cross, Mr Brian Bowen and the Rev'd Brian Gadd for the use of
facilities of the School;

• Scholarest for their nourishing catering at the school;
• the audio-visual staff and student volunteers;
• the many volunteers who provided infom1ative displays during the Synod;
• all of the Diocesan staff who have made themselves available during Synod and for all

their work in the preparations for Synod; and
• the Dean and Cathedral personnel for the inspiring Service on Friday evening.

Carried with acclamation 

13. Adjournment

The President adjourned the Synod at 12.58 pm and pronounced the Blessing.

14. Attendance

Clergy
Lay

�l\ c, .. ,�J 
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DIOCESAN GOVERNANCE CANON AMENDMENT (FDSC) CANON 
2018 

A Canon to amend the Diocesan Governance Canon to give effect to the amalgamation of the 
Diocesan Services Commission and the Financial Services Commission. 

The Archbishop, Clergy and Laity of the Diocese of Brisbane assembled in Synod prescribe – 

Short Title 

1. This Canon may be cited as the “Diocesan Governance Canon Amendment (FDSC) Canon
2018”.

Amendment 

2. The Diocesan Governance Canon is amended as follows:

(a) In section 2, delete the definitions of DSC and FSC and insert:

"FDSC" means the Finance and Diocesan Services Commission.

(b) Section 5(b) is amended by substituting the following:

(b) Finance and Diocesan Services Commission;

(c) In Part V, substitute sections 23 to 30 (inclusive) with sections 23 - 30 (inclusive) as set
out in schedule 1;

(d) Part VA, comprising sections 30A to 30H (inclusive), is repealed;

(e) Section 70(1) is amended by substituting the following:

(1) A reference in any Canon, Regulation, document or resolution to the Property
and Finance Board shall be read and construed as a reference to the FDSC.

(f) Part B to Schedule 1 is amended by deleting "Diocesan Services Commission" and
inserting "Finance and Diocesan Services Commission".

(g) Part D to Schedule 1 is amended by deleting "Financial Services Commission" and
inserting "Finance and Diocesan Services Commission".

Operation of FDSC 

3. (1) Regulation I - Finance and Diocesan Services Commission made by the Archbishop-in-
Council on 27 July 2017 is repealed. 

(2) Nothing in this Canon affects any action taken in reliance on Regulation I and in
particular:
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(a) the Finance and Diocesan Service Commission created under Regulation I
continues in existence under the provisions of the Diocesan Governance Canon
as amended by this Canon;

(b) nothing in this Canon affects any act, resolution or decision made in exercise of
its powers by the Finance and Diocesan Services Commission before the
coming into force of this Canon, which acts, resolutions or decisions remain
valid and in full force and effect unless and until otherwise determined by the
Finance and Diocesan Services Commission or the Archbishop-in-Council;

(c) without limiting subsection (2)(b), nothing in this Canon affects the
employment of any person who is employed by the Corporation as a result of
an exercise of power by the Finance and Diocesan Services Commission.

(3) The members of the Finance and Diocesan Services Commission appointed under
Regulation I continue in office as if appointed under the Diocesan Governance Canon
as amended by this Canon.

(4) For the purposes of calculating the length of service of a member of the Finance and
Diocesan Services Commission under sections 26(c) and (d) of the Diocesan
Governance Canon as amended by this Canon:

(a) the continuous length of service of the member on the FSC or the DSC up to
1 September 2017 will be taken to be service as a member of the Finance and
Diocesan Services Commission; and

(b) the continuous length of service of the member on the Finance and Diocesan
Services Commission from 1 September 2017 will be taken to be service as a
member of the Finance and Diocesan Services Commission.

Schedule 1 

PART V – FINANCE AND DIOCESAN SERVICES COMMISSION 

Purpose 

23. The purpose of the FDSC is to support the mission of the Church by providing strategic
direction and policy development to, and monitoring of, administrative systems across the
Diocese, managing and controlling all real property of the Corporation and ensuring the
proper management of all financial, banking, investment and treasury services across the
Diocese.

Objects 

24. The FDSC will:

(a) provide strategic direction, leadership and oversight in administrative support areas
including:

(i) strategic planning;
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(ii) information management and technology;
(iii) human relations and industrial relations;
(iv) insurance services;
(v) communications and the media;
(vi) governance, risk management and legal compliance;
(vii) records and archives; and
(viii) the management of real property;

(b) provide financial, banking, investment and treasury services to the Diocese,
Commissions and agencies of the Diocese, including the following functions:

(i) financial, management and special-purpose reporting, budgeting, accounting
systems, policies and procedures;

(ii) banking and treasury functions, including investment strategy, liquidity and
cash flow management;

(iii) financial governance and risk management, financial legislative, statutory
and audit compliance;

(iv) management of such of the financial, banking and investment services
dedicated to Anglican Financial Services by the FDSC.

(c) develop policies in each of the areas set out in paragraphs (a) and (b) and make
recommendations for the adoption of such policies to the Archbishop-in-Council;

(d) undertake research and planning and consult widely in the development of strategies
and policies related to the areas set out in paragraphs (a) and (b);

(e) consult and coordinate with other Commissions and agencies within the Diocese on
issues relating to each of the areas set out in paragraphs (a) and (b);

(f) develop a Delegations Manual for the Diocese for adoption by the Archbishop-in-
Council and review and recommend changes from time to time; and

(g) perform such other roles, tasks or objects which are consistent with its purpose or
which the Archbishop-in-Council may from time to time prescribe by Regulation.

Powers 

25. Subject to the operation of other Canons and within the limits imposed by the Synod or
Archbishop-in-Council, the FDSC may (for and on behalf of the Corporation) exercise any of
the powers of the Corporation, including:

(a) employ staff and remunerate contractors, advisors, consultants or other persons
providing services to the FDSC;

(b) raise money including by way of applications to government or government agencies;

(c) purchase equipment, supplies, information, communication, travel and other services
as may be required to conduct the business of the FDSC;

(d) operate bank accounts;
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(e) enter into contracts, agreements or other arrangements with Federal, State or Local
Governments, statutory authorities, companies or persons which the FDSC believes
are conducive to its objects;

(f) delegate the exercise of powers to individuals or committees (including the power to
delegate in accordance with a resolution or Regulation of the Archbishop-in-
Council); and

(g) do all such things as are incidental or conducive to achieving the objects of the FDSC
and the exercise of these powers.

Membership 

26. (a) The members of the FDSC shall be: 

(i) the Archbishop, who shall be President of the FDSC;
(ii) a Chairperson, if appointed by the Archbishop;
(iii) up to twelve members (including at least two clergy), appointed by the

Archbishop-in-Council; and
(iv) the Executive Director of the FDSC.

(b) At least two-thirds of the members of the FDSC must be practising Anglicans.

(c) After each ordinary session of the Synod, at least one third of the members appointed
under paragraph (a)(iii) must retire from office. Those to retire will be those who have
served longest in office. Where members have served an equal term, in the absence of
agreement as to which of them shall retire, the retiring member will be determined by
lot. Subject to paragraph (d), a member retiring under this paragraph (c) will be eligible
for reappointment. The retirement of the member takes effect on the date of
appointment of a successor under paragraph (e), unless the member is reappointed, in
which case the member will be taken to have retired and been reappointed on the date
of reappointment.

(d) No member appointed under paragraph (a)(iii) is permitted to serve more than 3 years
without retiring and being subject to reappointment. If such a member has served as a
member of the FDSC for a period of 12 or more consecutive years, then, in addition
to the provisions of paragraph (c), that member's appointment must be confirmed by
the Archbishop-in-Council at its first meeting after each ordinary session of the
Synod. If the Archbishop-in-Council does not resolve to confirm that appointment,
then the appointment of that member ceases.

(e) At its first meeting after each ordinary session of Synod, Archbishop-in-Council shall
appoint such number of members as are required under paragraph (a)(iii) to fill the
position of members retiring under paragraph (c).

(f) The Archbishop-in-Council shall have regard to the expertise and interests of the
people it appoints under paragraph (a)(iii) to ensure the business of the FDSC is dealt
with expeditiously. Without limiting the appointment of any individual, the skills and
qualifications appropriate for members of the FDSC include:

(i) mission of the church;
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(ii) administration and general management;
(iii) law;
(iv) human relations and industrial relations;
(v) public relations, marketing and the media
(vi) information technology and information management;
(vii) governance and compliance;
(viii) strategic planning and business development;
(ix) real estate, property development and facilities management;
(x) finance, accounting and economics;
(xi) banking;
(xii) auditing and risk management;
(xiii) investments;
(xiv) business development and financial management of schools or community

services/aged care;
(xv) records and archive management.

(h) The FDSC may invite persons to attend meetings of the FDSC on a temporary or
permanent basis.

Proceedings 

27. The FDSC shall determine procedures for the conduct of the business of the FDSC subject to
the following:

(a) the FDSC must meet as necessary for the proper discharge of its duties and
obligations under this Canon but must meet at least four times per year;

(b) the President, if in attendance, may chair the meeting. Should the President not be
present at the meeting or elect not to chair the meeting, the Chairperson shall chair
the meeting otherwise the members shall elect one of their number to chair the
meeting;

(c) resolutions shall be determined by a simple majority. If votes are equal the person
chairing the meeting shall have an additional casting vote;

(d) a quorum shall be half of the members;

(e) the FDSC shall arrange for records to be kept of the proceedings of the FDSC; and

(f) the FDSC may establish such committees as it shall consider expedient or convenient
for the functioning of the FDSC provided that at least one member of any committee
shall be a member of the FDSC and the chair of such committee shall be appointed
by the FDSC.

Reporting 

28. The FDSC shall report in the form required from time to time by the Archbishop-in-Council
at least twice each calendar year and provide a detailed set of management accounts to the
Archbishop-in-Council quarterly.

29. The Archbishop-in-Council may at any time direct the FDSC to provide such other reports or
information of any description in regard to the FDSC’s objects, authorities, powers and
activities as the Archbishop-in-Council may require, and direct any member or members of
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the FDSC to attend a meeting of the Archbishop-in-Council. 

30. The FDSC shall report in writing to each annual session of Synod in the form required from
time to time by the Archbishop-in-Council.  Such report will include the audited financial
statements for the preceding year and a budget of expenditure and income for the following
year.
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GENERAL SYNOD LEGISLATION CANON 

AMENDMENT CANON 2018 

A Canon to assent to and adopt canons of the General Synod by means of amendments to the 

General Synod Legislation Canon.  

The Archbishop, Clergy and Laity of the Diocese of Brisbane assembled in Synod prescribe – 

Short Title 

1. This Canon may be cited as the "General Synod Legislation Canon Amendment Canon 2018".

Definition 

2. In this Canon, the Principal Canon means the “General Synod Legislation Canon”

Assent to Canons of General Synod 

3. Schedule 1 of the Principal Canon is amended by the addition of the following to the Schedule –

     “No 2, 2017       Constitution (Appellate Tribunal) Amendment Canon 2017 

No 6, 2017       Constitution (Jurisdiction of Special Tribunal) Amendment Canon 2017” 

Adoption of Canons of General Synod 

4. Schedule 2 of the Principal Canon is amended by the addition of the following to the Schedule –

"No 7, 2017 Offences Amendment Canon 2017  

No 12, 2017 Special Tribunal (Limitation Period) Canon 2017 

No 18, 2017 Holy Orders (Removal from Exercise of Ministry) Canon 2017 

No 19, 2017 Canon Concerning Services Amendment Canon 2017” 
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PROFESSIONAL STANDARDS CANON AMENDMENT CANON 2018 

A Canon to amend the Professional Standards Canon. 

The Archbishop, Clergy and Laity of the Diocese of Brisbane assembled in Synod prescribe – 

Short Title 

1. This Canon may be cited as the "Professional Standards Canon Amendment Canon 2018".

Definition 

2. In this Canon, the Principal Canon means the “Professional Standards Canon”

Composition of PSB 

3. Omit sections 39(b) and (c) of the Principal Canon and replace them with –

“(b) up to eight members of the clergy of at least seven years standing; and 

(c) up to eight lay persons who may or may not be members of the Church and who have
skills or qualifications appropriate for members of the Board.

A Board can be constituted under section 42 notwithstanding a vacancy or vacancies in the 
membership of the panel provided there are sufficient members to constitute a Board under 
section 42(2).” 

4. Omit section 42(2) of the Principal Canon and replace it with –

“(2) For the purpose of any reference to the Board, the Board shall consist of – 

(a) the presiding member who shall be the President, the Deputy President or another
member of the panel who is eligible for appointment as a lay member of the
Appellate Tribunal; and

(b) an equal number not exceeding two of clerical and lay members of the panel.”

Other amendments 

5. The Principal Canon is amended as follows –

(a) In section 49(5), after “tribunal” in both places, insert “or commission of enquiry”.

(b) In section 50, add -

“The Board may, for the purpose of any particular reference, appoint a person to act as a
counsel assisting the Board to carry out any advocacy or advisory role that the Board may
determine.”

(c) In section 70, add -

“Unless otherwise ordered by the presiding member and subject to any conditions the
presiding member may order, the determination and recommendation provided to the
relevant Church Authority and the respondent will be accompanied by a copy of any
written reasons produced under section 51.”
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TRIBUNAL CANON AMENDMENT CANON 2018 

A Canon to amend the Tribunal Canon to incorporate changes to the Constitution of the Anglican 

Church of Australia. 

The Archbishop, Clergy and Laity of the Diocese of Brisbane assembled in Synod prescribe – 

Short Title 

1. This Canon may be cited as the "Tribunal Canon Amendment Canon 2018".

Composition of Tribunal 

2. Omit sections 20(1) to (4) of the Tribunal Canon and replace them with –

     20 (1) A Diocesan Tribunal shall be constituted for the trial of an Accused so long as it
consists of the following members – 

(a) the President,

(b) not less than two of the clerical members of the Panel of Triers, and

(c) not less than two of the lay members of the Panel of Triers.

(2) The President shall be appointed by the Archbishop.

(3) The President must be a person qualified to be a lay member of the Appellate
Tribunal in accordance with the provisions of section 57(1) of the Constitution of
the Anglican Church of Australia.

(4) The President shall preside over the trial.  If the President is not present then the
Archbishop may appoint another person qualified under the requirements of
section 20(3) as the President for the trial.

3. Add a new section 20(7) –

(7) The Archbishop is ineligible to be a member of the Panel of Triers or a Diocesan
Tribunal.  A person who is a member of the Panel of Triers or a Diocesan
Tribunal shall cease to hold that office on becoming the Archbishop.

Consequential amendments 

4. The Tribunal Canon is amended as follows –

(a) in section 26, delete the word “Deputy”.

(b) in section 27:

(i) in paragraph (b), delete “President” and insert “Tribunal”;

(ii) in paragraph (c), delete “by the President”.

(c) in section 31:

(i) delete the second sentence;

(ii) in the third sentence, delete the words “other” and “Deputy”.
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(d) omit section 32 and replace it with –

32. The President shall forthwith give the Archbishop notice in writing of the
decision and the recommendation (if any) of the Tribunal.

When Canon comes into force 

5. This Canon will have no force or effect until the date on which General Synod Canon No. 4 of
2014, Constitution Amendment (Membership of the Diocesan Tribunal) Canon 2014 comes into
force in the Diocese.
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NAME PARISH 

Mrs Gail Abbott CARINDALE 
Mr Dave Allen ROCHEDALE 
Mrs Narrelle Allen NERANG 
Mrs Susan Allen NANANGO 
Ms Alexandra Amankwah STAFFORD 
Mrs Donna Anderson CANTERBURY COLLEGE 
Ms Isobel  Annat LUTWYCHE 
Mr Daniel Aspinall HAMILTON 
Mr Daniel  Axelson GROVELY 
Mrs Rebecca Axelson GROVELY 
Mrs Suzanne  Bain St John's Anglican College 
Mr Darryl Barber HAMILTON 
Mrs Annette Barnes NUNDAH 
Mr Phillip Bate CHELMER-GRACEVILLE 
Mr Joshua  Beausang MORNINGSIDE 
Mrs Sandra  Beck CHERMSIDE 
Mrs Robyn Bell CANNON HILL ANGLICAN COLLEGE 
Mrs Judy Bennett SURFERS PARADISE 
Mrs Kay Benson BRIBIE ISLAND 
Mr Wayne  Bird BOONAH-HARRISVILLE 
Mrs Jann  Bishop KINGAROY 
Ms Anne Braithwaite MAROOCHYDORE 
Mrs Susan Brandis ST HILDA'S SCHOOL 
Mrs Barbara  Briggs BANYO 
Mrs Lesley  Briggs IPSWICH NORTH 
Mrs Helyn Brockman GOODNA 
Ms Wendy Brown ZILLMERE 
Dr Paul Browning ST PAUL'S SCHOOL 
Dr Desley Buchan ST GEORGE 
Mr Leigh  Buchanan FORTITUDE VALLEY 
Mrs Susan  Buchanan IPSWICH 
Mrs Frances Burns LOGAN 
Mrs Elizabeth  Butterworth BUDERIM 
Mrs Joycelyn  Cameron BRISBANE VALLEY 
Dr Alan Campbell ANGLICAN CHURCH GRAMMAR SCHOOL 

Mrs Beryl  Carroll GOONANEMAN 
Mrs Robyn Casey EASTERN HILLS ANGLICANS 
Mrs Rosalyn Cheales ST ANDREW'S ANGLICAN COLLEGE 

Mrs Danielle  Clark FRESHWATER 
Mr Geoff Clarke INALA 
Mrs Pamela Clemments ZILLMERE 
Mr Timothy  Coates INDOOROOPILLY 
Mr Donald  Cock EVERTON PARK 
Mrs Kim Cohen THE GLENNIE SCHOOL 
Ms Margaret  Compton TOOWOOMBA, ST LUKE'S 
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NAME PARISH 

Mrs Margaret  Cooper-
Smith

GOONANEMAN

Ms Mary Couche NOOSA
Ms Rebecca Crockett COOLUM
Miss Leanne  Cronk TOOWONG
Ms Denise  Cruickshank THE GAP
Mrs Cheryl  Cumming GAYNDAH
Ms Roslyn Curtis ST MARGARET'S SCHOOL
Dr Ann Dashwood TOOWOOMBA, ST LUKE'S
Dr Gemma Dashwood DC
Ms Catherine David GYMPIE
Mrs Suzanne Davis BUNDABERG
Ms Claire Dean GOLD COAST SOUTH
Mr Reginald Dean BUNDABERG WEST
Mr Michael Dennison TOOWOOMBA, ST BARTHOLOMEW'S
Mrs Lynne Doneley NAMBOUR
Mr Jeff Drysdale EKIBIN
Mr Mark Dungey SPRINGFIELD, ST ANDREW'S PARISH

Ms Susan Dunne ROSEWOOD
Mrs Charmaine Dyer ALEXANDRA HILLS
Mrs Janet Dyke KAWANA WATERS
Ms Cheryl Dymock SHERWOOD
Mr Barnaby Eaton FRASER COAST ANGLICAN COLLEGE

Dr Neville Eckersley KENMORE-BROOKFIELD
Mrs Glenda Ellis AUCHENFLOWER-MILTON
Ms Sue Ellis BOOVAL
Ms Rose Elu TORRES STRAIT ISLANDER
Mr Francisco  Estevao ROBINA-MERMAID BEACH
Mr Jeffrey  Eustace BRIBIE ISLAND
Mr Jack Files SUNNYBANK
Mrs Val Files SUNNYBANK
Mrs Marie Flegler MAROOCHYDORE
Mr John Fradgley ALL SAINTS' ANGLICAN SCHOOL
Mrs Gail Frankcom NEW FARM
Mr Garry Franks CABOOLTURE
Mrs Sylvia  Free DRAYTON
Mr John  Freeman CENTENARY SUBURBS
Mr Jeremy  Freyburg TOOWOOMBA, ST BARTHOLOMEW'S
Ms Marie  Fuller BANYO
Mrs Gail Fulton ALLORA-CLIFTON
Mr Alan Gallimore CATHEDRAL
Miss Petrina  Gardiner AUCHENFLOWER-MILTON
Mr Christopher

Gehrmann
YERONGA

Mr Evan Gilbert MATTHEW FLINDERS ANGLICAN COLLEGE

Mrs Elizabeth Gillam THE GLENNIE SCHOOL
Mr Julian  Glassock WILSTON
Dr Christopher  Gourlay CATHEDRAL
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NAME PARISH 

Mrs Catherine Grant CSC
Mr Alan Gray TOOWOOMBA WEST
Ms Allison Gray REDCLIFFE
Ms Sharyn Gray TOOWOOMBA WEST
Mr Anthony  Green CABOOLTURE
Mrs Desley  Green THE GAP
Mrs Merilyn Greensill HERVEY BAY
Mr David Hale ANNERLEY
Mr Bushra Hamid YERONGA
Mr Patrick Hanly ROMA
Ms Margaret Harrington NEW FARM
Mr Frank Harrison NORTH PINE
Ms Lynn Haughey INDOOROOPILLY
Mr Martin  Hawkins ROCHEDALE
Dr Sylvia  Haworth CHERMSIDE
Mrs Leah  Hayward BRISBANE VALLEY
Ms Jenna Haywood BARDON
Mrs Cheryl  Heidrich MUNDUBBERA-EIDSVOLD-MONTO
Mr Fredrich Heidrich MUNDUBBERA-EIDSVOLD-MONTO
Mr Gregory  Henderson KAWANA WATERS
Mr Roger Henderson DALBY
Mr Neil Henzell WYNNUM
Mrs Michelle Heuston TARA
Mr Stephen  Hilditch COOROORA
Mr Ross  Hodson WYNNUM
Mrs Rosemary Hogan BURLEIGH HEADS
Mr Glynn  Holland-Leam MEC - ANGLICAN YOUTH MINISTRIES

Mr Desmond Hunt IPSWICH
Mr Frederick  Hurman OAKEY
Mrs Janet Hurman OAKEY
Mr Kevin Hutton NOOSA
Mrs Helen Irwin SPRINGFIELD, ST ANDREW'S PARISH

Mrs Lesleigh Jackson GOLD COAST SOUTH
Mrs Judy Jaeger TAMBORINE MOUNTAIN
Ms Julie James BEENLEIGH
Mrs Dale Jarman BRAMBLE BAY
Mr Lawrence Johansen GATTON-MA MA CREEK
Mrs Marjorie Johansen GATTON-MA MA CREEK
Ms Debora  John MEC - ANGLICAN YOUTH MINISTRIES

Mrs Judith John MT GRAVATT
Mrs Judith  Jones EKIBIN
Mr Gerri Jordan ALL SAINTS, BRISBANE
Ms Cheryl Kadinsky EAST BRISBANE
Mr Barry Kelly St John's Anglican College
Mr Barry Kelly THE SPRINGFIELD COLLEGE
Mr Grantley  Kemble GOLD COAST NORTH
Ms Debbie Kemish ASPLEY - ALBANY CREEK
Dr Ruth  Kerr OAM ST LUCIA
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Mr Robert Kersnovske SAMFORD 
Mr David Keyt KANGAROO POINT 
Ms Anna-Britt Kjellgren LUTWYCHE 
Mrs Prudence Klaer WOOLLOONGABBA 
Ms Carmen Kleindienst GREEN HILLS 
Mr Stephen Knott COOMERA ANGLICAN COLLEGE 
Mrs Ann Lacey WOOLLOONGABBA 
Mr Hamish Lamb KILCOY 
Ms Kay Lauchland SURFERS PARADISE 
Mr Rob Law ST PAUL'S SCHOOL 
Ms Suzanne Lazarevski LAIDLEY 
Mrs Allison Leech TOOWOOMBA, ST JAMES' 
Mr Simon Lees TOOWOOMBA ANGLICAN COLLEGE & 

PREPARATORY SCHOOL 
Mrs Penelope Leimeister JIMBOOMBA 
Mr Tony Levick COORPAROO 
Mr David Lewis SANDGATE NORTHPOINT 
Ms Julie Lewis EASTERN HILLS ANGLICANS 
Mrs Julie Lobwein BARAMBAH 
Mr Hugh Luck-Hurst 

Smith 
HENDRA-CLAYFIELD 

Ms Ash-Lee Lund JIMBOOMBA 
Mr David  Lupton COOLUM 
Mr Ian Lupton WEST MORETON ANGLICAN COLLEGE 

Mr Stuart MacKenzie NORTH PINE 
Mrs Ann MacRonald KENMORE-BROOKFIELD 
Mr Scott Malcolmson ITHACA - RED HILL 
Mr Christopher Mancini SANDGATE NORTHPOINT 
Dr Russell  Manfield SOUTHPORT 
Mr Pradeep Manickam MEC - ANGLICAN YOUTH MINISTRIES 

Mr Earl  Marken WISHART 
Mr Richard Mason ST LUCIA 
Mrs Diane  Massurit ST GEORGE 
Mrs Irene  May BEAUDESERT 
Ms Amanda McCarrick STRATHPINE 
Mrs Annabelle  McDonald ALL SAINTS, BRISBANE 
Mr Michael McDonnell BEENLEIGH 
Mrs Pamela McHardy MARYBOROUGH 
Mr Geoff McLay WEST MORETON ANGLICAN COLLEGE 

Mrs Christine Mclean MITCHELL  ( MARANOA-WARREGO ANGLICAN 
AREA ) 

Mrs Coral  McVean NAMBOUR 
Mr Stuart Meade MATTHEW FLINDERS ANGLICAN COLLEGE 

Mrs Gisela Meehl TAMBORINE MOUNTAIN 
Mr Craig Merritt ST LUKE'S ANGLICAN SCHOOL 
Mr Barry Miller CROWS NEST 
Mr Ian  Mitchell LOGAN 
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NAME PARISH 

Ms Marilyn Moore SHERWOOD 
Prof Reid Mortensen TOOWOOMBA, ST JAMES' 
Mr Ian Mowat NANANGO 
The Hon 
Justice 

Debra Mullins Chancellor 

Mrs Stephanie Munday-
Lake 

HILLBROOK ANGLICAN SCHOOL 

Mr David Murray STAFFORD 
Mrs Janette Mychajlyk BUDERIM 
Mrs Susan Myring MALENY 
Ms Hope Nakagawa-

Morrison 
ROBINA-MERMAID BEACH 

Mr Ian Nelson ALGESTER 
Mrs Rhonda Nelson ALGESTER 
Ms Wynona Newby-Clark MEC - ANGLICAN YOUTH MINISTRIES 

Mr Derrick Newton KANGAROO POINT 
Mr Geoff Newton HILLBROOK ANGLICAN SCHOOL 
Mr Darren  Nicholls HERVEY BAY 
Dr Gavin Nicholson CANNON HILL ANGLICAN COLLEGE 
Miss Amy  Norman MEC - ANGLICAN YOUTH MINISTRIES 
Ms Donna Normoyle FORTITUDE VALLEY 

Mr Daniel O'Connor ANGLICAN CHURCH GRAMMAR SCHOOL 
Ms Bethel O'Keefe TORRES STRAIT ISLANDER 
Ms Trish Osgood COORPAROO 
Dr Diane Payton ALEXANDRA HILLS 

Mr Fraser Perrin THE SOUTHPORT SCHOOL 
Mr Grant  Peters BRAMBLE BAY 

Mrs Dianne Phillips ITHACA - RED HILL 
Mr Darren Pitt The Springfield Anglican College 
Mr Alan Postle LEICHHARDT  ( LEICHHARDT- CHINCHILLA 

ANGLICAN MISSION AREA) 
Mr Rodney  Powell MORNINGSIDE 
Mrs Dorothy Prasser IPSWICH NORTH 
Mr Thomas Pressler BOONAH-HARRISVILLE 
Mrs Alison Quinn ST MARGARET'S SCHOOL 
Mrs Angela Rae SOUTH BRISBANE 

Miss Vaishi Rajanayagam MT GRAVATT 
Mrs Pamela Ray WILSTON 
Mrs Gillian Rees LEICHHARDT  ( LEICHHARDT- CHINCHILLA 

ANGLICAN MISSION AREA) 
Ms Alison  Reid CLAYFIELD, ST MARK'S 
Mrs Kay Rhodes GOONDIWINDI 
Mr Garry  Richter MALENY 
Ms Toni  Riordan ST AIDAN'S SCHOOL 
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NAME PARISH 

Mr Mark  Robinson ROSEWOOD
Mr Jeffery Rogers WARWICK
Mr Christopher  Rohde MANLY-TINGALPA
Mrs Isobel Rohde MANLY-TINGALPA
Mr Hugh Rose TOOWOOMBA ANGLICAN COLLEGE &

PREPARATORY SCHOOL
Mrs Joanne Rose CARINDALE
Mr Doug Russell EAST BRISBANE
Mr Ian  Russell THE LAKES ANGLICAN CHURCH
Mrs Desiree  Sampson BOOVAL
Mr Joseph  Samson TOOWONG
Ms Rona Sandilands KINGAROY
Mr John Saunders WISHART
Mrs Patricia  Schmidt GOLD COAST NORTH
Mr Robert Seljak HILLBROOK ANGLICAN SCHOOL
Mrs Susan Sharpe ROMA
Mrs Carolyn Siemsen NUNDAH
Mr Paul  Sime EAST REDLAND
Ms Aileen  Sinclair MUDGEERABA
Mrs Angela Slack GAYNDAH
Dr Mark  Sly COOMERA ANGLICAN COLLEGE
Mr Donald Smith BULIMBA
Mr Victor  Smith EVERTON PARK
Mr David Sneesby ITHACA - ASHGROVE
Mr Grant  Sparks ITHACA - ASHGROVE
Ms Ruth  Sparks MEC - ANGLICAN YOUTH MINISTRIES

Mr Robert Standish-White CLAYFIELD, ST MARK'S
Mrs Aline Stinton WATERLOO BAY
Mrs Kathryn Swansson BEAUDESERT
Mr Robert Sweeney WATERLOO BAY
Mrs Marilyn Taylor CHARLEVILLE  ( MARANOA-WARREGO

ANGLICAN AREA )
Mrs Vivien  Taylor INALA
The Hon
Justice

David Thomas Deputy Chancellor

Mr Jeff Thomas CANTERBURY COLLEGE
Mr Allan  Thomson BULIMBA
Deaconess Margaret Thornton BURLEIGH HEADS

Dr Philip Towers MOGGILL-MT CROSBY
Dr Samantha Towers MOGGILL-MT CROSBY
Mr Peter  Tranter HENDRA-CLAYFIELD
Mrs Janine Tubb GOODNA
Mrs Gayle Tuckwood EAST REDLAND
Mrs Sally Turnbull CHINCHILLA  ( LEICHHARDT- CHINCHILLA

ANGLICAN MISSION AREA )
Mrs Janet  Turner GOONDIWINDI
Mr John Turner CALOUNDRA WITH GLASSHOUSE COUNTRY
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Mrs Kay Turner CALOUNDRA WITH GLASSHOUSE COUNTRY
Mrs Laura van

Kressibucher
STRATHPINE

Mr Lewis Von Stieglitz WARWICK

Mr Grant  Vorhauer NERANG
Mrs Susan  Waddell DALBY

Mr Greg Wain THE SOUTHPORT SCHOOL

Ms Cecile Wake ST AIDAN'S SCHOOL
Mr Milton  Walit LAIDLEY
Ms Heather Walker HOLLAND PARK
Ms Suzanne  Walker GREEN HILLS
Mr Patrick Wallas ALL SAINTS' ANGLICAN SCHOOL
Ms Linda  Wallis SAMFORD
Mr Allan  Warren STANTHORPE
Mrs Margaret Warren STANTHORPE
Mrs Jeanette  Wedemeyer BUNDABERG WEST
Mrs Lorraine West PITTSWORTH
Miss Eleanor  Whereat THE LAKES ANGLICAN CHURCH
Mr Raymond  White REDCLIFFE
Mrs Glenys Willocks KILCOY
Mr Bruce Wilson SOUTH BRISBANE
Dr Julie Wilson-Reynolds ST HILDA'S SCHOOL
Mr Gregory  Windsor FRESHWATER
Mrs Tina  Woodall DRAYTON
Mr Joe Wright FRASER COAST ANGLICAN COLLEGE
Dr John Wright GYMPIE
Mr Graham  Young HOLLAND PARK
Mr Mark Young ANNERLEY
Mr Jason  Zagami SOUTHPORT
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DIOCESAN STATISTICS 

SYNOD 2017 – SYNOD 2018 

DEATHS 

BAKER, The Rev’d Ken Died 29 October 2017 
JACKSON, The Rev’d Neville (Patrick) Died 24 May 2018 
LANDMAN, The Rev’d Denis Died 25 March 2018 
DYSON, The Rev’d Canon Ronald Died 20 August 2018 

CONSECRATIONS 

The Right Rev’d John Roundhill Assistant Bishop of the Southern Region 

ORDINATIONS 2017

PRIESTS 

The Rev’d Pauline Harley 
The Rev’d Rebecca King 
The Rev’d Peter Mayen
The Rev'd Dr Imelda O'Loughlin

The Rev’d Karen Allen
The Rev’d Christopher Bate
The Rev’d David Browne 
The Rev’d Jamee-Lee Callard
The Rev'd Heather Dearden

DEACONS 

The Rev’d Stephen Monseigneur
The Rev’d Dr Timothy Nicholson 
The Rev’d Bronwyn Pagram
The Rev'd Debra Tedman

NEW LICENCES 

Rector, Parish of Kenmore-Brookfield 
Mission Chaplain, St Francis’ College
Priest in Charge, Parish of Buderim 
General Secretary, CMS Qld & Nth NSW 
Priest in Charge, Leichhardt Chinchilla Anglican 
Mission District (formerly Newcastle Diocese) 
Permission to Officiate, Parish of Inala 
(formerly Dean of Rockhampton, Rector of St Paul’s)
Community Chaplain, St Andrew’s College 
(formerly PTO Noosa Parish) 
Priest in Charge, Parish of Burleigh Heads Community 
Chaplain (Deacon), Parish of Wishart Priest in Charge, 
Parish of Kawana Waters 

OTHER 

Priest in Charge, Parish of Pittsworth 
School Chaplain, The Glennie School  
(formerly School Chaplain, Hillbrook Anglican School) 
Deacon, Retired Permission to Officiate,  
Parish of Logan 
Priest in Charge, Parish of East Brisbane  
(remaining Priest in Charge, Parish of Annerley) 

The Rev’d Deborah Bird
The Rev’d Zoe Browne
The Rev’d Rosemary Gardiner
The Rev'd Peter Jeffery

CROMBIE, The Rev’d Jan Mary
DOW, The Rev’d Jasmine Rose
EVERS, The Rev’d Moira Evers
FAIRHURST, The Rev’d Mark Andrew
FREWIN, The Rev’d Terry

HOWIE, The Rev’d Lindsay David

McCLELLAN, The Rev’d Gary 

PERRY, The Rev’d Eron Avenel PHILP, 
The Rev’d Michelle Maree WOCKNER, 
The Rev’d Steven 

ANDREWS, The Rev’d Frances Mary
BAIRD, The Rev’d Sharon Leanne

CAIRNS, The Rev’d Robyn Gaye

CAMPBELL, The Rev’d Donald George

CHAMBERS, The Rev’d E Jilleen Priest in Charge, Parish of Kilcoy 
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COLLEDGE, The Rev’d Canon Nicole Honorary Canon, St John’s Cathedral
CRAIG-LEAVES, The Rev’d Julie Elizabeth Chaplain, West Moreton Anglican College  
EICHLER, The Rev’d Tania Ann Rector, Parish of Maroochydore  

(formerly Rector Parish of Centenary) 
GEHRMANN, The Rev’d Jeremy Priest-in-Charge, Parish of Coorparoo  

(formerly PTO, Parish of South Brisbane) 
JAMIESON, The Rev’d Jeanette Area Dean, Sunshine Coast Deanery 
JARVIS, The Rev’d Jeffrey Wallace Chaplain, Fraser Coast Anglican College 

(formerly PTO to Hervey Bay) 
LAMONT, The Rev’d David Phillip Associate Priest, Parish of Manly (to 17/06/2018) 
LEISEMANN, The Rev’d Canon Sarah Patricia Residential Canon, St John’s Cathedral
McMAHON, The Rev’d Stephen Rector, Parish of Ipswich 

(formerly Priest in Charge, Parish of Ipswich) 
MITCHELL, The Rev’d Paul Bentley Area Dean, Toowoomba Deanery  
PALMER, The Rev’d Peter Wayne Rector, Parish of Beenleigh (formerly Priest in Charge, 

Parish of Beenleigh) 
PERRY, The Rev’d Stewart Robert Priest in Charge, Parish of Mudgeeraba  

(remaining Rector of Robina-Mermaid Beach) 
PETERSEN, The Rev’d Donna Elizabeth Rector, Parish of Wynnum 

(formerly Priest in Charge, Parish of Wynnum) 
POTTER, The Rev’d Desmond Priest in Charge, Parish of Strathpine 

(formerly Permission to Officiate Parish of Hervey Bay) 
REUSS, The Rev’d Harold Priest in Charge, Parish of Yeronga (formerly 

Permission to Officiate Parish of Burleigh Heads) 
SHEPPERSON, The Rev;d Ann Honorary Assistant Priest, Parish of Maleny 

(formerly Honorary Assistant Priest, Parish of Gympie) 
SMITH, The Rev’d Canon Gary Associate Priest (half time), Parish of Gold Coast 

North (to 30 April 2018) 
STALLEY, The Rev’d Michael Area Dean – Brisbane South West Deanery (as well 

as Rector, Parish of Chelmer-Graceville) 
TALBOT, The Rev’d Daniel John Rector, Parish of Jimboomba (formerly Priest in 

Charge, Parish of Jimboomba) 
TYACK, The Rev’d Christopher Rhys Priest-in-Charge, Parish of Eastern Hills  

(formerly Assistant Priest, St Peter’s, Southport) 
WILSON, The Rev’d Susan Penelope Rector, Parish of Maryborough 
WORRALL, The Ven Julie Clare Archdeacon, Sunshine Coast 

PERMISSION TO OFFICIATE 

ANDREWS, The Rev’d Frances Mary Parish of Toowoomba St James’ (formerly Assistant 
Priest P/T Toowoomba St Luke’s) 

AVENELL, The Rev’d Daniel Anthony Parish of North Pine 
BLAND, The Rev’d Paul Thomas Parish of East Brisbane 
CHIPLIN, The Ven Michael Alfred Parish of Annerley 

(formerly, Rector Parish of Indooroopilly) 
COSGROVE, The Rev’d James Edward Parish of Waterloo Bay 
DALE, The Rev’d Alan Arthur Parish of Toowong) (formerly Assistant Priest 

Toowong) 
DEAN, The Rev’d Robert George Parish of Caboolture  
DONALDSON, The Rev’d Michael Phillip Parish of The Gap 

(formerly Rector, Parish of Keppel, Rockhampton 
Diocese) 

DORMAN, The Rev’d Bruce Robert Permission to Officiate Retired, Parish of Gympie 
(formerly, Honorary Assistant Priest, Parish of Gympie) 

FLORENCE, The Rev’d Mary Parish of Annerley 
HALL, The Rev’d James Matthew Parish of Noosa 

(formerly, Rector Parish of Nambour) 
LANDER, The Rev’d Dr Cecilie Marion Permission to Officiate Retired, Parish of East 

Brisbane 
(formerly, PTO Saint John’s Cathedral)

LANDER, The Rev’d Dr Mervyn Meredith Permission to Officiate Retired, Parish of East 
Brisbane 
(formerly, Retired PTO Saint John’s Cathedral)

LUNNISS, The Ven David Oliver Parish of Jimboomba 
(formerly, Honorary Assistant Priest, Parish of 
Cooroora) 
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MASLIN, The Rev’d Andrea Lorraine Permission to Officiate Deacon, Parish of 
Maryborough 
(formerly, Hon Deacon, Parish of Maryborough) 

McGRORY, The Rev’d Gregory Parish of Gold Coast South  
(formerly Rector Parish of Burleigh Heads) 

MILTON, The Rev’d Thomas Charles Parish of Wishart 
(formerly Assistant Priest, Parish of Wishart) 

PASCHKE, The Rev’d Ronald Parish of Morningside 
PATTISON, The Rev’d John Brack Parish of Caboolture 

(formerly PTO Parish of Bribie Island) 
REDHEAD, The Rev’d Stephen Harry Parish of Fortitude Valley 

(formerly PTO Parish of Caloundra) 
REDMAN, The Rev’d William Parish of Centenary Suburbs 

(formerly Priest in Charge, Parish of Ipswich North) 
SHAW, The Rev’d Garth Thomas Parish of St James’ Toowoomba

(formerly Priest in Charge, Parish of Pittsworth) 
SLIGO, The Rev’d Bruce James Parish of Gold Coast North 

(formerly Grafton Diocese) 
STRONG, The Rev’d Owen Trevor Parish of Chelmer-Graceville (formerly PTO Parish of 

Toowong) 
VIEROW, The Rev’d Shan Parish of East Redland 

(formerly Rector, Parish of Manly) 
WOOD, The Rt Rev’d Clyde Maurice Parish of St Luke’s Toowoomba
WOODS, The Rev’d Theodore Frank Spreull Permission to Officiate Retired, Parish of Buderim 

(formerly Permission to Officiate Retired, Parish of 
South Brisbane) 

RESIGNATIONS 

HUNTER, The Rev’d David TAYLOR, The Right Rev’d Alison Menzies 
MIDDLETON, The Rev’d Catriona Ann  
NIXON, The Rev’d Dr Michael Willoughby
PARSONS, The Rev’d Dr John 
PATCHING, The Rev’d Stephanie Jayne

ARCHBISHOP’S CERTIFICATE TO OFFICIATE ON SPECIAL OCCASIONS 

DUNGLISON, The Rev’d Edmond Francis 
FINLAY, The Rev’d Welburn Charles
MEREDITH, The Rt Rev’d Bevan Stanley
SHIELD, The Rev’d Barry Graham
SIMPSON, The Rev’d John Barrie
WALSH, The Rev’d Robert George
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Liturgical Assistants to December 2018 

Alexandra Hills 

Mr I A Andersen 
Miss M C Andersen 
Mr J M Angus 
Mrs M F Crawford 
Mrs J A Grace 
Dr D J Payton 
Mrs H M H Stanbrook 

Algester 

Mr A S Berry 
Mrs D M Bocquee 
Mrs C R Booth 
Mr N A Booth 
Mrs K M Carter 
Mr R S Dinnar 
Mrs J P Elliker 
Mrs L M Jones 
Mrs R Kake 
Mrs J T Mengel 
Mr I A Nelson 
Mr J G Sloan 
Mrs M M Smethurst 
Mrs P J Thorne 

All Saints, Brisbane 

Mr P D Kent 
Mr M S J McManus 
Mr J S Morrison 

Allora-Clifton 

Mr A J I Balmain 
Mrs P A Campbell 
Mrs B A Corby 
Ms G Fulton 
Mrs E A Kersley 
Mrs L J Sharman-Bowman 
Mrs D Taylor 

Annerley 

Br J A MacDonald SSF 
Mr C W Whitney 

Aspley – Albany Creek 

Mrs N E Eyles 
Mr J W Hawkey 
Ms B M Jordan 
Ms D M Kemish 
Mrs C H Pears 
Mrs N V Rowthorne 
Mrs A M Stosic 
Mrs R J Suosaari 

Auchenflower-Milton 

Miss P K Gardiner 
Mrs L M Keyes 

Banyo 

Mr R T F Armstrong 
Mrs D A Barber 
Mrs B J Briggs 
Ms M J Fuller 
Mrs S A Quinn 

Barambah 

Mrs J M Lobwein 
Mrs F M McFarlane 
Mrs L M Quinn 
Mrs S Waldock 

Bardon 

Dr P A Ashley 
Mr C E Gravestein 
Mrs J A Haywood 
Ms K Oakley 
Dr P M Pepper 
Mr P G Reedman 
Mr R J Smith 
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Beaudesert 

Mr P R Ambridge 
Mrs S L Harper 
Mrs D Hyland 
Mrs I S May 

Beenleigh 

Mr M J Bobermien 
Mrs Y J Bobermien 
Mr W N Dunlop 
Mrs H E M Farrar 
Mrs J A Hodby 
Mr G F Nilsson 
Mrs C P Smith 
Mr C Switzer 

Boonah-Harrisville 

Mrs A Andrews 
Mr W E Bird 
Mr B M Bradford 
Mrs F E Faulkner 
Mr J T Grayson 
Mrs J A Greet 
Mr T E Pressler 
Mr D J Roderick 
Mrs G M Roderick 

Booval 

Mrs L S Bilney 
Mr P J Bond 
Mrs M M Campbell 
Ms J A Covell 
Mrs K M Dale 
Ms C J Dart 
Mr L W Hull 
Miss L K Martin 
Mrs D J W Sampson 
Mrs C E Trotter 

Bramble Bay 

Mrs G M Bust 
Mrs V E M Patterson 
Mrs E A Peters 
Mrs G K Symons 
Mr W W Tattam 

Bribie Island 

Mrs V P Bourne 
Mr R G Cullen 
Mr T P D Dufton 
Mr J R Eustace 
Mrs A M Johnson 
Mr A S Jones 
Mr D G Keith 
Mrs L R Keith 
Mr R G Lawrence 
Mrs K M Llewelyn 
Mrs R L Nelson 
Ms D E Turner 
Mrs M M Voss 
Mr R Voss 
Mr  White 

Buderim 

Mr A F Brackley 
Mrs B H Brumby 
Mrs G Bryant 
Mrs E J Butterworth 
Mrs J J Clarke 
Mrs C E Cornish 
Mrs J Edwards 
Mr K G Evans 
Mrs J E Jones 
Mrs V M Kleinschmidt 
Mrs A Meares 
Mrs S M Milwright 
Mr T S Robson 
Mrs B Stone 
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Mr M G Tipper 
Mr D C White 
Mrs S White 
Mr J M Woodward 

Bulimba 

Miss L A M Bentley 
Mr H L Greaver 
Mrs J S Hanlon 
Dr J M Wood 

Bundaberg 

Mrs G J Bauer 
Mrs L Boreel 
Mr W F Christensen 
Mr S E Dye 
Mrs R C Ferguson 
Mrs S Galvin 
Mr W J Glover 
Dr W H Kingston 
Mrs M L McMillan 
Mrs D J Merritt 
Mr C J Mitchell 
Mr B E Nicholson 
Mrs M A Redman 
Mrs C G Savage 
Mrs H A Tarr 
Mrs M A Taylor 

Bundaberg West 

Mrs M G Baumgartner 
Mr G J Blundell 
Miss A G Brown 
Mr D K Carr 
Mr R J C Dean 
Mrs G C George 
Mrs D E Hoffmann 
Mrs L J Lincoln 
Mrs C A Mason 
Mrs J T Wedemeyer 

Burleigh Heads 

Mrs A E Larter 
Mrs J E Stuart 
Ms J Thornton 
Deaconess M Thornton 

Caboolture 

Mr S L D Arok 
Mrs D H Bauer 
Mrs M A Bol 
Mr P R Bryden 
Ms C S Christie 
Mrs C J Cofield 
Mrs N E Cowin 
Mr R A Cowin 
Mr G W Franks 
Mrs M M Hilton 
Mr G P Jordan 
Ms M C Kavanagh 
Mrs J M Laws 
Mr S G D Makuel 
Mr J A M Nguet 
Mrs S D Sanker 

Caloundra With  

Glasshouse Country 

Mrs W C Ashley-Cooper 
Mr H F Carr 
Mrs L K Conolly 
Mr G J Crabtree 
Mr I J Creighton 
Mrs C G Curran 
Ms R A Day 
Mrs P J Innes 
Mr E P Jenkins 
Mr S C Knight 
Mr B C Lees 
Ms K E Macklin 
Mr N A R Maher 
Mrs J E Nicholson 
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Mrs H M Page 
Mr Z H Palmer 
Mr E C Prickett 
Mrs H M Setch 
Mrs  C N Spence 
Ms J A Sperling 
Mrs M Tozer 
Ms C D Tyler-Wood 
Mrs S M White 

Carindale 

Mr I L Alexander 
Mr B P Blade 
Mr R J Clutterbuck 
Mr K W Yeung 

Cathedral 

Mr L M Burness 
Mr R E Fay 
Dr R M Field 
Mr A J Gallimore 
Dr C M Gourlay 
Mrs S Z Hadgraft 
Mr E T H Kernke 
Mrs M A Kernke 
Mr R W J King 
Ms I L Kruze 
Dr H M Lancaster 
Ms V A Liedtke 
Miss A M G McPherson 
Mr G J Meyer 
Mr S P Tinkler 
Mrs H J Walker 
Mrs H M Wootton 

Centenary Suburbs 

Mr D L Bullock 
Mr J D Freeman 
Mrs M C Johnson 

Mrs S A Mack 
Mr W T McMillan 
Mrs G V Neuendorf 
Mr A L Paatan 
Mr N J Paatan 
Mr A N Pennell 
Mr R J Swan 
Mrs A Trumata-Paatan 
Mrs B A Waterhouse 

Charleville (Maranoa-

Warrego Anglican Area) 

Mrs L B Ware 

Chelmer-Graceville 

Mr P S Bate 
Mrs D M Brown 
Mrs N Graham 
Mrs K K Green 
Ms E A Gregory 
Dr P A Keay 
Mr G J Meyer 
Mr  R K Parker 
Mrs J E Swanston 
Mr J M Swanston 

Chermside 

Mrs R J Bartlem 
Mrs  M A Brady 
Mrs B J Butler 
Mr D S Clarke 
Ms L E Clarke 
Mr M E Clarke 
Mr S W Clarke 
Mrs M M Coombs 
Ms C S Edwards 
Mr L E Emsworth-Copland 
Mrs L E Freeman 
Mrs  L D Gregory 
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Mr M J Gregory 
Ms P M Haldane 
Mr T N Rigby 
Mr D J Winters 

Chinchilla (Leichhardt- 

Chinchilla Anglican  

Mission Area) 

Mrs J C R Bunting 
Mrs D E Cunnington 
Mrs C A Cutcliffe 
Mr E J Hicks 
Mrs J C Jeffery 
Mrs H G Marsden 
Mr M G Marsden 
Ms W A Naughton 
Mr E S Turnbull 

Clayfield, St Mark's 

Mr D Adams 
Mr G D Anthonisz 
Mrs B M Barber 
Mr P J Kemp 
Mrs M M C Leditschke 
Mrs E A Lehmase 
Mr D C Matthews 
Mrs P N Matthews 
Mr P B McDougall 
Dr S S Monks 
Mr R N Peters 
Ms A M Reid 
Mrs J G Vacca 

Cooroora 

Mr N J Anderson 
Mrs B G Graham-Freeman 
Mrs S L Haylock 
Mr S J Hilditch 
Mrs R Ladbrook 

Mr R G Ladbrook 
Mr L H Taylor 
Mrs J A Topper 
Mrs M D Williamson 

Coorparoo 

Miss M D Moar 
Mr R V Venter 

Crows Nest 

Mrs F A Crosato 
Mrs B D Darracott 
Mrs C E Hartley 
Mrs D M Iseppi 
Mrs L M Richter 
Mr P A Turnbull 
Mrs C J Young 

Cunnamulla 

(Maranoa-Warrego 

Anglican Area) 

Mrs M R Johnstone 

Dalby 

Miss F A E Ellem 
Mr M J Harth 
Mrs M A Henschell 
Mrs K L Kelly 
Mr A G Martin 
Mrs Y J Martin 
Mrs D L Ryan 
Mrs D J Smith 
Mrs A C Thornton 
Mrs S J Waddell 

Drayton 

Mr C S Faulkner 
Mrs G I C McGee 
Mrs P L Mercer 
Mr G A Sloane 
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East Brisbane 

Mr L E Barron 
Mrs N S Dwyer 
Mr B R Seaton-Said 
Mr M J Willis 

East Redland 

Mrs B J Apostolides 
Mr J D Apostolidies 
Ms M A Beerling 
Mrs D F Brown 
Mr R T Collins 
Mrs S Dixon 
Mr G L J Elliott 
Mrs P A Hamlyn-Harris 
Mr W Hamlyn-Harris 
Dr D J D Marriott 
Mr B J McConnell 
Mrs B L Michael 
Miss P J Mills 
Mrs S Mills 
Mr G V Murrell 
Mrs D M Parnell 
Mrs V M Pullen 
Mr B C Reedman 
Mrs J R Sime 
Mr P D Sime 
Mrs B J Sorrell 
Mrs C Taylor 
Mr R J Turner 
Mr M W Vierow 

Eastern Hills Anglicans 

Mrs E M Callick 
Mrs R J Casey 
Mrs V Cowie 
Mr S J Matthews 
Miss J L Norman 
Mrs A S Perkins 

Mr J J Thomas 

Ekibin 

Mr A J Brown 
Mrs L W Crawford 
Mr G M E Farrow 
Miss S D Johnson 
Mrs J L Jones 
Mrs H C Lawler 
Mrs J O Markotsis 
Ms J A McNicol 
Miss H J Park 
Mrs R M White 
Mrs G V Williams 
Mrs M Wood 
Mrs C A Wren 

Everton Park 

Mr I D Crilly 
Mr N D Griffiths 
Mr K J T Herman 
Mrs V C Herman 
Mr R L Kemp 
Mrs R J Lewis 
Mrs L E McKay 
Mr R D McKay 
Mrs C L Peters 
Dr T D P Peters 
Mr K Redhead 
Mrs M A Redhead 
Mr V J Smith 
Mr R I Symes 
Mr R J Wiseman 

Fortitude Valley 

Mr L A Buchanan 
Mr N E Geraghty 
Mr R C Gorman 
Judge K M F Lapthorn 
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Ms M McMinn 
Ms D L Normoyle 
Mrs A C Ogden 
Mr G N Pethig 
Ms K Philp 
Ms K E Ross 

 
Freshwater 

Mr T J Andrew 
Deaconess D L Clark 
Mrs P E Deadman 
Mrs K M Frith 
Mr G W Holyer 
Mrs B L Johnstone 
Mrs P M Joyce 
Mrs C A Mullan 
Mr G W Price 
Mrs J K Tretheway 
Mr G J Weller 
Mr G J Windsor 

 
Gayndah 

Mrs C M Cumming 
Mr R T Harris 
Mrs S E Jameson 
Mrs M A Kenny 
Mrs A M Slack 
Mrs K A Slack 
Mrs D N Ulcoq 
Mrs I K Wharton 
Mr M D Wharton 
Mr C E W Whitehead 

 
Gold Coast North 

Mrs J Anderson 
Mr I T Boniface 
Mr P M Burt 
Mrs L A Campbell 
Mrs P L Canham 

Mrs P E Carpenter 
Mrs J D Dale 
Mrs I M M Daniel 
Mrs F Dougherty 
Mrs S C Eacott 
Mrs P M Grant 
Mr B S Hallewell 
Mr D Haywood 
Mrs R S Heaney 
Mrs J E Herring 
Ms K A Jones 
Lt Col G M Kemble 
Mrs S G La Porta 
Mrs L Martin 
Mr T McLennan 
Mrs G M Morris 
Mrs P Muller 
Mrs G F Murrell 
Dr T Mutongwizo 
Mr G Osborne 
Mrs J A Osborne 
Mr M O Palmer 
Mrs M Papaioannou 
Mr G W Powell 
Mrs D S Relph 
Mr J A J Relph 
Mr B N Schmidt 
Mrs P R Schmidt 
Mrs C E Sullivan 
Mrs A L Ticehurst 
Ms M Wheatley 
Mrs C A White 
Mr D J Wilson 
Mrs J A Wilson 
Ms M M Woods 

 
Gold Coast South 

Mrs P A Bailey 
Ms C Dean 
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Mr R Gibbons 
Mr B A Kennedy 
Mrs H M Little 
Mr C W S Miller 
Mr R G Paterson 
Mrs C J Pike 
Mrs B M Pullar 

 
Goodna 

Mrs K G A Adut 
Mr J T Atem 
Mrs H M Bonell 
Mrs M A Chol 
Mrs J A Dearden 
Mr G A Deng 
Mr J A Garang 
Mr J Garang 
Mr N D Garang 
Miss C L Grant 
Mr R J Green 
Mrs L V Idiens 
Mrs L J Jones 
Mrs G Lynn 
Mr R J Mabior 
Mrs D A Majok 
Mrs R A Malual 
Mrs M A Reng 
Ms K M Vellnagel 

 
Goonaneman 

Mrs B D Carroll 
Mrs L B Christensen 
Mrs M A Cooper-Smith 
Mrs D M Griffiths 
Mr A McHardy 
Mr P J Smith 
Mr M R St Henry 
Mrs  Stone 
Mrs J M Young 

Goondiwindi 

Mrs G P Barrett 
Mrs B J Binnie 
Mrs M H Guelfi 
Mrs M J Peck 
Mr J D R St Clair 
Mrs G S Toohey 
Mrs J M Warden 
Mrs B S Whitmee 

 
Green Hills 

Mrs J M Burt 
Mrs M P Goodwin 
Mrs C L Kliendienst 
Mr R J MacIver 
Mr A B O'Connor 
Mrs E Paterson 
Mr P G Rush 
Mr G T Shirvington 
Mr M J P Walker 
Ms S K Walker 
Mr G J Wilson 

 
Grovely 

Mr D B Axelson 
Mrs C M Black 
Mr G L Dellit 
Mrs M L Dobbs 
Mr G W Gillard 
Mr N I Hung 
Mr A E D Jayasundera 
Mr J M Murray 
Mrs R A Murray 

 
Gympie 

Mrs M Altenhofen 
Mr E I R Bezer 
Miss N S Burnett 
Mr  D W Crampton 
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Mrs E A Crase 
Mrs M I McGinn 
Ms M Nash 
Mrs H M Pedder 
Mr N W Wildey 
Dr J M Wright 
Mrs M Zylstra 

 
Hamilton 

Mr D E Aspinall 
Miss S F Liang 
Ms W McLean 
Miss Z Wellington-Hacker 

 
Hendra-Clayfield 

Mr R A Cussen 
Mrs C E Giddens 
Mr R J Gower 
Miss A A Harding 
Miss G R Tranter 
Mr P L Tranter 

 
Hervey Bay 

Mrs C H Ayres 
Mrs J M Boge 
Mrs E M Calder 
Mr J R Calder 
Mrs J V H Cleasby 
Mrs J E Crane 
Mrs N C Doyle 
Mrs L W Gronow 
Mrs A J King 
Mrs S Lucas 
Mr M J McClelland 
Mrs D L McRae 
Mrs W G Moffett 
Mr C J Morey 
Mr D A Mungomery 
Mr D K Nicholls 

Mrs R E Nicholls 
 
Holland Park 

Mrs P M F Collins 
Mrs D L Eales 
Mrs J M Ereaut 
Mrs J B Lethlean 
Mr A P Smith 
Mr R J Webb 

 
Inala 

Miss M S Elliott 
Mrs M Houston 
Ms J A King 
Mrs M A Omoo 
Mrs M D Sierak 
Mrs J A Singleton 
Mrs J A Smith 
Mrs V M Taylor 
Ms M N Wakeling 
Mr D V Wiskar 
Mrs G D Wiskar 

 
Indooroopilly 

Mrs G Byrom 
Mr T B Coates 
Mr E Dhanaraj 
Mrs E A Leaver 
Mr G C Marsh 
Mrs L M Pickering 
Ms D M Ping 
Mr F R M Potger 
Mr J E Saylor 
Mr P F Tainton 

 

Inglewood 

Mrs M J Cranston 
Mrs K A Osborne 
Mrs M A Rollins 
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Mrs S R Ward 

Ipswich North 

Mr G M Bickle 
Mrs L J Briggs 
Mrs C M Forbes 
Mrs B J McDonald 
Mrs N J Norwood 
Mr C J Raymont 
Mr M K Walit 

Ipswich 

Mr J C M Agoot 
Mrs R K Agoth 
Mrs T A R Ajak 
Mrs A A Akuot 
Mrs M Y Arok 
Mrs S K Buchanan 
Mrs V M Chaplin 
Mr A A Dak 
Mrs M A Dau 
Mrs A D ( Diing 
Mr K D Drennan 
Ms J M England 
Mrs D A Garang 
Mrs M A Garang 
Mr D F Hunt 
Ms D M Jok 
Mr P K Jongkuch 
Mrs E A K Kuir 
Mrs M Y M Nher 
Mr M M K Peter 
Mr P J Taylor 
Mrs D E Thomson 
Mr G S Thomson 
Ms J Ware 
Mrs M A Wrigley 
Mrs J A Zinn 

Ithaca – Ashgrove 

Mrs R G Carl 
Mrs S E C Combe 
Mrs R Haggarty 
Mr R R F Lane 
Mrs S M Lane 
Mrs J S McCurdy 
Mrs J D Morrison 
Mr G M Sparks 

Ithaca – Red Hill 

Mr J French 
Mr S D Malcolmson 
Mr K E Rouse 

Jandowae 

Mr J Haselwood 

Jimboomba 

Mr M G Bergman 
Mr R S Dinnar 
Mr J I Gurashi 
Mrs M Harris 
Mrs P L Leimeister 
Miss A Lund 
Mrs H L Robinson 
Mr N J Spanner 
Mrs N O Street 
Mrs J M Vines 

Kangaroo Point 

Mrs F M Best 
Mr K R Drew 
Mr J R Fraser 
Mr A M F Keyt 
Mrs R Laurie 
Mrs S J Reade 
Mrs K Self 
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Kawana Waters 

Mr J A Armstrong 
Mr N S Baron 
Mrs M M Beale 
Mrs J Blake 
Mrs L M Bruce 
Mrs J Dyke 
Mrs B R Evett 
Mr D S Henderson 
Mr G J Henderson 
Mrs E L Hinsley 
Mr N A Jensen 
Mrs C M Johnson 
Mr R J Johnson 
Mr R R C Markham 
Mrs W D McKenzie 
Mr A R McVittie 
Mrs R D Reid 
Mrs L E Rew 
Mr F E Schellenberger 
Mrs M A Schellenberger 
Mrs H J Van Den Bos 
Mr L W Van Den Bos 
Mrs J N Wood 

Kenmore-Brookfield 

Mrs M K Allen 
Dr A C Back 
Mr D J H Barton 
Mr A G N Bell 
Mr P J Brady 
Mrs R R Bruton 
Mrs M M Chandler 
Ms M J Conway 
Mr G J Curnow 
Mr A D Dann 
Dr N Eckersley 
Dr N Eckersley 
Mrs E A Fischer 

Mrs J French 
Mrs C A Grant 
Mrs E A Harvey 
Dr R E McFadyen 
Mrs H R Newson 
Ms M S Raymond 
Dr M E Rose 
Mrs E M Saunders 
Mr A T Scott 
Ms C M Streatfield 
Mrs CMM Tullberg 
Ms J C Vandersee 
Mr J J C Vickers 
Mrs K A Vickers 
Mrs M L Webb 
Mr K R Weller 
Mrs P G Weller 

Kilcoy 

Mrs M D Deakin 
Mrs C J Dobson 
Mrs C K Duncalfe 
Mrs D J Good 
Mrs D K Kunde 
Mrs S E Munt 
Mrs J J Preece 

Kingaroy 

Mrs G J Allen 
Mrs J C Bishop 
Mrs D B Carige 
Mr S J Carige 
Mr G V Marr 
Mrs D J McKechnie 
Ms R J Sandilands 
Mrs M G Shaw 
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Laidley 

Mrs A G Chapman 
Mr D G Green 

 
Leichhardt (Leichhardt- 

Chinchilla Anglican  

Mission Area) 

Mrs J L Baker 
Mrs K Balnaves 
Mrs H J Becker 
Mrs C A Brockhurst 
Mr E S Gibbons 
Mrs M N Gray 
Mrs H C Hansen 
Mr A B Postle 
Mrs G Rees 
Mrs M E Statham 

 
Logan 

Mrs M H Daniels 
Mr P A De Lacy 
Ms R R De Lacy 
Mrs G L Douglas 
Ms P Ferguson 
Ms S M Gould 
Ms J A Harris 
Ms L K Harris 
Mr G P Harrison 
Mr B Hawkins 
Mr K E Hayman 
Mr P C Johnstone 
Mr R Kake 
Mr B Kerrison 
Mr J Matore 
Mr I D Mitchell 
Mrs L T Moss 
Ms S M Myirs 
Mrs J A Nightingale 
Mrs J F Paton 

Mrs O Pearce 
Ms J M Sardie 
Mr A G Shellshear 
Mr G R Stiles 
Mrs S Treadgold 

 
Lutwyche 

Mrs R M Grove 
Mr E J Maeke 
Mrs L E Peloe 
Mr E G E Yates 
Mr R A J Yates 

 
Maleny 

Mrs M K Cooper 
Mr J F Gratton-Caine 
Ms H M Guest 
Mr P C Hennessy 
Mrs D Y O'Neill 
Mrs V M Pearson 
Mr K W A Penhaligon 
Mr G N Richter 
Mr G W Sando 
Mrs D Somerville 
Mrs M R Walker 
Mr A C Walter 
Mr B A Warren 
Mrs J Wilkins 
Fr J H Wotlemaro 

 
Manly-Tingalpa 

Mr M F Austin 
Mr R D Byl 
Mr N E Crisp 
Mrs M A Dawson 
Mrs A J Gill 
Mr G L Hills 
Mrs M A Lawrence 
Mrs P R Ramsay 
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Mr C R Rohde 
Mrs K E Voltz 
Mrs N L Wilson 
Mr R K D Wilson 

Maroochydore 

Mrs J P Clempson 
Mr C L Cross 
Mrs M J Flegler 
Mrs N M Hagenbach 
Mrs L P Hutchison 
Mrs E R Kerwin 
Mrs D McAdam 
Mrs A M Newsome 
Mr C Newsome 
Mrs C S Reed 
Mrs H Saxby 
Mrs M L Thrift 
Mr L J Tremlett 

Maryborough 

Mr A J Allport 
Mrs B L Cairns 
Mrs C L Corben 
Mrs C A Cranage 
Mr N E Eichmann 
Mrs L S Garlepp 
Mrs D J Harris 
Mr A McHardy 
Mr I R Miles 
Mrs C A Morris 
Mrs S M Pitt 
Mrs A E Ree 
Mrs C M Smith 
Mrs R J Tatnell 
Mrs B N Trainer 
Mr A F Vollmerhause 
Mrs P L Wilkinson 

Millmerran 

Mrs C R King 
Mrs P E Millar 
Mr R G Millar 
Mr A J Stewart 

Mitchell (Maranoa-Warrego 

Anglican Area) 

Mrs J E Crocker 
Mr J M Mathewson 

Moggill-Mt Crosby 

Mr R B Ponsonby 

Morningside 

Mr J J Beausang 
Mrs S Bell 
Ms S M Z Lui 
Mr R J Powell 

Mount Gravatt 

Mrs B D Blaik 
Mrs A M Coldham-Fussell 
Mr O N Falua 
Mr L C Jones 
Mr M A Juster 
Mrs N D Kewley 
Mrs R A Mitchell 
Mr R G Mitchell 
Mr K Nayagam 
Mr M Perry 
Mrs P Sahayam 
Mrs D K Stevens 
Mr A G Tate 
Mrs V L J Walton 
Mr A Warrington 
Mrs K E Warrington 
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Mundubbera-Eidsvold-Monto 

Mrs E R J Augustine 
Mr A J T Coates 
Mrs C A Forsyth 
Mrs C J Heidrich 
Mr F Heidrich 
Mr P A Reiser 
Mrs J M Roger 

Nambour 

Mr C E Blake 
Ms C Bourne 
Mrs V A Davies 
Mrs H K Hall 
Mrs S L Hersant 
Ms A McAlister 
Mrs C L McVean 

Nanango 

Mrs E F M Mostaert 
Mr I M Mowat 
Mr W J Turner 

Nerang 

Mrs P M Cox 
Mrs M E Davenport 
Mrs A P Hay 
Mr G I Vorhauer 
Mrs W Wales 

New Farm 

Ms J Enright 
Mr H W Haddrell 
Ms J N M Hunter 
Mr R B L Loamanu 
Ms J G Singaraju 
Mr H Vaka 
Ms K T O Young 

Noosa 

Mrs D M Albrecht 
Mr R J Albrecht 
Mrs M M Cochrane 
Mrs R L Craven 
Mrs H M Dalrymple 
Mr C D Gilbert 
Mrs A Guy 
Mrs J B Habermehl 
Mrs M J Hansen 
Mrs K Harvey 
Mrs B J Heath 
Mr K J Hutton 
Mrs R M Hutton 
Mrs J Kadlecek-Gilbert 
Mrs E A Klarie 
Mrs E K MacDonald 
Mrs J M Marsh 
Mrs N J McLay 
Mrs P A Mortley 
Mrs C W Pearson 
Mr D D Roche 
Mrs L B Schafer 
Mrs V J Smerdon 
Mrs D J Turkington 
Mrs N K Urquhart 

North Pine 

Mr G F Aldom 
Mrs S J Armstrong 
Mr P D Browning 
Ms P L Dixon 
Mrs D M Evans 
Mr D J Gover 
Mr R J Haddon 
Mrs R J Harrison 
Ms E A Hobman 
Mr G M Hollindale 
Mrs A M Kratzmann 
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Mrs R B McKewen 
Ms C A Murray 
Mrs S M Polkinghorne 
Mr K R Slade 

 
Nundah 

Mr N G Crisp 
Mr P M Klienhans 
Mrs S M Milczewski 
Mrs M A Oulds 

 
Oakey 

Mr G C Cooke 
Mr N A Hollindale 
Mr F V Hurman 
Mrs J A Sloss 

 
Pittsworth 

Mrs F C Garratt 
Mr R E Holzberger 
Mr J N Keeley 
Mr I G Kronk 
Mr C W Mills 
Mrs A C Scott 
Mrs A M Stallman 

 
Redcliffe 

Mr M W Banner 
Mrs F F Baumann 
Ms K E Christensen 
Mr G A O Devine 
Mr I M Fraser 
Ms A E Gray 
Mr R A Highfield 
Mr O O Kuchmenko 
Miss C Lane 
Mrs M G McIntosh 
Mrs G C Neilsen 
Mr B F Richardson 

Mrs J E Stowers 
Mrs L A Weise 
Mr R H White 

 

Robina-Mermaid Beach 

Mrs  L A Carmichael 
Mr D Chau 
Mrs D P C Courage 
Mr F M Estevao 
Mrs J C Estevao 
Mrs L M Farrar 
Mr J W Fradgley 
Mrs L J Hardstaff 
Mr S Kurien 
Mr G L Leo 
Mr A H Mayer 
Mrs J D Schulte 
Mr J A Tunnell 
Mr J S Withington 

 
Roma 

Mr R J C Cormack 
Mrs V J Lingard 
Mr C R Miller 
Mrs J L Miller 
Mrs L Sabine 
Mrs S Sharpe 
Mrs J M Stinson 

 
Rosewood 

Mr T W Albury 
Mr R Clark 
Dr G J Dashwood 
Mrs G E Davenport 
Mrs D L Greensill 
Mr K C Hew 
Ms L M Klewin 
Mrs C E A Marre 
Mrs C M Nicol 
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Ms S M Vigar 
 
Samford 

Dr E Heck 
Mrs K Torrens 

 
Sandgate Northpoint 

Mr J A Blake 
Mrs A L Campbell 
Mr G A Connolly 
Mrs M A Humphries 
Mrs S Smallcombe 

 
Sherwood 

Mr L J Brown 
Mr J A Deakin 
Mr B Harwood 
Mrs E I Merritt 
Mrs K F Saffery 
Mr B D Teal 

 
South Brisbane 

Dr T J Lawson 
Mrs L Osborne 
Ms E V Radke 
Mr B E Sara 
Mr A J Sauer, OAM 
Mr M K Warren 
Mr P I Wornham 

 
Southport 

Mr R Appleby 
Dr M E Hampson 
Mrs R C Inglis 
Mr S R Inglis 
Mr R H Kingsmill 
Mr K H Lister 
Mr R C Manfield 
Mr J T Pye 

Mrs C M Syms 
Mr K Waugh 
Miss F Zhu 

 
Springfield,  

St Andrew's Parish 

Mr P H Bell 
Mr G Chinyemba 
Mr T H Davis 
Mrs G M C Saavedro 
Mr S Stephens 
Miss E L Williams 

 
St Aidan's School 

Ms C Begbie 
Ms L J McGuire 
Ms T M Riordan 

 
St George 

Mrs D E Buchan 
Mr T Hourn 

 
St John's Anglican College 

Mrs S G Bain 
Mr M S Brownlow 
Miss M B Gramenz 
Mrs S L Hawken 
Mrs R E Hinchliffe 
Mr G R Johnson 
Mr L K Knapman 
Mr W A B Pascoe 

 
St John's College 

Mr T H C Dunstone 
 
St Lucia 

Mr H F Buckham 
Mr W L Butner 
Ms L M Chesters 
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Ms R E Chesters 
Mrs G K Clifford 
Mr M Conroy 
Prof S C Derrington 
Miss R M Faragher 
Mr M D Gould 
Mrs S M O Grotherr 
Mrs A Jones 
Mrs G M Kuskopf 
Mrs C A O'Ryan 
Ms G E Paul 
Mrs D H Ponsonby 
Mr S J Tonge 

St Paul's School 

Dr P D Browning 

Stafford 

Miss A A Amankwah 
Mrs G A Amankwah-Toa 
Ms J T McK Cassells 
Ms G M Cawthorne 
Mr L C Gillies 
Mr D O Haidley 
Mrs N R Murray 
Mr A J Pratten 
Mr C B Rule 
Mrs J A Stacey 

Stanthorpe 

Mr J R Boucher 
Mr A N Connew 
Mrs A S Poole 
Mr A B Warren 

Strathpine 

Mrs H E Baart 
Miss S Barrett 
Mr M R Bolton 

Mr A W Brown 
Mr G C Fewtrell 
Mrs J S Fewtrell 
Mrs D S Fisher 
Mrs B Hargreaves 
Mr K J Hargreaves 
Mr D G Hassall 
Mrs L M Kerr 
Ms J H Leigh 
Mr N A Leigh 
Mrs E Lund 
Mr R N Lynam 
Ms A McCarrick 
Ms G R McCarrick 
Ms B M Nielsen 
Ms L Van Zyl 

Sunnybank 

Mr A C Phillips 
Miss R L E Soltes 

Surfers Paradise 

Mrs L A Aitken 
Mrs J M Anderson 
Mr B J Bailey 
Mrs S E Bailey 
Mrs J H Bennett 
Mrs H R Bismire 
Mrs Y A Breitkreutz 
Mrs J R Felt 
Mr G J Hendry 
Mr R P M Kelly 
Miss K A Lauchland 
Mr B J Marshall 
Mrs E A McEnlly 
Mrs P Millican 
Ms S L Molloy 
Mrs E K Murphy 
Mr I C Murphy 
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Mrs J G Newnham 
Miss J N Prouten 
Miss S R Ross 
Mrs B M Roughley 
Mr J T Roughley 
Mrs E A Sayer 
Mr R A Sayer 
Mr C S Shadforth 
Miss E Van der Schyff 
Mrs C A M Wallace-Barnett 

Tamborine Mountain 

Mrs D E Ayscough 
Mrs B A Noble 
Mr J W Noble 
Miss J M Reeves 

Tara 

Mrs M K Heuston 

Texas-Inglewood 

Mrs M U A Forster 
Mrs M L Muller 

The Gap 

Mrs H Boltman 
Mrs M J de Vries 
Mr A A Radford 
Mrs L K Rinder 
Mr A J Robinson 
Mr G J Robinson 
Mrs A H Sinclair 

The Glennie School 

Mr L W Duffin 
Mrs B J Suhr 
Mr S J Warren 

The Lakes Anglican Church 

Mrs N M Cunneen 
Ms U Dowman 
Mr A Hughes 
Mr B K Rankin 
Mr I P Russell 
Ms F Semenoff 
Mrs E N Watts 
Miss E J Whereat 

Toowong 

Miss L M Cronk 
Miss  J Greensill 
Dr W F N Henricksen 
Mr F X Hollingsworth 
Mr G P Hyde 
Mr P J Luxton 
Dr G McDonald 
Mr J B Samson 
Ms M A Walker 

Toowoomba West 

Mr M E Costidell 
Mr B P Gaydon 
Mrs J S Graham 
Mr A J Gray 
The Rev'd R P Gummow 
Mr H R Hannam 
Mr R Mengel 
Mr A Millis 
Mr  J B Newport 
Mrs R I Quinnell 
Mrs L M Scotney 
Mrs C J Smith 
Mr P C Wicks 
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Toowoomba, St 

Bartholomew's 

Mr S M Adamson 
Mrs E G W Adcock 
Mrs J R Berry 
Mr R J Carter 
Mrs J Clarke 
Mrs M A Coutts 
Mrs J L Dennison 
Mr M Dennison 
Ms M V F Dewis 
Mr W J Dutton 
Mr J H Freyburg 
Mr D R Gamble 
Mr G J Hansford 
Mrs L M James 
Mr V J Little 
Mrs  J E Mallyon 
Ms G Mould 
Miss A J E Norman 
Mrs J O'Shannassy 
Dr T Rathie 
Ms R A Ryan 
Mr M Skelton 
Ms W F Swanson 
Mrs K R Venables 
Mrs N M White 

Toowoomba, St James' 

Mr J K Adol 
Mr C K Agok 
Mr A G Ajak 
Mr D K Akech 
Ms R A Akech 
Mr W G S Anderssen 
Mr J M Arok 
Mrs B A Belford 
Mr G L Biggs 
Ms K M Bishop 

Mr M S Carlile 
Mr H A Clayton 
Mr N Collyer 
Mr V J Davis 
Mrs C M Hall 
Mrs M A Head 
Mrs K M Hockey 
Mrs L M Hooper 
Mrs J Humphreys 
Mrs R A Jimma 
Mrs A K Mabia 
Mrs W D Maslen 
Mr R L May 
Mrs E R McFadden 
Mrs M L D Newman 
Ms A L Newton 
Mr A J Newton 
Mr G N Newton 
Mrs L M Newton 
Mr A A Piok 
Mrs E Reynolds 
Mrs L J Tonkin 
Mrs P A Wedgwood 
Mr P F Wedgwood 
Dr E C Willey 
Mrs H A Willey 

Toowoomba, St Luke's 

Mr G W Bench 
Mrs L K Cain 
Dr A Dashwood 
Mrs R L Dealtry 
Mrs L E Fraser 
Mr S B Hart 
Mrs M G Howard 
Mr A Jacob 
Mr S Jeneke 
Mrs S J Lee 
Mrs J C Lemin 
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Mr G M Lilley 
Miss N McLeod 
Mr R H Moran 
Mrs E L Rennick 
Mrs R A Robson 
Mr J C Scanlan 
Mr R M Schonfeld 
Mr P T Smith 
Mrs S M Smith 
Mrs P G Wilson 

 
Warwick 

Mrs  J Allen 
Mrs L R Brittain 
Mr R A Brittain 
Miss J F Corcut 
Mr J H Corcut 
Mrs J A Cutmore 
Miss O F Cutmore 
Mrs R J Forbes 
Mr J L E Rogers 
Mrs P F Warne 

 
Waterloo Bay 

Ms D M Baguley 
Mr M C Banks 
Mrs J A M Bryant 
Mr I Carr 
Mrs M R Carr 
Mr R H Clark 
Miss H E Cunningham 
Mrs L A Farrow 
Mr N F Gardiner 
Mr R G Haskins 
Mr G E Hooker 
Mrs G S Moloney 
Mrs C M Moriarty 
Mr J Oyewole 
Mr J F Stahlhut 

Mr D A Stannard 
Mr R G Sweeney 
Mr G D Thompson 
Mrs J D White 

 

Wilston 

Mrs N A Anderson 
Mrs S M Bryant 
Mr B Fletcher 
Mr S J Forrest 
Mr J J Glassock 
Mr D M Swindells 
Mr C E Timms 

 
Wishart 

Mr J R Avery 
Mr P K Baker 
Mrs A L Dickson 
Mrs C E Keith 
Mr T Keith 
Mr R L Lacey 
Mr E M J Marken 
Mrs V I Mason 
Mrs P K Miles 
Mr R G Miles 
Mrs E A Parker 
Mr J P Redman 
Mrs P D Schaschke 
Dr G R R Tacon 
Mr D J E Willis 

 
Woolloongabba 

Miss M J Humby 
Mrs A S Main 
Mr D R O'Loughlin 
Mrs L C O'loughlin 
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Wynnum 

Mrs J E Dunbar 
Mrs M A Henzell 
Mr R W Hodson 
Mrs M M Jacob 
Mrs S E Kemp 
Mrs E N Ollenburg 
Ms S C Payne 
Mr R M Petersen 
Mr G J Tognola 
Ms R J Tognola 

Yeronga 

Mr A Ahmed 
Mr Y I Angelo 
Mr M J Anyieth 
Mr K G Baisden 
Mr C Gehrmann 
Mr B Hamid 
Mr J J Jirima 
Mrs A K Mabior 
Miss J McDiarmid 
Mr J W Nasona 
Mr P A Robinson 
Mr B Shan 
Mrs D A Van Doorn 

Zillmere 

Ms W E Brown 
Mr A J Bryant 
Mr D W Button 
Mrs H R Crowley 
Mr O Ekwudu 
Mrs V M Halsey 
Mr T J Murton 
Miss R A Rogers 
Mr A M Sadegh 
Mr B M Sadegh 
Mr A R Taylor 
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Diocesan Directory 

Anglican Church of Australia 
 Diocese of Brisbane, St Martin’s House, 373 Ann Street, Brisbane, 4000 

Episcopal Office 

3835 2218 

3835 2218         Episcopal Office 
     Fax 3832 5030 

ajoseph@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2249     
hmunro@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2213    
jgreaves@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

The Archbishop 
The Most Rev’d Dr Phillip Aspinall 

Executive Assistant 
Ms Ann Joseph 

Archbishop’s Chaplain 
The Rev’d Dr Howard Munro

Assistant Bishops: 
Northern Region 
The Right Rev’d Jeremy Greaves

Southern Region 
The Right Rev’d John Roundhill 

Personal Assistants 
Mrs Ann Armitage 
Wed-Fri  

Mrs Joanne Rose 
Mon-Wed 

3835 2213 
jroundhill@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2269 
aarmitage@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2213  
jrose@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
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Western Region 
The Right Rev’d Cameron Venables 

Personal Assistant  
Ms Helen Briffa 
PO Box 2600, Toowoomba 4350 

4614 7050 
cvenables@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

4614 7050 
hbriffa@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Diocesan Director of Ordinands 
The Rev’d J Milburn  

Personal Assistant Ms Lyn Lamb 

3902 1814  
john.milburn@stjohnsbulimba.org 

3902 1814  
lyn@stjohnsbulimba.org 

General Manager’s Office 

3835 2222  Fax 3831 1170 

3835 2221       Fax 3831 1170 
gmoffice@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2221  
yhuang@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2211  
jjohnson@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2204 
jvorster@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2253 
lsargeant@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

St Martin’s House,  
373 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000 
(GPO Box 421, Brisbane 4001) 

General Manager/Registrar 
Mr Tim Reid 

Executive Assistant 
Ms Yi-Ching Huang 

Executive Assistant 
Mrs Jean Johnson 
Wed- Fri 

Administrative Assistant 
Mrs Jolanda Vorster  

Assistant Registrar 
Mrs Lisa Sargeant  
Mon-Wed 

Legal Advisor 
Mrs Susan Horton 
Mon-Wed 

Legal Advisor 
Mrs Michelle Newick 
Mon, Tues, Thu 

3835 2275 
shorton@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2286 
mnewick@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
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3835 2283 
kathomas@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2229 
ksquire@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2265 
cwojewoda@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2247          0432 754 897 
ieckersley@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2278  
ngentner@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2303          0402 965 204 
jbasham@anglicanchurchsq.org.au  

Redress & Claims Coordinator 
Ms Kara Thomas 

Litigation Solicitor 
Ms Kassandra Squire 

Legal Admin Assistant 
Mrs Christine Wojewoda 

Policy & Advocacy Advisor Mr 
Ian Eckersley 

Risk & Compliance Coordinator 
Mr Nick Gentner 

Research Specialist 
Ms Jen Basham 

Justice Enabler 
Mr Peter Branjerdporn 3835 2303          0431 606 432  

pbrandjerdporn@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

RAP Coordinator 
Mrs Christine Ellis 3835 2304 

cellis@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Office of Professional Standards 

St Martin’s House,  
373 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000 
(GPO Box 421, Brisbane 4001) 

1800 242 544  Fax 3831 9873  
dops@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Director, Professional Standards 
Mr Greg Milles 3835 2266 

gmilles@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Associate Director 
Mrs Kristi-Lee Ritchie 
Mon-Thu 

3835 2258 
kritchie@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Associate Director 
Ms Yean Lim 3835 2293 

ylim@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Administrative Assistant 
Mrs Narelle Robertson 
Mon-Wed  

3835 2274
nrobertson@anglicanchurchsq.org.au
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Administrative Assistant 
Mrs Ana Mila 
Wed-Fri 

3835 2216 
amila@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Research Officer 
Mr Ben Oberhardt 3835 2261 

boberhardt@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

St John’s Cathedral 

Cathedral Office  
Mon-Fri 9am-5pm 
St Martin’s House, 373 Ann Street, 
Brisbane 4000 

3835 2222          Fax 3832 3173  
cathedral@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

Dean  
The Very Rev’d Dr Peter Catt 3835 2232

pcatt@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

Assistant Priest 
The Rev’d Bronwyn Pagram 3835 2248

bpagram@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

Honorary Deacon 
The Rev’d Dr Ann Solari 0424 423 972 

annsolari@westnet.com.au 

Events Manager /  
Precinct Manager 
Mr Gerard Finn 3835 2231 

precinct@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

Dean’s Personal Assistant 
Ms Lisa Clarke  3835 2239 

lclarke@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

Receptionist 
Ms Frances Thompson 
Tue, Wed 

Ms Jan Reid 
Thu, Fri 

3835 2222 
reception@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

3835 2222 
jreid@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

Financial Consultant 
Mr Lindsay Marshall (Thursday) 3835 2228 

lmarshall@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

274

mailto:amila@anglicanchurchsq.org.au
mailto:boberhardt@anglicanchurchsq.org.au
mailto:precinct@stjohnscathedral.com.au
mailto:pcatt@stjohnscathedral.com.au
mailto:bpagram@stjohnscathedral.com.au
mailto:annsolari@westnet.com.au
mailto:precinct@stjohnscathedral.com.au
mailto:lclarke@stjohnscathedral.com.au
mailto:reception@stjohnscathedral.com.au
mailto:jreid@stjohnscathedral.com.au
mailto:lmarshall@stjohnscathedral.com.au


3835 2224 
accounts@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

Cathedral Accounts 
Mrs Catherine Malberbe 
Mon-Thu 

Cathedral Guides & Shop 
Mrs Georgina Gooderidge 
Mon, Thu & Fri

Director of Music 
Mr Graeme Morton 

Cathedral Organist 
Mr Andrej Kouznetsov 

3835 2225 
jscott@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

3835 2264 
gmorton@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

3835 2264
akouznetsov@stjohnscathedral.com.au 

Ministry Education Commission 

3514 7400          Fax 3369 4691 
www.stfran.qld.edu.au   
enquiries@ministryeducation.org.au 

3835 2218 

3514 7401 
jholland@anglicanchurchsq.org.au  

233 Milton Road, (PO Box 1261), 
Milton 4064 

Commission Chair  
The Most Rev’d Dr PJ Aspinall 

Executive Director  
& Principal SFC  
The Rt Rev’d Dr JC Holland 

PA to Executive Director 
Ms Linda Burridge

Property & Finance Officer 
Mr Stephen Clarke 

Director of Formation 
The Rev’d Penny Jones 

Director, Youth, Children 
& Families Ministry  
Mr Jonathan Kemp 

Trainer & Youth 
Camp Co-ordinator 
Ms Erica Skerman 

3514 7400 
lburridge@ministryeducation.org.au 

3514 7402 
stephen@ministryeducation.org.au 

3514 7415 
phjones@ministryeducation.org.au 

3514 7432 
jdkemp@ministryeducation.org.au 

3514 7412
eskerman@ministryeducation.org.au 
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3514 7429 
dkeenan@ministryeducation.org.au 

Director - Anglican Spiritual 
Direction Formation 
Mrs Dale Keenan 

Admin Officer - Anglican 
Spiritual Direction Formation 
Ms Wendy Dann 3514 7433 

wdann@ministryeducation.org.au 

St Francis’ Theological College 

233 Milton Road, Milton PO 
Box 1261 Milton Q 4064 

3514 7400   Fax 3369 4691 
www.stfran.qld.edu.au
enquiries@ministryeducation.org.au 

Principal  
The Rt Rev’d Dr J C Holland 

3514 7401 
jholland@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Academic Dean 
Dr Peter Kline

3514 7418 
pkline@ministryeducation.org.au 

Registrar  
Mrs Suzie Anthonisz 

3514 7403 
registrar@ministryeducation.org.au 

Director of Lay Education 
Mr Jonathan Sargeant 

3514 7442 
jonathans@ministryeducation.org.au 

Roscoe Library 
Library Manager 
Ms Eve James 3514 7419   

library@ministryeducation.org.au  
ejames@ministryeducation.org.a
u www.roscoe.org.au   

3878 3348   Fax 3878 3374 
brookfieldcentre@iinet.au   

Household of Deacons  

Brookfield Centre for 
Christian Spirituality 
139 Brookfield Rd (PO Box 966) 
Kenmore 4069 

Diocesan EFM 3514 7400 
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Vacant 

Community Chaplain & 
Missioner (Young Adults)
The Rev'd Jasmine Dow

3514 7416
jdow@ministryeducation.org.au 
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Anglican Schools Commission 

Church House 
419 Ann Street, 
Brisbane 4000 

3835 2288          Fax 3839 0879 
ascoffice@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Web www.ascqld.org.au   

Executive Director 
Ms Sherril Molloy 3835 2251   

smolloy@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Executive Assistant 
Ms Lorelle Armitage  3835 2280 

larmitage@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Publishing & Social Media 
Coordinator 
Mrs Kerryn Smith 3835 2282   

kjsmith@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Education & Care Services 
Project Coordinator 
Ms Sharon Mehan 3835 2291 

smehan@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Education & Care Services 
Support Officer 
Ms Kerry Frances 3835 2292 

kfrances@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Cyber Safety Support Officer 
Mr Steve Window 3835 2226 

swindow@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Manager – Systems Compliance 
Mr Robert Nettleton 3835 2237 

rnettleton@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Child Safety & Wellbeing 
Advocate 
Mrs Heather Bryce 3835 2259 Fax 3839 0879 

hbryce@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Manager System Finance 
Mr John Gregg 3835 2285 

jgregg@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Mission Education Advisor 
Mrs Vanessa Gamack 3835 2294 

vgamack@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Administration Coordinator 
Ms Levina Fuller 3835 2288 

lfuller@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
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Schools 

Diocesan Owned Schools 

SCHOOLS FOR BOYS 

Anglican Church  
Grammar School 
Oaklands Parade,  
East Brisbane 4169 
Council Chair Mr D O’Connor 
Headmaster Dr A Campbell 
Director, Business and Finance 
Mrs E Stannard 
Chaplain  
The Rev’d B S A Gadd 

3896 2200 Fax 3891 5976 
info@churchie.com.au 

3896 2281 

The Southport School  
Winchester Street, Southport 4215 
Council Chair Mr F Perrin 
Headmaster Mr G Wain 
Business Manager Mr R Cardiff 
Chaplain The Rev’d J Whereat 

5531 9911 Fax 5531 9977 
reception@tss.qld.edu.au 

5531 9956 

SCHOOLS FOR GIRLS 
St Hilda’s School 
52 High Street, (PO Box 290), 
Southport,  4215 
Council Chair  
Assoc. Professor Mrs S Brandis 
Principal Dr J Wilson Reynolds 
Business Manager Mr P Salter 
Chaplain The Rev’d P Duckworth 

5532 4922     Fax 5591 5352 
principal@sthildas.qld.edu.au 

The Glennie School 
248 Herries Street, Toowoomba 
4350 
Council Chair  
Mrs E Gillam 
Principal 
Mrs K Cohen 
Director of Finance and 
Administration 
Mr J Hockaday 
Chaplain  
The Rev’d S Baird 

4688 8888      Fax 4688 8848 
enquiries@glennie.qld.edu.au 

4688 8808 

278

mailto:info@churchie.com.au
mailto:reception@tss.qld.edu.au
mailto:principal@sthildas.qld.edu.au
mailto:enquiries@glennie.qld.edu.au


Co-Educational 
Cannon Hill Anglican College  
Cnr Junction and Krupp Roads,  
Cannon Hill 4170 
(PO Box 3366, Tingalpa DC 4173) 
Council Chair Dr G Nicholson 
Principal Mrs R Bell 
Business Manager  
Mrs K Campbell 
Chaplain The Rev’d Canon 
S Leisemann 

3896 0444     
college@chac.qld.edu.au 

Coomera Anglican College 
8 Days Road, Coomera 4209 
(PO Box 457, Upper Coomera 
4210) 
Council Chair Mr Stephen Knott 
Principal Dr M Sly 
Business Manager Mr D Dobbie 
Mentor Chaplains The Rev’d  
M Rulfs 

5585 9900 Fax 5585 9911 
cac@cac.qld.edu.au 

Fraser Coast Anglican College  
Doolong South Road, Hervey Bay 
4655 
(PO Box 1150, Hervey Bay, 4655) 
Council Chair Mr B Eaton 
Principal Mr J Wright 
Business Manager Mrs Nikki 
Robertson 
Chaplain The Rev’d J Jarvis 

4124 5411 Fax 4124 5833 
admin@fcac.qld.edu.au 

St Andrew’s Anglican College 
40 Peregian Springs Drive,  
Peregian Springs 4573  
Council Chair Mrs R Cheales 
Principal The Rev’d C Ivey 
Business Manager Mrs A Brown 
Chaplain The Rev’d G McClellan 

5471 5555 Fax 5471 5500 
enquiries@saac.qld.edu.au 

St Luke’s Anglican School 
4 Mezger Street, Bundaberg 4670 
Council Chair Mrs H Conradie 
Principal Mr C Merritt 
Business Manager Mr D Reed 
Chaplain The Rev’d I Furby 

4132 7555   Fax 4132 7556 
stlukes@stlukes.qld.edu.au 

St Paul’s School 
34 Strathpine Road, Bald Hills 4036 
Council Chair Mr R Law 
Headmaster Dr P Browning 
Finance Manager Mrs C Sweeney 

3261 1388   Fax 3261 4521 
reception@stpauls.qld.edu.au 

279

mailto:college@chac.qld.edu.au
mailto:cac@cac.qld.edu.au
mailto:admin@fcac.qld.edu.au
mailto:enquiries@saac.qld.edu.au
mailto:stlukes@stlukes.qld.edu.au
mailto:reception@stpauls.qld.edu.au


Chaplain The Rev’d M K Leam 

Toowoomba Anglican College & 
Preparatory School 
2 Campbell Street, Toowoomba 
4350  
Chair Mr H Rose 
Head of School Mr S Lees 
Business Manager Ms J Edwards 
Chaplain The Rev’d Z Browne 

4639 8111    Fax 4639 8100 
admin@tacaps.qld.edu.au 

West Moreton  
Anglican College 
Keswick Road, Karrabin 4306 
(Locked Bag 8004), Ipswich 4305) 
Council Chair Dr I Lupton 
Principal Mr G McLay 
Director of Corporate Services  
Ms V Gallinaro 
Chaplain The Rev’d J Craig-Leaves 

3813 4555    Fax 3813 4566 
info@wmac.com.au 

St John’s Anglican College &  
The Springfield Anglican College 
(FSAC Ltd) 
Chair of FSAC Board Mr T Reid 
Chief Financial Manager  
Mrs K Lewis 

3372 0111    Fax 3372 0190 
info@sjac.qld.edu.au 

St John’s Anglican College 
College Avenue & Alpine Place 
Forest Lake. 4078 
(PO Box 4078, Forest Lake, 4078) 
Principal Ms M McIvor 
Chaplain The Rev’d S Crothers-
Robertson 

3372 0111  Fax 3372 0190 
info@sjac.qld.edu.au 

The Springfield Anglican College 
63 Springfield Greenbank Arterial,  
(PO Box 4180) Springfield, 4300 
Principal Mr D Pitt 
Chaplain The Rev’d E Williams 

3814 8100    Fax 3814 8199 
info@tsac.qld.edu.au 

Other Schools within the  

Anglican Schools Commission 

Society Of The Sacred Advent 
St Aidan’s Anglican Girls School 
11 Ruthven Street, (PO Box 46), 
Corinda, 4075 
Council Chair Ms Cecile Wake 

3373 5999  Fax 3379 9432 
reception@staidans.qld.edu.au 
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Principal Ms T Riordan 
Director of Business Operations 
Mrs T Williams 
Chaplain The Rev’d G Moses 

St Margaret’s Anglican Girls 
School 
11 Petrie Street, Ascot, 4007 
Council Chair Ms A Quinn 
Principal Ms R Curtis 
Director of Business Operations 
Mrs T Williams  
Chaplain The Rev’d N Colledge 

3862 0777  Fax 3862 0701 
mail@stmargarets.qld.edu.au 

Co-Educational 
All Saints Anglican School 
102-104 Highfield Drive,
Merrimac 4226
Council Chair Mr J Fradgley
Headmaster Mr P Wallas
Commercial Manager
Ms L Thomas
Chaplain The Rev’d A McGuinness

5530 2855    Fax 5530 3314 
enquiries@asas.qld.edu.au 

Canterbury College 
(originally constituted as the 
College of the Good Shepherd)  
Old Logan Village Road, Waterford 
4133  
(PO Box 616, Beenleigh 4207) 
Council Chair Mr J Thomas 
Head of College Mrs D Anderson 
Director Business & Finance Mr K 
Fuller 
Chaplain  The Rev'd Elroy Mee 

3299 0888   Fax 3805 2132 
school@canterbury.qld.edu.au 

Hillbrook Anglican School 
45 Hurdcotte Street, Enoggera, 
4051  
(PO Box 469, Everton Park, 4053) 
Council Chair Mr R Seljak 
Principal Mr G Newton 
Business Manager Mrs B Wearne, 
Mr B Durham 
Chaplain Mr D Adams 

3354 3422 
hillbrook@hillbrook.qld.edu.au 

Matthew Flinders Anglican 
College 
Stringybark Road, Buderim 4556 
Chair, Board of Directors  
Mr E Gilbert 
Principal Mr Stuart Meade 

5477 3200 Fax 5477 1703 
flinders@mfac.edu.au 
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Director of Business & 
Operations Mrs S Verrinder 
Chaplain The Rev’d Lizzie Gaitskell 

Anglican Schools Commission 

Education & Care Services
Services Approved under The Corporation of the Synod of the Diocese of Brisbane 

07 5531 3019 
admin@careylane.com.au 

07 5585 9925 
jrees@cac.qld.edu.au 

07 5585 9982 
herwin@cac.qld.edu.au 

07 4197 9342
kcarr@fcac.qld.edu.au

Carey Lane Early Learning Centre 3 
Carey Lane, Southport 4215  

Ms Sarah Dolby & Ms Alison 
Combridge 

Long Day Care, Kindergarten Program 

Coomera Anglican College  
Early Learning Centre 
PO Box 457, Upper Coomera 4209 

Ms Jenny Rees 

Long Day Care, Kindergarten Program 

Coomera Anglican  
College OSHC 
PO Box 457, Upper Coomera 4209 

Ms Helen Erwin 

Before & after school/vacation care 

Fraser Coast Anglican College  Early 
Learning Centre  
‘Koala Kindy’  
Doolong S Rd, Hervey Bay 4655 

Mrs Kylie Carr 
Long Day Care, Kindergarten Program 

Fraser Coast Anglican College 
OSHC 
‘Roos Care’  
Doolong S Rd, Hervey Bay 4655 

Ms Shay Russell 

Before & after school/vacation care 

07 4197 9301
srussell@fcac.qld.edu.au 
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07 5471 5600 
ogoryl@saac.qld.edu.au 

07 5471 5600 
kkennedy@saac.qld.edu.au 

07 5577 7378 
lcleverly@sthildas.qld.edu.au 

07 4132 7539 
catherine-donaldson@slasmail.com 

07 3261 1388 / 0414 295 146 
m.connolly@stpauls.qld.edu.au

07 4688 8842 
harmana@glennie.qld.edu.au 

Little Saints Early Learning Centre 10 
Peregian Springs Drive, Peregian 
Springs 4573 

Ms Ola Goryl 
Long Day Care, Kindergarten 

St Andrews After School 
& Vacation Care 
40 Peregian Springs Drive, Peregian 
Springs 4573 

Ms Kelly Kennedy 
Before & after school/vacation care 

St Hilda’s School – Pre-preparatory 
PO Box 290, Southport 4215 

Ms Lisa Cleverly 
Long Day Care, Kindergarten Program, 
before & after school/vacation care 

St Luke’s l Early Learning Centre 
4 Mezger Street, Bundaberg 4670 

Ms Catherine Donaldson 

Long Day Care, Kindergarten Program, 
before & after school/vacation care 

St Paul’s Early Learning Centre 
34 Strathpine Road, Bald Hills 4036 

Ms Marianne Connolly 

Kindergarten Program 

The Glennie Community 
Kindergarten  
257 Herries Street,  
Toowoomba 4350 
Mrs Amanda Harman 
Kindergarten Program 

The Glennie Pitstop OSHC 
263-269 Herries Street,
Toowoomba 4350
Mrs Lynne Henare 
Before & after school/vacation care 

07 4688 8787 
pitstop@glennie.qld.edu.au
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07 5531 9869 
karen.humphreys@tss.qld.edu.au  

07 4639 8111 
mwright@tacaps.qld.edu.au 

07 4639 8111 
shill@tacaps.qld.edu.au

07 5618 8242 
rainbowtown@tam.org.au 

The Southport School Preparatory 
School 
22 Winchester Street, Southport 

Mrs Karen Humphreys 

Long Day Care, Kindergarten Program, 
before & after school/vacation care 

Toowoomba Anglican College and 
Preparatory School Kindergarten 
2 Campbell Street, Toowoomba 4350 

Ms Michele Wright 

Kindergarten Program 

Toowoomba Anglican College & 
Preparatory School OSHC 
2 Campbell Street,  
Toowoomba 4350 

Mrs Sheridan Hill 

Before & after school/vacation care 

Parish of Robina 
Rainbow Town Early  
Learning Centre 
186 Robina Town Centre Drive, 
Robina 4226 

Ms Catriona MacGregor 
& Ms Emma Dalziell 

Long Day Care, Kindergarten Program 

Parish of Wilston 
St Alban’s Early Childhood Centre 
47 Lovedale Street, Wilston 4051 
Ms Alison Barrass 

Long Day Care, Kindergarten Program 

07 3352 7617 
stalbanswilstonecc@tpg.com.au 
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Parish of Sunnybank  
Sunnybank Anglican  
Early Learning Centre 
73 Everest Street, Sunnybank 4109 

Ms Diane Nitschke 

Long Day Care, Kindergarten Program 

07 3344 1868 
contact@saelc.com.au 

Parish of Sunnybank  
Sunnybank Anglican Outside 
School Hours Care 
139 Young St, Sunnybank 4109 

Ms Robyn Armstrong 

Before & after school/vacation care 

07 3344 4128 
sunnycare@bigpond.com 

Anglican Community Services Commission 

Anglicare Southern Queensland, a Member of Anglicare Australia
Executive Office 
Level 3, Webber House, 439 Ann Street, 
Brisbane 4000 
PO Box 10556, Adelaide Street,  
Brisbane 4000 

3838 7617  Fax 3838 7654 
info@anglicaresq.org.au 
anglicaresq.org.au 

Executive Director Mrs Karen Crouch 

Director of Services Mrs Sue Cooke 

Director Strategy & Transformation 
Mr Glenn Bradley 

Director Governance, Risk & Quality 
Mrs Amanda Davies 

Director Organisational Development 
Ms Anna Zilli 

Director Mission  
The Rev’d Canon Linda McWilliam 

Chief Financial Officer 
Mr David Barrie 

Chief Information Officer 
Mr Mark Smith 
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New clients, referrals and general enquiries 1300 610 610 Fax 3028 4699 

Overseas and Interstate +61 7 3028 4669

Donations or bequests  1300 244 683 

Mission  
Level 3, Webber House, 439 Ann Street, 
Brisbane Q 4000 

3838 7551 Fax 3838 7654 

Anglicare Offices 

Brisbane North 
North Park Business Centre, Suite 205A 
6 Barbara Street, Stafford 

1300 610 610 Fax 3552 7900 

Brisbane South  
21 Martin Street,  
Woolloongabba 4102 1300 610 610 Fax 3028 4599 

Caboolture  
Suite 2, 69 King Street, 
Caboolture Q 4510 1300 610 610  Fax 5428 2521 

Gold Coast 
220-221 Highfield Drive,
Robina Q 4226 1300 610 610 Fax 5525 4199 

Kilcoy 
16 Kropp St 
Kilcoy Q 4515 1300 610 610 Fax 5422 3299 

Logan 
Unit 6, 3 - 9 University Drive, 
Meadowbrook 4131 1300 610 610 Fax 3200 8173 

Rural & Remote Central West 
150 Eagle Street, Longreach 4730 1300 610 610 Fax 4658 3156 

Rural & Remote South West 
50 Arthur St, Roma Q 4455 1300 610 610 Fax 4622 6478 

Sunshine Coast  
174 Currie Street, Nambour 4560 1300 610 610 Fax 5476 2106 

Toowoomba  
2 Scout’s Way  
Toowoomba  4350 1300 610 610 Fax 4614 7099 

286



Townsville 
11/155 Denham Street, 
Townsville  4810 1300 610 610 Fax 4722 0444 

West Moreton 
144 Brisbane Road, 
Booval 4304 1300 610 610 Fax 3282 0004 

Wide Bay 
12 Banksia Street,  
Point Vernon 4655 1300 610 610 Fax 4191 2812 

Home Maintenance & 
Modifications Service 
19-21 Martin St,
Woolloongabba  4120

1300 610 610 Fax 3028 4599 

Insync Cleveland  
38 Middle Street, Cleveland  4163 1300 610 610 Fax 3821 6944 

Insync Beenleigh 
Unit 4, 29 Logan River Road, 
Beenleigh  4207 

1300 610 610 Fax 3801 8523 

Insync Mount Gravatt 
130 Camlet St, Mount Gravatt East QLD 4122 1300 610 610 

St Bart’s Youth Accommodation  
130 Camlet St, Mount Gravatt East  4122 1300 610 610 

Residential Aged Care 

Abri Home for the Aged  
38A Bauer Street, Southport  4215 5555 4888 Fax 5571 1957 

Edwin Marsden Tooth Memorial  
Home for Aged  
162 Oceana Terrace, Manly  4179 3396 1564 Fax 3393 3746 

Kirami Home for the Aged  
12 Banksia Street, Point Vernon  4655 4191 2888 Fax 4194 5876 

Meilene Home for the Aged  
2 Meilene St, Bundaberg  4670 4151 7527 Fax 4151 0224 

St John's Home for Aged Men  
11 Exmouth Street, Toowong  4066 3870 7479 Fax 3870 9503 

287



St Martin's Nursing Home  
304 Roghan Road, Taigum  4018 3623 6900 Fax 3216 2380 

Symes Grove Home for the Aged 
333 Handford Road, Taigum  4018 3623 6901 Fax 3265 1488 

Symes Thorpe Home for the Aged  
69 Stenner St, Rangeville, Toowoomba  4350 4687 3700 Fax 4635 9182 

Retirement Villages 

Lota Court  
162 Oceana Terrace, Lota  4179 3396 1564 Fax 3393 3746 

Meilene Court 
2 Meilene St, Bundaberg  4670 4151 7527 Fax 4151 0224 

Symes Grove Villas 
333 Handford Road, Taigum  4018 3623 6901 Fax 3265 1488 

The Glebe Villas  
Beatrice St, Drayton 4350 4687 3700 Fax 4635 9182 

Children & Families 

Children & Families Brisbane  
221 Logan Road, Buranda  4102 1300 610 610 Fax 3028 4699 

Children & Families Caboolture 
157-165 King Street, Caboolture  4510 1300 610 610 Fax 5428 4999 

Children & Families Gold Coast 
3/54 Nerang Street, Nerang  4211 1300 610 610 Fax 5578 4809 

Children & Families Gympie  
44 Duke Street, Gympie  4570 1300 610 610 Fax 5483 7822 

Children & Families Logan 
2906 Logan Road , Underwood  4119 1300 610 610 Fax 3340 9288 

Children & Families Roma 
50-52 Arthur Street, Roma  4455 1300 610 610 Fax 4622 4097 
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Mental Health & Family Wellbeing 

Mental Health & Family Wellbeing North 

408 Gympie Rd Strathpine  4500 

15 Hill Parade, Clontarf  4019 

North Park Business Centre, Suite 205A, 
6 Babarra Street, Stafford  4053 

2 O’Connell Street, Gympie 4570 

44 Duke Street, Gympie 4570 

60 Cheapside Street, Maryborough  4650 

34-36 Capper Street, Gayndah  4625

50-52 Arthur Street, Roma  4455

41 Alfred Street, Charleville  4470 

1300 114 397 Fax 3028 4699 

Mental Health & Family Wellbeing South 

221 Logan Rd, Buranda  4102 

105 Poinsettia Street, Inala  4077 

2906 Logan Road, Underwood  4119 

Unit 4/29 Logan River Road, Beenleigh,  4207 

38 Middle Street, Cleveland  4163 

5 Olive Street, Southport  4215 

Tower House Business Centre, 2190 Gold 
Coast Hwy, Miami 4220 

17-19 Bannerman Street, Riverview  4303

144 Brisbane Road, Booval,  4304 

Central Plaza, Level 2, Unit 8, 532 Ruthven 
Street, Toowoomba,  4350  

35 Guy Street, Warwick, LD 4370 

The Goondiwindi Business Hub, 116 Marshall 
Street, Goondiwindi  4390 

1300 114 397 Fax 3028 4699 
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Living Well  
408 Gympie Rd, Strathpine  4500 3481 4901 Fax 3481 4998 

A Place To Belong  
69 Thomas St, West End  4101 3217 2522 Fax 3217 2274 

Homelessness Services 

Homelessness Services – Women and 
Families (including Alina, Anglican Women's 
Hostel, and St Mary's Support and 
Accommodation Program) 

3377 3111 Fax 3377 3159 

Marketing 

Corporate Services  
Level 1 Webber House,  
439 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000 
GPO Box 421, Brisbane 4001 

Parishes & Schools - 
marketing@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Anglicare - 
marketing@anglicaresq.org.au    

Head of Marketing & Comms 
Amy-Lee Hopkins 3838 7685  Mbl 0417 197 122 

Anglicare, Parishes & Schools - 
aleehopkins@anglicaresq.org.au 

Brand Manager 
Louise Firth 3838 7689   Mbl 0401 760 035 

lfirth@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Social Media and Content 
Manager – Bryce Schneider 3838 7691 

bschneider@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Fundraising and Events 
Manager – Tiffany Berg 1300 244 683 

Anglicare Fundraising  
giving@anglicaresq.org.au   
Anglicare SQ Events   
events@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
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Finance & Diocesan Services Commission 

St Martin’s House, 
373 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000 
(GPO Box 421, Brisbane 4001) 

3835 2306  Fax 3835 2330 

Executive Director 
Ms Sandra Long 3835 2305 

slong@anglicanchurch.org.au 

Group Manager – Property 
Mr Hiro Kawamata 3835 2262 

hkawamata@anglicanchurch.org.au 

Group Manager – Treasury & 
Investments 
Mr David Burton 

3835 2263 
dburton@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Group Manager – Organisational 
Support Services 
Ms Kym Clark 

3835 2314 
kclark@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Group Manager – Digital 
Innovation 
Mr Patrick Meuleman 3835 2271 

pmeuleman@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Diocesan Financial Controller 
Mr Andrew Dowling  3835 2342 

adowling2@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Senior Insurance Officer 
Mr Phillip Tolley 3835 2256 

ptolley@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Parish Liaison Officer 
Kelly Houston 1300 337 277 

khouston@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Diocesan Archivist 
Mr Michael Rogers 3835 2333 

mrogers@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
ANFIN Office 
Level 1, St Martin’s House 
373 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000 
GPO Box 421, Brisbane 4001 

3835 2355 or 1300 889 700 
Fax 3838 2299 
askus@anfin.com.au  
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Pay Office 3835 2325          Fax 3835 2336 
payroll@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

anglican focus 
www.anglicanfocus.org.au 

Editor 
Ms Michelle McDonald 3835 2230 

focus@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Parishes & Other Mission 
Agencies Commission 

St Martin’s House,  
373 Ann Street, Brisbane 4000 
(GPO Box 421, Brisbane 4001) 

3835 2222  Fax 3831 1170 

Executive Director 
Dr Stephen Harrison 

Administrator  
Ms Belinda Macarthur 

3835 2233 
sharrison@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3835 2284 
bmacarthur@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

PMC Chaplaincy Services 

Manager, Chaplaincy Services 
Mrs Sally Isles 0437 761 304 

sisles@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

HOSPITALS 
Diocesan Hospital Ministry 
Coordinator 
The Rev’d Canon Cheryl Selvage Mbl 0407 585 270 
Pastoral Care Coordinators 

Greater Brisbane Region  
The Rev’d Canon Cheryl Selvage 

Princess Alexandra Hospital, Mater 
Hospital, Ipswich Hospitals 

Mbl 0407 585 270 
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Mrs Carol O’Ryan 

Royal Brisbane & Women’s Hospital, 
The Lady Cilento Children’s Hospital 

Mbl 0421 179 276 

Ms Judy Burt 

The Prince Charles Hospital, 
Holy Spirit Northside Hospital 

Mbl 0402 666 598 

Gold Coast Region 
Mrs Michelle Philp 

Gold Coast University Hospital,  
Gold Coast Private Hospital,  
Allamanda Private Hospital, Carrara 
Public Hospital,  
Pindara Private Hospital, Robina H 
Spendlove Private Hospital, 
John Flynn Private Hospital 

Mbl 0409 204 489 

Northern Region  
The Rev’d Ann Shepperson 

Sunshine Coast University Private 
Hospital & Sunshine Coast University 

Mbl 0408 983 193 

Western Region  
Ms Jodie O’Shannassy 

Toowoomba Base Hospital, Baillie 
Henderson Hospital, St Andrew’s 
Private Hospital, St Vincent’s Private 
Hospital 

Mbl 0438 712 125 

PRISONS 

Refer: 
Mrs Sally Isles Mbl 0437 761 304 

sisles@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 
Correctional Centres supported by 
the Anglican Church of Southern 
Queensland:  
Arthur Gorrie, Borallon, Brisbane,  
Brisbane Women’s, Helena Jones,  
Maryborough, Numinbah, Palen Creek, 
Southern Queensland, Wolston,  
Woodford  

Also under the Care of Sally Isles: 
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Diocese of Rockhampton – 
Capricornia Correctional Centre 
(Rockhampton) 
Diocese of North Queensland – 
Townsville Women’s Correctional 
Centre, Townsville Men’s Correctional 
Centre, Lotus Glen Correctional Centre 
(Mareeba) 

POLICE 

Refer: 
Mrs Sally Isles 

Police Chaplains 
The Rev’d Rod Wood 

Mbl 0437 761 304 
sisles@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Mbl 0417 739 768 

ECUMENICAL TERTIARY 

The Rev’d Fang Ling Quested 
Griffith, QUT 0457 863 338 

Contact via  
pmc@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Aboriginal & Torres Strait Islander Ministry 

Aboriginal & Torres Strait Islander 
Ministry 3835 2222 

RAP Coordinator 
Mrs Christine Ellis 3835 2304 

cellis@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Religious Orders 

Society of the Sacred Advent 

The Sisters of the Sacred Advent 
30 The Village, Taigum 
333 Handford Road, Taigum  4018 

3865 7604 
gillian@stmargarets.qld.edu.au 
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St Aidan’s School 
11 Ruthven Street (Aidan’s Way), 
Corinda 4075 

3373 5999 
reception@staidans.qld.edu.au 

St Margaret’s School 
11 Petrie Street, Ascot 4007 

3862 0777 
reception@stmargarets.qld.edu.au 

Society of St Francis 

Society of St Francis  
St Philip’s Rectory,  
115 Cornwall Street, Annerley 4103 

3391 3915 Fax 3391 3916 
brdonald@franciscan.org.au 

Society of St Francis Third Order 
Asia Pacific Province 

Provincial Minister  
The Rt Rev’d Godfrey Fryar 

9 Stonebridge Place 
Aspley 4034 

Provincial Chaplain 
The Rev’d Mandy Wheatley 
25 Forsters Bay Rd, 
Narooma.NSW 2546 

Assistant Provincial Minister 
The Rev’d Sally Buckley 
PO Box 514 
Esperance WA 6450 

Provincial Secretary 
Mr John Blakemore 
18 Myola Road 
Umina Beach NSW 2257 

Provincial Treasurer 
Ms Glenys McCarrick 
PO Box 161, 
Lawnton  4501 

Mbl 0417 730 541 
gcfryar@iinet.net.au 

Mbl 0401 670 132 
mmjcwheatley@bigpond.com 

Mbl 0408 714 564 
Fr.sall4@gmail.com 

02 4344 6904 
vashon@optusnet.com.au 

0438 821 684 
glenys_mccarrick@pacificnet.au 
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Oratory of the Good Shepherd 

Oratory of the Good Shepherd 
Superior  
The Rev’d Professor Peter Hibbert 
OGS 
3 Blossom Road, Erdington,  
Birmingham B24 OUD UK 

phibbert@ogs.net 

Provincial Prior  
The Ven Keith Dean-Jones OGS 
Parish of Bundaberg, Rectory,  
2 Meilene Street, 
Kalkie Bundaberg  4670 

07 4151 3128 
Kdean-jones@ogs.net 

Brisbane Prior  
The Ven Michael Chiplin OGS 

3279 0745 
Mchiplin@ogs.net 

Mission-related Organisations 

Anglican Aid Abroad  
PO Box 256, Grange 4051 

President 
The Rev’d Neville D Nixon 
Administrative Assistant 
The Rev’d Fr Noel Jackson 
Treasurer 
Br Daniel Matthews  SSF 
Secretary 
Mrs Marilyn Wright 

3391 3915 
www.anglicanaidabroad.com.au 
donate@anglicanaidabroad.com.au 

3391 3915 

Anglican Board of Mission – 
Australia Ltd 
Postal Address Locked Bag 4005, 
Queen Victoria Bldg, NSW 1230 

Brisbane Committee 
Chair The Rev’d Ken Spreadborough 

Auxiliary Mrs Lynette Keyes 

Maryborough Auxiliary 
Ms Noela Thomson 

02 9264 1021  Fax 02 9261 3560 
1300 302 663 

www.abmission.org 
info@abm.asn.au   
Mbl 0418 838 013 

3868 3732 
0409 890 256 

0411 194 751 
noelathomson@gmail.com 
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Anglican Overseas Aid 

CEO The Rev’d Dr Bob Mitchell 
PO Box 389, Abbotsford Vic 3067 

03 9495 6100 
aoa@anglicanoverseasaid.org.au 

Anglican Cursillo Movement in 
Australia – Diocese of Brisbane 
2 Abif St, Cotswold Hills 4350 

Episcopal Overseer  
The Right Rev’d Cam Venables 

Diocesan Lay Director  
Mrs Margaret Siebenhausen 

Secretary 
Ms Gail Toohey 

Treasurer 
Ms Jo Warden 

Diocesan Spiritual Advisor  
The Rev’d Iain Moore 

0484 308 983 
masiebenhausen@bigpond.com 

0488 711 477 
jctoohey@bigpond.net.au 

0438 712 974 
gjwarden5@bigpond.com 

3818 2545   0488 180 542 
Revnd.iain@gmail.com  

Anglican Men’s Society Qld 
Provincial Council 

General Manager  
Mr Andy Brodersen 
3 Gabrielle Court,  
Collingwood Park 4301 

Council Chairman  
Mr Jim Smith 
23 Weetwood Street, 
Toowoomba 4350 

3381 8817 0413 191 154 
andyandaase@optusnet.com.au 

4634 4766  0475 267 677 
jamesjimmysmith@outlook.com 

Angligreen 
Chair The Rev’d Peter Moore 
27 Dandenong St, Forest Lake 
4078 

Mbl 0429 679 011 
peterm44@bigpond.net.au 
www.angligreen.org.au 

Bush Church Aid Society 
Regional Officer Qld/NNSW  
The Rev’d David Rogers-Smith 

9 Fenimore Street, Wishart 4122 
(PO Box 6565, Upper Mt Gravatt 4122) 

3349 9081 Fax 3849 7927 
Mbl 0448 019 081 
www.bushchurchaid.com.au 
d.rogerssmith@bushchurchaid.com.au
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Bush Ministry Fund 

Episcopal Overseer  
The Rt Rev’d C D Venables 4614 7050 

cvenables@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

Church Missionary Society – Qld 
with Northern NSW 

General Secretary  
The Rev’d John Menear 
Hope Central, 126 Barry Parade, 
Fortitude Valley, Brisbane, 4000 
PO Box 526, Fortitude Valley 4006 

3171 3020 
qld@cms.org.au 
www.cms.org.au 

GFS — An Anglican Ministry 
PO Box 1261, Milton 4064 

Office Administrator  
Ms Margaret Humphries 3514 7451  

gfsbrisbane@hotmail.com 
Mathew Hale Public Library 
PO Box 13675,  
George Street Post Shop 4003 
A library to provide resources for 
Christian Ministry 

John Stenning 

Mon 12noon-2pm 

Mbl  0432 049 288 
www.mathewhalepubliclibrary.com 
info@mathewhalepubliclibrary.com 

Mission to Seafarers 
PO Box 9260, Wynnum Plaza 4178 

Chaplain  
The Rev’d Stephen Briggs 3895 1181          0428 136 116 

stephenbriggs68@bigpond.com 

MU Australia  
(formerly Mothers’ Union) 

President Mrs Beverley Perry  
5 Camplin Court, Branyan 4670 

Secretary The Rev’d Robert Perry 

Bookshop  
Located at St Barnabas Anglican 
Church Hall, 189 Lister Street, 
Sunnybank 
Thu 9.30am to 2pm 

4155 0724  0438 108 019 
bev.perry16@bigpond.com 

0407 901 735 
brisdiosecretary@gmail.com 
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Publication Co-ordinator 
Mrs Peta Williams, 31 Yellowstone 
Court, Munruben 4125  3297 1867  0404 084 336 

mubnepub@yahoo.com.au 

MU Worldwide 

General Trustee 
The Rev’d Canon Libbie Crossman 

MU Provincial President  
The Rev’d Anne Kennedy 
29 Abercromby Road,  
Blackburn South  Vic  3130 

Australian Secretary 
Mrs Marilyn Robey 
8 Darwin Drive, 
Bathurst  NSW  2795 

Web www.muaustralia.org.au 

0407 131 488 
libbiecrossman47@gmail.com 

(03) 9877 7107
ppmuaustralia@telstra.com

(02) 6331 8287
muaustsecretary@telstra.com

Pastoral Counselling & Chaplaincy 
Services 
(formerly Interchurch Trade & 
Industry Mission)   

Australia-wide  
Dr Lindsay McMillan 0409 186 322 

www.converginternational.com.au   
lindsaymcmillan@reventure.com.au 

Queensland Churches Together 

1st Floor, “Old Bishopsbourne”,  
St Francis’ Theological College, 
PO Box 2096, Toowong 4066 

General Secretary  
The Rev’d Canon Richard Tutin 

Admin Officer 
Jackie Fewtrell 

3369 6792 
admin@qct.org.au 
www.qct.org.au 

Service Personnel Anglican  
Help Society 
192 Marine Parade, Rainbow Bay 4225 
(PO Box 326, Coolangatta. 4225) 

Chairman The Rev’d Don Parker 

Secretary Mr David Phillips 

5536 1261  
info@stgeorges.net.au 
www.spahs.com.au  
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St George’s Defence Holiday Suites 
for service and ex-service personnel 
Mon-Fri 9am-4pm 
Sat 9am-12noon 

Conference Centres 

CMS Tamborine 

St Colomb’s Ministry 
Centre 23 Victoria Street, 
Clayfield  

The Old Friary Centre 

Bookings  5545 1417 

3268 3092 

3878 3348 
Brookfieldcentre@iinet.net.au 

Parish Caring Ministries 

4151 3128 
admin@bundaberganglican.org 

5535 6066 
stjohnsbh@winshop.com.au 

Bundaberg, Christ Church  
Caring Ministries 
Parish Office 
59 Woongarra St, Bundaberg 

Ministering to those in need, Dorcas, 
Soup Kitchen and Emergency Relief 
Mon-Fri 9am-1pm 

Burleigh Heads, St John’s 
Community Care Services  
14 Park Ave, Burleigh Heads 

Office Administrator 
Helen Reeds 

Emergency Relief  
Tue-Thu 8.30am–12noon (with 
referral) 

Caboolture, St Lawrence’s Parish 
Care Program 
Parish Office 
165 King St, Caboolture 
Rector The Rev’d Avril Green 

Provision of food parcels to people in 
the Caboolture area 

5419 0835 
churchcaboolture@gmail.com 
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5492 6515      Fax  5492 6524  
tsilich@anglicanchurchsq.org.au 

3359 2012 

13 3742 
hello@epicassist.org 

(07) 3857 5085

3852 1635 
welfare@trinityvalley.org.au 

3818 0945 

Caloundra, CHSP Maintenance & 
Modification 
PO Box 52 Caloundra 4551 
Manager Miss Toni Silich 

HACC program, maintenance & 
modification 

Chermside Anglican 
Welfare Ministries 
Ms Karen Winters 

Emergency Relief 
Tues and Fri 9.30am-11.45am 
in Chermside and surrounds.  
Food parcels 

EPIC Assist 

CEO Bill Gamack 
Brisbane Head Office 
Sunshine Coast, Brisbane, Fraser 
Coast, Capricornia  

Gold Coast 

Provides employment opportunities for 
people with a disability. 

Fortitude Valley, Trinity Centre 
Pantry  
Holy Trinity Hall 
PO Box 1220, Fortitude Valley 4006 
Convenor Liz Jarvis 

Trinity Pantry Food  
Tues-Fri 12noon-3pm 
Emergency Relief  
Thu 12noon- 3pm 

Goodna Anglican Welfare Ministries 

Emergency relief. Food parcels  
Referral to Anglicare counselling 
services 
Tues 9am-12.30pm 

Inala, Careforce 

Emergency relief. Food parcels. 
Counselling 

3372 1216 
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3808 2696 
smass@westnet.com.au 

3869 1000          Fax 3869 2100 
manager@homeassistservices.com.au 

5531 6013 
generaladmin@stjohnscc.org.au 

Logan, St Mark’s Anglican 
Social Services 

Coordinator Ms Faye Fanning 

Emergency Relief. Food parcels. Baby 
Bundles. Kits of Household Goods. 
Christmas Hampers. Community 
Friendship Group held 1st & 3rd 
Wednesdays of the month 

Sandgate & District (St Margaret’s) 
Home Assist Secure 
PO Box 135, Sandgate 4017 
Ms Kelly Gray 

Home maintenance and modification 

Surfers Paradise Anglican Crisis 
Care (SPACC) 
(incorporating St John’s Drop In 
Centre) 

General Manager 
The Rev’d Jon Brook 

Drop in centre providing hot meals: 
Mon-Fri 11.30am-12.30pm  
Sat breakfast 7.30am-8.30am  
Shower: 
Mon-Fri 9am-12noon 
Laundry facilities: 
Tue, Thu, Fri 9am-12noon 
Welfare office for administering 
Emergency Relief and general 
support: Mon-Thu 9am-11am  

ER:  
Mon-Fri 9am to 11.30am 
Two men’s homes for men in crisis 
(supported medium term 
accommodation). 

Tamborine Mountain  
Emergency Relief 
2 Dapsang Dr,  
Tambourine Mountain 4272 

Ms Gisela Meehl 
Emergency Relief Program

5545 2919 
anglicantambourine@bigpond.com 
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